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So (two-thirds being in the affirma-

tive) the rules were suspended and the 
bill was passed. 

The result of the vote was announced 
as above recorded. 

A motion to reconsider was laid on 
the table. 

f 

SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGE-
MENT DISTRICT PYTHON ELIMI-
NATION PROGRAM 
(Mr. FRANCIS ROONEY of Florida 

asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. FRANCIS ROONEY of Florida. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today to discuss an 
invasive and dangerous species destroy-
ing our Everglades ecosystem. 

Geoff Roepstorff, pictured here, is a 
constituent who is a banker by day and 
a python hunter by night. I hunted 
with Geoff and killed some of these 
pythons while participating in the 
South Florida Water Management Dis-
trict Python Elimination Program. 
One of the pythons I killed is hanging 
in my office today. You can come by 
and see it. 

The elimination program has re-
moved over 820 snakes from south Flor-
ida, but as of now, they can’t hunt in-
side the Everglades National Park be-
cause of Interior regulations. These 
predators eat up small animals and dis-
rupt our ecosystem throughout the Ev-
erglades and even eat panthers, bob-
cats, and alligators, and they pose a 
threat to humans. The South Florida 
Water Management District Python 
Elimination Program incentivizes 
members of the public to assist in 
hunting and eliminating these invasive 
species. 

I want to especially thank Mike 
Kirkland and Tia Barnett from South 
Florida Water Management District for 
their work on this program, and I say 
that now is the time to allow experi-
enced and trained hunters like Geoff 
Roepstorff and others, as part of the 
elimination program, to be allowed to 
hunt and eliminate pythons in Ever-
glades National Park. 

BIDDING FAREWELL TO GOV-
ERNOR BRENDAN BYRNE OF 
NEW JERSEY 

(Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute.) 

Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN. Mr. 
Speaker, last week, New Jersey said its 
final good-bye to a tireless advocate, 
dedicated leader, and wonderful man 
who just happened to also have been 
our Governor. Brendan Byrne, our two- 
term Governor, never let the weight of 
his office bog him down. He will be re-
membered for his wit, his passion, and 
the force of his will. 

Governor Byrne helped inspire and 
instill honorable characteristics of 
public service into generations of New 
Jerseyans. I consider myself blessed to 
be among them. 

It is a bittersweet moment to bid 
farewell to Governor Byrne. I will long 
keep Ruthie and Tom and the entire 
Byrne family in my thoughts and in 
my prayers as their loved ones and, in-
deed, New Jersey has suffered a tre-
mendous loss. 

f 

CONGRATULATING WAYZATA HIGH 
SCHOOL 

(Mr. PAULSEN asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. PAULSEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to congratulate Wayzata High 
School on being named Minnesota’s 
best public school by USA Today. 

Strong public schools are the founda-
tion of our community, and while Min-
nesota has many great public and pri-
vate schools, Wayzata does stand out 
among them. The schools are evaluated 
on standardized test scores, student- 
teacher ratios, graduation rates, Ad-
vanced Placement enrollment, and 
more. Wayzata High School has over 
3,200 students, a student ratio of 17 to 
1, and an average SAT score of 1420. 

Across the Nation, 80 percent of stu-
dents graduate from high school. In 
Minnesota, 88 percent graduate, and in 
Wayzata, 93 percent of their students 
graduate. Their Advanced Placement 
enrollment is high, Mr. Speaker. Over 
25 percent of 10th graders, 36 percent of 
11th graders, and 34 percent of seniors 
are enrolled in AP classes at Wayzata. 

Mr. Speaker, Principal Scott 
Gengler, all of the teachers and staff, 
students and parents, and the Spartan 
community deserve this recognition. 
Congratulations to Wayzata High 
School. 

f 

HONORING JORDAN THOMAS FOR 
RECEIVING THE RHODES SCHOL-
ARSHIP 

(Mr. PAYNE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. PAYNE. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to honor Jordan Thomas, a sen-

ior at Princeton University and a grad-
uate of University High School in New-
ark, New Jersey, for being selected as a 
2018 Rhodes Scholar, one of only 32 in 
the country. 

This young man, who graduated high 
school in my district, is the first New-
ark Public Schools student in over a 
decade to receive this prestigious 
honor. 

In addition to getting straight A’s 
since his freshman year at Princeton, 
Jordan is writing a thesis on school- 
based support services that Newark 
Public Schools offers pregnant and par-
enting teens. 

In the next year, he will be taking 
his talents abroad to study social pol-
icy at Oxford College in England. Jor-
dan plans to return to his home of 
Newark as a public servant. He told the 
Star Ledger newspaper: ‘‘Newark built 
me. Newark shaped me.’’ As a lifelong 
resident of Newark myself, I know that 
feeling. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask my colleagues to 
join me in congratulating Jordan 
Thomas for his successes, service, and 
future. His love for his community 
shows that our country’s future is in 
good hands. 

f 
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NATIONAL LAW ENFORCEMENT 
APPRECIATION DAY 

(Ms. TENNEY asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. TENNEY. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today in recognition of Law Enforce-
ment Appreciation Day. 

Law enforcement officers coura-
geously put their lives on the line to 
protect our homes, our businesses, and 
our schools. They are truly the unsung 
heroes of our communities. We are 
grateful to the men and women in blue 
who service the front line of defense 
here at home. 

Today and every day, we must stand 
with our members of law enforcement 
and their families to honor the sac-
rifices and the contributions they 
make to ensure that our families re-
main safe. 

I also especially thank the United 
States Capitol Police force, who work 
each day to ensure that Members, staff, 
and visitors to the Nation’s Capital are 
safe and secure. 

Let us not forget to honor the service 
and sacrifice of all who serve in law en-
forcement, especially in New York 
State: our New York State Police, the 
New York State Park Police, county, 
city, and village police forces, and, of 
course, corrections officers throughout 
the great State of New York. 

f 

HONORING LIEUTENANT DEBRA 
CLAYTON AND DEPUTY NORM 
LEWIS 

(Mrs. DEMINGS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 
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Mrs. DEMINGS. Mr. Speaker, I rise 

today to recognize the lives of Lieuten-
ant Debra Clayton of the Orlando Po-
lice Department and Deputy Norm 
Lewis of the Orange County Sheriff’s 
Office. 

Lieutenant Clayton was an out-
standing officer, a loving wife, mother, 
and friend. One year ago today, she was 
shot and killed while attempting to ap-
prehend a murder suspect. 

Deputy Lewis was killed the same 
day while searching for Lieutenant 
Clayton’s killer. Deputy Lewis was 
deeply admired by all of his colleagues: 
a man described as a ‘‘gentle giant,’’ 
who played for the UCF Knights and 
went on to be a true public servant. 

Mr. Speaker, it has been said that 
when a law enforcement officer falls, a 
part of America dies. 

Today we recognize these two public 
servants and pay tribute to them for 
paying the ultimate sacrifice. Today 
we also take a moment on Law En-
forcement Appreciation Day to thank 
law enforcement officers throughout 
our Nation who serve and protect us 
and our families. 

f 

IRANIAN PEOPLE ARE ENSLAVED 
BY THE MULLAHS 

(Mr. POE of Texas asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. POE of Texas. Mr. Speaker, 
cracks are beginning to form in the 
iron grip of the Iranian regime. The op-
pressed people of Iran have taken to 
the streets to demand an end to the 
corrupt and brutal dictatorship. 

The mullahs in Tehran have stolen 
the wealth of the country and the peo-
ple, lining their own pockets and fund-
ing terror throughout the Middle East. 

Like in 2009, when the Iranian people 
rose up to confront the corruption of 
the regime, these Iranians have been 
met with harsh violence and been mur-
dered in the streets. Thousands of oth-
ers have been imprisoned. In 2009, how-
ever, the United States sat in the 
stands as a spectator and watched the 
Ayatollah crush freedom. 

I applaud this President’s show of 
support for freedom in Iran. The United 
States must show political and public 
support for our friends for liberty in 
Iran. 

As President Kennedy once said: 
‘‘Let every Nation know, whether it 
wishes us well or ill, that we will pay 
any price, bear any burden, meet any 
hardship, support any friend, oppose 
any foe, in order to assure the survival 
and the success of liberty.’’ 

Like our friends in Iran. 
And that is just the way it is. 

f 

CELEBRATING THE HISTORY OF 
TEXAS 

(Ms. JACKSON LEE asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Ms. JACKSON LEE. Mr. Speaker, I 
have often come to this floor to remind 

my colleagues of the devastation that 
the people of Texas have experienced 
with Hurricane Harvey. I certainly 
don’t intend to ignore our other friends 
in the Virgin Islands, Puerto Rico, 
Florida, and California who have expe-
rienced their own devastation, along 
with Louisiana. 

But I am excited today, Mr. Speaker, 
because I am introducing a bill that 
celebrates the history of Texas. H.R. 
4745 is the emancipation national his-
toric trail. Many people know that the 
Emancipation Proclamation was not 
heard in Texas but for 2 years later in 
1865. 

This emancipation national historic 
trail recounts the journey of many of 
those individuals: freed slaves going 
from the Osterman Building and Reedy 
Chapel in Galveston, Texas; along 
Texas State Highway 3, Interstate 
Highway 45 North, Freedmen’s Town, 
and Emancipation Park in Houston, 
Texas; following the migration route of 
newly freed slaves and other persons of 
African descent; from the major 19th 
century seaport of Galveston. 

It is a collaboration with people from 
both parties throughout the commu-
nity. It is one of unity, Mr. Speaker. It 
is one where we are coming together. 

I look forward to passing this legisla-
tion with my colleagues—Republicans 
and Democrats—because it is a celebra-
tion of the history of Texas. 

f 

STOP THE BLEED 

(Mr. ROE of Tennessee asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. ROE of Tennessee. Mr. Speaker, 
as a physician, I rise today to raise 
awareness about the value of com-
prehensive training aimed at pre-
venting deaths after a traumatic injury 
occurs. 

Last fall, I took part in a ‘‘Stop the 
Bleeding’’ training course offered by 
the American College of Surgeons. This 
simple training teaches individuals 
how to treat bleeding injuries and help 
save a life. 

Each year, more than 180,000 people 
die from traumatic injuries. The most 
common and easily preventable cause 
of these deaths is too much blood loss 
in the critical minutes before trained 
first responders arrive. With an aver-
age response time of 8 to 12 minutes 
once 911 is called, it is the responsi-
bility for all of us to prepare to help 
others in the event of a traumatic in-
jury. 

I look forward to working with my 
fellow Members of Congress and advo-
cates, such as my friends of the Amer-
ican College of Surgeons, to raise 
awareness of the value of this life-
saving technique. 

f 

WOMEN AND THE TAX SCAM 

(Mrs. LAWRENCE asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mrs. LAWRENCE. Mr. Speaker, last 
month, Republicans rammed through a 
terrible tax bill with devastating con-
sequences, and women are among the 
hardest hit. This tax plan drains funds 
from working mothers while giving 
huge tax breaks to corporations and 
the wealthy. 

Women are breadwinners for half of 
the American families with children. 
These women often do more work for 
less pay. 

Nearly six in ten workers in low- 
wage jobs are women. Women earn 82 
cents on the dollar. In Michigan, it is 
even lower: 74 cents. 

The tax plan takes away the indi-
vidual mandate, so 9.5 million women 
could lose healthcare—annual exams, 
birth control, cancer screening, preg-
nancy support—and lose economic se-
curity. 

Under this new law, the wealthiest 
continue to prosper at the expense of 
hardworking women in this country. 
We deserve better in America. People 
deserve better than this reckless tax 
bill. 

f 

NATIONAL LAW ENFORCEMENT 
APPRECIATION DAY 

(Mr. FITZPATRICK asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to mark National Law En-
forcement Appreciation Day. 

In 2017, 128 law enforcement officers 
were killed in the line of duty. Despite 
the significant danger they face, these 
brave men and women continue to put 
their badge on every day, leaving their 
loved ones at home, to protect our 
friends, our families, and our commu-
nities. 

I was fortunate to be a member of the 
thin blue line for nearly a decade and a 
half as an FBI special agent. During 
that time, I worked with some of the 
most dedicated, mission-oriented pro-
fessionals in the Nation, to include 
Federal, State, and local law enforce-
ment officers. 

I ask that today, and every day, all 
Americans take a moment to reflect on 
what our law enforcement officers do 
to protect our liberties and to ensure 
the safety of our communities. We owe 
them a debt of gratitude for their serv-
ice and for their sacrifice. 

As I did last year, I urge the Presi-
dent to observe this day by lighting the 
White House blue this evening. 

f 

CONGRATULATING COLONEL BRIT 
HATLEY AND THE HAPPY HOOLI-
GANS 

(Mr. CRAMER asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. CRAMER. Mr. Speaker, no U.S. 
Air Force unit has ever won more than 
19 Outstanding Unit Awards. This last 
Saturday, I was honored to be in Fargo 
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