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IN HONOR OF THE TOWNS OF AU-

RORA, HOLLAND AND WALES, 
NEW YORK BICENTENNIAL ANNI-
VERSARIES 

HON. CHRIS COLLINS 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. COLLINS of New York. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to recognize the Towns of Aurora, 
Holland and Wales, New York on their bicen-
tennial anniversaries. 

The Towns of Aurora, Holland and Wales, 
New York were founded on April l5, 1818, 
when the Town of Willink, New York was split 
into three different towns. Each of the towns 
has their own rich history, and I am honored 
to represent them here in Congress. 

The Town of Aurora was home to Millard 
Fillnore, twenty-seven years before he be-
came the 13th President of the United States. 
Today, Millard Fillmore’s home is currently a 
National Historic Landmark in Erie County, 
New York. 

Holland, New York, named after the Holland 
Land Company, is home to the Holland 
Speedway. Here, families and NASCAR en-
thusiasts can spend an afternoon enjoying the 
races or racing their own cars for fun. 

Wales, New York, named after the Wales of 
Britain for its rolling hills and green pastures, 
prides itself on its rural, dairying environment 
and family friendly atmosphere. 

I thank the Towns of Aurora, Holland, and 
Wales for their commitment to preserving 200 
years of history, and I congratulate them on 
their Bicentennial Anniversaries. 

f 

MIGUEL OLIVAS MALDONADO 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Miguel Olivas 
Maldonado for receiving the Arvada Wheat 
Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth award. 

Miguel Olivas Maldonado is a student at Ar-
vada K–8 and received this award because 
his determination and hard work have allowed 
him to overcome adversities. 

The dedication demonstrated by Miguel 
Olivas Maldonado is exemplary of the type of 
achievement that can be attained with hard 
work and perseverance. It is essential stu-
dents at all levels strive to make the most of 
their education and develop a work ethic 
which will guide them for the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Miguel Olivas Maldonado for winning the Ar-
vada Wheat Ridge Service Ambassadors for 
Youth award. I have no doubt he will exhibit 
the same dedication and character in all of his 
future accomplishments. 

INTRODUCTION OF THE VETERAN 
EMPLOYMENT AND CHILD CARE 
ACCESS ACT 

HON. J. LUIS CORREA 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. CORREA. Mr. Speaker, since January 
2013, veteran unemployment decreased from 
just under 8 percent to where it is now at 2.7 
percent—the lowest levels since 2001. Despite 
the progress, barriers to childcare services still 
exist for low-income and homeless veterans 
who are seeking employment. 

Currently, it is optional for the Department of 
Veteran Affairs (VA) to provide childcare as-
sistance under the Vocational Rehabilitation 
and Employment (VR&E). This means VA is 
not required to provide childcare assistance 
even if a veteran qualifies for assistance. Ac-
cording to the VA, during Fiscal Year (FY) 
2017, over 131,000 veterans participated in 
the VR&E Program of which an estimated 
43,000 of those veteran participants had one 
or more child dependents. Of the 131,000 vet-
erans who participated in VR&E Program, only 
17 veterans received childcare assistance. In 
FY2016, 12 veterans received child care as-
sistance. 

That is why, today, I am introducing the Vet-
eran Employment and Child Care Access Act, 
which would expand child care services and 
enable veterans who are participating in VA 
and Department of Labor workforce develop-
ment, job training, job placement services, or 
vocational rehabilitation programs to access 
childcare services while they participate. Spe-
cifically, this bill would make mandatory for VA 
and DOL to provide childcare services to eligi-
ble veteran who are participating in job train-
ing or vocational rehabilitation programs. 

This is the same bill that Senator TAMMY 
DUCKWORTH—a veteran and hero—introduced 
in the Senate. I am proud our legislation will 
ensure that veterans have access to afford-
able childcare services when they most need 
it. This bill will provide much needed childcare 
services to low-income and homeless veterans 
working towards finding a good and stable job. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO DONNA FORD—28TH 
CONGRESSIONAL DISTRICT 
WOMAN OF THE YEAR 

HON. ADAM B. SCHIFF 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. SCHIFF. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Each year, 
we pay special tribute to the contributions and 
sacrifices made by our nation’s women. It is 
an honor to pay homage to outstanding 
women who are making a difference in my 
Congressional District. I would like to recog-
nize a remarkable woman, Donna Ford of La 
Cañada Flintridge, California. 

A civil litigator for several years in New York 
and Pennsylvania, Ms. Ford relocated to La 
Cañada Flintridge with her family in 2005. 
Since moving to California, she has been an 
active member of the local community, serving 
as a dedicated volunteer and board member 
of several non-profit organizations. 

Believing that all children have tremendous 
potential regardless of their background or cir-
cumstances, Donna is a passionate advocate 
for young people and is committed to enrich-
ing the lives of children and adolescents. To 
that end, for twelve years, she has served on 
the board of directors of Hillsides, an organi-
zation dedicated to fostering a stable, healthy 
environment for at-risk children and their fami-
lies by providing a range of innovative serv-
ices, including residential treatment, individual-
ized education, counseling and adoption as-
sistance. Ms. Ford currently serves as chair of 
the Hillsides Board of Directors, co-chaired 
Hillsides’ annual gala in 2011, and has served 
on several committees over the years. 

In addition to her work with Hillsides, Donna 
is a longtime volunteer of the Cottage Guild at 
Rosemary Children’s Services in Pasadena, 
which provides education, therapeutic support 
and permanency planning to children and ado-
lescents, and residential housing at Rosemary 
Cottage for young girls between 13 and 18 
years of age. 

Donna has continued her commendable 
work with children by mentoring African Amer-
ican girls at John Muir High School in Pasa-
dena and serving as a board member of the 
Institute for Educational Advancement, a 
Pasadena organization that assists gifted chil-
dren in reaching their full potential, for a dec-
ade. In addition, she volunteers for the Univer-
sity of Southern California’s Medical Faculty 
Family and Friends, which raises scholarship 
funds for medical students, and has served on 
the diversity committee for the Pasadena Play-
house. 

Donna is married to Dr. Henri R. Ford and 
they have two children. 

I ask all Members to join me in honoring this 
exceptional, well-respected woman of Califor-
nia’s 28th Congressional District, Donna Ford. 

f 

IN MEMORY OF MAYOR HECTOR F. 
GARCIA 

HON. MICHAEL C. BURGESS 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. BURGESS. Mr. Speaker, today I rise to 
honor the life of Mayor Hector F. Garcia. 
Mayor Garcia served the City of Watauga for 
more than 29 years. He passed away this 
year at the age of 78 after a lifetime of service 
to his community and our nation. 

Mayor Garcia and his wife Wendy first 
moved to Watauga in 1968 to raise their fam-
ily. In 1979, Mayor Garcia began his service 
as co-chair of Watauga’s first charter commis-
sion. He was elected to the city council in 
1980 and served until 1986. In 1994, he 
chaired the Zoning Board of Adjustment. Two 
years later, he was elected mayor of Watauga 
and served until 2002. After a brief hiatus, Mr. 
Garcia was elected for a second time as 
mayor in 2013 and served until his death. 

In 1958, Mayor Garcia joined the U.S. Air 
Force and served our country for more than 
ten years. Following his service, he worked for 
General Dynamics, now Lockheed Martin, for 
more than 35 years. Initially hired as an air-
craft assembler, he rose within the company, 
retiring from the the engineering and planning 
department. 

A lifelong North Texan, Mayor Garcia self-
lessly served not only the City of Watauga, but 
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our entire community. He will be deeply 
missed. I extend my deepest condolences to 
his wife Wendy, their family, and all who knew 
him. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO DEANNA CANTRELL— 
CALIFORNIA’S 24TH CONGRES-
SIONAL WOMAN OF THE YEAR 

HON. SALUD O. CARBAJAL 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. CARBAJAL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Every year, 
we dedicate the month of March to give spe-
cial recognition to the accomplishments and 
sacrifices made by America’s women. I con-
sider it an honor to highlight the extraordinary 
women who are making a difference in my 
District. I would like to recognize one out-
standing woman Deanna Cantrell, of San Luis 
Obispo, California. 

Deanna has served as the San Luis Obispo 
Chief of Police since January of 2016, making 
her one of less than 2 percent of female police 
chiefs in the nation. Before joining our Central 
Coast community, Deanna spent 21 years with 
the Mesa, Arizona Police Department where 
she held a variety of impressive positions. 
Since arriving in San Luis Obispo, Deanna 
has made immense strides in encouraging 
community engagement, particularly among 
marginalized groups. She started the PACT, a 
group comprised of local action groups such 
as Women’s March SLO, RACE Matters SLO, 
Hispanic Leadership Council, the LGBTQIA 
community and more. She’s assigned officers 
to various specific populations to be the liaison 
that supports those communities and en-
hances partnership and communication. 

Deanna also started PEACE, a series of 
community workshops to increase under-
standing between PD and law enforcement. 
Additionally, she was invited to be a speaker 
at the inaugural Women’s March in San Luis 
Obispo where she made the community feel 
both heard and protected. 

Those who know her describe Deanna as 
someone who shares herself as a person, role 
model, and friend by visiting schools, sitting on 
panels, and always saying yes when called 
upon for support. She exemplifies the kind-
ness, warmth, determination, intelligence, and 
caring we hope to see in every person in uni-
form. Deanna’s tireless service to our district 
makes her someone who all young women 
and men can look up to with admiration. 

I ask all Members to join me today in hon-
oring an exceptional woman of California’s 
24th Congressional District, Deanna Cantrell, 
for her incredible service to her community. 
We thank Deanna for her service. 

f 

HONORING THE LIFE OF NORMA 
ETHERIDGE THORN SARVER 

HON. MARK DeSAULNIER 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. DESAULNIER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to honor the life of Norma Etheridge Thorn 
Sarver. I join her family and friends to cele-
brate her life and service to the community. 

Norma was born on October 21, 1921. She 
married Captain William A. Thorn (USN), who 
commanded the aircraft carrier USS Antietam, 
and they had two daughters. Captain Thorn 
was killed when his plane crashed into the Po-
tomac River after taking off from the Naval 
Support Facility in Washington, DC. 

Civic engagement, social responsibility, and 
service to her community were extremely im-
portant to Norma. She volunteered at DePaul 
Medical Center for more than 25 years giving 
nearly 10,000 hours of her time. Norma was a 
longtime member of Larchmont United Meth-
odist Church, and active in the Lakewood Gar-
den Club, Women of Wesleyan, and the 
Kings’ Daughters Royster Circle. She was part 
of a group of pioneering women who re-
sponded to the needs of their community, es-
pecially during times of such hardships as war 
and economic depression. 

In October of 1965, Norma married her sec-
ond husband, Rear Admiral Ben W. Sarver 
(USN), a 1935 graduate of the U.S. Naval 
Academy. Ben served in the Pacific Theater 
during World War II on several destroyers, 
and was the recovery officer for the early 
Gemini space flights. Norma quickly took on 
the role of mother to his three children. 

Norma’s strength, conviction, and devotion 
could be felt by all who were lucky enough to 
know her. Through the loss of both husbands 
and as a survivor of ovarian cancer, she lived 
her life with grace and a fearless spirit. She 
was a loving wife, mother, grandmother, 
friend, and confidant who lifted people up, 
brought out the best in them, and always pro-
vided words of encouragement. Norma, and 
her infectious smile, will be dearly missed by 
both her family and the community. 

f 

HONORING FIREFIGHTERS IVAN 
FLANSCHA AND ZACHARY AN-
THONY OF PENNSYLVANIA, 
YORK CITY FIRE DEPARTMENT 

HON. SCOTT PERRY 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. PERRY. Mr. Speaker, today I extend my 
heartfelt condolences to the family, loved ones 
and peers of my constituents, York City Fire-
fighters Ivan Flanscha and Zachary Anthony, 
who perished in the Line of Duty on Thursday, 
March 22, 2018. We grieve their passing and 
are forever indebted for their selfless, tireless 
and devoted years of service as firefighters. 

I’ve long revered the commitment of people 
who devote themselves selflessly to serving 
our communities and fellow citizens. Ivan 
learned the importance of public service at an 
early age from his father, a dedicated police 
officer in Waterloo, Iowa who lost his life in an 
off-duty accident when Ivan was five years 
old. Ivan began his career with the York City 
Fire Department in 1999, where he earned the 
auspicious title of Firefighter of the Year in 
2004. His colleagues recall his amazing and 
tireless work ethic, how dependable and reli-
able he was to all who knew him. 

Zachary joined the York City Fire Depart-
ment in 2010, and dedicated his life to public 
service, gladly helping others in the commu-
nity—whether in the course of his official du-
ties or in his private life. Zachary’s colleagues 
recall his fantastic spirit and free will, as well 

as his eagerness to embrace new opportuni-
ties and experiences. 

On behalf of Pennsylvania’s Fourth Con-
gressional District, I am crestfallen at the 
passing of these brave Warriors, and offer my 
heartfelt condolences to the family, friends and 
loved ones of Ivan Flanscha and Zachary An-
thony on our tragic loss. While they died in 
service to our Commonwealth and Country, 
they were doing what they loved and what 
truly mattered to them; they set the standard 
for all to follow—in their lives and in their serv-
ice. Ivan and Zachary will remain in my heart 
and prayers, and I wish them Godspeed and 
I’ll see them on the High Ground. 

f 

KALEIGH MELINGER 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Kaleigh 
Melinger for receiving the Arvada Wheat 
Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth award. 

Kaleigh Melinger is a student at Jefferson 
High School and received this award because 
her determination and hard work have allowed 
her to overcome adversities. 

The dedication demonstrated by Kaleigh 
Melinger is exemplary of the type of achieve-
ment that can be attained with hard work and 
perseverance. It is essential students at all 
levels strive to make the most of their edu-
cation and develop a work ethic which will 
guide them for the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Kaleigh Melinger for winning the Arvada 
Wheat Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth 
award. I have no doubt she will exhibit the 
same dedication and character in all of her fu-
ture accomplishments. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO EMILY GLEICHER— 
28TH CONGRESSIONAL DISTRICT 
WOMAN OF THE YEAR 

HON. ADAM B. SCHIFF 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. SCHIFF. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Each year, 
we pay special tribute to the contributions 
made by our nation’s women. It is an honor to 
pay homage to outstanding women who are 
making a difference in my congressional dis-
trict. Today I would like to recognize a remark-
able woman, Emily Gleicher of Elysian Valley, 
a unique neighborhood of Los Angeles, Cali-
fornia. 

Growing up in Queens, New York, Emily 
saw the need for sustainable living and gar-
dening in major cities. She would walk the 
streets of New York and see empty parcels of 
land filled with garbage and dead weeds and 
she saw an opportunity to enhance urban 
areas with sustainable farming. 

When Emily moved to Los Angeles in 2012, 
she and her husband, Arlen Jason Wood, de-
cided to convert their front yard into a giant 
raised lima bean farm where they would later 
sell their crops to local farmer’s markets. As 
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