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vital victim compensation in California. Julie 
has strived to help crime victims sort through 
complicated legal matters and help them cope 
with the financial aftermath of the crimes in 
which they were involved. Julie has also been 
committed to conducting multi-lingual victim 
outreach and public awareness efforts to 
reach crime survivors in California. 

After the mass shooting in Las Vegas in Oc-
tober of 2017, it was no surprise, Julie was 
right ready to help. With her assistance, along 
with the CCCB, they were able to reach 
across state lines to provide information, as-
sistance and guidance regarding victim com-
pensation to hundreds of survivors who call 
California home. 

When there was a mass shooting in April of 
2017 in Fresno County, Julie personally 
helped to provide compensation funding for fu-
nerals for the murdered victims. She also 
aided the Fresno Police Department providing 
resources to better fund future victim assist-
ance services for Fresno County. 

As a past member of the Board of Directors 
and a current member of the National Asso-
ciation of Crime Victim Compensation Board, 
Julie has vocalized the need to ensure violent 
crime victims are aware of the financial sup-
port and services available to them. 

Julie’s persistent support of crime victims is 
unparalleled. Julie is a superb leader and a 
truly compassionate person, who is committed 
to improving the lives of crime victims every-
where. 

Each year the Congressional Victims’ Rights 
Caucus honors outstanding individuals and or-
ganizations for their tireless efforts supporting 
and empowering survivors of crime. Co- 
chaired and co-founded by JIM COSTA (D–CA) 
and myself, the bipartisan caucus advocates 
for crime victims and protects programs that 
provide critical support for related services. 

I am proud to announce Julie Nauman as 
the recipient of the Congressional Victims’ 
Rights Caucus the Suzanne McDaniel Memo-
rial Award for Public Awareness. The Public 
Awareness Award is in memory of Susanne 
McDaniel, one of the first prosecutor-based 
victim advocates in Texas and the nation. 
There is no doubt, Julie has used her voice to 
promote and to bring about change at the Na-
tional level for crime victims. 

And that’s just the way it is. 
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Mr. SCHIFF. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Each year, 
we pay special tribute to the contributions and 
sacrifices made by our nation’s women. It is 
an honor to pay homage to outstanding 
women who are making a difference in my 
Congressional District. I would like to recog-
nize a remarkable woman, Anastasia Mann of 
Hollywood Hills, a unique neighborhood of Los 
Angeles, California. 

Anastasia Mann founded Corniche Travel in 
1987 and successfully launched a new divi-
sion called Anastasia’s Africa in 2004, which 
specializes in customized trips to southern and 

eastern Africa. She later established Corniche 
Entertainment, which provides music and en-
tertainment for private events around the 
world. Alongside the development of her own 
company, Anastasia has taken on several 
leadership roles in the travel industry, locally, 
state-wide, nationally and internationally. She 
is the founding chairman of the West Holly-
wood Visitors and Convention Bureau, and a 
founding member of the California Travel and 
Tourism Commission, where she served two 
terms as the sole representative for all travel 
management agencies in California and 
served on the Executive Committee. In addi-
tion, she is a member of the California Cham-
ber of Commerce and spent ten years on the 
international board of directors of the Travel & 
Tourism Research Association, serving as 
President and Chair. Ms. Mann served as a 
California representative to the White House 
Conference on Tourism during the Clinton Ad-
ministration and was a keynote speaker at 
both the 2003 International Conference on 
Peace through Tourism in Geneva, Switzer-
land and the 2005 IIPT African Conference in 
Lusaka, Zambia. 

In addition to her impressive achievements 
in the travel industry, Ms. Mann is also ac-
tively involved in the community, serving as 
President of the Hollywood Hills West Neigh-
borhood Council and as a Hearing Examiner 
for the Los Angeles Police Department’s 
Board of Rights. She is a long-standing board 
member of the Hollywood Chamber of Com-
merce and was involved with the Hollywood 
Arts Council. Anastasia and her company sup-
port several organizations, including the Fred 
Jordan Mission in downtown Los Angeles, 
Program for Torture Victims, OneLegacy 
Foundation and Disabled American Veterans. 

Ms. Mann’s noble deeds have not been 
overlooked as she has received numerous 
commendations by the Los Angeles City 
Council, Los Angeles Mayor, the Governor of 
California and the United States Senate for 
philanthropy and business achievements. She 
also received the Woman of Achievement 
Award from the Century City Chamber of 
Commerce in 2006, the prestigious Diamond 
Award from the Southern California chapter of 
the American Society of Travel Agents in 2017 
and was the first recipient of the Anastasia K. 
Mann Leadership Award from the Travel and 
Tourism Marketing Association. 

I ask all Members to join me in honoring this 
exceptional, well-respected woman of Califor-
nia’s 28th Congressional District, Anastasia 
Mann. 

f 

BILLIE DEAN 

HON. VAL BUTLER DEMINGS 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mrs. DEMINGS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor the career of Vice Mayor Billie Dean, 
who will retire this month after serving the city 
of Apopka, Florida, for over twenty years. 

Mr. Dean was born and raised in Clermont, 
Florida, across the lake from his current home. 
He attended Jones High School and Eustis 
Vocational High School, and earned a Bach-
elor’s and Master’s degree from Florida A&M 
University. 

Mr. Dean also served our nation with honor 
and courage in the United States Army. A Ko-

rean War veteran, he received a Bronze Star 
for valor. 

After settling in Apopka—where he has lived 
for over 35 years—Mr. Dean became a teach-
er and activist. He has served as a member 
of the Florida League of Cities, a Board Mem-
ber of the Lake Apopka Natural Gas Board, a 
CARET Representative for Land Grant Col-
leges and Universities on behalf of Florida 
A&M University. 

He has been a role model in his community, 
both through his example, and as a member 
of the 100 Black Men of Orlando, Inc., a long- 
term mentoring group for black children. 

An active member and trustee of Mt. Pleas-
ant Missionary Baptist Church in Orlando, he 
has put his faith into practice in his commu-
nity. 

In 1994, Mr. Dean was elected to the 
Apopka City Commission. In 2014, he became 
Vice Mayor—the honor bestowed upon the 
city’s longest-serving Commissioner. 

Mr. Dean was an educator. He knew that 
education is the key to success, and worked 
throughout his life to ready the next generation 
to thrive. He married Isadora Moye Dean, and 
together they have five children and three 
grandchildren. 

In Mr. Dean, our children see a model for 
public, civic, and community service. While 
Apopka will miss him as a Commissioner, I 
am certain that his positive influence on our 
community will be evident for years to come. 
Mr. Speaker, I offer my heartiest congratula-
tions to Mr. Dean upon his retirement. 
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RETIREMENT OF PHIL COYNE 

HON. MICHAEL F. DOYLE 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. MICHAEL F. DOYLE of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today to honor Mr. Phil 
Coyne, a Pittsburgh icon who has just retired 
after eighty-one years of service to our com-
munity as an usher for the Pittsburgh Pirates. 

Phil, the brother of Pittsburgh’s former Con-
gressman Bill Coyne, served generations of 
sports fans during his career, pausing only to 
serve his country in the military for four years 
during World War II. 

At 99, Phil retired with a unique store of 
memories that spanned three different ball-
parks and six thousand games. Arguably the 
Pirates’ biggest loss of the season, Phil leaves 
with his own Pirates jersey sporting the num-
ber 99, and his presence will be felt not only 
by the fans sitting along the third-base line in 
PNC Park, but by the whole city. 

‘‘Phil remains number one on our organiza-
tional seniority list and will always have a 
place on our team,’’ affirmed Pirates President 
Frank Coonelly. 

Phil also ushered at Steelers football games 
until he was 98—and at St. Paul Cathedral 
every Sunday. 

Phil’s long career is unlikely to ever be 
matched or exceeded. 

While Coyne will not be there to usher for 
anyone any longer, he will still listen to games 
and even attend some of them—but now as a 
fan. 

On behalf of Pennsylvania’s 14th Congres-
sional District, I want to commend Phil and 
thank him for his many years of dedication to 
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Pittsburgh sports and his community, and I am 
pleased to honor him as his 100th birthday ap-
proaches. 

f 

MEGAN SCHUELLER 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Megan 
Schueller for receiving the Arvada Wheat 
Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth award. 

Megan Schueller is a student at Warren 
Tech North and received this award because 
her determination and hard work have allowed 
her to overcome adversities. 

The dedication demonstrated by Megan 
Schueller is exemplary of the type of achieve-
ment that can be attained with hard work and 
perseverance. It is essential students at all 
levels strive to make the most of their edu-
cation and develop a work ethic which will 
guide them for the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Megan Schueller for winning the Arvada 
Wheat Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth 
award. I have no doubt she will exhibit the 
same dedication and character in all of her fu-
ture accomplishments. 

f 

RECOGNIZING THE VICTIMS OF 
THE SMOLENSK AIR CRASH 

HON. BRIAN K. FITZPATRICK 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, it is with 
sadness that I join in acknowledging the 
eighth anniversary of the Smolensk Disaster, a 
tragedy that claimed the lives of Polish Presi-
dent Lech Kaczynski, his wife Maria, and 94 
others aboard a government aircraft on April 
10, 2010. Among the victims were high rank-
ing generals and government officials, clergy, 
anti-communist leaders and the family mem-
bers of victims traveling to a ceremony for the 
1940 Katyn Forest Massacre. Also on the 
plane was one American citizen on an official 
mission for the city of Chicago. This week, we 
offer our prayers for the souls of the 96 crash 
victims and honor those who served their 
country. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO BETH FARNSWORTH 
WARD—CALIFORNIA’S 24TH CON-
GRESSIONAL WOMAN OF THE 
YEAR 

HON. SALUD O. CARBAJAL 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. CARBAJAL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Every year, 
we dedicate the month of March to give spe-
cial recognition to the accomplishments and 
sacrifices made by America’s women. I con-
sider it an honor to highlight the extraordinary 
women who are making a difference in my 

District. I would like to recognize one out-
standing woman, Beth Farnsworth Ward, from 
Santa Barbara. 

Beth Farnsworth Ward is an Anchor and 
Reporter for KEYT NewsChannel 3 in Santa 
Barbara. When the Thomas Fire broke out in 
December of 2017 and rapidly spread through 
two counties, Beth stepped up and took the 
lead covering the disaster and its aftermath, 
working tirelessly to bring important stories 
and up-to-date news to affected residents. 

Beth provided vital TV news information for 
our community as evacuations and alerts 
came out from county officials. Her out-
standing leadership and tireless work to help 
residents navigate information, warnings, and 
updates ensured residents all throughout the 
Central Coast were well-informed during the 
largest wildfire in California history and her 
work to keep residents safe cannot be under-
stated. 

She stepped up once again in January, 
when the deadly mudslides left many in 
Montecito in need of resources and informa-
tion. Beth’s tireless devotion, from telling com-
pelling and hard-hitting stories from the field to 
delivering timely news on set was invaluable 
to our community as we joined together as a 
community to recover from two of the worst 
natural disasters our community has faced. 

I am honored to recognize Beth for her 
commitment to our news operation and the 
residents of Santa Barbara county. Her news 
coverage is exemplary of the importance of 
journalism and local reporting to our commu-
nity’s safety and security. 

I ask all Members to join me today in hon-
oring an exceptional woman of California’s 
24th Congressional District, Beth Farnsworth 
Ward, for her incredible service to her commu-
nity. 
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TRIBUTE TO ISA-KAE MEKSIN— 
28TH CONGRESSIONAL DISTRICT 
WOMAN OF THE YEAR 

HON. ADAM B. SCHIFF 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. SCHIFF. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of Women’s History Month. Each year, 
we pay special tribute to the contributions and 
sacrifices made by our nation’s women. It is 
an honor to pay homage to outstanding 
women who are making a difference in my 
congressional district. I would like to recognize 
a remarkable woman, Isa-Kae Meksin of Echo 
Park, a unique neighborhood of Los Angeles, 
California. 

Isa-Kae’s family immigrated to New York 
from the Ukraine where her father was a con-
cert pianist and her mother was a homemaker. 
Growing up, Isa-Kae’s mother taught her to 
question authority and to think on her feet, 
guiding her towards her passion for local poli-
tics and historic preservation. 

While in New York, Ms. Meksin received a 
Bachelor’s Degree from Hunter College and 
soon after worked as a secretary for C.L.R. 
James, the visionary Afro-Trinidadian historian 
and journalist. It was during this time that she 
observed how workers, women, African-Ameri-
cans and youth, were agents of change, and 
it was this work that led her to Los Angeles to 
connect with and observe the activities of the 
local factory workers. 

Isa-Kae moved to California in 1953 where 
she attended California State University, Los 
Angeles and worked towards her teaching cre-
dential. As a teacher in the 1950’s, she dedi-
cated her time to working with students with 
disabilities, specifically the visually impaired, 
and she maintains life-long relationships with 
some of these past students. Ms. Meksin con-
tinued this incredible work for many years until 
she found a new passion: activism. 

In 1978, Isa-Kae worked on opposing the 
discriminatory Briggs Initiative which would 
have banned gays and lesbians, and anyone 
who supported Lesbian Gay Bisexual 
Transgender (LGBT) rights, from working in 
California public schools. As someone who 
fought for and supported the rights of LGBT 
individuals, Isa-Kae testified to the horrific out-
comes of such a potentially divisive initiative 
and how the legislation perpetuated grossly in-
accurate portrayals of homosexuals, and 
through her dedicated efforts and those of oth-
ers, the Briggs Initiative was defeated. 

Isa-Kae continues her activist work by vol-
unteering with various organizations like the 
Watts Gang Task Force, the American Civil 
Liberties Union, the Central City Action Com-
mittee, the Citizens Committee to Save Ely-
sian Park, the Studio for Southern California 
History and many others. Among her many 
accomplishments, Ms. Meksin works with Cali-
fornia State University, Los Angeles to create 
opportunities for homeless youth to attend col-
lege and in 2017, she was awarded the Distin-
guished Educator Award from the university 
for her efforts. 

I ask all Members to join me in honoring this 
exceptional, well-respected woman of Califor-
nia’s 28th Congressional District, Isa-Kae 
Meksin. 

f 

MEGAN RONDINI 

HON. TED POE 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, April 12, 2018 

Mr. POE of Texas. Mr. Speaker, Megan 
Rondini was a young college student at the 
University of Alabama. She was a bright 
young woman with her whole life ahead of 
her. What happened next should have never 
transpired. Megan was raped by a man from 
a rich family in Tuscaloosa, Alabama. After 
Megan managed to escape Bunn by fleeing 
outside a second story window, she headed to 
a hospital for a rape kit. She did everything a 
victim should do. 

But it was here the system began to fail her. 
The hospital did not have a sexual assault fo-
rensic examiner or SAFE on staff, so they had 
nobody trained to properly deal with a sexual 
assault victim or trained to properly collect 
DNA evidence. 

When she went to the police station, she 
was treated with disdain and disbelief, dis-
missed and ignored. The police didn’t believe 
her, and treated her like a criminal. They even 
read her—the victim—her Miranda Rights. 

Megan was failed by the system at every 
turn. Feeling like she had no other option, she 
tragically took her own life. 

The injustices she endured started a na-
tional dialogue about campus sexual assault, 
an issue that is extremely pervasive in our so-
ciety, but one that very few people wanted to 
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