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Washington, D.C., greatly desired the 
opportunity to remember those we 
have lost and pay their respects to the 
approximately 7.3 million Vietnam war 
veterans living today. 

To accommodate, the Vietnam Vet-
erans Memorial Fund built an iconic 
replica of the Vietnam Veterans Memo-
rial. This replica travels across the 
country as part of The Wall That Heals 
exhibit, stopping in approximately 39 
communities each year. The replica is 
375 feet in length, 7.5 feet high at its 
tallest point, and includes 140 panels, 
each engraved with the names of fallen 
United States Armed Forces service-
members who served during the Viet-
nam war. It has been displayed at al-
most 600 communities nationwide. 

There are roughly 7,500 Vietnam vet-
erans living in my district, the 43rd 
Congressional District, alone, and over 
570,000 in the State of California. Cali-
fornia is home to more veterans than 
any other State—almost 2 million. The 
residents of my district and the State 
of California deserve the opportunity 
to say thank you to some of the brav-
est Americans who have ever lived and 
remember those they may have lost. 

I worked with the city of Gardena 
and the Vietnam Veterans Memorial 
Fund for 2 years to bring the replica to 
my district, and I am so happy to say 
that we recently succeeded. This past 
weekend, The Wall That Heals arrived 
in one of my cities, the city of Gar-
dena, California, to a welcoming crowd 
of hundreds who came to pay their re-
spects and honor Vietnam veterans. 

In my opinion, full and appropriate 
recognition of our Vietnam veterans is 
long overdue. The war often separated 
friends and families, both physically 
and politically, and created divisions 
which have taken years to heal. Many 
veterans have spoken about how dif-
ficult this was and how much harder 
this made the healing process. 

No matter what you may have felt 
about the war, we should all honor the 
sacrifice made by our veterans who an-
swered their country’s call, who served, 
and who sacrificed. 

This country should be and is hon-
ored to acknowledge and express appre-
ciation for the sacrifices Vietnam vet-
erans and their families made, both 
during their service and over the many 
years since. The Vietnam Veterans Me-
morial, The Wall That Heals, and the 
dozens of local museums and memo-
rials allow us to pay proper respect to 
and commemorate our Vietnam vet-
erans. 

I have just introduced a resolution in 
recognition of the Vietnam Veterans 
Memorial, its traveling replica, which 
is one part of The Wall That Heals ex-
hibit, and the Vietnam veterans for 
their devotion to neighbor, commu-
nity, and country. 

I say once again: Welcome home, 
Vietnam veterans. 
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HONORING MASTER SERGEANT 
WILLIAM R. POSCH 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Florida (Mr. RUTHERFORD) for 5 min-
utes. 

Mr. RUTHERFORD. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to honor the life of Master 
Sergeant William R. ‘‘Bill’’ Posch, who 
died on March 15, 2018, while serving 
his country in Iraq. 

His dedication to this Nation and its 
freedom will never be forgotten. Mas-
ter Sergeant Posch spent his life help-
ing others. As a teenager, he worked as 
a lifeguard for Jacksonville Beach 
Ocean Rescue, where he developed his 
passion for search-and-rescue missions. 
At the age of 15, he saved the life of a 
surfer who was drowning after having a 
seizure in the water. After this experi-
ence, he knew he wanted to join the 
military after he graduated from 
Fletcher High School. 

When he was just 17, he told the local 
newspaper that after graduation he was 
going to enlist with the intent of be-
coming a rescue swimmer. And he did 
just that. Master Sergeant Posch was 
an Air Force Reserve pararescueman 
assigned to the 308th Rescue Squadron, 
known as the Guardian Angel Airmen, 
at Patrick Air Force Base. This squad-
ron is one of the most deployed in the 
Air Force Reserve, and this was re-
flected in the important missions that 
Master Sergeant Posch carried out. 

In his time with the Air Force, Mas-
ter Sergeant Posch completed 143 com-
bat missions, led a crisis evacuation of 
more than 126 Americans from the U.S. 
Embassy in South Sudan, and assisted 
with the rescue mission in Texas in the 
wake of Hurricane Harvey. The Air 
Force awarded him many medals, in-
cluding the Air Medal with silver oak 
leaf cluster, the Aerial Achievement 
Medal, the Air Force Commendation 
Medal of Valor, and he was also named 
one of the Air Force’s 12 outstanding 
airmen of 2014. 

He courageously served our Nation 
for 18 years, and we in northeast Flor-
ida will always be proud to call him 
one of our own. I salute Master Ser-
geant William R. Posch on his years of 
service and sacrifice to our country. He 
will forever be remembered as an 
American hero. May God bless him and 
our Nation. 
RECOGNIZING MALIA DOMINGO FOR HER SELEC-

TION AS A FLORIDA OUTSTANDING SCHOOL 
VOLUNTEER 
Mr. RUTHERFORD. Mr. Speaker, I 

rise today to honor Malia Domingo of 
Yulee, Florida. Malia was recently 
named one of Florida’s outstanding 
school volunteers for 2017 and 2018 by 
the Florida Department of Education. 

She began her volunteer work in the 
sixth grade, earning 350 volunteer 
hours over the course of that school 
year. Malia first started volunteering 
at Yulee Primary School, working in 
four different kindergarten classrooms, 
aiding students with the accelerated 
reader program. 

In addition to this, Malia has worked 
with students who have special needs, 
spending hours with many students 
one-on-one to increase their learning. 
Malia also dedicated her time in the 
summer to the students with special 
needs by volunteering in an extended 
school year program. 

Malia is now in the 11th grade at 
Yulee High School, and in addition to 
being named one of the State’s out-
standing school volunteers, she was re-
cently honored by Nassau County as 
the youth volunteer of the year. 

I want to congratulate Malia Do-
mingo for her 6 years of community 
service and her dedication to improv-
ing the lives of all those she helps. 
Malia is a great role model for her fel-
low students, and she has made the 
Fourth District of Florida very proud. 
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HONORING AND THANKING THE 
PATRIOT GUARD RIDERS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
New York (Mr. ZELDIN) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. ZELDIN. Mr. Speaker, today I 
rise to honor and thank the Patriot 
Guard Riders, who live on Long Island 
and all across our country. The Patriot 
Guard Riders, a nonprofit organization, 
consists of a diverse group of motor-
cycle enthusiasts and patriots who 
share a deep appreciation and commit-
ment to honoring our U.S. servicemem-
bers, veterans, and their families. 

Rooted in their unwavering patriot-
ism and respect for our Nation’s mili-
tary men and women, the Patriot 
Guard Riders go above and beyond 
daily to ensure everyone, from our Na-
tion’s veterans to our communities’ 
first responders and their families, re-
ceive the appreciation they deserve. 

When a veteran arrives at Calverton 
National Cemetery for burial in my 
district, the Patriot Guard Riders are 
there. On Veterans Day, Memorial Day, 
the Fourth of July, and 9/11 events, the 
Patriot Guard Riders are there. When 
our communities’ veterans are return-
ing from their Honor Flight trips to 
Washington, D.C., our Patriot Guard 
Riders are there. No matter rain or 
shine or snow, whether it is freezing 
cold or scorching hot, the Patriot 
Guard Riders are there. 

Last month, our Nation lost seven 
airmen in the line of duty, four of 
whom were from the 106th Rescue Wing 
on Long Island. As their families gath-
ered at Gabreski Air National Guard 
Base to receive their sons, brothers, 
husbands, and our heroes, several dozen 
Patriot Guard Riders gathered to es-
cort these fallen airmen from the base. 
It is in these moments, the most dif-
ficult moments in the lives of the fami-
lies of these fallen airmen, when the 
Patriot Guard Riders, as detailed in 
their motto, stand for those who stood 
for us. 

The family members of these fallen 
servicemembers may not know the 
names of these Patriot Guard Riders, 
but recognition is not what drives 
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