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Strategy and Army commitments worldwide, 
and providing mission-critical forces and capa-
bilities in direct support of America’s active 
duty forces. 

Through two World Wars, the Cold War, 
Korea, Vietnam, the Persian Gulf War, the 
Global War on Terror and countless other cri-
ses, operations and emergencies, the Army 
Reserve has never failed to answer the Na-
tion’s call. 

Today our Nation faces new threats, from 
multiple sources, that challenge U.S. military 
dominance across every domain. And again, 
the Army Reserve is rising to the challenge, 
creating a Ready Force of units and individual 
Soldiers postured to move fast, engage quick-
ly, and win decisively on the battlefields of 
today and tomorrow. 

The world is rapidly changing but one thing 
is constant: The Army Reserve will remain the 
dedicated federal reserve of the most decisive 
and lethal land force in the world—ready now, 
shaping tomorrow; forging the most capable, 
combat-ready and lethal Army Reserve in U.S. 
history. And so, I wish the Army Reserve an-
other Happy Birthday, and many more years 
of success. 

f 

CELEBRATING THE 100TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF THE BOYNE DIS-
TRICT LIBRARY 

HON. JACK BERGMAN 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Mr. BERGMAN. Mr. Speaker, it’s my honor 
to recognize the Boyne District Library upon 
the occasion of its 100th Anniversary. Through 
its trusted service, reliable staff, and commu-
nity investment, the Boyne District Library has 
become an indispensable part of Northern 
Michigan. 

Opened in April 1918 with a grant from the 
Carnegie Corporation, the private book collec-
tion of a Petoskey lawyer, and an incredibly 
determined staff, the library grew into the local 
institution it is today. Over the course of 100 
years, the Boyne District Library forged its 
path to success while maintaining its commit-
ment to the community it was built upon. 
Today, the library still stands at its original 
spot on the corner of Park and Main Street in 
Boyne City. 

To celebrate its 100th Anniversary, the li-
brary has issued a challenge to patrons of all 
ages to read 100 books over the course of the 
year. Additionally, it hosted an event in Feb-
ruary which included a presentation on the 
history of the Boyne District Library—from the 
original grant application in 1916 to the 
present. Later this summer, the anniversary 
will continue to be celebrated through events 
like an ice cream social and bookmobile visit. 
Day after day, the Boyne District Library con-
tinues to set a positive example of what can 
be achieved when the people of a community 
work together for the common good. 

Mr. Speaker, it’s my honor to congratulate 
the Boyne District Library and its staff for 100 
years of success, service, and community in-
vestment. Michiganders can take great pride 
in knowing the First District is home to such 
dedicated citizens. On behalf of my constitu-
ents, I wish the Boyne District Library all the 
best in its future endeavors. 

COMMUNITY ASSOCIATIONS PRO-
VIDE VALUE TO RESIDENTS AND 
LOCAL GOVERNMENTS 

HON. PETE SESSIONS 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Mr. SESSIONS. Mr. Speaker, community 
associations are an expanding phenomenon 
and the preferred form of new residential de-
velopments approved by local governments 
across this country. These developments con-
sist of planned communities in the form of 
condominiums, cooperatives, and single-family 
homes. Local governments appreciate these 
developments because they offer residents 
private amenities such as pools, sport courts, 
parks, walking trails, and other amenities that 
would otherwise be provided and maintained 
with public dollars. In fact, an estimated $88 
billion is collected annually in dues from com-
munity association residents to pay for essen-
tial association obligations including the instal-
lation and maintenance of amenities. 

The growth of planned communities is 
showcasing a residency choice selected by 
more and more Americans each year. As of 
2017, approximately 70 million Americans re-
side in nearly 350,000 community associations 
across the country. Residents enjoy this type 
of living for a number of reasons including a 
sense of community, access to aforemen-
tioned private amenities, enforcement of aes-
thetic standards set by the community, and 
regular maintenance of common areas. With 
democratically elected resident board mem-
bers who volunteer to serve their community, 
this is arguably the most local form of govern-
ment (quasi) that exists. Related to this, an 
estimated 2.36 million residents volunteer for 
service on their community’s board of directors 
or other committees performing 80 million 
hours of volunteer service valued at $1.93 bil-
lion. Those are significant numbers. 

The financial benefit enjoyed by residents in 
planned communities is that home values are 
historically four to five percent higher than 
homes that are not in planned communities. 
That translates into the positive protection of 
property values in these communities and a 
higher return on investment when it comes 
time for owners to sell. 

Mr. Speaker, it is worth noting that approxi-
mately half of these communities are self- 
managed either with just volunteers or profes-
sional staff hired and managed directly by the 
association’s board of directors. The rest of 
these associations hire professional manage-
ment companies to manage the operation of 
their communities and/or their finances and 
provide counsel to the board of directors. 

Personally, I’m proud of the fact that the 
largest community association management 
company, Associa, is headquartered in Dallas, 
Texas, in my Congressional District. Associa 
employs nearly 10,000 people across North 
America in 180 office locations operating in 35 
states as well as Canada and Mexico. Associa 
manages roughly 10,000 communities, com-
prising more than 2.5 million units, and hous-
ing more than 5 million residents. Associa is a 
privately-owned company that was started by 
John Carona more than 40 years ago and he 
continues to lead the industry with constant in-
novation and unparalleled customer service. 
John is not only a successful businessman, 

but he is a humble public servant having 
served 24 years in the Texas State Legisla-
ture. I am proud to call him a supporter and 
friend of mine. 

Mr. Speaker, I offer these comments today 
because as community associations continue 
to grow they also continue to evolve as does 
the community association management in-
dustry. I am pleased that management compa-
nies like Associa are not satisfied with busi-
ness-as-usual but rather choose to invest in 
world-class employee training and cutting 
edge technologies for their clients. By doing 
so, they help ensure well-run community asso-
ciations and well-informed board members 
and residents. I extend my appreciation to 
Associa’s employees and to the volunteers in 
community associations around the country for 
their service to their clients and communities. 

f 

HONORING THE 70TH ANNIVER-
SARY OF THE STATE OF ISRAEL 

HON. BRAD R. WENSTRUP 
OF OHIO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Mr. WENSTRUP. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
honor our friend and ally, Israel, on its recent 
Independence Day. 70 years ago, after cen-
turies of expulsions, pogroms, prejudice, and 
persecution, the Jewish people celebrated 
their return to Israel and the establishment of 
a land where they could live in peace and 
prosperity. 

We are all too aware that Israel has repeat-
edly faced grave threats to this peace, and 
must regularly defend its very existence 
against those who would destroy her. Despite 
these threats, for the last seven decades, the 
Israeli people have stood strong in defense of 
freedom and democracy, and built a thriving 
nation. After this historic anniversary, let us in 
the United States Congress reaffirm our com-
mitment to our ally. Since its independence, 
our nations have had a special relationship, 
deeply rooted in shared democratic principles 
and values. 

Our nations are both free and vibrant de-
mocracies, and together, we can create a 
safer world. We live in dangerous times, with 
enemies who threaten Americans and Israelis 
alike. Our joint counterterrorism and military 
efforts are essential for the prosperity of both 
of our nations. Mr. Speaker, on behalf of this 
member of the House of Representatives, I 
would like to congratulate Israel on their 70th 
anniversary and reaffirm our commitment: 
Israel, we stand with you. 

f 

ALEXIS RUNNING BEAR 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Alexis Run-
ning Bear for receiving the Arvada Wheat 
Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth award. 

Alexis Running Bear is a student at Jeffer-
son High School and received this award be-
cause her determination and hard work have 
allowed her to overcome adversities. 
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The dedication demonstrated by Alexis Run-

ning Bear is exemplary of the type of achieve-
ment that can be attained with hard work and 
perseverance. It is essential students at all 
levels strive to make the most of their edu-
cation and develop a work ethic which will 
guide them for the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Alexis Running Bear for winning the Arvada 
Wheat Ridge Service Ambassadors for Youth 
award. I have no doubt she will exhibit the 
same dedication and character in all of her fu-
ture accomplishments. 

f 

COMMEMORATING THE HONOR-
ABLE BARBARA LEE FOR 20 
YEARS OF SERVICE IN THE U.S. 
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

HON. ZOE LOFGREN 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Ms. LOFGREN. Mr. Speaker, I rise with my 
colleagues, Congressman PETE AGUILAR, Con-
gresswoman KAREN BASS, Congresswoman 
NANETTE BARRAGÁN, Congressman AMI BERA, 
Congresswoman JULIA BROWNLEY, Congress-
man SALUD CARBAJAL, Congressman TONY 
CÁRDENAS, Congresswoman JUDY CHU, Con-
gressman LOU CORREA, Congressman JIM 
COSTA, Congresswoman SUSAN DAVIS, Con-
gressman MARK DESAULNIER, Congress-
woman ANNA ESHOO, Congressman JOHN 
GARAMENDI, Congressman JIMMY GOMEZ, Con-
gressman JARED HUFFMAN, Congressman RO 
KHANNA, Congressman TED LIEU, Congress-
man ALAN LOWENTHAL, Congresswoman 
DORIS MATSUI, Congressman JERRY MCNER-
NEY, Congresswoman GRACE NAPOLITANO, 
Congressman JIMMY PANETTA, Congress-
woman NANCY PELOSI, Congressman SCOTT 
PETERS, Congresswoman LUCILLE ROYBAL- 
ALLARD, Congressman RAUL RUIZ, Congress-
woman LINDA SÁNCHEZ, Congressman ADAM 
SCHIFF, Congressman BRAD SHERMAN, Con-
gresswoman JACKIE SPEIER, Congressman 
ERIC SWALWELL, Congressman MARK TAKANO, 
Congressman MIKE THOMPSON, Congress-
woman NORMA TORRES, Congressman JUAN 
VARGAS, and Congresswoman MAXINE 
WATERS, to commemorate my distinguished 
colleague, the Honorable BARBARA LEE, as 
she celebrates her 20th anniversary in the 
United States House of Representatives. 

Throughout her career representing the East 
Bay of California, Congresswoman BARBARA 
LEE has fought to turn our nation’s promise of 
peace, equality and justice for all into a reality. 
Her legislative accomplishments are many and 
varied, but they are all rooted in the universal 
goal of uplifting the marginalized and under-
represented. She has been relentless in her 
commitment to addressing and alleviating pov-
erty, ending the HIV/AIDS pandemic, and ad-
vancing a vision of U.S. foreign policy that ac-
tively promotes global peace and security. 

As a young working mother who relied on 
public assistance while raising her sons, Con-
gresswoman LEE knows firsthand the chal-
lenges faced by those living in poverty. She 
has rightly called out the moral atrocity that is 
America’s epidemic of poverty. Since 2013, 
she has served as Chair of the Democratic 
Whip’s Task Force on Poverty, Income In-
equality, and Opportunity, which is finding so-

lutions to end the scourge of poverty. Con-
gresswoman LEE has also made addressing 
institutionalized racism and racial wealth dis-
parities a cornerstone of her approach. On the 
Appropriations Committee, she works tirelessly 
to protect and expand programs like unem-
ployment insurance, housing assistance, child 
care, the Earned Income Tax Credit (EITC) 
and Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Pro-
gram (SNAP). 

Congresswoman LEE has also been a con-
sistent force for ending HIV/AIDS domestically 
and globally. She has authored or co-spon-
sored every major piece of legislation dealing 
with the AIDS crisis since entering Congress, 
including bills to establish the Global Fund to 
Fight AIDS, Tuberculosis, and Malaria and the 
President’s Emergency Plan for AIDS Relief 
(PEPFAR). Due to this groundbreaking legisla-
tion, the United States is a world leader in re-
sponding to the HIV/AIDS pandemic and end-
ing this public health emergency for good. 

Congresswoman BARBARA LEE is also a 
leading voice for global peace and security. 
She is best known for her brave lone opposi-
tion to the open-ended 2001 Authorization for 
the Use of Military Force that passed by Con-
gress just three days after the September 11th 
attacks. Her foresight in predicting that this 
war authorization would be used as a blank 
check for perpetual war has proved prescient; 
today, this AUMF remains the legal basis for 
more than 40 military operations around the 
world. 16 years later, Congresswoman LEE re-
mains persistent in her efforts to repeal the 
AUMF, and last year achieved a historic vic-
tory when her repeal bill was adopted by a bi-
partisan and nearly unanimous vote of the Ap-
propriations Committee. 

Congresswoman LEE has fought to strength-
en ties with countries around the world—serv-
ing three times as the U.S. Congressional 
Representative to the United Nations. Her 
decades of persistent advocacy for normal-
izing relations with Cuba was integral to the 
re-opening of the U.S. embassy on the island. 
Through her position on the State and Foreign 
Operations Appropriations Subcommittee, 
Congresswoman LEE has been a vocal cham-
pion of soft power initiatives, securing life-
saving funding for foreign development, nutri-
tion and health care programs. Her leadership 
positions in Congress include: Vice Chair of 
the Democratic Steering and Policy Committee 
(2017–present), Vice Chair and founding 
member of the LGBT Equality Caucus, Co- 
Founder and Co-Chair of the Congressional 
HIV/AIDS Caucus, and Co-Chair of the Sudan 
and South Sudan Caucus. 

She is the former chair (2008–2010) of the 
Congressional Black Caucus, a former co- 
chair of the Congressional Progressive Cau-
cus, and a member of the Congressional 
Asian Pacific American Caucus, where she 
serves as co-Chair of the Health Care Task 
Force. Congresswoman LEE is a member of 
the Appropriations Committee and the Budget 
Committee, and previously served on the 
Banking, International Relations, Financial 
Services, and Foreign Affairs committees. 

Congresswoman BARBARA LEE’s extraor-
dinary work makes her an invaluable member 
of Congress. Today we celebrate her passion, 
commitment, and dedication to public service 
these past 20 years, and express our admira-
tion that she remains a renegade for peace 
and justice. We send her our highest regards 
and best wishes as she crosses this incredible 
milestone. 

REMEMBERING THE LIFE OF 
EDWIN ‘‘DAVID’’ COLWELL 

HON. TIM RYAN 
OF OHIO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 24, 2018 

Mr. RYAN of Ohio. Mr. Speaker, today I rise 
to remember the life of Edwin ‘‘David’’ Colwell, 
87, who passed away on Sunday, April 15, 
2018. 

David was born on March 14, 1931 in 
Vinton, Ohio to the late Everett and Grace 
Colwell, nee Kincaid. He was a proud OSU 
grad, and the first college grad in his family. 
He was in ROTC/Air Force and after gradua-
tion served as a pilot flying over the Sea of 
Japan to bring food to our armed forces in 
Korea after the end of the Korean War. 

After his honorable discharge as a Captain, 
David returned to Ohio and married his first 
wife Janice Fike in Ashland, Ohio. They had 2 
dear daughters, Cappi and Camilla. After 22 
years of marriage, Janice passed in 1983. 
Professionally, David began his career with 
The Kroger Company, first in the bakery, then 
through the ranks until he headed up the 
‘‘Cookies, Crackers and Snacks Division’’, 
which was very popular with the kids in the 
neighborhood. It was during this time, during 
the early ’70s that David began developing his 
real estate business, focusing on housing for 
Ohio State students. E. David’s Properties 
continues to house students annually. It has 
housed thousands over almost 40 years. 
David was a very popular landlord, receiving 
Valentine’s Day cards and invitations to his 
renters’ graduation parties. He loved the stu-
dents and was so proud of their accomplish-
ments! 

David enjoyed travelling the world with his 
wife Jolene, knowing no stranger, relishing dif-
ferent cultures and traditions, and always 
ready to plan the next trip. They loved Europe, 
particularly Poland and the Czech Republic, 
and their 30 years of beach vacations in Mex-
ico where they had so many loving friends. 
There was no more passionate an OSU sports 
fan than David. He held season tickets for 
football and basketball. He and his best bud, 
Harvey, were always sure that their coaching 
expertise could help the Bucks win! 

For 30 years, David has been married to 
Jolene Moritz Molitoris who is a friend of mine 
and long-time public servant and transpor-
tation leader. Jolene was an official at the 
Ohio Department of Transportation when 
President Clinton appointed her as the Admin-
istrator of the Federal Railroad Administration 
and later she served as Director of the Ohio 
Department of Transportation. 

There was no more passionate a family 
man than David. He was so proud of all the 
family accomplishments. He so loved his fam-
ily. He will be missed beyond imagining by his 
wife Jolene; and his children, Cappi, Camilla, 
spouse, Harold, Jill, Jay, spouse, Catherine; 
grandchildren, Calina, Devin and Ellis; and his 
sister, Catherine; and his beloved dogs, Choo 
Choo and Teddy. 

I extend my sincerest condolences to his 
family and friends. 
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