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force and Navy. He served as an admis-
sions officer at the U.S. Naval Acad-
emy; the technical assistant to the di-
rector of Naval Nuclear Propulsion; the 
nuclear officer program manager and 
submarine officer community manager 
on the staff of the Deputy Chief of 
Naval Operations, Manpower, Per-
sonnel, Training, and Education; the 
prospective commanding officer in-
structor for the Pacific submarine 
force; and the chief of the program and 
budget branch on the Joint Staff, Pro-
gram and Budget Analysis Division. 
His current assignment as director of 
the Navy’s Appropriations Matters Of-
fice, FMBE, exposed him to the widest 
possible view of the Department of the 
Navy’s budgetary requirements within 
the broader context of the national de-
fense arena, preparing him well for fu-
ture leadership at the highest levels of 
our Navy. 

As Admiral Dollaga departs the Pen-
tagon for his next assignment, I want 
to take this opportunity to urge my 
colleagues to join me in extending our 
congratulations to him on his pro-
motion; to thank him, his wife, Lani, 
and his family for their years of serv-
ice; and to wish him ‘‘fair winds and 
following seas’’ as he continues to lead 
our Navy in the years ahead. 

Thank you. 
f 

ADDITIONAL STATEMENTS 

TRIBUTE TO SOPHIA VELLA 
∑ Mr. BARRASSO. Mr. President, I 
would like to take the opportunity to 
express my appreciation to Sophia for 
her hard work as an intern in the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public 
Works. I recognize her efforts and con-
tributions to my office, as well as to 
the State of Wyoming. 

Sophia is a native of Virginia. She is 
a student at Virginia Polytechnic and 
State University, where she is studying 
political science and foreign affairs. 
She has demonstrated a strong work 
ethic, which has made her an invalu-
able asset to our office. The quality of 
her work is reflected in her great ef-
forts over the last several months. 

I want to thank Sophia for the dedi-
cation she has shown while working for 
me and my staff. It was a pleasure to 
have her as part of our team. I know 
she will have continued success with 
all of her future endeavors. I wish her 
all my best on her next journey.∑ 

f 

SESQUICENTENNIAL OF ALTOONA, 
IOWA 

∑ Mrs. ERNST. Mr. President, today I 
wish to recognize the city of Altoona, 
IA, which was founded 150 years ago. 

Originally named because of its loca-
tion as the highest point—or altitude— 
on the Des Moines Valley Railroad, Al-
toona has continued to reach for new 
heights since its plot was recorded in 
1868. Altoona has come a long way from 
its turn of the century, coal-mining 
identity. 

Today Altoona is home to Iowa’s pre-
mier entertainment destinations, with 
seemingly unlimited potential ahead. 
While Altoona’s numerous regional at-
tractions may define the landscape of 
the city, there is no doubt it is the peo-
ple of Altoona who define its fabric. 
Over the years, Altoona’s leadership 
has never forgotten its roots, and de-
spite world-class amenities and contig-
uous proximity to Iowa’s capital and 
largest city, Altoona continues to 
maintain that small town feeling that 
Iowans know and love. 

There is no better place in America 
to raise a family than Iowa, and Al-
toona is a shining example of why. I in-
vite my colleagues in the U.S. Senate 
to join me in congratulating the city of 
Altoona on their sesquicentennial, and 
I wish them another 150 prosperous 
years.∑ 

f 

10TH ANNIVERSARY OF JUPITER 
INLET LIGHTHOUSE OUT-
STANDING NATURAL AREA 

∑ Mr. NELSON. Mr. President, today 
marks a special day. It is the 10th anni-
versary of the designation of the Jupi-
ter Inlet Lighthouse Outstanding Nat-
ural Area. This 120-acre site in Palm 
Beach County, FL, contains invaluable 
historic and cultural resources, includ-
ing an archaeological record showing 
continuous Native American settle-
ment dating back 5,000 years. 

Every year, tens of thousands of visi-
tors enjoy tours of the restored 1860 Ju-
piter Inlet Lighthouse and historical 
grounds, which include the 1892 George 
Washington Tindall House. 

The Federal designation also protects 
the area’s rich natural environment 
along the Indian River Lagoon, which 
provides habitat for over two dozen 
State or federally listed species, from 
the West Indian manatee to the Florida 
scrub jay. 

A decade ago, I filed legislation to 
protect this special area, and on May 8, 
2008, President George W. Bush signed 
it into law, Public Law 110–229. To this 
day, the Jupiter Inlet Lighthouse Out-
standing Natural Area remains the 
only unit of the 34-million-acre Na-
tional Landscape Conservation System 
east of the Mississippi River. 

I would like to commend the many 
partners who help the Department of 
the Interior take care of this heritage 
landmark, including the Loxahatchee 
River Historical Society, Palm Beach 
County, the town of Jupiter, the vil-
lage of Tequesta, and the U.S. Coast 
Guard. Together, we have ensured this 
area will be preserved for future gen-
erations.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO KELLIE MORFORD 
∑ Mr. ROUNDS. Mr. President, today I 
recognize Kellie Morford, an intern in 
my Washington, DC, office, for all the 
hard work she has done on behalf of 
myself, my staff, and the State of 
South Dakota. 

Kellie is a graduate of Spearfish High 
School in Spearfish, SD. Recently, she 

graduated from Chadron State College 
in Chadron, NE, where she studied 
criminal justice and legal studies. 
Kellie is a dedicated and diligent work-
er who has been devoted to getting the 
most out of her internship experience 
and who has been a true asset to the of-
fice. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Kellie for all of the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO NATALEE DEAETTE 

∑ Mr. SANDERS. Mr. President, I 
would like to recognize a remarkable 
Vermonter, Natalee Deaette, who was 
recently selected as a 2018 Truman 
scholar. Natalee is one of just 59 out-
standing college students from across 
the country who was honored this year 
by the Harry S. Truman Scholarship 
Foundation with this prestigious grad-
uate fellowship for young people who 
are pursuing careers as public service 
leaders. 

Natalee is a member of Boston Col-
lege’s class of 2019, where she studies 
applied psychology and human develop-
ment, with a focus on community ad-
vocacy and social policy and a minor in 
managing for social impact. She is in-
volved in BC’s Undergraduate Govern-
ment and Emerging Leader Program, 
the McGillycuddy Logue Fellows Pro-
gram, the Montserrat Coalition, Appa-
lachia Volunteers, and the Global Med-
ical Brigades. These are all very nota-
ble activities and achievements that 
demonstrate the depth of Natalee’s 
commitment to her community. 

What makes Natalee’s story all the 
more impressive is that she broke 
through significant barriers to get to 
this place in her life. Natalee is a na-
tive of the most rural and economi-
cally challenged area of Vermont, 
where college graduation rates are well 
below the State and national averages. 
She is herself a first-generation college 
student and understands just how dif-
ficult it can be to navigate the world of 
higher education. 

While in high school, Natalee greatly 
benefited from participating in John-
son State College’s acclaimed Upward 
Bound program, which helps motivated 
first-generation high school students 
prepare for college success. The experi-
ence so influenced Natalee that she has 
worked for the program for the past 3 
years. She also credits Upward Bound 
for inspiring her to pursue a career in 
public service and addressing edu-
cational inequity among disadvantaged 
youth, particularly those from rural 
areas. 

I, like many Vermonters, am enor-
mously proud of all that Natalee has 
already accomplished, and we look for-
ward to what she will achieve in the fu-
ture. I join with Natalee’s friends and 
family in congratulating her for being 
named a Truman scholar and wishing 
her the best of luck in her future en-
deavors.∑ 
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RECOGNIZING CALLIE’S BISCUITS 

∑ Mr. SCOTT. Mr. President, today it 
is my pleasure to honor Callie’s Bis-
cuits, a small business in Charleston, 
SC, that serves up homemade, nation-
ally recognized biscuits. 

Callie’s was founded in 2005 by Carrie 
Morey to bring her mother Callie’s bis-
cuit recipe to folks across the country. 
I had a chance to meet Carrie in per-
son, and there is no question that she 
exudes the exact traits required of 
someone determined to run a pros-
perous business. Today the company 
has since expanded to three locations, 
including Charleston’s Upper King Dis-
trict and the Charleston City Market. 
Her goal was to build a business around 
her passion for southern food while cre-
ating a healthy environment for her to 
still spend time with her family. When 
Carrie first started the company, she 
only used part-time help. She now em-
ploys 65 people who help her carry out 
her business’s day-to-day operations, 
while keeping the tradition of southern 
biscuit-making alive. 

The story of Callie’s Biscuits is ex-
emplary of the American entrepre-
neurial spirit that we are honoring dur-
ing National Small Business Week. 
Callie’s and other small businesses play 
a critical and unique role in our na-
tional economy and our communities. 
Carrie’s success has brought great joy 
to South Carolinians and has garnered 
national recognition for her biscuits. 

Carrie also gives back to her commu-
nity; she is a guest lecturer at the Col-
lege of Charleston Business School’s 
entrepreneurship classes and serves as 
an adviser to innovators at a baking 
incubator she operates. In this role, she 
advises these entrepreneurs on both 
baking and operating a small business. 
I would like to congratulate Carrie and 
all the employees of Callie’s Biscuits 
for the positive impact they are mak-
ing in the lowcountry and beyond, and 
I wish them continued success in their 
business.∑ 

f 

MESSAGES FROM THE PRESIDENT 

Messages from the President of the 
United States were communicated to 
the Senate by Ms. Ridgway, one of his 
secretaries. 

f 

PRESIDENTIAL MESSAGES 

TEXT OF AN AGREEMENT BE-
TWEEN THE GOVERNMENT OF 
THE UNITED STATES OF AMER-
ICA AND THE GOVERNMENT OF 
THE UNITED MEXICAN STATES 
FOR COOPERATION IN PEACEFUL 
USES OF NUCLEAR ENERGY—PM 
34 

The PRESIDING OFFICER laid be-
fore the Senate the following message 
from the President of the United 
States, together with accompanying 
reports and papers, which was referred 
to the Committee on Foreign Rela-
tions: 

To the Congress of the United States: 
I am pleased to transmit to the Con-

gress, pursuant to subsections 123 b. 
and 123 d. of the Atomic Energy Act of 
1954, as amended (42 U.S.C. 2153(b), (d)) 
(the ‘‘Act’’), the text of an Agreement 
between the Government of the United 
States of America and the Government 
of the United Mexican States for Co-
operation in Peaceful Uses of Nuclear 
Energy (the ‘‘Agreement’’). I am also 
pleased to transmit my written ap-
proval, authorization, and determina-
tion concerning the Agreement and an 
unclassified Nuclear Proliferation As-
sessment Statement (NPAS) con-
cerning the Agreement. In accordance 
with section 123 of the Act, a classified 
annex to the NPAS, prepared by the 
Secretary of State, in consultation 
with the Director of National Intel-
ligence, summarizing relevant classi-
fied information, will be submitted to 
the Congress separately. A joint memo-
randum submitted to me by the Secre-
taries of State and Energy and a letter 
from the Chairman of the Nuclear Reg-
ulatory Commission stating the views 
of the Commission are also enclosed. 
An addendum to the NPAS containing 
a comprehensive analysis of the export 
control system of Mexico with respect 
to nuclear-related matters, including 
interactions with other countries of 
proliferation concern and the actual or 
suspected nuclear, dual-use, or missile- 
related transfers to such countries, 
pursuant to section 102A(w) of the Na-
tional Security Act of 1947 (50 U.S.C. 
3024(w)), is being submitted separately 
by the Director of National Intel-
ligence. 

The Agreement has been negotiated 
in accordance with the Act and other 
applicable law. In my judgment, it 
meets all applicable statutory require-
ments and will advance the non-
proliferation and other foreign policy 
interests of the United States. 

The Agreement contains all of the 
provisions required by subsection 123 a. 
of the Act. It provides a comprehensive 
framework for peaceful nuclear co-
operation with Mexico based on a mu-
tual commitment to nuclear non-
proliferation. It would permit the 
transfer of material, equipment (in-
cluding reactors), components, and in-
formation for nuclear research and nu-
clear power production. It would not 
permit the transfer of Restricted Data 
or sensitive nuclear technology. Any 
special fissionable material transferred 
could only be in the form of low en-
riched uranium, with the exception of 
small quantities of material for use in 
samples, standards, detectors, or tar-
gets or for such other purposes as the 
parties may agree. 

Through the Agreement, Mexico 
would affirm its intent to rely on exist-
ing international markets for nuclear 
fuel services involving sensitive nu-
clear technologies (i.e. enrichment and 
reprocessing), and the United States 
would affirm its intent to support 
these international markets and would 
agree to endeavor to take necessary 

and feasible actions to ensure a reli-
able supply of low enriched uranium 
fuel to Mexico. 

The Agreement has a term of 30 
years, although it can be terminated 
by either party on one year’s advance 
written notice. In the event of termi-
nation or expiration of the Agreement, 
key nonproliferation conditions and 
controls will continue in effect as long 
as any material, equipment, or compo-
nent subject to the Agreement remains 
in the territory of the party concerned 
or under its jurisdiction or control 
anywhere, or until such time as the 
parties agree that such material, 
equipment, or components are no 
longer usable for any nuclear activity 
relevant from the point of view of safe-
guards. 

Mexico has a strong track record on 
nonproliferation and has consistently 
reiterated its commitment to non-
proliferation. It is a party to the Trea-
ty on the Non-Proliferation of Nuclear 
Weapons and has concluded a Com-
prehensive Safeguards Agreement and 
Additional Protocol with the Inter-
national Atomic Energy Agency. Mex-
ico has a strong system of nuclear ex-
port controls and has harmonized its 
controls with the Nuclear Suppliers 
Group guidelines. A more detailed dis-
cussion of Mexico’s domestic civil nu-
clear activities and its nuclear non-
proliferation policies and practices is 
provided in the NPAS and its classified 
annex. 

I have considered the views and rec-
ommendations of the interested depart-
ments and agencies in reviewing the 
Agreement and have determined that 
its performance will promote, and will 
not constitute an unreasonable risk to, 
the common defense and security. Ac-
cordingly, I have approved the Agree-
ment and authorized its execution and 
urge that the Congress give it favor-
able consideration. 

This transmission shall constitute a 
submittal for purposes of both sub-
sections 123b. and 123d. of the Act. My 
Administration is prepared to begin 
immediately consultations with the 
Senate Foreign Relations Committee 
and the House Foreign Affairs Com-
mittee, as provided in subsection 123b. 
Upon completion of the 30 days of con-
tinuous session review provided for in 
subsection 123b., the 60 days of contin-
uous session review provided for in sub-
section 123d. shall commence. 

DONALD J. TRUMP.
THE WHITE HOUSE, May 8, 2018. 

f 

REPORT OF 38 RESCISSIONS OF 
BUDGET AUTHORITY—PM 35 

The PRESIDING OFFICER laid be-
fore the Senate the following message 
from the President of the United 
States, together with accompanying 
papers; which was referred jointly, pur-
suant to the order of January 30, 1975, 
as modified by the order of April 11, 
1986; to the Committees on Appropria-
tions, the Budget; Agriculture, Nutri-
tion, and Forestry; Environment and 
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