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Maurice was not to be found. Hurriedly, I 
rushed behind the stage and scaffolding to 
see if we could locate her and sure enough, 
I spotted Sister Maurice on her knees planting 
holy medals in the soil around the perimeter of 
what was to be the future new Veterans Clinic. 
That describes Sister Maurice. In her own 
words, ‘‘I’ve always had a big heart for the 
veterans, watching them come home crippled 
and with health problems. I am happy that we 
are able to help them at the VA Clinic.’’ I hope 
the tree will also serve as a reminder of the 
sacrifices our veterans give that fosters the al-
truistic support of such remarkable individuals 
as Sister Maurice. 

Sister Maurice’s work and spirit will live on 
through her chosen Order-the Sisters of Saint 
Francis of Sylvania whom she loved. She will 
be fondly remembered and dearly missed for 
her dedication to God, service, and fellow men 
and women. Our country surely owes her a 
debt of gratitude. 

The hallmark of a public servant is to leave 
the world a better place for humanity after you 
leave it Sister Maurice Wodarski fulfilled her 
mission. May God bless her and keep her in 
celestial comfort and joy. 
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RECOGNIZING MARION COLEMAN 

HON. ERIC SWALWELL 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, May 24, 2018 

Mr. SWALWELL of California. Mr. Speaker, 
I rise today to recognize Marion Coleman in 
honor of her being named a National Endow-
ment for the Arts National Heritage Fellow for 
her work as a traditional African-American 
quilter. 

Marion first learned to sew from her grand-
mother and her great aunts in her home state 
of Texas. The love of quilting she garnered 
from her family inspired her to pass the quilt-
ing tradition down to the next generation 
through teaching. She began making quilts 
professionally in 2002 with her piece York in 
the Corp of Discovery, a quilt about the only 
African-American in the Lewis and Clark expe-
dition. She went on to receive awards for her 
pieces, Neighborhood Watch and Ruby 
Bridges. These pieces all evoked narratives of 
the African-American experience. 

Her professional career has taken her 
throughout the United States and around the 
world. In 2012, she was a guest artist at Quilt 
Week in Yokohama, Japan, and in 2013, her 
work was exhibited in the U.S. Consulate in 
Jerusalem through the Art in Embassies Pro-
gram. In 2016, her work was added to the 
Nelson Mandela Gateway Museum in Cape 
Town, South Africa. 

While Coleman’s narrative quilt work has re-
ceived national and international acclaim, she 
has been committed to helping her local com-
munity. Marion regularly spends time volun-
teering with local female detainees, and in 
2008 she started the Minerva Project with the 
Alameda County Arts Commission. Through 
this project, Coleman taught female youth de-
tainees how to quilt, and she led them in a 
creative exercise that emphasized the qualities 
of courage, strength and wisdom. 

The National Endowment for the Arts Na-
tional Heritage Fellowship is the nation’s high-
est honor in the folk and traditional arts, it is 

only fitting, then, that Marion Coleman is one 
of nine fellows selected this year, joining the 
ranks of former honorees such as B.B. King 
and Mavis Staples. 

Marion Coleman has made an indelible 
mark on the quilting and fiber folk arts commu-
nity. Her extensive body of work, and her 
commitment to education throughout the com-
munity is well deserving of the National Herit-
age Fellowship Award. I am honored to rep-
resent Marion Coleman, and I am grateful for 
her numerous contributions to the East Bay. 
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NATIONAL DEFENSE AUTHORIZA-
TION ACT FOR FISCAL YEAR 2019 

SPEECH OF 

HON. KYRSTEN SINEMA 
OF ARIZONA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, May 22, 2018 

The House in Committee of the Whole 
House on the state of the Union had under 
consideration the bill (H.R. 5515) to authorize 
appropriations for fiscal year 2019 for mili-
tary activities of the Department of Defense 
and for military construction, to prescribe 
military personnel strengths for such fiscal 
year, and for other purposes: 

Ms. SINEMA. Mr. Chair, I rise in support of 
H.R. 5515, the National Defense Authorization 
Act for Fiscal Year 2019. This bipartisan bill 
gives our troops a well-deserved pay raise 
and makes important investments in our na-
tional defense that will keep our country safe 
and strong. 

I thank Chairman THORNBERRY and Ranking 
Member SMITH for their leadership on this im-
portant legislation, and for their support in in-
cluding all four of my amendments, as part of 
the en bloc amendments, in this bipartisan bill. 

Terrorists like Islamic State present a clear 
threat to our country and to our allies. As ISIS 
loses territory in Iraq and Syria, its strategies 
to obtain funding and spread violence evolve. 
My first amendment ensures we develop strat-
egies to counter ISIS financing as the terrorist 
group, its affiliates, and their sources of rev-
enue change. It requires the Secretaries of 
Defense, State, and Treasury to provide a 
joint report to Congress on the current and fu-
ture funding mechanisms of the Islamic State 
and its affiliates, and what the U.S. is doing to 
stop them. I thank Congressman FITZPATRICK 
of Pennsylvania and Congressman BUDD of 
North Carolina for working across the aisle 
with me on this commonsense solution. The 
safety and security of Arizona families con-
tinues to be my top priority. 

My second amendment is the latest in a se-
ries of actions I’ve taken to ensure Arizona 
has the resources it needs for wildfire season. 
My amendment formally acknowledges the 
dangers that wildfires pose to our security and 
requires the Department of Defense to con-
sider how their assets—including air support— 
could complement the efforts of federal fire-
fighting agencies in tackling the toughest, 
most dangerous fires. Arizonans know that 
when a wildfire is out of control, it’s all hands 
on deck. My amendment directs government 
to do the same. 

We owe a great debt to the men and 
woman who serve in our military, and it is crit-
ical that we support their transitions from mili-
tary to civilian life. My third amendment helps 

servicemembers transition successfully to civil-
ian life by ensuring they receive quality finan-
cial literacy training prior to separation. When 
servicemembers go through the Transition As-
sistance Program, they learn about their 
earned benefits and ways to obtain jobs, 
healthcare, education, and housing. Financial 
literacy training will enable servicemembers to 
better utilize these benefits and the edu-
cational and career training available to them 
now and into the future. I thank Congressman 
HOLLINGSWORTH of Indiana for working with 
me to ensure our troops are prepared to suc-
ceed in civilian life and achieve the American 
Dream. 

My fourth amendment helps address a tech-
nological vulnerability for both the public and 
private sectors. Government-owned mobile de-
vices, including those owned by the Depart-
ment of Defense, are targets for data 
breaches and hacking. It is important that we 
develop technologies that secure these types 
of devices and protect our information. My 
amendment requires the Department of De-
fense to brief Congress on certain threats to 
mobile devices and what actions the Depart-
ment will take to prevent mobile device data 
breaches and hacks. I thank my fellow Arizo-
nans, Congressmen BIGGS and GALLEGO for 
working with me to safeguard our national se-
curity. 
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RECOGNIZING LEVY COUNTY 
SCHOOL EDUCATORS ON THEIR 
RETIREMENT 

HON. NEAL P. DUNN 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, May 24, 2018 

Mr. DUNN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize Brad and Sue Penney, and congratu-
late them on retiring after 30 years of service 
to the Levy County School system. Brad and 
Sue both began their careers at Cedar Key 
School in 1988, the very school that they are 
retiring from on May 31st. They have led a life 
of service to Levy County and represent the 
best of America. 

Sue spent her career instilling a love of 
books and reading in students in the library 
and media center. She also served as a sub-
stitute teacher, assisting teachers and stu-
dents of all ages. She went above and beyond 
for her students over the years, serving as a 
class and club sponsor, track coach, and 
cheerleading coach. She received ESP of the 
Year for the second time this year. 

Brad began his career as the janitor, moving 
into the roles of physical education teacher, 
and computer lab specialist. He then went 
back to school to earn his teaching degree; 
going on to teach history, social sciences, and 
Spanish. Throughout his time in education, he 
also served as the track and basketball coach, 
as well as Athletic Director and Assistant Prin-
cipal. He was awarded Teacher of the Year, 
as well as Teacher of the District in 2006– 
2007. 

Brad and Sue have 4 daughters, all of 
whom graduated from the same school where 
they teach. 

Mr. Speaker, please join me in congratu-
lating Sue and Brad Penney on their retire-
ment and thanking them for their dedication to 
enriching the lives of students across the Sec-
ond District of Florida. 
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