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Not only will these girls find an abundance 

of resources on the grounds, they will also 
each be able to create a unique plan of res-
toration known as the Refuge Circle of Care. 
While volunteers have been working tirelessly 
to build these facilities and bring in furniture, 
girls all over America have been raising 
money for the cause. 

One organization of passionate college- 
aged women known as ‘‘Pedal the Pacific’’ will 
be cycling 1,700 miles down the west coast to 
raise $250,000 for the ranch—more than dou-
ble the $60,000 they raised last year. It is 
through people such as these that commu-
nities like the Ranch are able to be built and 
provide victims a home where they can heal. 

Such spaces are necessary, as today in my 
home state of Texas there are almost 79,000 
minors that are victims of sex trafficking. Yet, 
even though child sex trafficking is the fastest 
growing crime in this country, there are not 
even 600 beds offered nationwide for child sex 
trafficking survivors to be able to recover long- 
term. Organizations like Refuge Ranch have 
the right idea in creating more communities 
and offering more beds to victims of this hor-
rific crime. When it opens in August, the Ref-
uge Ranch will be the largest live-in rehabilita-
tion facility for rescued victims of minor sex 
trafficking in the United States. Those at the 
Refuge Ranch have the right idea and I am 
certain that they will provide 48 young girls 
with not just a safe place to sleep, but a home 
in which they can heal. 

And that’s just the way it is. 
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KATHERINE WOOD 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Katherine 
(Katie) Wood for receiving the Congressional 
Gold Award. 

The Congressional Award is an award from 
the United States Congress for young Ameri-
cans who demonstrate excellence in four pro-
gram areas: Voluntary Public Service, Per-
sonal Development, Physical Fitness and Ex-
pedition/Exploration. It is awarded to young 
people who strive to challenge themselves 
and reach new goals. 

Katie received this award because of her 
determination, hard work and achievements in 
these program areas. This year, Katie is being 
awarded the Gold Congressional Award—the 
highest honor and a tremendous accomplish-
ment! In past years, Katie has earned two Sil-
ver Congressional Awards. 

This type of achievement can only be at-
tained with hard work and perseverance, both 
of which have been exemplified by Katie in 
this award process and in her day-to-day life. 
I applaud students like Katie who work to 
make the most of their education, commit to 
being lifelong learners and develop a work 
ethic and new skills which will guide them for 
the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Katie Wood for winning the Congressional 
Gold Award. I have no doubt she will exhibit 
the same dedication and character in all of her 
future accomplishments. 

HONORING THE LIFE OF 
MARGUERITE FREEMAN 

HON. DEREK KILMER 
OF WASHINGTON 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. KILMER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
pay tribute to Marguerite Freeman of Bain-
bridge Island, Washington, who passed away 
on Monday, June 18, 2018. 

Marge—as she was known to her friends— 
lived an eventful life. As she said in her mem-
oir, ‘‘I’ve tasted the pioneers’ hardships’’ and 
‘‘moved into the 21st century and saw all the 
changes, a complex technological future . . .’’ 

Born into a family of Swedish and Danish 
immigrants who homesteaded in Birka, North 
Dakota, she was the seventh of Arthur and 
Elda Leidholm’s nine children. She recalled 
the Great Depression, the hope of the New 
Deal, including her older brothers enlisting in 
the Civilian Conservation Corps, and the per-
severance of farmers. As she said, ‘‘My par-
ents’ courage and determination was passed 
on to us and we were taught to never be 
afraid of failure but work hard at what we be-
lieved in, to be honest and true to ourselves.’’ 

And while she often cited Ronald Reagan’s 
adage that ‘‘we were poor, but we didn’t know 
it,’’ from her very first vote, in 1944, to her 
last, she was a proud FDR Democrat. 

World War II was a turning point in Marge’s 
life. She followed her brothers west to Seattle. 
There she joined the war effort, earning 67 
cents an hour as a ‘‘Rosie the Riveter’’ on the 
B–17 production line for Boeing. There, too, 
she met her future husband, Donald Freeman, 
on leave from the USS Indiana stationed in 
Bremerton. They were married on July 20, 
1946 at Gethsemane Lutheran Church in Se-
attle. On that day, in a way, she also joined 
the Navy. 

They travelled the country and the world 
with a growing family of three boys. It was not 
until Don’s retirement that they truly found a 
home, settling on Bainbridge Island. Marge 
became an integral part of our community, vol-
unteering at her beloved Bethany Lutheran 
Church and the local Helpline House. Her 
deep faith and love permeated all she did. 

The story of Marguerite Freeman is a life of 
service; service to God; service to her country; 
service to her family; and service to her com-
munity. 

Her memory and her spirit live on in her 
friends and family. Today, our thoughts are 
with them: her sons Terry, Mark, and Don, her 
six grandchildren and her nine great-grand-
children. 

Mr. Speaker, today, we remember Mar-
guerite Freeman. 
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PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. PAUL TONKO 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. TONKO. Mr. Speaker, on June 15, 
2018, I was not present and voting in the 
House of Representatives. 

Had I been present for roll call vote 267, I 
would have voted no. 

Had I been present for roll call vote 268, I 
would have voted no. 

CONGRATULATING KAREN 
RICHARD 

HON. PETER WELCH 
OF VERMONT 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. WELCH. Mr. Speaker, on June 25, 
2018, Mrs. Karen Richard will retire after 31 
years of service to the town of Colchester, 
Vermont. Mrs. Richard was elected in 1998 as 
Colchester Town Clerk and Treasurer after 11 
years of work in the local assessor’s office. 
She quickly led the town in replacing outdated 
voting machines and optimizing the town’s 
election process. Perhaps her greatest con-
tribution to the town was her efforts to digitize 
the town’s land records. Because of Mrs. 
Richard, Colchester was one of the first towns 
in Vermont to digitize their land records and 
by the end of the year, all the records will be 
available for the public online. At a time when 
many municipal employees are being asked to 
go above and beyond for their residents, Mrs. 
Richard’s leadership was transformational. Her 
hard work was recognized when she earned 
the awards of Vermont Clerk of the Year in 
2007 and Vermont Treasurer of the Year in 
2014. 

Outside of her elected role, she has been 
Chair of the Vermont Municipal Clerks and 
Treasurers Association’s Legislative Com-
mittee, a member of the Champlain Water Dis-
trict Board of Commissioners, and Clerk/ 
Treasurer for Colchester Fire District No. 3. 

Mr. Speaker, her exceptional work on behalf 
of Vermont communities will surely be missed 
and I wish Mrs. Richard well in her retirement. 

f 

HONORING RANDY COOK 

HON. SEAN P. DUFFY 
OF WISCONSIN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. DUFFY. Mr. Speaker, I proudly rise 
today to honor Farm Service Agency Wis-
consin District 1 Director Randy Cook. 

Mr. Cook has spent over 30 years of his 
professional career serving his community and 
the great state of Wisconsin. Mr. Cook knew 
from the beginning the importance of carrying 
on the values and honor of farming by teach-
ing agriculture from 1981 to 1987 at Cameron 
High School. 

His willingness to help farms big and small 
achieve the American dream was shown 
through his work at the Farm Service Agency. 
Mr. Cook served 21 years as executive direc-
tor in the counties of Pierce, Dunn, and his 
home community of Barron County. His care 
and love for farmers over those two decades 
made him a natural fit as District 1 Director of 
the Wisconsin Farm Service Agency where he 
served for the past 10 years. 

On behalf of the residents of Wisconsin’s 
7th Congressional District, I wanted to say 
thank you to Mr. Cook for devoting his skills, 
passion, and knowledge to the greatest asset 
in the state of Wisconsin, our farmers. I am 
proud to call him a friend, leader, and a con-
stituent of this Congressional District. 
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RECOGNIZING THE CAREER OF 

CAM MARTIN 

HON. KEVIN McCARTHY 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. MCCARTHY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to recognize an outstanding individual, Mr. J. 
Campbell ‘‘Cam’’ Martin, in recognition of his 
retirement from the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA). After four dec-
ades of Federal service, Cam recently retired 
from NASA Armstrong Flight Research Center 
at Edwards Air Force Base, California. 

Cam earned his Bachelor of Science degree 
in Business Logistics from Pennsylvania State 
University. Later, he received a Master of Arts 
& Administrative Sciences from George Wash-
ington University. A longtime patriot and public 
servant, Cam served in the United States 
Navy before beginning his career with NASA 
Langley Research Center in 1988. While at 
Langley, he received the NASA Group 
Achievement Award for the Airborne Wind 
Shear Flight Operations Campaign fore-
shadowing a long and fruitful career. In 1994, 
NASA Armstrong, formerly NASA Dryden 
Flight Research Center, was fortunate to gain 
Cam as Chief of the Office of External Affairs, 
and he has remained an integral member of 
the Armstrong community. 

Cam distinguished himself as a man who 
truly loved what he did, and he never failed to 
inspire an interest in aeronautical science with 
those who worked with him. It was this pas-
sion that drove Cam to advocate for years to 
change the name of the Dryden Flight Re-
search Center to the Armstrong Flight Re-
search Center. Cam knew better than most of 
Neil Armstrong’s legacy as a test pilot at the 
Center from 1955 to 1962, and through his 
great effort and collaboration with NASA and 
our community, the site was renamed in 2014 
after the first person to walk on the Moon. 

As Armstrong’s Legislative Affairs liaison, 
Cam has served as an incredible resource on 
all things space and science-related, always 
underscoring why NASA’s mission is worthy of 
support. Usually soft-spoken, whenever Cam 
started to extol the great work being done at 
Armstrong, I could hear the excitement and 
passion rise in his voice. He never engaged in 
hyperbole—he never had to since the work at 
Armstrong is truly amazing. During Cam’s ten-
ure at Armstrong, NASA and Lockheed Martin 
made significant progress on the Quiet Super-
sonic Technology X-Plane (QUESST), a pro-
gram designed to quiet the sound of a sonic 
boom and offer the world the promise of com-
mercial supersonic air travel. Among Cam’s 
other achievements at NASA Armstrong was 
his successful advocacy for the Stratospheric 
Observatory for Infrared Astronomy (SOFIA) 
program, which still flies to this day and pro-
vides incredible science. During the fatal test 
flight crash of SpaceShip Two on October 31, 
2014, Cam provided on-scene contingency 
communications support throughout the day 
directly to the chief executive of Mojave Air 
and Space Port, who described those con-
tributions as providing ‘‘calm presence’’ and 
having ‘‘professional brilliance.’’ Additionally, 
Cam has routinely served as a member of my 
Service Academy Panel, offering his expertise 
as a former Navy man to advise me on my 
annual appointments to the United States 
Service Academies. 

Cam Martin’s career at Armstrong will be re-
membered for his passion and energy, his avi-
ator sunglasses, leather fighter pilot jacket, 
and of course his classic Mustang. I am grate-
ful to be able to count him as a friend, and 
while he will no longer be working at Arm-
strong, I know that Cam will continue to advo-
cate for space, science, technology, and, most 
importantly the first ‘‘A’’ in NASA-aeronautics. 

After many years of service to our nation, I 
know that Cam looks forward to spending 
more time with his wife, Susi, and his children, 
Scott and Skye. Cam will be missed at NASA, 
but I salute his dedication to his field and 
country. I wish him the best as he begins this 
new chapter of his life. 
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RECOGNIZING THE LIFETIME OF 
SERVICE AND MINISTRY OF PAS-
TOR DENIS MCBRIDE 

HON. MATT GAETZ 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. GAETZ. Mr. Speaker, today I rise to 
recognize Pastor Denis McBride of the PCC 
Campus Church for his remarkable lifetime of 
service and ministry in Northwest Florida and 
around the world. 

He began his ministry serving as a youth 
pastor, in addition to teaching history and 
Bible prior to his move to Pensacola, FL. He 
is a favorite among students across the nation 
and world as he dynamically taught Bible and 
history for over 25 years through the ABeka 
Academy distance-learning program. 

In August of 2011, God called him to pastor 
Campus Church located on the premises of 
Pensacola Christian College. Pastor McBride 
displays a genuine love for families and a 
heart for young people. 

As senior pastor of the Campus Church, he 
not only ministered to students, but also local 
families and thousands more across the coun-
try through the Rejoice telecast. People are 
automatically drawn to Pastor McBride for his 
down-to-earth personality and genuine interest 
in each member’s spiritual well-being. 

Faith and family values are the pillars of 
Northwest Florida, and it is an honor for me to 
have faith leaders in our district, such as Pas-
tor McBride, who represent, preserve and pro-
mote those strong values through their leader-
ship and service. 

Mr. Speaker, on behalf of the United States 
Congress, I am privileged to congratulate Pas-
tor Denis McBride for his lifetime of service 
and the extraordinary legacy he leaves for fu-
ture leaders of our Faith. 

f 

HONORING LAKEISHA RICHARDSON 

HON. BENNIE G. THOMPSON 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. THOMPSON of Mississippi. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise today to honor a remarkable profes-
sional, Dr. Lakeisha Richardson. 

As an alumna of Xavier University, the Uni-
versity of Tennessee Medical School and the 
University of Mississippi School of Medicine, 
the illustrious Dr. Lakeisha Richardson, has 

emerged as one of the nation’s most brilliant 
and well-respected Board-Certified Obstetri-
cian/Gynecologist. ‘‘Dr. Lakeisha’’ as she is af-
fectionately called by her clients and col-
leagues, advises and motivates women to 
prioritize their health, which she contends is 
their ‘‘true wealth’’. 

When she is not delivering babies, treating 
patients, or saving lives in the ER, Dr. 
Lakeisha is captivating audiences at univer-
sities, corporate events, conferences, church-
es and nonprofit organizations, where she 
shares information about women’s health 
strategies, self-empowerment, mental and psy-
chological well-being, and the art of living a 
balanced life. 

Her compelling story of personal challenges 
and triumphs combined with a compassionate 
heart and a wealth of knowledge makes Dr. 
Lakeisha relatable to all audiences. Her warm 
spirit, winning smile and engaging personality 
also leaves audiences captivated and inspired 
to live their best lives spiritually, physically, 
mentally, emotionally, and financially. 

Dr. Lakeisha is also very passionate about 
issues relating to women’s sexual health. Her 
brilliance, expertise, and ability to provide 
women with the knowledge, skills and strate-
gies they need in order to experience true inti-
macy, sexual pleasure, and fulfillment has led 
Dr. Lakeisha to facilitate numerous sessions 
on topics such as Communicating with Your 
Partner, Being an Active Part in Your Sexual 
Fulfillment, Overcoming Sexual Fears, Navi-
gating New Sexual Territory, and Creating 
Your Ultimate Life. 

Dr. Lakeisha is also a well-known speaker, 
consultant, radio show host, and an adjunct 
professor. She is the Founder and CEO of Dr. 
Lakeisha Ob/Gyn and has a successful private 
practice in Mississippi. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask my colleagues to join me 
in recognizing Dr. Lakeisha Richardson for her 
dedication to serving others and giving back to 
the community. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. RON ESTES 
OF KANSAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Mr. ESTES of Kansas. Mr. Speaker, I was 
not present for Roll Call vote No. 267 on 
Agreeing to the Amendment, the Thornberry of 
Texas Part A Amendment No. 4. Had I been 
present, I would have voted yea. 

I was not present for Roll Call vote No. 268 
on Passage of H.R. 2851. Had I been present, 
I would have voted yea. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. BARBARA LEE 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 19, 2018 

Ms. LEE. Mr. Speaker, if I were present, I 
would have voted NO on roll call number 265 
to H.R. 5788. 

If I were present, I would have voted NO on 
roll call number 266 to H.R. 5735. 
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