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without the hard work of staff. I thank them for 
their efforts and include in the RECORD the fol-
lowing names: 

Katelynn Bradley, Kris Erickson, Eric Her-
sey, Bruce Johnson, Erika Jeffers, Erica 
Loewe, Esther Kahng, Marcos Manosalvas, 
Charla Ouertatani, Lisa Peto, Courtney Robin-
son, Glen Sears, Katy Strohmeier. 

f 

HONORING TEXAS A&M UNIVER-
SITY–KINGSVILLE NCAA MEN’S 
OUTDOOR TRACK AND FIELD 
CHAMPIONSHIP 

HON. FILEMON VELA 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. VELA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to con-
gratulate the Texas A&M University-Kingsville 
Javelinas on their 2018 NCAA Division II 
Men’s Outdoor Track and Field National 
Championship. 

The Javelinas capped off an impressive 
season as National Champions on May 26, 
2018 thanks to the enduring dedication and 
leadership of head coach Ryan Dall and the 
entire coaching staff. During the highly com-
petitive national meet of 113 total teams, the 
Javelinas scored 65 points and won four indi-
vidual National Champion titles. 

I want to congratulate the athletes. Charles 
Greaves secured a critical first place finish in 
the triple jump event for the Javelinas, and 
joined Deon Hope, Javier Lopez and Todd 
Nicholas in their first place win in the 4 x 100 
meter relay race. Senior Javier Lopez claimed 
back-to-hack titles in the 100 meter hurdles in 
his last event as a Javelina. Richard Cer-
vantes impressively finished first overall after 
trailing behind in 15th place in the shot put 
event. I am very proud of the hard work and 
perseverance these gentlemen demonstrated 
on the national stage. 

The National Championship team was com-
prised of: Joshua Adame, Seth Barker, 
Marckenley Betony, Jamarkus Birks, Raymond 
Borjon, Jesus Caballero, Richard Cervantes, 
Johnnie Davila, Robert Downs, Damian 
Feeney, Kentwuan Freeman, Hilario Garcia, 
Charles Greaves, Daniel Guerrero, Miguel 
Hanze, Johnathon Harper, Drew Hill, Deon 
Hope, Arturo Huerta, Kenneth Jackson, Lane 
Janecka, Sean Landez, Javier Lopez, Elias 
Madrid, Ricky Medrano, Lane Michna, Todd 
Nicholas, Jasiah Patterson, Andrew Perez, 
Supun Randeniya, Jorge Rios, Francisco 
Solis, Shane Stehle, Juan Suarez, Joseph 
Swierc, Jose Ventura IV, Dean Wallace, Chris-
topher Williams, Brandon Wilson, Ayman 
Zahafi, Kenny Zamorano, and Vitaly Zhgun. 
The coaching staff included: Ryan Dall, Tim 
Miller, Aared Sampson, and Amber Perry. 

Mr. Speaker, please join me in recognizing 
the great accomplishment of the Texas A&M- 
Kingsville Javelinas. As their Representative in 
Congress, I am very proud of all their hard 
work and commitment that resulted in this ex-
ceptional achievement. 

SUMMER INTERN ANGEL 
CALDWELL 

HON. KEN BUCK 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. BUCK. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize Angel Caldwell for her hard work and 
dedication to the people of Colorado’s Fourth 
District as an intern in my Washington, D.C. 
office for the summer of 2018. 

The work of this young woman has been 
exemplary, and I know she has a bright future. 
She served as a tour guide, interacted with 
constituents, and learned a great deal about 
our nation’s legislative process. I was glad to 
be able to offer this educational opportunity, 
and look forward to seeing her build her ca-
reer in public service. 

Angel plans to continue pursuing her degree 
at Virginia Union University at the end of this 
internship. I wish her the best as she pursues 
her career path. Mr. Speaker, it is an honor to 
recognize Angel Caldwell for her service the 
last several months to the people of Colo-
rado’s 4th District. 

f 

RECOGNIZING THE CITI OPEN 
TENNIS TOURNAMENT 

HON. ELEANOR HOLMES NORTON 
OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Ms. NORTON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
ask the House of Representatives to recog-
nize the Citi Open Tennis Tournament, taking 
place July 28 through August 5, 2018, in Rock 
Creek Park, on its 50th edition in the District 
of Columbia. This tournament is not only a 
Washington tennis tradition, but also an eco-
nomic staple in the region. 

The Washington tennis tournament, now 
known as the Citi Open Tennis Tournament, 
was founded in 1969 by tennis legend and 
Hall of Famer Donald Dell and his business 
partner John Harris with the support of Arthur 
Ashe, the first African American to win both 
the U.S. Open and Wimbledon tournaments. 
Ashe declared he would participate in the in-
augural tournament under two conditions: that 
the tournament would take place in a naturally 
integrated neighborhood, and that it would be 
played on public land where all people could 
come together, enjoy the sport and share the 
experience. Today, the tournament remains at 
its original location, 16th & Kennedy Streets 
NW, in Rock Creek Park. 

In 1972, Dell gifted the tournament to the 
Washington Tennis & Education Foundation 
(then called the Washington Area Tennis Pa-
trons), a nonprofit organization supporting 
local education causes for over 1,500 low-in-
come and underserved children in the District. 

The Citi Open Tennis Tournament draws 
the best players in the world, making D.C. a 
global tennis destination. The tournament is 
also seen on television in over 140 countries, 
contributing to the city’s reputation as a tourist 
destination. Recent economic impact studies 
found that the estimated total gross impact of 
the Citi Open Tennis Tournament on the re-
gional economy exceeds $25 million annually. 
The tournament is the only Association of 

Tennis Professionals 500 level event in the 
United States and one of only four profes-
sional tennis tournaments combining men’s 
and women’s events. It is also recognized as 
an international level tournament by the Wom-
en’s Tennis Association. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask the House of Represent-
atives to join me in recognizing the tour-
nament’s 50th edition by celebrating ‘‘Tennis 
Week in the District of Columbia,’’ commemo-
rated July 28 through August 5, 2018, as well 
as acknowledging the Washington Tennis & 
Education Foundation for a world-class sport-
ing event and contributions raised for D.C. 
youth. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. GWEN MOORE 
OF WISCONSIN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Ms. MOORE. Mr. Speaker, I was unavoid-
ably absent on July 23, 2018 and missed Roll 
Call Votes 366 and 367. Had I been present, 
I would have voted YES on both roll calls. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO PRESIDENT AND 
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER OF 
THE SAGINAW COUNTY CHAMBER 
OF COMMERCE ROBERT VAN 
DEVENTER 

HON. JOHN R. MOOLENAAR 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. MOOLENAAR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to pay tribute to Robert Van Deventer, the 
President and CEO of the Saginaw County 
Chamber of Commerce, upon his retirement. 

During his more than fifteen years with the 
Saginaw County Chamber, Bob has been a 
recognized community leader and a leading 
advocate for enhancing the Great Lakes Bay 
Region. In fact, numerous non-profit organiza-
tions have recruited Bob to serve as an advi-
sor and have sought his expertise; Bob has 
served on the Great Lakes Bay Regional 
Branding and Communications Council, Sagi-
naw County Business and Education Partner-
ship, the Great Lakes Regional Convention 
and Visitors Bureau, Saginaw Future, Inc., the 
SVSU College of Business and Management 
Advisory Board and the CMU Alumni Advisory 
Board of Directors just to list a few. 

Bob also served as President and member 
of the Board of Directors for the Great Lakes 
Bay Regional Alliance. Under his leadership, 
Bob increased communication and joint ven-
tures amongst Bay, Isabella, Midland and 
Saginaw counties. At a time when the City of 
Saginaw was about to close the doors on the 
Saginaw Civic Center, Bob along with the 
Saginaw County Chamber of Commerce, led a 
successful campaign to restore and upgrade 
the building into what is now the Dow Event 
Center. This advancement set in motion the 
campaign to redevelop the deteriorating down-
town Saginaw. Bob and the Alliance have 
been able to enhance our local communities 
by drawing tourism to the Great Lakes Bay 
Region. 

Throughout Bob’s illustrious career with the 
Saginaw County Chamber of Commerce, he 
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truly embodied its mission and vision. From 
supporting the success of local businesses to 
building healthy organizations and community 
through his volunteerism, Bob has dedicated 
his efforts to revitalizing Saginaw County and 
creating an exceptional place to live and work. 

On behalf of the Fourth Congressional Dis-
trict of Michigan, I am honored today to recog-
nize Robert Van Deventer upon his retirement 
from the Saginaw County Chamber of Com-
merce and extend my appreciation for his 
commitment to Saginaw and the Great Lakes 
Bay Region. 

f 

SUMMER INTERN LIAM MULLETT 

HON. KEN BUCK 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. BUCK. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize Liam Mullett for his hard work and 
dedication to the people of Colorado’s Fourth 
District as an intern in my Washington, D.C. 
office for the summer of 2018. 

The work of this young man has been ex-
emplary, and I know he has a bright future. He 
served as a tour guide, interacted with con-
stituents, and learned a great deal about our 
nation’s legislative process. I was glad to be 
able to offer this educational opportunity, and 
look forward to seeing him build his career in 
public service. 

Liam plans to continue pursuing his degree 
at Princeton at the end of this internship. I 
wish him the best as he pursues his career 
path. Mr. Speaker, it is an honor to recognize 
Liam Mullett for his service the last several 
months to the people of Colorado’s 4th Dis-
trict. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. VICENTE GONZALEZ 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. GONZALEZ of Texas. Mr. Speaker, on 
July 18, 2018 during Roll Call No. 345, I was 
inadvertently recorded as voting ‘‘aye.’’ I sup-
port the National Endowment for the Arts and 
the National Endowment for the Humanities, 
and my vote should be recorded as ‘‘no.’’ The 
NEA and NEH are essential because they 
support and strengthen our great country’s 
rich and diverse cultural heritage and history. 
These organizations promote excellence 
across all of America’s communities and de-
serve Congress’ unwavering support. I look 
forward to supporting the NEA and the NEH in 
the future. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF MRS. 
CAROLYN G. RANDOLPH 

HON. SANFORD D. BISHOP, JR. 
OF GEORGIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. BISHOP of Georgia. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize the work and service of a 
dedicated educator, woman of grace, and 

servant to all mankind, Mrs. Carolyn G. Ran-
dolph. Mrs. Randolph, Life Member of Alpha 
Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc., has been elected 
to serve as the South Atlantic Regional Direc-
tor, reflecting her distinguished leadership in 
Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc. A luncheon 
honoring her will be held on Saturday, July 28, 
2018 at 1 p.m. at the Green Island Country 
Club in Columbus, Georgia. 

A native of Columbus, Georgia, Carolyn re-
ceived a Bachelor of Science degree in Sec-
ondary Mathematics from the University of 
North Carolina at Greensboro, a Master of 
Science degree from North Carolina A&T 
State University, and an Education Specialist 
degree from Columbus State University. 

Winston Churchill said, ‘‘We make a living 
by what we get, but we make a life by what 
we give.’’ Through every stage of her life, Mrs. 
Randolph has always given of herself to oth-
ers. She served as an educator for many 
years before retiring and today, she serves as 
a Clinical Supervisor for the Mathematics 
Woodrow Wilson Fellows and an adjunct in-
structor at Columbus State University. 

Carolyn’s service also extends into her 
church life at Fourth Street Missionary Baptist 
Church in Columbus, Georgia where she is an 
active member. A dedicated servant of God, 
she has served in the Deacon’s Wives, Chris-
tian Education, Pastoral Relations, and Men’s 
and Women’s Ministries. 

Carolyn was first initiated in Alpha Kappa 
Alpha Sorority, Inc. through the Alpha Psi 
Omega Chapter in Wilmington, North Carolina, 
the first Greek letter organization among Afri-
can-American women in Southeastern North 
Carolina. She is currently a member of the 
Gamma Tau Omega Chapter in Columbus, 
Georgia where she has served as President 
(two terms), First Vice President, Second Vice 
President, House Treasurer, Chaplain, Chair 
of the Connections Committee, a member of 
the Graduate Advisors Council, former Chair 
of the Scholarship Committee, and first Presi-
dent of the chapter’s foundation, 
S.I.S.T.E.R.S., Inc. 

She has diligently served at the local, re-
gional, and international levels within Alpha 
Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc. and was recently 
awarded the 2018 Georgia Legislative Wom-
en’s Caucus Servant Leadership Award, which 
was presented by Georgia State Representa-
tive Carolyn Hugley (District 136) during Wom-
en’s History Month. 

Mrs. Randolph has accomplished many 
things in her life but none of these would have 
been possible without the enduring love and 
support of her husband, Chester; their three 
daughters, and their three grandchildren. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask my colleagues to join my 
wife Vivian and me, along with the more than 
730,000 constituents of the Second Congres-
sional District of Georgia, in extending our sin-
cerest congratulations to Mrs. Carolyn G. Ran-
dolph for being elected the South Atlantic Re-
gional Director for Alpha Kappa Alpha Soror-
ity, Inc. and for her many years of service to 
her community, nation, and all mankind. 

HONORING THE LIFE AND SERVICE 
OF OFFICER DIEGO MORENO 

HON. DAVID G. REICHERT 
OF WASHINGTON 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. REICHERT. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
remember Police Officer Diego Moreno who 
died in the line of duty on Sunday, July 22, 
2018. 

On that somber day, Washington State’s 
law enforcement lost one of their own. Officer 
Diego Moreno from the Kent Police Depart-
ment lost his life in the line of duty while plac-
ing spike strips while assisting to apprehend 
the suspects in an active vehicle pursuit. 

Officer Moreno was loved by his community 
and his colleagues. Having grown up in Ven-
ezuela, Officer Moreno used his fluency in 
Spanish to help translate between his fellow 
officers and the large Hispanic population in 
the community in which they serve. The Kent 
Police Department said, ‘‘His contributions to 
our department and positive impact on his co-
workers and the community have been signifi-
cant.’’ 

An eight-year veteran with the department, 
Officer Moreno served in the civil disturbance 
unit as a hostage negotiator and a defense 
tactics instructor, and has been recognized for 
his heroic actions while serving with the de-
partment. After saving an elderly woman from 
a fire, Officer Moreno received the Chiefs 
Award for Exceptional Duty in 2016. He was 
also honored by the Kent City Council with the 
Lifesaving Medal for saving someone from an 
opioid overdose in June of last year. 

Since his passing, Washington State has 
greatly mourned his loss. Our thoughts and 
prayers are with his loving family that he 
leaves behind, his wife and his two children. 
We also remember his colleagues at the Kent 
Police Department as they face the heartbreak 
of losing a coworker and friend. 

Over the next week, in Kent, Washington, 
his family, friends, colleagues, and community 
will unite to celebrate his life and honor his 
service to our country. We recognize that 
same service here in Washington, D.C. today. 
I join with his family, friends, and community 
in thanking Police Officer Diego Moreno for his 
service. 

f 

SUMMER INTERN JANSON 
REQUIST 

HON. KEN BUCK 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, July 24, 2018 

Mr. BUCK. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize Janson Requist for his hard work and 
dedication to the people of Colorado’s Fourth 
District as an intern in my Washington, D.C. 
office for the summer of 2018. 

The work of this young man has been ex-
emplary, and I know he has a bright future. He 
served as a tour guide, interacted with con-
stituents, and learned a great deal about our 
nation’s legislative process. I was glad to be 
able to offer this educational opportunity, and 
look forward to seeing him build his career in 
public service. 

Janson plans to continue pursuing his de-
gree at Colorado Christian University and 
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