
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — HOUSEH10036 December 11, 2018 
In Florida, for example, Republican 

Governor Rick Scott, now Senator- 
elect, undermined confidence in the 
State’s own recount process by making 
his own unsubstantiated claims of 
widespread voter fraud and filed law-
suits against and called for investiga-
tions into certain Democratic-leaning 
counties. 

In Georgia, Secretary of State Brian 
Kemp refused to step down from his 
role overseeing his own election to be 
Governor of the State. Under his man-
agement, more than a half a million 
people were purged from voting rolls in 
July of 2017. That election was decided 
by just tens of thousands of votes. It 
makes a difference. 

In North Carolina’s Ninth Congres-
sional District today, the State Elec-
tions Board is investigating whether a 
local GOP operative illegally collected 
absentee ballots and altered votes or 
never submitted them. It may yet lead 
to, frankly, the decertification of that 
election and a new special election to 
be called. 

In Wisconsin and Michigan, the GOP- 
controlled, lame duck State legisla-
tures have pushed through a series of 
measures that would strip the incom-
ing Democratic Governor, Attorney 
General, and Secretary of State of key 
authorities and restrict access to early 
voting. 

We have seen this before. It is part of 
a pattern, unfortunately, of voter sup-
pression: purging voter rolls; difficult 
voter I.D. restrictions; eliminating 
early voting; outdated and insufficient 
voting machines; and long lines, espe-
cially in minority precincts. 

In 2016, North Carolina closed early 
voting stations and, just coinciden-
tally, reduced African American voting 
by 8.5 percent, clearly a dispositive dif-
ference. 

Republican governors like Governor 
Scott of Florida have exercised their 
discretion to restore felon voting 
rights in as restrictive a manner as 
possible. His predecessor, Governor 
CHARLIE CRIST, now our colleague, re-
stored voting rights to 155,000 individ-
uals in Florida in 4 years. Governor 
Scott averaged just 400 per year. 

In Wisconsin, a strict voter I.D. law 
has been credited with suppressing the 
vote of more than 200,000 Wisconsin 
voters who were otherwise eligible to 
cast a ballot in 2016. 

Could that have made a difference in 
the electoral vote of the State of Wis-
consin? 
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These tactics undermine democracy. 
They are not worthy of the party of 
Lincoln, and they further erode Amer-
ica’s trust in government. 

I implore my friends on the other 
side of the aisle: Let’s win fair or 
square. Let’s make sure every Ameri-
can’s vote is counted and is treated as 
sacred. America will be the stronger 
for it. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Mem-
bers are reminded to refrain from en-

gaging in personalities toward the 
President of the United States. 

f 

HONORING DONEGAL INDIANS 
FIELD HOCKEY TEAM 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Pennsylvania (Mr. SMUCKER) for 5 min-
utes. 

Mr. SMUCKER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to congratulate and to honor the 
young women of the Donegal Indians 
field hockey team, who won the PIAA 
State championship this year, their 
second in 3 years. 

The Donegal Indians held an impres-
sive 28–1 season record, with 235 points 
scored and only 19 points scored 
against them. They can be described in 
one word: dominating. 

They finally met their match in the 
State championship game, where they 
were scoreless through regulation. 
When the team needed to score, they 
turned to one player, Captain Mac-
kenzie Allessie, who holds the national 
record for scoring in girls high school 
field hockey. 

Mackenzie racked up an impressive 
351 goals during her tenure at Donegal. 
The last goal that Mackenzie scored 
lifted the Indians to their second cham-
pionship. 

The team members’ drive is a trait 
that will serve them well in the future. 
I congratulate them, their coaches, and 
the community for their victory. I wish 
them all continued success. 

RECOGNIZING CASEY KAUFHOLD 

Mr. SMUCKER. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
recognize the amazing accomplish-
ments of Ms. Casey Kaufhold, a 14- 
year-old freshman at Conestoga Valley 
High School in Lancaster, Pennsyl-
vania. 

Casey is a winner and a world record 
holder. Last month, she competed with 
Olympic-class archers from around the 
world at the World Archery Indoor Se-
ries GT Open in Luxembourg. She 
earned 589 out of 600 possible points to 
win the gold medal for this event and 
set a world record for the highest score 
earned by an archer under the age of 17 
during competition. 

We are all incredibly proud of Casey’s 
achievements, and we are looking for-
ward to all that is in store for her in 
the future, which I believe will be as a 
future Olympian. And if she does so, 
she will represent our Nation well. We 
wish her continued success in all of her 
endeavors. 

RECOGNIZING LINN MOEDINGER 

Mr. SMUCKER. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
recognize a man synonymous with rail-
roading in Lancaster County: Mr. Linn 
Moedinger. 

After 51 years—51 years—working for 
the Strasburg Rail Road, Linn is retir-
ing as president of the Strasburg Rail 
Road Company. 

Strasburg Rail Road was founded in 
1832. It is the oldest continuously oper-
ating railroad in the Western Hemi-
sphere. After 125 years of declining rev-

enue, 24 individuals, including Linn’s 
parents, decided to buy the railroad. 

Today, it is a top tourist destination 
in the district that I represent. They 
brought new life to Strasburg Rail 
Road, turning it into a tourist railroad 
and helping educate and entertain 
thousands of visitors in our community 
each year. 

Linn took his first paying job at the 
Strasburg Rail Road when he was 17. 
He cleaned the restrooms. Year after 
year, his responsibilities increased and 
so did his love for the railroad. 

Linn was named president in 2000 and 
has overseen great expansion of the 
Strasburg Rail Road, and it is a histor-
ical marker in the State of Pennsyl-
vania. 

Thank you to Linn for his many 
years of service, and I wish him all the 
best in his retirement. 

f 

RECESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess until noon 
today. 

Accordingly (at 10 o’clock and 49 
minutes a.m.), the House stood in re-
cess. 

f 
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AFTER RECESS 

The recess having expired, the House 
was called to order by the Speaker at 
noon. 

f 

PRAYER 

The Chaplain, the Reverend Patrick 
J. Conroy, offered the following prayer: 

Loving and gracious God, we give 
You thanks for giving us another day. 

We ask today that You bless the 
Members of the people’s House to be 
the best and most faithful servants of 
the people they serve. 

May they be filled with gratitude at 
the opportunity they have to serve in 
this place. We thank You for the abili-
ties they have been given to do their 
work to contribute to the common 
good. 

As this second session of the 115th 
Congress draws near its end and legis-
lative business once again weighs heav-
ily on this Hill, withhold not Your spir-
it of wisdom and truth from this as-
sembly. Give each Member clarity of 
thought and purity of motive so that 
they may render their service as their 
best selves. 

May all that is done this day in the 
people’s House be for Your greater 
honor and glory. 

Amen. 
f 

THE JOURNAL 

The SPEAKER. The Chair has exam-
ined the Journal of the last day’s pro-
ceedings and announces to the House 
his approval thereof. 

Pursuant to clause 1, rule I, the Jour-
nal stands approved. 
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