AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3765

Public Law 115-270
115th Congress
An Act

To provide for improvements to the rivers and harbors of the United States, to

provide for the conservation and development of water and related resources, _Oct. 23,2018
to provide for water pollution control activities, and for other purposes. [S. 8021]
Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled, America’s Water
Infrastruct
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS, Act of 2018,
(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as “America’s Water 33 USC 2201
Infrastructure Act of 2018”. note.

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents for this Act
is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.

TITLE I—WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT

Sec. 101. Short title.
Sec. 102. Secretary defined.

Subtitle A—General Provisions

Sec. 1101. Sense of Congress regarding water resources development bills.

Sec. 1102. Study of the future of the United States Army Corps of Engineers.

Sec. 1103. Study on economic and budgetary analyses.

Sec. 1104. Dissemination of information.

Sec. 1105. Non-Federal engagement and review.

Sec. 1106. Lake Okeechobee regulation schedule review.

Sec. 1107. Access to real estate data.

Sec. 1108. Aquatic invasive species research.

Sec. 1109. Harmful algal bloom technology demonstration.

Sec. 1110. Bubbly Creek, Chicago ecosystem restoration.

Sec. 1111. Dredge pilot program.

Sec. 1112. Hurricane and storm damage protection program.

Sec. 1113. Operation and maintenance of existing infrastructure.

Sec. 1114. Assistance relating to water supply.

Sec. 1115. Property acquisition.

Sec. 1116. Dredged material management plans.

Sec. 1117. Inclusion of project or facility in Corps of Engineers workplan.

Sec. 1118. Geomatic data.

Sec. 1119. Local government reservoir permit review.

Sec. 1120. Transparency and accountability in cost sharing for water resources de-
velopment projects.

Sec. 1121. Upper Missouri Mainstem Reservoir water withdrawal intake easement
review.

Sec. 1122. Limitation on contract execution.

Sec. 1123. Certain levee improvements.

Sec. 1124. Cost-share payment for certain projects.

Sec. 1125. Locks on Allegheny River.

Sec. 1126. Purpose and need.

Sec. 1127. Prior project authorization.

Sec. 1128. Mississippi River and Tributaries Project.

Sec. 1129. Inclusion of Tribal interests in project consultations.

Sec. 1130. Beneficial use of dredged material.

Sec. 1131. Ice jam prevention and mitigation.



132 STAT. 3766

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

1132.
1133.
1134.
1135.
1136.
1137.
1138.
1139.
1140.
1141.
1142.

1143.
1144.
1145.
1146.
1147.
1148.
1149.
1150.
1151.
1152.
1153.

1154.

1155.
1156.

1157.
1158.
1159.
1160.
1161.
1162.
1163.
1164.
1165.
1166.
1167.
1168.
1169.
1170.
1171.
1172.
1173.

1174.
1175.

1176.

1201.
1202.
1203.
1204.
1205.
1206.
1207.
1208.
1209.
1210.
1211.
1212.
1213.
1214.
1215.
1216.
1217.
1218.

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Rehabilitation of Corps of Engineers constructed dams.

Columbia River.

Missouri River Reservoir sediment management.

Reauthorization of lock operations pilot program.

Credit or reimbursement.

Non-Federal implementation pilot program.

Surplus water contracts and water storage agreements.

Post-disaster watershed assessments in territories of the United States.
Expedited consideration.

Project studies subject to independent peer review.

Feasibility of Chicago Sanitary and Ship Canal Dispersal Barriers
Project, Illinois.

Acknowledgment of credit.

Levee safety initiative reauthorization.

Funding to process permits.

Reservoir sediment.

Clarification for integral determination.

Beneficial use of dredged sediment.

Inclusion of alternative measures for aquatic ecosystem restoration.
Regional sediment management.

Operation and maintenance of navigation and hydroelectric facilities.
Study of water resources development projects by non-Federal interests.
Construction of water resources development projects by non-Federal in-
terests.

Corps budgeting; project deauthorizations; comprehensive backlog re-
port.

Indian Tribes.

Inﬂlz;ltion adjustment of cost-sharing provisions for territories and Indian
Tribes.

Corps of Engineers continuing authorities program.

Hurricane and storm damage reduction.

Regional coalitions and higher education.

Emergency response to natural disasters.

Cost and benefit feasibility assessment.

Extended community assistance by the Corps of Engineers.

Dam safety.

Local government water management plans.

Structures and facilities constructed by Secretary.

Advanced funds for water resources development studies and projects.
Costs in excess of Federal participation limit.

Disposition of projects.

Contributed funds for non-Federal reservoir operations.

Watercraft inspection stations.

Restricted areas at Corps of Engineers dams.

Coastal erosion.

Prohibition on surplus water fees, Lake Cumberland Watershed, Ken-
tucky and Tennessee.

Middle Rio Grande peak flow restoration.

Prohibition of administrative fees in implementing Rough River Lake
Flowage Easement Encroachment Resolution Plan.

Preconstruction engineering design demonstration program.

Subtitle B—Studies and Reports

Authorization of proposed feasibility studies.

Additional studies.

Expedited completion.

GAO study on benefit-cost analysis reforms.

Harbor Maintenance Trust Fund report.

Identification of nonpowered dams for hydropower development.
Study on innovative ports for offshore wind development.
Innovative materials and advanced technologies report.

Study and report on expediting certain waiver processes.
Report on debris removal.

Corps flood policy within urban areas.

Feasibility studies for mitigation of damage.

Applications of military leasing authorities.

Community engagement.

Transparency in administrative expenses.

Assessment of harbors and inland harbors.

Maintenance of high-risk flood control projects.

North Atlantic Division report on hurricane barriers and harbors of ref-
uge.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3767

Sec. 1219. Great Lakes coastal resiliency study.

Sec. 1220. McMicken Dam, Arizona, and Muddy River, Massachusetts.
Sec. 1221. Table Rock Lake, Arkansas and Missouri.

Sec. 1222. Forecast-informed reservoir operations.

Sec. 1223. Cedar River, Iowa.

Sec. 1224. Old River control structure, Louisiana.

Sec. 1225. Upper Mississippi River protection.

Sec. 1226. Missouri River.

Sec. 1227. Lower Missouri River bank stabilization and navigation.
Sec. 1228. Coastal Texas study.

Sec. 1229. Report on water supply contract, Wright Patman Lake, Texas.

Subtitle C—Deauthorizations, Modifications, and Related Provisions

Sec. 1301. Deauthorization of inactive projects.

Sec. 1302. Backlog prevention.

Sec. 1303. Project modifications.

Sec. 1304. Lytle and Cajon Creeks, California.

Sec. 1305. Yuba River Basin, California.

Sec. 1306. Bridgeport Harbor, Connecticut.

Sec. 1307. Delaware River navigation project.

Sec. 1308. Comprehensive Everglades restoration plan, Central and Southern Flor-
ida, Everglades Agricultural Area, Florida.

Sec. 1309. Kissimmee River restoration, Florida.

Sec. 1310. Levee L—212, Four River Basin, Ocklawaha River, Florida.

Sec. 1311. Green River and Barren River Locks and Dams, Kentucky.

Sec. 1312. Cape Arundel Disposal Site, Maine.

Sec. 1313. Penobscot River, Maine.

Sec. 1314. Boston harbor reserved channel deauthorizations.

Sec. 1315. Corps of Engineers bridge repair program for New England evacuation
routes.

Sec. 1316. Plymouth Harbor, Massachusetts.

Sec. 1317. Portsmouth Harbor and Piscataqua River.

Sec. 1318. Missouri River and tributaries at Kansas Cities, Missouri and Kansas.

Sec. 1319. Hampton Harbor, New Hampshire, navigation improvement project.

Sec. 1320. Passaic River Federal Navigation Channel, New Jersey.

Sec. 1321. Fargo-Moorhead Metropolitan Area Diversion Project, North Dakota.

Sec. 1322. Clatsop County, Oregon.

Sec. 1323. Svensen Island, Oregon.

Sec. 1324. West Tennessee Tributaries project, Tennessee.

Sec. 1325. Puget Sound nearshore ecosystem restoration.

Sec. 1326. Milwaukee Harbor, Milwaukee, Wisconsin.

Sec. 1327. Project completion for disaster areas.

Sec. 1328. Federal assistance.

Sec. 1329. Expedited initiation.

Sec. 1330. Project deauthorization and study extensions.

Sec. 1331. Conveyances.

Sec. 1332. Report on future water resources development.

Subtitle D—Water Resources Infrastructure

Sec. 1401. Project authorizations.
Sec. 1402. Special rules.
Sec. 1403. Norfolk Harbor and Channels, Virginia.

TITLE II—DRINKING WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENT

Sec. 2001. Indian reservation drinking water program.

Sec. 2002. Clean, safe, reliable water infrastructure.

Sec. 2003. Study on intractable water systems.

Sec. 2004. Sense of Congress relating to access to nonpotable water.

Sec. 2005. Drinking water infrastructure resilience and sustainability.

Sec. 2006. Voluntary school and child care program lead testing grant program en-
hancement.

Sec. 2007. Innovative water technology grant program.

Sec. 2008. Improved consumer confidence reports.

Sec. 2009. Contractual agreements.

Sec. 2010. Additional considerations for compliance.

Sec. 2011. Improved accuracy and availability of compliance monitoring data.

Sec. 2012. Asset management.

Sec. 2013. Community water system risk and resilience.

Sec. 2014. Authorization for grants for State programs.

Sec. 2015. State revolving loan funds.

Sec. 2016. Authorization for source water petition programs.



132 STAT. 3768

Water Resources
Development Act
of 2018.

33 USC 2201
note.

33 USC 2201
note.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

2017.
2018.
2019.
2020.
2021.
2022.
2023.

3001.
3002.
3003.
3004.
3005.
3006.
3007.
3008.

3009.

4101.
4102.
4103.
4104.
4105.
4106.
4107.

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Review of technologies.

Source water.

Report on Federal cross-cutting requirements.

Assistance for areas affected by natural disasters.

Monitoring for unregulated contaminants.

American iron and steel products.

Authorization for capitalization grants to States for State drinking water
treatment revolving loan funds.

TITLE III—ENERGY

Modernizing authorizations for necessary hydropower approvals.
Qualifying conduit hydropower facilities.

Promoting hydropower development at existing nonpowered dams.
Closed-Loop pumped storage projects.

Considerations for relicensing terms.

Fair ratepayer accountability, transparency, and efficiency standards.

J. Bennett Johnston Waterway hydropower extension.

Stay and Reinstatement of FERC License No. 11393 for the Mahoney
Lake Hydroelectric Project.

Strategic Petroleum Reserve drawdown.

TITLE IV—OTHER MATTERS
Subtitle A—Clean Water

Stormwater infrastructure funding task force.

Wastewater technology clearinghouse.

Technical assistance for treatment works.

Amendments to Long Island Sound programs.

Authorization of appropriations for Columbia river basin restoration.
Sewer overflow control grants.

Assistance for individual household decentralized wastewater systems of
individuals with low or moderate income.

Subtitle B—WIFIA Reauthorization and Innovative Financing for State Loan Funds

Sec. 4201. WIFIA reauthorization and innovative financing for State loan funds.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

Sec.
Sec.

4301.
4302.
4303.
4304.
4305.
4306.
4307.
4308.
4309.
4310.

4311.
4312.
4313.

4314.
4315.

Subtitle C—Miscellaneous

Agreement with Commissioner of Reclamation.

Snake River Basin flood prevention action plan.

GAO audit of contracts and Tainter gate repairs of Harlan County Dam.
Water infrastructure and workforce investment.

Regional liaisons for minority, Tribal, and low-income communities.
WaterSense.

Predatory and other wild animals.

Klamath project water and power.

Certain Bureau of Reclamation dikes.

Authority to make entire active capacity of Fontenelle Reservoir avail-
able for use.

Blackfeet water rights settlement.

Indian irrigation fund reauthorization.

Reauthorization of repair, replacement, and maintenance of certain In-
dian irrigation projects.

Indian dam safety reauthorization.

Diana E. Murphy United States Courthouse.

TITLE I—WATER RESOURCES
DEVELOPMENT

SEC. 101. SHORT TITLE.

This title may be cited as the “Water Resources Development
Act of 2018”.

SEC. 102. SECRETARY DEFINED.

In this title, the term “Secretary” means the Secretary of the
Army.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3769

Subtitle A—General Provisions

SEC. 1101. SENSE OF CONGRESS REGARDING WATER RESOURCES
DEVELOPMENT BILLS.

It is the sense of Congress that, because the missions of the
Corps of Engineers for navigation, flood control, beach erosion con-
trol and shoreline protection, hydroelectric power, recreation, water
supply, environmental protection, restoration, and enhancement,
and fish and wildlife mitigation benefit all Americans, and because
water resources development projects are critical to maintaining
the country’s economic prosperity, national security, and environ-
mental protection, Congress should consider a water resources
development bill not less often than once every Congress.

SEC. 1102. STUDY OF THE FUTURE OF THE UNITED STATES ARMY
CORPS OF ENGINEERS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall enter into an agreement
with the National Academy of Sciences to convene a committee
of experts to carry out a comprehensive study on—

(1) the ability of the Corps of Engineers to carry out its
statutory missions and responsibilities, and the potential effects
of transferring the functions (including regulatory obligations),
personnel, assets, and civilian staff responsibilities of the Sec-
retary relating to civil works from the Department of Defense
to a new or existing agency or subagency of the Federal Govern-
ment, including how such a transfer might affect the Federal
Government’s ability to meet the current statutory missions
and responsibilities of the Corps of Engineers; and

(2) improving the Corps of Engineers’ project delivery proc- Recommenda-
esses, including recommendations for such improvements, tions.
taking into account factors including—

(A) the effect of the annual appropriations process
on the ability of the Corps of Engineers to efficiently secure
and carry out contracts for water resources development
projects and perform regulatory obligations;

(B) the effect that the current Corps of Engineers
leadership and geographic structure at the division and
district levels has on its ability to carry out its missions
in a cost-effective manner; and

(C) the effect of the frequency of rotations of senior
leaders of the Corps of Engineers and how such frequency
affects the function of the district.

(b) CONSIDERATIONS.—The study carried out under subsection
(a) shall include consideration of—

(1) effects on the national security of the United States;

(2) the ability of the Corps of Engineers to maintain suffi-
cient engineering capability and capacity to assist ongoing and
future operations of the United States armed services;

(3) emergency and natural disaster response obligations
of the Federal Government that are carried out by the Corps
of Engineers; and

(4) the ability of the Corps of Engineers to increase effi-
ciency, coordination, transparency, and cost savings of the
project delivery process.

(c) SUBMISSION TO CONGRESS.—The Secretary shall submit the Reports.
final report of the National Academy containing the findings of



132 STAT. 3770 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Deadline.

Recommenda-

tions.

Analyses.

the study carried out under subsection (a) to the Committee on
Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives
and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate
not later than 2 years after the date of enactment of this Act.

(d) CONGRESSIONAL APPROVAL.—The Secretary may not imple-
ment the findings of the study carried out under subsection (a)
unless expressly authorized by Congress.

SEC. 1103. STUDY ON ECONOMIC AND BUDGETARY ANALYSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days after the date of
enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall enter into an agreement
with the National Academy of Sciences to—

(1) carry out a study on the economic principles and analyt-
ical methodologies currently used by or applied to the Corps
of Engineers to formulate, evaluate, and budget for water
resources development projects; and

(2) make recommendations to Congress on potential
changes to such principles and methodologies to improve trans-
parency, return on Federal investment, cost savings, and
prioritization, in the formulation, evaluation, and budgeting
of such projects.

(b) CONSIDERATIONS.—The study under subsection (a) shall
include—

(1) an analysis of the current economic principles and
analytical methodologies used by or applied to the Corps of
Engineers in determining the total benefits and total costs
during the formulation of, and plan selection for, a water
resources development project;

(2) an analysis of improvements or alternatives to how
the Corps of Engineers utilizes the National Economic Develop-
ment, Regional Economic Development, Environmental Quality,
and Other Social Effects accounts developed by the Institute
for Water Resources of the Corps of Engineers in the formula-
tion of, and plan selection for, such projects;

(3) an analysis of whether such principles and methodolo-
gies fully account for all of the potential benefits of project
alternatives, including any reasonably associated benefits of
such alternatives that are not contrary to law, Federal policy,
or sound water resources management;

(4) an analysis of whether such principles and methodolo-
gies fully account for all of the costs of project alternatives,
including potential societal costs, such as lost ecosystem serv-
ices, and full lifecycle costs for such alternatives;

(5) an analysis of the methodologies utilized by the Federal
Government in setting and applying discount rates for benefit-
cost analyses used in the formulation, evaluation, and budg-
eting of Corps of Engineers water resources development
projects;

(6) an analysis of whether or not the Corps of Engineers—

(A) considers cumulative benefits of locally developed
projects, including Master Plans approved by the Corps;
and

(B) uses the benefits referred to in subparagraph (A)
for purposes of benefit-cost analysis for project justification
for potential projects within such Master Plans; and



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3771

(7) consideration of the report submitted under section
1204, if that report is submitted prior to completion of the
study under this section.

(c) PUBLICATION.—The agreement entered into under subsection
(a) shall require the National Academy of Sciences to, not later
than 30 days after the completion of the study—

(1) submit a report containing the results of the study Reports.
and the recommendations to the Committee on Environment Recommenda-
and Public Works of the Senate and the Committee on Ho0
Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives; and

(2) make a copy of such report available on a publicly Web posting.
accessible website.

SEC. 1104. DISSEMINATION OF INFORMATION. 33 USC 2282d

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress finds the following: note.

(1) Congress plays a central role in identifying, prioritizing,
and authorizing vital water resources infrastructure activities
throughout the United States.

(2) The Water Resources Reform and Development Act
of 2014 (Public Law 113-121) established a new and trans-
parent process to review and prioritize the water resources
development activities of the Corps of Engineers with strong
congressional oversight.

(3) Section 7001 of the Water Resources Reform and
Development Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2282d) requires the Sec-
retary to develop and submit to Congress each year a Report
to Congress on Future Water Resources Development and, as
part of the annual report process, to—

(A) publish a notice in the Federal Register that
requests from non-Federal interests proposed feasibility
studies and proposed modifications to authorized water
resources development projects and feasibility studies for
inclusion in the report; and

(B) review the proposals submitted and include in the
report those proposed feasibility studies and proposed modi-
fications that meet the criteria for inclusion established
under such section 7001.

(4) Congress will use the information provided in the
annual Report to Congress on Future Water Resources Develop-
ment to determine authorization needs and priorities for pur-
poses of water resources development legislation.

(5) To ensure that Congress can gain a thorough under-
standing of the water resources development needs and prior-
ities of the United States, it is important that the Secretary
take sufficient steps to ensure that non-Federal interests are
made aware of the new annual report process, including the
need for non-Federal interests to submit proposals during the
Secretary’s annual request for proposals in order for such pro-
posals to be eligible for consideration by Congress.

(b) DISSEMINATION OF PROCESS INFORMATION.—The Secretary
shall develop, support, and implement education and awareness
efforts for non-Federal interests with respect to the annual Report
to Congress on Future Water Resources Development required
under section 7001 of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2282d), including efforts to—



132 STAT. 3772 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Notice.

Guidance.

33 USC 2202.

Guidance.

Web posting.

Time period.

Web posting.

(1) develop and disseminate technical assistance materials,
seminars, and guidance on the annual process as it relates
to non-Federal interests;

(2) provide written notice to local elected officials and pre-
vious and potential non-Federal interests on the annual process
and on opportunities to address local water resources challenges
through the missions and authorities of the Corps of Engineers;

(3) issue guidance for non-Federal interests to assist such
interests in developing proposals for water resources develop-
ment projects that satisfy the requirements of such section
7001; and

(4) provide, at the request of a non-Federal interest, assist-
ance with researching and identifying existing project
authorizations and Corps of Engineers decision documents.

SEC. 1105. NON-FEDERAL ENGAGEMENT AND REVIEW.

(a) IsSUANCE.—The Secretary shall expeditiously issue guidance
to implement each covered provision of law in accordance with
this section.

(b) PuBLIC NOTICE.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Prior to developing and issuing any new
or revised implementation guidance for a covered water
resources development law, the Secretary shall issue a public
notice that—

(A) informs potentially interested non-Federal stake-
holders of the Secretary’s intent to develop and issue such
guidance; and

(B) provides an opportunity for interested non-Federal
stakeholders to engage with, and provide input and rec-
ommendations to, the Secretary on the development and
issuance of such guidance.

(2) ISSUANCE OF NOTICE.—The Secretary shall issue the
notice under paragraph (1) through a posting on a publicly
accessible website dedicated to providing notice on the develop-
ment and issuance of implementation guidance for a covered
water resources development law.

(c) STAKEHOLDER ENGAGEMENT.—

(1) INpUT.—The Secretary shall allow a minimum of 60
days after issuance of the public notice under subsection (b)
for non-Federal stakeholders to provide input and recommenda-
tions to the Secretary, prior to finalizing implementation guid-
ance for a covered water resources development law.

(2) OUTREACH.—The Secretary may, as appropriate (as
determined by the Secretary), reach out to non-Federal stake-
holders and circulate drafts of implementation guidance for
a covered water resources development law for informal input
and recommendations.

(d) SuBMISSION.—The Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of
the Senate a copy of all input and recommendations received pursu-
ant to subsection (c) and a description of any consideration of
such input and recommendations.

(e) DEVELOPMENT OF  GUIDANCE.—When  developing
implementation guidance for a covered water resources development
law, the Secretary shall take into consideration the input and
recommendations received from non-Federal stakeholders, and



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3773

make the final guidance available to the public on the publicly
accessible website described in subsection (b)(2).
(f) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:

(1) COVERED PROVISION OF LAW.—The term “covered provi-
sion of law” means a provision of law under the jurisdiction
of the Secretary contained in, or amended by, a covered water
resources development law, with respect to which—

(A) the Secretary determines guidance is necessary
in order to implement the provision; and

(B) no such guidance has been issued as of the date
of enactment of this Act.

(2) COVERED WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT LAW.—The
term “covered water resources development law” means—

] (A) the Water Resources Reform and Development Act

of 2014;

(B) the Water Resources Development Act of 2016;

(C) this Act; and

(D) any Federal water resources development law
enacted after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 1106. LAKE OKEECHOBEE REGULATION SCHEDULE REVIEW.

The Secretary shall expedite completion of the Lake Okeechobee
regulation schedule to coincide with the completion of the Herbert
Hoover Dike project, and may consider all relevant aspects of the
Comprehensive Everglades Restoration Plan described in section
601 g)f the Water Resources Development Act of 2000 (114 Stat.
2680).

SEC. 1107. ACCESS TO REAL ESTATE DATA. 33 USC 579e.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Using available funds, the Secretary shall Public
make publicly available, including on a publicly accessible website, information.
information on all Federal real estate assets in the United States Veb posting.
that are owned, operated, or managed by, or in the custody of,
the Corps of Engineers.

(b) REQUIREMENTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The real estate information made avail-
able under subsection (a) shall include—

(A) existing standardized real estate plat descriptions
of assets described in subsection (a); and
(B) existing geographic information systems and

geospatial information associated with such assets.

(2) COLLABORATION.—In making information available Consultation.
under subsection (a), the Secretary shall consult with the
Administrator of General Services. Such information may be
made available, in whole or in part, in the Federal real property
database published under section 21 of the Federal Assets
Sale and Transfer Act of 2016 (Public Law 114-287), as deter-
mined appropriate by the Administrator of General Services.

Nothing in this paragraph shall be construed as requiring

the Administrator of General Services to add additional data

elements or features to such Federal real property database

if such additions are impractical or would add additional costs

to such database.

(¢) LMITATION.—Nothing in this section shall compel or
authorize the disclosure of data or other information determined
by the Secretary to be confidential, privileged, national security
information, personal information, or information the disclosure
of which is otherwise prohibited by law.



132 STAT. 3774 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

33 USC 2263a.

Recommenda-
tions.
Plan.

36 USC 610 note.

Memorandum.

33 USC 2326
note.
Contracts.

(d) TiMING.—The Secretary shall ensure that the implementa-
tion of subsection (a) occurs as soon as practicable.

(e) EFFECT ON OTHER LAWS.—Nothing in this section shall
be construed as modifying, or exempting the Corps of Engineers
from, the requirements of the Federal real property database pub-
lished under section 21 of the Federal Assets Sale and Transfer
Act of 2016 (Public Law 114-287).

SEC. 1108. AQUATIC INVASIVE SPECIES RESEARCH.

(a) IN GENERAL.—As part of the ongoing activities of the Engi-
neer Research and Development Center to address the spread and
impacts of aquatic invasive species, the Secretary shall undertake
research on the management and eradication of aquatic invasive
species, including Asian carp and zebra mussels.

(b) LOCATIONS.—In carrying out subsection (a), the Secretary
shall work with Corps of Engineers district offices representing
diverse geographical regions of the continental United States that
are impacted by aquatic invasive species, such as the Atlantic,
Pacific, and Gulf coasts and the Great Lakes.

(c) REPORT.—Not later than 180 days after the date of enact-
ment of this section, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of
the Senate a report recommending a plan to address the spread
and impacts of aquatic invasive species.

SEC. 1109. HARMFUL ALGAL BLOOM TECHNOLOGY DEMONSTRATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, acting through the Engineer
Research and Development Center, shall implement a 5-year harm-
ful algal bloom technology development demonstration program
under the Aquatic Nuisance Research Program. To the extent prac-
ticable, the Secretary shall support research that will identify and
develop improved strategies for early detection, prevention, and
management techniques and procedures to reduce the occurrence
and effects of harmful algal blooms in the Nation’s water resources.

(b) ScALABILITY REQUIREMENT.—The Secretary shall ensure
that technologies identified, tested, and deployed under the harmful
algal bloom technology development demonstration program have
the ability to scale up to meet the needs of harmful-algal-bloom-
related events.

SEC. 1110. BUBBLY CREEK, CHICAGO ECOSYSTEM RESTORATION.

The Secretary shall enter into a memorandum of understanding
with the Administrator of the Environmental Protection Agency
to facilitate ecosystem restoration activities at the South Fork of
the South Branch of the Chicago River (commonly known as Bubbly
Creek).

SEC. 1111. DREDGE PILOT PROGRAM.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary is authorized to carry out
a pilot program to award contracts with a duration of up to 5
years for the operation and maintenance of harbors and inland
harbors referred to in section 210(a)(2) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2238(a)(2)).

(b) SCOPE.—In carrying out the pilot program under subsection
(a), the Secretary may award a contract described in such sub-
section, which may address one or more harbors or inland harbors



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3775

in a geographical region, if the Secretary determines that the con-
tract provides cost savings compared to the awarding of such work
on an annual basis or on a project-by-project basis.

(c) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—Not later than 1 year after the
date on which the first contract is awarded pursuant to the pilot
program carried out under subsection (a), the Secretary shall submit
to Congress a report evaluating, with respect to the pilot program
and any contracts awarded under the pilot program—

(1) cost effectiveness;

(2) reliability and performance;

(3) cost savings attributable to mobilization and demobiliza-
tion of dredge equipment; and

(4) response times to address navigational impediments.

(d) SUNSET.—The authority of the Secretary to enter into con-
tracts pursuant to the pilot program carried out under subsection
(a), shall expire on the date that is 10 years after the date of
enactment of this Act.

SEC. 1112. HURRICANE AND STORM DAMAGE PROTECTION PROGRAM. 33 USC 426¢g

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary is authorized to carry out ré%ﬁ'mcts‘

a pilot program to award single contracts for more than one author-
ized hurricane and storm damage reduction project in a geo-
graphical region, including projects across more than one Corps
of Engineers district, if the Secretary determines that the contract
provides cost savings compared to the awarding of such work on
a project-by-project basis.

(b) PROJECT SELECTION.—In carrying out the pilot program Consultation.
under subsection (a), the Secretary shall consult with relevant
State agencies in selecting projects.

(c) CRITERIA.—In carrying out the pilot program under sub-
section (a), the Secretary shall establish criteria and other consider-
ations that—

(1) foster Federal, State, and local collaboration;

(2) evaluate the performance of projects being carried out
under a single contract with respect to whether such projects
yield any regional or multi-district benefits; and

(3) include other criteria and considerations that the Sec-
retary determines to be appropriate.

(d) REPORT.—Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment Recommenda-
of this Act, and annually thereafter, the Secretary shall submit tions.
to the Committee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate
and the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the
House of Representatives a report that includes findings and rec-
ommendations of the Secretary with respect to the projects com-
pleted under the pilot program carried out under subsection (a).

(e) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There is authorized
to be appropriated to carry out this section $75,000,000.

(f) TERMINATION.—The authority of the Secretary to enter into
contracts pursuant to the pilot program carried out under subsection
(a) shall expire on the date that is 10 years after the date of
enactment of this Act.

SEC. 1113. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF EXISTING INFRASTRUC- 33 USC 2351a
TURE. note.

The Secretary shall improve the reliability, and operation and
maintenance of, existing infrastructure of the Corps of Engineers,
and, as necessary, improve its resilience to cyber-related threats.



132 STAT. 3776 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

33 USC 634.

35 USC 598a.

Easements.

33 USC 2326b
note.

33 USC 549b.

33 USC 2292
note.
Guidance.

SEC. 1114. ASSISTANCE RELATING TO WATER SUPPLY.

The Secretary may provide assistance to municipalities the
water supply of which is adversely affected by construction carried
out by the Corps of Engineers.

SEC. 1115. PROPERTY ACQUISITION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—In acquiring an interest in land, or requiring
a non-Federal interest to acquire an interest in land, the Secretary
shall, in accordance with the Uniform Relocation Assistance and
Real Property Acquisition Policies Act of 1970, first consider the
minimum interest in real property necessary to support the water
resources development project for which such interest is acquired.

(b) DETERMINATION.—In determining an interest in land under
subsection (a), the Secretary shall first consider a temporary ease-
ment or other interest designed to reduce the overall cost of the
water resources development project for which such interest is
acquired, reduce the time to complete such project, and minimize
conflict with property owners related to such project.

(¢) PROCEDURES USED IN STATE.—In carrying out subsection
(a), the Secretary shall consider, with respect to a State, the proce-
dures that the State uses to acquire, or require the acquisition
of, interests in land, to the extent that such procedures are generally
consistent with the goals of a project or action.

SEC. 1116. DREDGED MATERIAL MANAGEMENT PLANS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—For purposes of dredged material manage-
ment plans initiated after the date of enactment of this Act, the
Secretary shall expedite the dredged material management plan
process in order that such plans make maximum use of existing
information, studies, and innovative dredged material management
practices, and avoid any redundant information collection and
studies.

(b) REPORT.—Not later than 60 days after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to Congress a report on
how the Corps of Engineers intends to meet the requirements
of subsection (a).

SEC. 1117. INCLUSION OF PROJECT OR FACILITY IN CORPS OF ENGI-
NEERS WORKPLAN.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall, to the maximum extent
practicable, include in the future workplan of the Corps any author-
ized project or facility of the Corps of Engineers—

(1) that the Secretary has studied for disposition under
an existing authority, including by carrying out a disposition
study under section 216 of the Flood Control Act of 1970 (33
U.S.C. 549a); and

(2) for which a final report by the Director of Civil Works
has been completed.

(b) NOTIFICATION TO COMMITTEES.—Upon completion of a final
report referred to in subsection (a), the Secretary shall transmit
a copy of the report to the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives and the Committee on
Environment and Public Works of the Senate.

SEC. 1118. GEOMATIC DATA.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall develop guidance for
the acceptance and use of information obtained from a non-Federal
interest through geomatic techniques, including remote sensing and



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3777

land surveying, cartography, geographic information systems, global
navigation satellite systems, photogrammetry, or other remote
means, in carrying out any authority of the Secretary.

(b) CONSIDERATIONS.—In carrying out this section, the Sec-
retary shall ensure that use of information described in subsection
(a) meets the data quality and operational requirements of the
Secretary.

(c) SAVINGS CLAUSE.—Nothing in this section—

(1) requires the Secretary to accept information that the
Secretary determines does not meet the guidance developed
under this section; or

(2) changes the current statutory or regulatory require-
ments of the Corps of Engineers.

SEC. 1119. LOCAL GOVERNMENT RESERVOIR PERMIT REVIEW. 33 USC 2347

(a) IN GENERAL.—During the 10-year period after the date %?Itrfé period.

of enactment of this section, the Secretary shall expedite review
of applications for covered permits, if the permit applicant is a
local governmental entity with jurisdiction over an area for which—
(1) any portion of the water resources available to the
area served by the local governmental entity is polluted by
chemicals used at a formerly used defense site under the juris-
diction of the Department of Defense that is undergoing (or
is scheduled to undergo) environmental restoration under
chapter 160 of title 10, United States Code; and
(2) mitigation of the pollution described in paragraph (1)
is ongoing.

(b) COVERED PERMIT DEFINED.—In this section, the term “cov-
ered permit” means a permit to be issued by the Secretary to
modify a reservoir owned or operated by the Secretary, with respect
to which not less than 80 percent of the water rights are held
for drinking water supplies, in order to accommodate projected
water supply needs of an area with a population of less than
80,000.

(¢) LiMmITATIONS.—Nothing in this section affects any obligation
to comply with the provisions of any Federal law, including—

(1) the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (42

U.S.C. 4321 et seq.); and

(2) the Federal Water Pollution Control Act (33 U.S.C.

1251 et seq.).

SEC. 1120. TRANSPARENCY AND ACCOUNTABILITY IN COST SHARING 33 USC 2315b.
FOR WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT PROJECTS.

(a) DEFINITION OF BALANCE SHEET.—In this section, the term
“balance sheet” means a document that describes—

(1) the funds provided by each Federal and non-Federal
interest for a water resources development project; and
(2) the status of those funds.

(b) ESTABLISHMENT OF BALANCE SHEET.—Each district of the
Corps of Engineers shall, using the authority of the Secretary
under section 10 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1988
(33 U.S.C. 2315)—

(1) maintain a balance sheet for each water resources
development project carried out by the Secretary for which

a non-Federal cost share is required; and

(2) on request of a non-Federal interest that provided funds
for the project, provide to the non-Federal interest a copy
of the balance sheet.



132 STAT. 3778 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Time period.

Deadline.

Notification.

Deadline.

Time period.

Definition.

(c) UNDER-BUDGET PROJECTS.—In the case of a water resources
development project carried out by the Secretary that is completed
at a cost less than the estimated cost, the Secretary shall transfer
any excess non-Federal funds to the non-Federal interest in accord-
ance with the cost-share requirement applicable to the project.

SEC. 1121. UPPER MISSOURI MAINSTEM RESERVOIR WATER WITH-
DRAWAL INTAKE EASEMENT REVIEW.

(a) IN GENERAL.—During the 10-year period beginning on the
date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall, to the maximum
extent practicable, expedite the review of applications for a covered
easement.

(b) PROCESS.—In carrying out this section, the Secretary shall
develop an application to obtain a covered easement that requires
an applicant for a covered easement to submit information that
includes—

(1) all permissible locations for the proposed easement;

(2) the corresponding dimensions of the proposed easement;

(3) the methods of installation of the water withdrawal
intakes; and

(4) any other information that the Secretary may require
to complete the review.

(c) RESPONSE.—Not later than 30 days after the date on which
the Secretary receives an application under subsection (b), the
Secretary shall seek to provide to the applicant a written notifica-
tion that states—

(1) whether the application is complete; and
(2) if the application is not complete, what information
is needed for the application to be complete.

(d) DETERMINATION.—To the maximum extent practicable, not
later than 120 days after the date on which the Secretary receives
a complete application for a covered easement, the Secretary shall
approve or deny the application for the covered easement.

(e) COvERED EASEMENT DEFINED.—In this section, the term
“covered easement” means an easement necessary to access Federal
land under the control of the Secretary for the placement of water
withdrawal intakes in the Upper Missouri Mainstem Reservoirs
that does not otherwise involve the alteration or modification of
any structures or facilities located on that Federal land, other
than those owned by the non-Federal interest.

(f) LiMmITATIONS.—Nothing in this section affects any obligation
to comply with the provisions of any Federal law, including—

(1) the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (42

U.S.C. 4321 et seq.); and

(2) the Federal Water Pollution Control Act (33 U.S.C.

1251 et seq.).

SEC. 1122. LIMITATION ON CONTRACT EXECUTION.

(a) LIMITATION.—For any new covered contract entered into
during the period beginning on the date of enactment of this Act
and ending on December 31, 2020, any local governmental entity
that is a party to a covered contract entered into before such
period shall be required to pay not more than 110 percent of
the contractual rate per acre-foot in effect under the most recent
such covered contract.

(b) COVERED CONTRACT.—In this section, the term “covered
contract” means a contract between a local governmental entity



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3779

and the Secretary for water supply storage in a nonhydropower
lake within the Verdigris River Basin.

SEC. 1123. CERTAIN LEVEE IMPROVEMENTS. 33 USC 3306.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding section 211 of the Water
Resources Development Act of 2000 (31 U.S.C. 6505 note), the
Secretary, at the request of a local government, is authorized to
provide technical services, on a reimbursable basis, to the local
government to assess the reasons a federally constructed levee
owned or operated by the local government is not accredited by
the Federal Emergency Management Agency.

(b) FEDERAL LEVEES.—In carrying out this section, in a case
in which a levee owned and operated by the Secretary is hydrau-
lically tied to a levee described in subsection (a), the Secretary
is encouraged to cooperate, to the maximum extent practicable,
with the relevant local governmental entities in assessing the rea-
sons the levee described in subsection (a) is not accredited.

(¢) LIMITATION.—Nothing in this section—

(1) affects the responsibilities of a local government to
operate and maintain its flood control infrastructure; or

(2) obligates the Secretary to expend additional Federal
resources on levees owned and operated by the Secretary.

SEC. 1124. COST-SHARE PAYMENT FOR CERTAIN PROJECTS.

The Secretary shall, subject to the availability of appropriations,
pay the outstanding balance of the Federal cost share for any
project carried out under section 593 of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1999 (113 Stat. 380).

SEC. 1125. LOCKS ON ALLEGHENY RIVER.

The Corps of Engineers may consider, in making funding deter-
minations with respect to the operation and maintenance of locks
on the Allegheny River—

(1) recreational boat traffic levels; and
(2) related economic benefits.

SEC. 1126. PURPOSE AND NEED. 33 USC 2347b.

(a) PURPOSE AND NEED STATEMENTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 90 days after the date Deadline.
of receipt of a complete application for a water storage project,
the District Engineer shall develop and provide to the applicant
a purpose and need statement that describes—

(A) whether the District Engineer concurs with the
assessment of the purpose of and need for the water storage
project proposed by the applicant; and

(B) in any case in which the District Engineer does Assessment.
not concur as described in subparagraph (A), an assessment
by the District Engineer of the purpose of and need for
the project.

(2) EFFECT ON ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT STATEMENTS.—No
environmental impact statement or environmental assessment
required under the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969
(42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq.) shall substantially commence with
respect to a water storage project until the date on which
the District Engineer provides to the applicant a purpose and
need statement as required under paragraph (1).

(b) APPEALS REQUEST.—A non-Federal interest may use the
administrative appeals process described in part 331 of title 33,



132 STAT. 3780 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

33 USC 2355.

33 USC 7020.

Definition.

Code of Federal Regulations (or any succeeding regulation), in rela-
tion to a decision of the Secretary related to an application for
a water storage project.

SEC. 1127. PRIOR PROJECT AUTHORIZATION.

In any case in which a project under the jurisdiction of the
Secretary is budgeted under a different business line than the
business line under which the project was originally authorized,
the Secretary shall ensure that the project is carried out in accord-
ance with any requirements that apply to the business line under
which the project was originally authorized.

SEC. 1128. MISSISSIPPI RIVER AND TRIBUTARIES PROJECT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—After any flood event requiring operation
or activation of any floodway or backwater feature within the Mis-
sissippi River and Tributaries Project through natural overtopping
of a Federal levee or artificial crevassing of a Federal levee to
relieve pressure on the levees elsewhere in the system, the Secretary
shall expeditiously reset and restore the damaged floodway’s levees.

(b) CONSULTATION.—In carrying out subsection (a), the Sec-
retary shall provide an opportunity for consultation with affected
communities.

(¢c) Mississippl RIVER AND TRIBUTARIES PROJECT.—The term
“Mississippi River and Tributaries Project” means the Mississippi
River and Tributaries project authorized by the Act of May 15,
1928 (Chap. 569; 45 Stat. 534).

SEC. 1129. INCLUSION OF TRIBAL INTERESTS IN PROJECT CONSULTA-
TIONS.

(a) REPORT REQUIRED.—As soon as practicable following the
date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit the report
required under section 1120(a)(3) of the Water Resources Develop-
ment Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1643).

(b) CoNSULTATION.—The Secretary shall ensure that all existing
Tribal consultation policies, regulations, and guidance continue to
be implemented, and that consultations with Federal and State
agencies and Indian Tribes required for a water resources develop-
ment project are carried out.

SEC. 1130. BENEFICIAL USE OF DREDGED MATERIAL.

Section 1122 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2016
(33 U.S.C. 2326 note) is amended—
(1) in subsection (b)(1), by striking “10” and inserting “20”;
and
(2) in subsection (g), by striking “10” and inserting “20”.

SEC. 1131. ICE JAM PREVENTION AND MITIGATION.

Section 1150(c) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2016 (33 U.S.C. 701s note) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking “During fiscal years 2017 through 2022,
the Secretary” and inserting “The Secretary”; and

(B) by striking “10 projects” and inserting “20 projects”;
and
(2) in paragraph (2)—

(A) by striking “shall ensure” and inserting the fol-
lowing : “shall—

“(A) ensure”;



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3781

(B) by striking the period at the end and inserting
“ and”; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

“B) select not fewer than one project to be carried
out on a reservation (as defined in section 3 of the Indian
Financing Act of 1974) that serves more than one Indian
tribe (as defined in section 4 of the Indian Self-Determina-
tion and Education Assistance Act).”.

SEC. 1132. REHABILITATION OF CORPS OF ENGINEERS CONSTRUCTED
DAMS.

Section 1177 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2016
(33 U.S.C. 467f-2 note) is amended—
(1) in subsection (e), by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting
“$40,000,000”; and
(2) in subsection (f), by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting
“$40,000,000”.

SEC. 1133. COLUMBIA RIVER.

(a) BONNEVILLE DAM, OREGON.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in consultation with the Consultation.
Secretary of the Interior, shall examine and assess the extent Examinations.
to which Indians (as defined in section 4 of the Indian Self- Assessments.
Determination and Education Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 5304))
have been displaced as a result of the construction of the
Bonneville Dam, Oregon, as authorized by the first section
of the Act of August 30, 1935 (49 Stat. 1032) and the first
section and section 2(a) of the Act of August 20, 1937 (16
U.S.C. 832, 832a(a)).

(2) INcLUSION.—The examination and assessment under
paragraph (1) may include assessments relating to housing
and related facilities.

(3) ASSISTANCE.—If the Secretary determines, based on Determination.
the examination and assessment under paragraph (1), that
assistance is required or needed, the Secretary may use all
existing authorities of the Secretary, including under this Act,
to provide assistance to Indians who have been displaced as
a result of the construction of the Bonneville Dam, Oregon.

(4) TRIBAL ASSISTANCE.—Section 1178(c)(1)(A) of the Water
Resources Development Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1675) is amended
by striking “Upon the request of the Secretary of the Interior,
the Secretary may provide assistance” and inserting “The Sec-
retary, in consultation with the Secretary of the Interior, may
provide assistance”.

(b) JOHN DAY DAM, WASHINGTON AND OREGON.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in consultation with the Consultation.
Secretary of the Interior, shall examine and assess the extent Examinations.
to which Indians (as defined in section 4 of the Indian Self- Assessments.
Determination and Education Assistance Act (25 U.S.C. 5304))
have been displaced as a result of the construction of the
John Day Dam, Oregon, as authorized by section 204 of the
Flood Control Act of 1950 (64 Stat. 179).

(2) INCLUSION.—The examination and assessment under
paragraph (1) may include—

(A) assessments relating to housing and related facili-
ties; and

(B) the study required by section 1178(c)(2) of the
Water Resources Development Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1675).



132 STAT. 3782

Determination.

Consultation.
Development
plan.

Cost estimate.
Schedule.

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

(3) ASSISTANCE.—If the Secretary determines, based on
the examination and assessment under paragraph (1), that
assistance is required or needed, the Secretary may use all
existing authorities of the Secretary, including under this Act,
to provide assistance to Indians who have been displaced as
a result of the construction of the John Day Dam, Oregon.
(c) DALLES DAM, WASHINGTON AND OREGON.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, in consultation with the
Secretary of the Interior, shall complete and carry out a village
development plan for any Indian village submerged as a result
of the construction of the Dalles Dam, Columbia River, Wash-
ington and Oregon, as authorized by section 204 of the Flood
Control Act of 1950 (64 Stat. 179).

(2) ASSISTANCE.—The Secretary may acquire land from
willing land owners in carrying out a village development plan
under paragraph (1).

(3) REQUIREMENTS.—A village development plan completed
under paragraph (1) shall include, at a minimum, an estimated
cost and tentative schedule for the construction of a replace-
ment village.

SEC. 1134. MISSOURI RIVER RESERVOIR SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT.

Section 1179(a) of the Water Resources Development Act of

2016 (130 Stat. 1675) is amended—

Applicability.

(1) by redesignating paragraphs (4) through (8) as para-
graphs (5) through (9), respectively;

(2) by inserting after paragraph (3) the following:

“(4) PRIORITIZATION OF SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT PLANS.—
In carrying out the pilot project under this subsection, the
Secretary shall give priority to developing and implementing
sediment management plans that affect reservoirs that cross
State lines.”; and

(3) in paragraph (8) (as so redesignated)—

(A) by redesignating subparagraph (B) as subpara-
graph (D); and

(B) by striking subparagraph (A) and inserting the
following:

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall carry out the
pilot program established under this subsection in partner-
ship with the Secretary of the Interior, and the program
shall apply to reservoirs managed or owned by the Bureau
of Reclamation.

“(B) MEMORANDUM OF AGREEMENT.—For sediment
management plans that apply to a reservoir managed or
owned by the Bureau of Reclamation under subparagraph
(A), the Secretary and the Secretary of the Interior shall
execute a memorandum of agreement establishing the
framework for a partnership and the terms and conditions
for sharing expertise and resources.

“(C) PAYMENTS.—The Secretary is authorized to accept
and expend funds from the Secretary of the Interior to
complete any work under this paragraph at a reservoir
managed or owned by the Bureau of Reclamation.”.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3783

SEC. 1135. REAUTHORIZATION OF LOCK OPERATIONS PILOT PRO-
GRAM.

Section 1017(f) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2212 note) is amended by striking
“5 years” and inserting “10 years”.

SEC. 1136. CREDIT OR REIMBURSEMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1022 of the Water Resources Reform
and Development Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2225) is amended to
read as follows:

“SEC. 1022. CREDIT OR REIMBURSEMENT.

“(a) REQUESTS FOR CREDITS.—With respect to an authorized
flood damage reduction project, or separable element thereof, that
has been constructed by a non-Federal interest under section 211
of the Water Resources Development Act of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 701b—
13), or an authorized coastal navigation project that has been con-
structed by the Corps of Engineers pursuant to section 11 of the
Act of March 3, 1925, before the date of enactment of the Water
Resources Development Act of 2018, the Secretary may provide
to the non-Federal interest, at the request of the non-Federal
interest, a credit in an amount equal to the estimated Federal
share of the cost of the project or separable element, in lieu of
providing to the non-Federal interest a reimbursement in that
amount or reimbursement of funds of an equivalent amount, subject
to the availability of appropriations.

“(b) APPLICATION OF CREDITS.—At the request of the non-Fed-
eral interest, the Secretary may apply all or a portion of such
credit to the share of the cost of the non-Federal interest of carrying
out other flood damage reduction and coastal navigation projects
or studies.

“(c) APPLICATION OF REIMBURSEMENT.—At the request of the
non-Federal interest, the Secretary may apply such funds, subject
to the availability of appropriations, equal to the share of the
cost of the non-Federal interest of carrying out other flood damage
reduction and coastal navigation projects or studies.”.

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of contents contained
in section 1(b) of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1193) is amended by striking the item
relating to section 1022 and inserting the following:

“Sec. 1022. Credit or reimbursement.”.
SEC. 1137. NON-FEDERAL IMPLEMENTATION PILOT PROGRAM.

Section 1043(b) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2201 note) is amended—
(1) in paragraph (3)(A)(i)—
(A) in the matter preceding subclause (I)—
(i) by striking “15” and inserting “20”; and
(i) by striking “prior to the date of enactment
of this Act”;
(B) in subclause (I)—
(1) in the matter preceding item (aa), by inserting
“that have been authorized for construction prior to
the date of enactment of this Act and” after “not more
than 12 projects”; and
(i1) in item (bb), by striking “; and” and inserting
a semicolon;



132 STAT. 3784 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

(C) in subclause (II)—

(i) by inserting “that have been authorized for
construction prior to the date of enactment of this
Act and” after “not more than 3 projects”; and

(i1) by striking the semicolon and inserting “; and”;
and
(D) by adding at the end the following:

“(ITT) not more than 5 projects that have been
authorized for construction, but did not receive
the authorization prior to the date of enactment
of this Act;”; and

(2) in paragraph (8), by striking “2015 through 2019” and
inserting “2019 through 2023”.

SEC. 1138. SURPLUS WATER CONTRACTS AND WATER STORAGE AGREE-
MENTS.

Section 1046(c) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1254) is amended—
(1) in paragraph (1)—

(A) by striking “shall not charge a fee” and inserting
the following: “shall not—

“(A) charge a fee”;

(B) by striking “Reservoirs.” and inserting “Reservoirs;
or”; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(B) assess a water storage fee with respect to any
water storage in the Upper Missouri Mainstem Res-
ervoirs.”; and
(2) in paragraph (3), by striking “10” and inserting “12”.

SEC. 1139. POST-DISASTER WATERSHED ASSESSMENTS IN TERRI-
TORIES OF THE UNITED STATES.

Section 3025 of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2267b) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(e) ASSESSMENTS IN TERRITORIES OF THE UNITED STATES.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—For any major disaster declared in a
territory of the United States before the date of enactment
of this subsection, all activities in the territory carried out
or undertaken pursuant to the authorities described in this
section shall be conducted at full Federal expense unless the
President determines that the territory has the ability to pay
the cost share for an assessment under this section without
the use of loans.

“(2) TERRITORY DEFINED.—In this subsection, the term
‘territory of the United States’ means an insular area specified
in section 1156(a)(1) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2310(a)(1)).”.

SEC. 1140. EXPEDITED CONSIDERATION.

Section 7004(b)(4) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1374) is amended by striking “December
31, 2018” and inserting “December 31, 2024”.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3785

SEC. 1141. PROJECT STUDIES SUBJECT TO INDEPENDENT PEER
REVIEW.

Section 2034(h)(2) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 2007 (33 U.S.C. 2343(h)(2)) is amended by striking “12 years”
and inserting “17 years”.

SEC. 1142. FEASIBILITY OF CHICAGO SANITARY AND SHIP CANAL DIS-
PERSAL BARRIERS PROJECT, ILLINOIS.

Section 3061(d) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2007 (Public Law 110-114; 121 Stat. 1121) is amended—

(1) by striking “The Secretary” and inserting the following:

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE.—Operation and mainte-
nance of any project authorized to be carried out pursuant
to the feasibility study identified in paragraph (1) shall be
carried out at 80 percent Federal expense and 20 percent non-
Federal expense.

“(3) CONSULTATION.—After construction of any project
authorized to be carried out pursuant to the feasibility study
identified in paragraph (1), the Secretary shall consult with
the Governor of the State in which the project is constructed
before any control technologies not included in the Chief’s
Report are implemented.”.

SEC. 1143. ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF CREDIT.

Section 7007(a) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2007 (121 Stat. 1277; 128 Stat. 1226) is amended by adding at
the end the following: “Notwithstanding section 221(a)(4)(C)(1) of
the Flood Control Act of 1970 (42 U.S.C. 1962d-5b(a)(4)(C)(i)), the
Secretary may provide credit for work carried out during the period
beginning on November 8, 2007, and ending on the date of enact-
ment of the Water Resources Development Act of 2018 by the
non-Federal interest for a project under this title if the Secretary
determines that the work is integral to the project and was carried
out in accordance with the requirements of subchapter 4 of chapter
31, and chapter 37, of title 40, United States Code.”.

SEC. 1144. LEVEE SAFETY INITIATIVE REAUTHORIZATION.

Title IX of the Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (33
U.S.C. 3301 et seq.) is amended—
(1) in section 9005(g)(2)(E)i), by striking “2015 through
2019” and inserting “2019 through 2023”; and
(2) in section 9008, by striking “2015 through 2019” each
place it appears and inserting “2019 through 2023”.

SEC. 1145. FUNDING TO PROCESS PERMITS.

Section 214(a) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2000 (33 U.S.C. 2352(a)) is amended—
(1) by striking paragraph (3) and redesignating paragraphs
(4) and (5) as paragraphs (3) and (4), respectively; and
(2) in paragraph (4), as so redesignated—
(A) by striking “4 years after the date of enactment
of this paragraph” and inserting “December 31, 2022”; and
(B) by striking “carry out a study” and inserting “carry
out a followup study”.



132 STAT. 3786 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

SEC. 1146. RESERVOIR SEDIMENT.

Section 215 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2000
(33 U.S.C. 2326¢) is amended—
(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) by striking “the date of enactment of the Water
Resources Development Act of 2016” and inserting “the
date of enactment of the Water Resources Development
Act 0of 2018”; and
(B) by striking “shall establish, using available funds,
a pilot program to accept” and inserting “shall, using avail-
able funds, accept”;
(2) in subsection (b)—
(A) in paragraph (2), by adding “and” at the end;
(B) in paragraph (3), by striking “; and” at the end
and inserting a period; and
(C) by striking paragraph (4); and
(3) by striking subsection (f) and inserting the following:
“f) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—Not later than 3 years after the
date of enactment of the Water Resources Development Act of
2018, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee on Environment
and Public Works of the Senate and the Committee on Transpor-
tation and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives a report
describing the results of the program under this section.”.

SEC. 1147. CLARIFICATION FOR INTEGRAL DETERMINATION.

Section 601(e)(5) of the Water Resources Development Act of
2000 (Public Law 106-541) is amended—
(1) in subparagraph (B)(i)—
(A) in subclause (II), by striking “; or” and inserting
a semicolon; and
(B) by inserting after subclause (III) the following:
“(IV) the credit is provided for work carried out
by the non-Federal sponsor in the implementation of
an authorized project implementation report, and such
work was defined in an agreement between the Sec-
retary and the non-Federal sponsor prior to the execu-
tion of such work; or
“(V) the credit is provided for any work carried
out by the non-Federal sponsor, as agreed to by the
District Commander and non-Federal sponsor in a writ-
ten agreement (which may include an electronic agree-
ment) prior to such work being carried out by the
non-Federal sponsor;”;
(2) in subparagraph (B), by amending clause (iii) to read
as follows:
“(iii) the Secretary determines that the work per-
formed by the non-Federal sponsor—
“(I) is integral to the project; and
“(ITI) was carried out in accordance with the
requirements of subchapter 4 of chapter 31, and
chapter 37, of title 40, United States Code.”;
(3) by redesignating subparagraphs (C) through (E) as sub-
paragraphs (D) through (F), respectively; and
(4) by inserting after subparagraph (B) the following:
“(C) TIMING.—In any case in which the Secretary
approves credit under subparagraph (B), in a written agree-
ment (which may include an electronic agreement) with



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3787

the non-Federal sponsor, the Secretary shall provide such
credit for work completed under an agreement that pre-
scribes the terms and conditions for the in-kind contribu-
tions.”.

SEC. 1148. BENEFICIAL USE OF DREDGED SEDIMENT. 33 USC 2326

(a) IN GENERAL.—In carrying out a project for the beneficial E(;tseéments‘

reuse of sediment to reduce storm damage to property under section Determination.
204 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1992 (33 U.S.C.
2326) that involves only a single application of sediment, the Sec-
retary may grant a temporary easement necessary to facilitate
the placement of sediment, if the Secretary determines that
%ranting a temporary easement is in the interest of the United
tates.

(b) LIMITATION.—If the Secretary grants a temporary easement
under subsection (a) with respect to a project, that project shall
no longer be eligible for future placement of sediment under section
204 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1992 (33 U.S.C.
2326).

SEC. 1149. INCLUSION OF ALTERNATIVE MEASURES FOR AQUATIC ECO-
SYSTEM RESTORATION.

(a) INCLUSION OF ALTERATIVE MEASURES FOR AQUATIC Eco-
SYSTEM RESTORATION.—Section 206 of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 2230) is amended—

(1) by redesignating subsection (e) as subsection (f); and
(2) by inserting after subsection (d) the following:

“(e) USE OF NATURAL AND NATURE-BASED FEATURES.—In car-
rying out a project to restore and protect an aquatic ecosystem
or estuary under subsection (a), the Secretary shall consider, and
may include, with the consent of the non-Federal interest, a natural
feature or nature-based feature, as such terms are defined in section
1184 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2016, if the
Secretary determines that inclusion of such features is consistent
with the requirements of subsection (a).”.

(b) AMENDMENT TO DEFINITION.—Section 1184(a)(2) of the
Water Resources Development Act of 2016 (33 U.S.C. 2289a(a)(2))
is amended by striking “in coastal areas”.

(c) NATURAL INFRASTRUCTURE.—In carrying out a feasibility 33 USC 2282
report developed under section 905 of the Water Resources Develop- note.
ment Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2282) for a project for flood risk
management or hurricane and storm damage risk reduction, the
Secretary shall consider the use of both traditional and natural
infrastructure alternatives, alone or in conjunction with each other,
if those alternatives are practicable.

SEC. 1150. REGIONAL SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT.

Section 204(a)(1)(A) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1992 (33 U.S.C. 2326(a)(1)(A)) is amended by inserting “including
a project authorized for flood control,” after “an authorized Federal
water resources project,”.

SEC. 1151. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF NAVIGATION AND
HYDROELECTRIC FACILITIES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 314 of the Water Resources Develop-
ment Act of 1990 (33 U.S.C. 2321) is amended—
(1) in the heading by inserting “NAVIGATION AND” before
“HYDROELECTRIC FACILITIES”;



132 STAT. 3788 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Reports.

Determination.

Recommenda-
tions.

(2) in the first sentence, by striking “Activities currently
performed” and inserting the following:
“(a) IN GENERAL.—Activities currently performed”;
(3) in subsection (a) (as designated by paragraph (2)), by
inserting “navigation or” before “hydroelectric”;
(4) in the second sentence, by striking “This section” and
inserting the following:
1 “(b) MAJOR MAINTENANCE CONTRACTS ALLOWED.—This section”;
an
(5) by adding at the end the following:
“(c) ExcLUSION.—This section does not—
“(1) apply to a navigation facility that was under contract
on or before the date of enactment of this subsection with
a r(llon-Federal interest to perform operations or maintenance;
an
“(2) prohibit the Secretary from contracting out commercial
activities after the date of enactment of this subsection at
a navigation facility.”.
(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of contents contained
in section 1(b) of the Water Resources Development Act of 1990
(104 Stat. 4604) is amended by striking the item relating to section
314 and inserting the following:

“Sec. 314. Operation and maintenance of navigation and hydroelectric facilities.”.

SEC. 1152. STUDY OF WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT PROJECTS
BY NON-FEDERAL INTERESTS.

Section 203 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1986
(33 U.S.C. 2231) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a)(1), by inserting “federally authorized”
before “feasibility study”;

(2) by amending subsection (¢) to read as follows:

“(c) SUBMISSION TO CONGRESS.—

“(1) REVIEW AND SUBMISSION OF STUDIES TO CONGRESS.—
Not later than 180 days after the date of receipt of a feasibility
study of a project under subsection (a)(1), the Secretary shall
submit to the Committee on Environment and Public Works
of the Senate and the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives a report that
describes—

“(A) the results of the Secretary’s review of the study
under subsection (b), including a determination of whether
the project is feasible;

“(B) any recommendations the Secretary may have con-
cerning the plan or design of the project; and

“C) any conditions the Secretary may require for
construction of the project.

“(2) LiMITATION.—The completion of the review by the Sec-
retary of a feasibility study that has been submitted under
subsection (a)(1) may not be delayed as a result of consideration
being given to changes in policy or priority with respect to
project consideration.”; and

(3) by amending subsection (e) to read as follows:

“(e) REVIEW AND TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.—

“(1) REVIEW.—The Secretary may accept and expend funds
provided by non-Federal interests to undertake reviews, inspec-
tions, certifications, and other activities that are the responsi-
bility of the Secretary in carrying out this section.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3789

“(2) TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.—At the request of a non-Fed-
eral interest, the Secretary shall provide to the non-Federal
interest technical assistance relating to any aspect of a feasi-
bility study if the non-Federal interest contracts with the Sec-
retary to pay all costs of providing such technical assistance.

“(3) LIMITATION.—Funds provided by non-Federal interests
under this subsection shall not be eligible for credit under
subsection (d) or reimbursement.

“(4) IMPARTIAL DECISIONMAKING.—In carrying out this sec-
tion, the Secretary shall ensure that the use of funds accepted
from a non-Federal interest will not affect the impartial
decisionmaking of the Secretary, either substantively or proce-
durally.

“(5) SAVINGS PROVISION.—The provision of technical assist-
ance by the Secretary under paragraph (2)—

“(A) shall not be considered to be an approval or
endorsement of the feasibility study; and

“(B) shall not affect the responsibilities of the Secretary
under subsections (b) and (c).”.

SEC. 1153. CONSTRUCTION OF WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT
PROJECTS BY NON-FEDERAL INTERESTS.

Section 204 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1986
(33 U.S.C. 2232) is amended—
(1) in subsection (b)—

(A) in paragraph (1), in the matter preceding subpara-
graph (A), by inserting “federally authorized” before “water
resources development project”;

(B) in paragraph (2)(A), by inserting “, except as pro-
vided in paragraph (3)” before the semicolon; and

(C) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) PERMIT EXCEPTION.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—For a project described in subsection
(a)(1) or subsection (a)(3), or a separable element thereof,
with respect to which a written agreement described in
subparagraph (B) has been entered into, a non-Federal
interest that carries out a project under this section shall
not be required to obtain any Federal permits or approvals
that would not be required if the Secretary carried out
the project or separable element unless significant new
circumstances or information relevant to environmental
concerns or compliance have arisen since development of
the project recommendation.

“(B) WRITTEN AGREEMENT.—For purposes of this para- Compliance.
graph, a written agreement shall provide that the non-
Federal interest shall comply with the same legal and
technical requirements that would apply if the project or
separable element were carried out by the Secretary,
including all mitigation required to offset environmental
impacts of the project or separable element as determined
by the Secretary.

“(C) CERTIFICATIONS.—Notwithstanding subparagraph
(A), if a non-Federal interest carrying out a project under
this section would, in the absence of a written agreement
entered into under this paragraph, be required to obtain
a certification from a State under Federal law to carry
out the project, such certification shall still be required



132 STAT. 3790

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

if a written agreement is entered into with respect to

the project under this paragraph.

“(4) DATA SHARING.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—If a non-Federal interest for a water
resources development project begins to carry out that
water resources development project under this section,
the non-Federal interest may request that the Secretary
transfer to the non-Federal interest all relevant data and
documentation under the control of the Secretary with
respect to that water resources development project.

“(B) DEADLINE.—Except as provided in subparagraph
(C), the Secretary shall transfer the data and documenta-
tion requested by a non-Federal interest under subpara-
graph (A) not later than the date that is 90 days after
the date on which the non-Federal interest so requests
such data and documentation.

“(C) LimrtaTioN.—Nothing in this paragraph obligates
the Secretary to share any data or documentation that
the Secretary considers to be proprietary information.”;
(2) by amending subsection (c) to read as follows:

“(c) STUDIES AND ENGINEERING.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—When requested by an appropriate non-
Federal interest, the Secretary shall undertake all necessary
studies, engineering, and technical assistance on construction
for any project to be undertaken under subsection (b), and
provide technical assistance in obtaining all necessary permits
for the construction, if the non-Federal interest contracts with
the Secretary to furnish the United States funds for the studies,
engineering, or technical assistance on construction in the
period during which the studies, engineering, or technical
assistance on construction are being conducted.

“(2) No wAIlvER.—Nothing in this section may be construed
to waive any requirement of section 3142 of title 40, United
States Code.

“(3) LIMITATION.—Funds provided by non-Federal interests
under this subsection shall not be eligible for credit or
reimbursement under subsection (d).

“(4) IMPARTIAL DECISIONMAKING.—In carrying out this sec-
tion, the Secretary shall ensure that the use of funds accepted
from a non-Federal interest will not affect the impartial
decisionmaking of the Secretary, either substantively or proce-
durally.”; and

(3) in subsection (d)—

(A) in paragraph (3)—

(i) in subparagraph (A), by striking “; and” and
inserting a semicolon;

(i1) in subparagraph (B)(ii), by striking the period
at the end and inserting “; and”; and

(iii) by adding at the end the following:

“(C) in the case of reimbursement, appropriations are
provided by Congress for such purpose.”; and

(B) in paragraph (5)—

(i) by striking “flood damage reduction” each place
it appears and inserting “water resources develop-
ment”;



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3791

(ii) in subparagraph (A), by striking “for a discrete
segment of a” and inserting “for carrying out a discrete
segment of a federally authorized”; and

(iii) in subparagraph (D), in the matter preceding
clause (i), by inserting “to be carried out” after
“project”.

SEC. 1154. CORPS BUDGETING; PROJECT DEAUTHORIZATIONS; COM- 33 USC 579f.
PREHENSIVE BACKLOG REPORT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 1001 of the Water Resources Develop-
ment Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 579a) is amended—
(1) by striking the section designator and all that follows
through “Any project” and inserting the following:

“SEC. 1001. CORPS BUDGETING; PROJECT DEAUTHORIZATIONS; COM-
PREHENSIVE BACKLOG REPORT.

“(a) Any project”; and

(2) in subsection (b), by striking paragraphs (3) and (4)
and inserting the following:

“(3) COMPREHENSIVE CONSTRUCTION BACKLOG AND OPER-
ATION AND MAINTENANCE REPORT.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary, once every 2 years, Time period.
shall compile and publish— Lists.

“(i) a complete list of all projects and separable
elements of projects of the Corps of Engineers that
are authorized for construction but have not been com-
pleted;

“(i1) a complete list of all feasibility studies of
the Corps of Engineers that Congress has authorized
the Secretary to carry out for which a Report of the
Chief of Engineers has not been issued,;

“(iii) a complete list of all environmental infra-
structure projects authorized by Congress under sec-
tion 219 of the Water Resources Development Act of
1992 (106 Stat. 4835); and

“(iv) a list of major Federal operation and mainte-
nance needs of projects and properties under the con-
trol of the Corps of Engineers.

“(B) REQUIRED INFORMATION.—The Secretary shall
include on each list developed under clause (i), (ii), or
(iii) of subparagraph (A) for each feasibility study, project,
and separable element on that list—

“(i) the date of authorization of the feasibility
study, project, or separable element, including any sub-
sequent modifications to the original authorization;

“(i1) the original budget authority for the feasibility
study, project, or separable element;

“(i1i) a brief description of the feasibility study,
project, or separable element;

“(iv) the estimated date of completion of the feasi- Estimate.
bility study, project, or separable element, assuming
all capability is fully funded,;

“(v) the estimated total cost of completion of the Cost estimate.
feasibility study, project, or separable element;

“(vi) the amount of funds spent on the feasibility
study, project, or separable element, including Federal
and non-Federal funds;



132 STAT. 3792

Estimates.

Time period.

Web posting.

PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

“(vii) the amount of appropriations estimated to
be required in each fiscal year during the period of
construction to complete the project or separable ele-
ment by the date specified under clause (iv);

“(viii) the location of the feasibility study, project,
or separable element;

“(ix) a statement from the non-Federal interest
for the project or separable element indicating the
non-Federal interest’s capability to provide the
required local cooperation estimated to be required
for the project or separable element in each fiscal year
during the period of construction;

“(x) the benefit-cost ratio of the project or separable
element, calculated using the discount rate specified
by the Office of Management and Budget for purposes
of preparing the President’s budget pursuant to chapter
11 of title 31, United States Code;

“(xi) the benefit-cost ratio of the project or sepa-
rable element, calculated using the discount rate uti-
lized by the Corps of Engineers for water resources
development project planning pursuant to section 80
of the Water Resources Development Act of 1974 (42
U.S.C. 1962d-17); and

“(xii) the last fiscal year in which the project or
separable element incurred obligations.

“(C) REQUIRED OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE INFORMA-

TION.—The Secretary shall include on the list developed
under subparagraph (A)(iv), for each project and property
under the control of the Corps of Engineers on that list—

“(i) the authority under which the project was
authorized or the property was acquired by the Corps
of Engineers;

“(i1) a brief description of the project or property;

“(iii) an estimate of the Federal costs to meet the
major operation and maintenance needs at the project
or property; and

“(iv) an estimate of unmet or deferred operation
and maintenance needs at the project or property.

“(D) PUBLICATION.—

“(i) IN GENERAL.—For fiscal year 2020, and once
every 2 years thereafter, in conjunction with the Presi-
dent’s annual budget submission to Congress under
section 1105(a) of title 31, United States Code, the
Secretary shall submit a copy of the lists developed
under subparagraph (A) to—

“(I) the Committee on Environment and Public

Works and the Committee on Appropriations of

the Senate and the Committee on Transportation

and Infrastructure and the Committee on Appro-
priations of the House of Representatives; and

“(II) the Director of the Office of Management
and Budget.

“(ii)) PuBLIC AVAILABILITY.—The Secretary shall
make a copy of the lists available on a publicly acces-
sible website site in a manner that is downloadable,
searchable, and sortable.”.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3793

(b) BUDGETARY EVALUATION METRICS AND TRANSPARENCY.—
Beginning in fiscal year 2020, in the formulation of the annual Effective date.
budget request for the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers (Civil Works) President.
pursuant to section 1105(a) of title 31, United States Code, the
President shall ensure that such budget request—

(1) aligns the assessment of the potential benefit-cost ratio

for budgeting water resources development projects with that

used by the Corps of Engineers during project plan formulation

and evaluation pursuant to section 80 of the Water Resources

Development Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 1962d-17); and

(2) demonstrates the transparent criteria and metrics uti-

lized by the President in the evaluation and selection of water

resources development projects included in such budget request.

(c) PuBLIC PARTICIPATION.—In the development of, or any pro- Time period.
posed major substantive modification to, a proposed budget for
water resources development projects, the Secretary, through each
District shall, not less frequently than annually—

(1) provide to non-Federal interests and other interested
stakeholders information on the proposed budget for projects

or substantive modifications to project budgets within each

District’s jurisdiction;

(2) hold multiple public meetings to discuss the budget
for projects within each District’s jurisdiction; and

(3) provide to non-Federal interests the opportunity to
collaborate with District personnel for projects within each

District’s jurisdiction—

(A) to support information sharing; and

(B) to the maximum extent practicable, to share in
concept development and decisionmaking to achieve com-
plementary or integrated solutions to problems.

SEC. 1155. INDIAN TRIBES.

(a) COST SHARING PROVISIONS FOR TERRITORIES AND INDIAN
TRIBES.—Section 1156(a)(2) of the Water Resources Development
Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2310(a)(2)) is amended by striking “(as
defined” and all that follows through the period at the end and
inserting “or tribal organization (as those terms are defined in
section 4 of the Indian Self-Determination and Education Assistance
Act (25 U.S.C. 5304)).”.

(b) WRITTEN AGREEMENT REQUIREMENT FOR WATER RESOURCES
PrROJECTS.—Section 221(b)(1) of the Flood Control Act of 1970 (42
U.S.C. 1962d-5b(b)(1)) is amended by striking “(including a” and
all that follows through “; or” at the end and inserting “(including
an Indian tribe and a tribal organization (as those terms are defined
in section 4 of the Indian Self-Determination and Education Assist-
ance Act (25 U.S.C. 5304)); or”.

SEC. 1156. INFLATION ADJUSTMENT OF COST-SHARING PROVISIONS
FOR TERRITORIES AND INDIAN TRIBES.

Section 1156(b) of the Water Resources Development Act of
1986 (33 U.S.C. 2310(b)) is amended by striking “the date of enact-
ment of this subsection” and inserting “the date of enactment of
the Water Resources Development Act of 2018”.

SEC. 1157. CORPS OF ENGINEERS CONTINUING AUTHORITIES PRO-
GRAM.

(a) STORM AND HURRICANE RESTORATION AND IMPACT MINIMIZA-
TION PROGRAM.—Section 3(c)(1) of the Act of August 13, 1946 (33



132 STAT. 3794 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

U.S.C. 426g(c)(1)) is amended by striking “$30,000,000” and
inserting “$37,500,000”.

(b) SMALL RIVER AND HARBOR IMPROVEMENT PROJECTS.—Sec-
tion 107(a) of the River and Harbor Act of 1960 (33 U.S.C. 577(a))
is amended by striking “$50,000,000” and inserting “$62,500,000”.

(c) SHORE DAMAGE PREVENTION OR MITIGATION.—Section 111(c)
of the River and Harbor Act of 1968 (33 U.S.C. 426i(c)) is amended
by striking “$10,000,000” and inserting “$12,500,000”.

(d) REGIONAL SEDIMENT MANAGEMENT.—Section 204(g) of the
Water Resources Development Act of 1992 (33 U.S.C. 2326(g)) is
amended in the first sentence by striking “$50,000,000” and
inserting “$62,500,000”.

(e) SMALL FLoOD CONTROL PROJECTS.—Section 205 of the Flood
Control Act of 1948 (33 U.S.C. 701s) is amended in the first sentence
by striking “$55,000,000” and inserting “$68,750,000”.

(f) AQUATIC ECOSYSTEM RESTORATION.—Section 206(f) of the
Water Resources Development Act of 1996 (as redesignated by
section 1149) is amended by striking “$50,000,000” and inserting
“$62,500,000”.

(g) PROJECT MODIFICATIONS FOR IMPROVEMENT OF ENVIRON-
MENT.—Section 1135(h) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2309a(h)) is amended by striking “$40,000,000”
and inserting “$50,000,000”.

(h) EMERGENCY STREAMBANK AND SHORELINE PROTECTION.—
Section 14 of the Flood Control Act of 1946 (33 U.S.C. 701r) is
amended by striking “$20,000,000” and inserting “$25,000,000”.

(i) TrRIBAL PARTNERSHIP PROGRAM.—Section 203(b)(4) of the
Water Resources Development Act of 2000 (33 U.S.C. 2269) is
amended to read as follows:

“(4) DESIGN AND CONSTRUCTION.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary may carry out the
design and construction of a water resources development
project, or separable element of a project, described in
paragraph (1) that the Secretary determines is feasible
if the Federal share of the cost of the project or separable
element is not more than $12,500,000.

“(B) SPECIFIC AUTHORIZATION.—If the Federal share
of the cost of the project or separable element described
in subparagraph (A) is more than $12,500,000, the Sec-
retary may only carry out the project or separable element
if Congress enacts a law authorizing the Secretary to carry
out the project or separable element.”.

SEC. 1158. HURRICANE AND STORM DAMAGE REDUCTION.

Section 156 of the Water Resources Development Act of 1976
(42 U.S.C. 1962d-5f) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b)—

(A) by striking “Notwithstanding” and inserting the
following:

“(1) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding”; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) TiMING.—The 15 additional years provided under para-
graph (1) shall begin on the date of initiation of construction
of congressionally authorized nourishment.”; and

(2) in subsection (e), by striking “5 year-period” and
inserting “10-year period”.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3795

SEC. 1159. REGIONAL COALITIONS AND HIGHER EDUCATION.

Section 22(a) of the Water Resources Development Act of 1974
(42 U.S.C. 1962d-16(a)) is amended—

(1) by amending paragraph (1) to read as follows:

“(1) COMPREHENSIVE PLANS.—The Secretary of the Army, Cooperation.
acting through the Chief of Engineers, is authorized to Reports.
cooperate with any State, group of States, non-Federal interest
working with a State or group of States, or regional coalition
of governmental entities in the preparation of comprehensive
plans for the development, utilization, and conservation of the
water and related resources of drainage basins, watersheds,
or ecosystems located within the boundaries of such State,
interest, or entity, including plans to comprehensively address
water resources challenges, and to submit to Congress reports
and recommendations with respect to appropriate Federal
participation in carrying out such plans.”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(3) INSTITUTION OF HIGHER EDUCATION.—Notwithstanding
section 236 of title 10, United States Code, in carrying out
this subsection, the Secretary may work with an institution
of higher education, as determined appropriate by the Sec-
retary.”.

SEC. 1160. EMERGENCY RESPONSE TO NATURAL DISASTERS.

Section 5(a)(1) of the Act of August 18, 1941 (33 U.S.C.
701n(a)(1)) is amended in the first sentence—

(1) by striking “strengthening, raising, extending, or other
modification thereof” and inserting “strengthening, raising,
extending, realigning, or other modification thereof”’; and

(2) by striking “structure or project damaged or destroyed
by wind, wave, or water action of other than an ordinary
nature to the design level of protection when, in the discretion
of the Chief of Engineers,” and inserting “structure or project
damaged or destroyed by wind, wave, or water action of other
than an ordinary nature to either the pre-storm level or the
design level of protection, whichever provides greater protec-
tion, when, in the discretion of the Chief of Engineers,”.

SEC. 1161. COST AND BENEFIT FEASIBILITY ASSESSMENT.

(a) CosT BENEFIT AND SPECIAL CONDITIONS.—Section 5(a) of
the Act of August 18, 1941 (33 U.S.C. 701n(a)), as amended by
this Act, is further amended by striking paragraph (2) and inserting
the following:

“(2) COST AND BENEFIT FEASIBILITY ASSESSMENT.—

“(A) CONSIDERATION OF BENEFITS.—In preparing a cost
and benefit feasibility assessment for any emergency
project described in paragraph (1), the Chief of Engineers
shall consider the benefits to be gained by such project
for the protection of—

“(1) residential establishments;

“(i1) commercial establishments, including the
protection of inventory; and

“(iii) agricultural establishments, including the
protection of crops.

“(B) SPECIAL CONDITIONS.—

“(i) AUTHORITY TO CARRY OUT WORK.—The Chief
of Engineers may carry out repair or restoration work



132 STAT. 3796 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Determinations.

33 USC 701n
note.

Determinations.

described in paragraph (1) that does not produce bene-
fits greater than the cost if—

“(I) the non-Federal sponsor agrees to pay an
amount sufficient to make the remaining costs of
the project equal to the estimated value of the
benefits of the repair or restoration work; and

“(II) the Secretary determines that—

“(aa) the damage to the structure was not

a result of negligent operation or maintenance;

and

“(bb) repair of the project could benefit
another Corps project.

“(i1) TREATMENT OF PAYMENTS.—Non-Federal pay-
ments pursuant to clause (i) shall be in addition to
any non-Federal payments required by the Chief of
Engineers that are applicable to the remaining costs
of the repair or restoration work.”.

(b) CONTINUED ELIGIBILITY.—Notwithstanding a non-Federal
flood control work’s status in the Rehabilitation and Inspection
Program carried out pursuant to section 5 of the Act of August
18, 1941 (33 U.S.C. 701n), any unconstructed emergency project
for the non-Federal flood control work that was formulated during
the three fiscal years preceding the fiscal year in which this Act
was enacted but that was determined to not produce benefits greater
than costs shall remain eligible for assistance under such section
5 until the last day of the third fiscal year following the fiscal
year in which this Act was enacted if—

(1) the non-Federal sponsor agrees, in accordance with
such section 5, as amended by this Act, to pay an amount
sufficient to make the remaining costs of the project equal
to the estimated value of the benefits of the repair or restoration
work; and

(2) the Secretary determines that—

(A) the damage to the structure was not as a result
of negligent operation or maintenance; and

(B) repair of the project could benefit another Corps
project.

SEC. 1162. EXTENDED COMMUNITY ASSISTANCE BY THE CORPS OF
ENGINEERS.

Section 5(a) of the Act of August 18, 1941 (33 U.S.C. 701n(a)),
as amended by this Act, is further amended—

(1) by redesignating paragraph (3) as paragraph (4); and

(2) by inserting after paragraph (2) the following:

“(3) EXTENDED ASSISTANCE.—Upon request by a locality
receiving assistance under the fourth sentence of paragraph
(1), the Secretary shall, subject to the availability of appropria-
tions, enter into an agreement with the locality to provide
such assistance beyond the time period otherwise provided
for by the Secretary under such sentence.”.

SEC. 1163. DAM SAFETY.

Section 14 of the National Dam Safety Program Act (33 U.S.C.
467j) is amended by striking “2015 through 2019” each place it
appears and inserting “2019 through 2023”.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3797

SEC. 1164. LOCAL GOVERNMENT WATER MANAGEMENT PLANS. Study.

With the consent of the non-Federal interest for a feasibility E;%gmclnatwn'

study for a water resources development project, the Secretary 1962d-5b note.
may enter into a written agreement under section 221(a) of the

Flood Control Act of 1970, with a unit of local government in

the watershed that has adopted a local or regional water manage-

ment plan, to allow the unit of local government to participate

in the feasibility study to determine if there is an opportunity

to include additional feasible elements in the project in order to

help achieve the purposes identified in the local or regional water
management plan.

SEC. 1165. STRUCTURES AND FACILITIES CONSTRUCTED BY SEC-
RETARY.

Section 14 of the Act of March 3, 1899 (33 U.S.C. 408) is
amended by adding at the end the following:

“(d) Work DEFINED.—For the purposes of this section, the
term ‘work’ shall not include unimproved real estate owned or
operated by the Secretary as part of a water resources development
project if the Secretary determines that modification of such real
estate would not affect the function and usefulness of the project.”.

SEC. 1166. ADVANCED FUNDS FOR WATER RESOURCES DEVELOPMENT
STUDIES AND PROJECTS.

(a) CONTRIBUTIONS BY STATES AND POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
FOR IMMEDIATE USE ON AUTHORIZED FLOOD-CONTROL WORK; REPAY-
MENT.—The Act of October 15, 1940 (33 U.S.C. 701h-1) is
amended—

(1) by striking “a flood-control project duly adopted and
authorized by law” and inserting “a federally authorized water
resources development project,”;

(2) by striking “such work” and inserting “such project”;

(3) by striking “from appropriations which may be provided
by Congress for flood-control work” and inserting “if appropria-
tions are provided by Congress for such purpose”; and

(4) by adding at the end the following: “For purposes of Definition.
this Act, the term ‘State’ means the several States, the District
of Columbia, the commonwealths, territories, and possessions
of the United States, and Indian tribes (as defined in section
4(e) of the Indian Self-Determination and Education Assistance
Act (25 U.S.C. 5304(e))).”.

(b) No ADVERSE EFFECT ON PROCESSES.—In implementing any 33 USC 701h-2.
provision of law that authorizes a non-Federal interest to provide,
advance, or contribute funds to the Secretary for the development
or implementation of a water resources development project
(including sections 203 and 204 of the Water Resources Develop-
ment Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2231, 2232), section 5 of the Act
of June 22, 1936 (33 U.S.C. 701h), and the Act of October 15,
1940 (33 U.S.C. 701h-1)), the Secretary shall ensure, to the max-
imum extent practicable, that the use by a non-Federal interest
of such authorities does not adversely affect—

(1) the process or timeline for development and
implementation of other water resources development projects
by other non-Federal entities that do not use such authorities;
or



132 STAT. 3798 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

33 USC 578b.

Study.

Publication.

Recommenda-

tions.

(2) the process for including such projects in the President’s
annual budget submission to Congress under section 1105(a)
of title 31, United States Code.
(c) ADVANCES BY PRIVATE PARTIES; REPAYMENT.—Section 11
of the Act of March 3, 1925 (Chapter 467; 33 U.S.C. 561) is repealed.

SEC. 1167. COSTS IN EXCESS OF FEDERAL PARTICIPATION LIMIT.

Section 14 of the Flood Control Act of 1946 (33 U.S.C. 701r),
as amended by this Act, is further amended by inserting “, and
if such amount is not sufficient to cover the costs included in
the Federal cost share for a project, as determined by the Secretary,
the non-Federal interest shall be responsible for any such costs
that exceed such amount” before the period at the end.

SEC. 1168. DISPOSITION OF PROJECTS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—In carrying out a disposition study for a
project of the Corps of Engineers, or a separable element of such
a project, including a disposition study under section 216 of the
Flood Control Act of 1970 (33 U.S.C. 549a), the Secretary shall
consider modifications that would improve the overall quality of
the environment in the public interest, including removal of the
project or separable element of a project.

(b) DISPOSITION STUDY TRANSPARENCY.—The Secretary shall
carry out disposition studies described in subsection (a) in a trans-
parent manner, including by—

(1) providing opportunities for public input; and
(2) publishing the final disposition studies.

(¢) REMOVAL OF INFRASTRUCTURE.—For disposition studies
described in subsection (a) in which the Secretary determines that
a Federal interest no longer exists, and makes a recommendation
of removal of the project or separable element of a project, the
Secretary is authorized, using existing authorities, to pursue
removal of the project or separable element of a project in partner-
ship with other Federal agencies and non-Federal entities with
appropriate capabilities to undertake infrastructure removal.

SEC. 1169. CONTRIBUTED FUNDS FOR NON-FEDERAL RESERVOIR
OPERATIONS.

Section 5 of the Act of June 22, 1936 (33 U.S.C. 701h), is
amended by inserting after “authorized purposes of the project:”
the following: “Provided further, That the Secretary is authorized
to receive and expend funds from an owner of a non-Federal res-
ervoir to formulate, review, or revise operational documents for
any non-Federal reservoir for which the Secretary is authorized
to prescribe regulations for the use of storage allocated for flood
control or navigation pursuant to section 7 of the Act of December
22,1944 (33 U.S.C. 709).”.

SEC. 1170. WATERCRAFT INSPECTION STATIONS.

Section 104 of the River and Harbor Act of 1958 (33 U.S.C.
610) is amended—
(1) by amending subsection (b) to read as follows:
“(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—There is authorized to be appropriated
to carry out this section $110,000,000 for each fiscal year,
of which—

“(A) $30,000,000 shall be made available to carry out
subsection (d)(1)(A)@1);



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3799

“B) $30,000,000 shall be made available to carry out
subsection (d)(1)(A)(ii); and

“(C) $30,000,000 shall be made available to carry out
subsection (d)(1)(A)(ii).

“(2) CONTROL OPERATIONS.—Any funds made available
under paragraph (1) to be used for control operations shall
be allocated by the Chief of Engineers on a priority basis,
based on the urgency and need of each area and the availability
of local funds.”; and

(2) in subsection (d)—

(A) by amending paragraph (1) to read as follows:
“(1) IN GENERAL.—

“(A) WATERCRAFT INSPECTION STATIONS.—In carrying
out this section, the Secretary shall establish (as
applicable), operate, and maintain new or existing
watercraft inspection stations—

“(1) to protect the Columbia River Basin;
d“(ii) to protect the Upper Missouri River Basin;
an
“(iii) to protect the Upper Colorado River Basin
and the South Platte and Arizona River Basins.

“(B) LocATIONS.—The Secretary shall establish Consultation.
watercraft inspection stations under subparagraph (A) at
locations with the highest likelihood of preventing the
spread of aquatic invasive species at reservoirs operated
and maintained by the Secretary, as determined by the
Secretary in consultation with States within the areas
described in subparagraph (A).

“(C) RarPID RESPONSE.—The Secretary shall assist
States within the areas described in subparagraph (A) with
rapid response to any aquatic invasive species, including
quagga or zebra mussel, infestation.”; and

(B) by amending paragraph (3)(A) to read as follows:

“(A) the Governors of the States within the areas
described in each of clauses (i) through (iii) of paragraph
(1)(A), as applicable;”.

SEC. 1171. RESTRICTED AREAS AT CORPS OF ENGINEERS DAMS.

Section 2 of the Freedom to Fish Act (Public Law 113-13;
127 Stat. 449, 128 Stat. 1271) is amended by striking “4 years
after the date of enactment of the Water Resources Reform and
Development Act of 2014” each place it appears and inserting
“5 years after the date of enactment of the Water Resources
Development Act of 2018”.

SEC. 1172. COASTAL EROSION. 33 USC 4261

(a) IN GENERAL.—Pursuant to section 111 of the River and note.
Harbor Act of 1968 (33 U.S.C. 426i), the Secretary shall, to the
maximum extent practicable, complete operation and maintenance
renourishment to mitigate coastal erosion attributed to Federal
project structures in the upper northeast United States.

(b) PROJECT SELECTION.—In carrying out the work under sub-
section (a), the Secretary shall—

(1) identify and carry out not more than five projects—

(A) located in any of the States of Maine, New Hamp- State list.
shire, Massachusetts, Connecticut, Rhode Island, or New
York; and



132 STAT. 3800 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Consultation.

(B) for which a feasibility study has been completed
by December 31, 2019, that includes findings that a Federal
project structure is interrupting the natural flow of sedi-
ment and causing coastal erosion; and
(2) consult with relevant State agencies in selecting

projects.

SEC. 1173. PROHIBITION ON SURPLUS WATER FEES, LAKE CUM-
BERLAND WATERSHED, KENTUCKY AND TENNESSEE.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall not charge a fee for
surplus water under a contract entered into pursuant to section
6 of the Act of December 22, 1944 (33 U.S.C. 708), if the contract
is for surplus water stored in the Lake Cumberland Watershed,
Kentucky and Tennessee.

(b) TERMINATION.—The limitation under subsection (a) shall
expire on the date that is 2 years after the date of enactment
of this Act.

(c) APPLICABILITY.—Nothing in this section—

(1) affects the authority of the Secretary under section
2695 of title 10, United States Code, to accept funds or to
cover the administrative expenses relating to certain real prop-
erty transactions;

(2) affects the application of section 6 of the Act of
December 22, 1944 (33 U.S.C. 708) or section 301 of the Water
Supply Act of 1958 (43 U.S.C. 390b) to surplus water stored
outside of the Lake Cumberland Watershed, Kentucky and
Tennessee; or

(3) affects the authority of the Secretary to accept funds
under section 216(c) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 2321a(c)).

SEC. 1174. MIDDLE RIO GRANDE PEAK FLOW RESTORATION.

(a) RESTARTING OF TEMPORARY DEVIATION.—Subject to sub-
section (b), the Secretary shall restart the temporary deviation
in the operation of Cochiti Lake and Jemez Canyon Dam, that
was initiated in 2009 and terminated in 2013, to continue to
evaluate the effects of the deviation.

(b) APPROVAL AND CONSULTATION.—Before restarting the tem-
porary deviation under subsection (a), the Secretary shall, as
required under the applicable water control manuals—

(1) first obtain approval from—
(A) Pueblo de Cochiti;
(B) Pueblo of Santa Ana; and
(C) the Rio Grande Compact Commission established
by the compact approved by Congress under the Act of
May 31, 1939 (53 Stat. 785, chapter 155); and
(2) to the maximum extent practicable, consult with the
existing Cochiti Lake Environmental Resources Team, which
includes other Federal agencies and landowners in the region.

(c) SUNSET.—The authority to conduct the temporary deviation
described in subsection (a) shall terminate on the date that is
5 years after the date on which the Secretary restarts the temporary
deviation under such subsection.

SEC. 1175. PROHIBITION OF ADMINISTRATIVE FEES IN IMPLEMENTING
ROUGH RIVER LAKE FLOWAGE EASEMENT ENCROACH-
MENT RESOLUTION PLAN.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—In this section:



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3801

(1) ELIGIBLE PROPERTY OWNER.—The term “eligible prop-
erty owner” means the owner of a property—

(A)d) described in Scenario A, B, C, or D in the Plan;
or

(ii) that consists of vacant land located above 534 feet
mean sea level that is encumbered by a Rough River Lake
flowage easement; and

(B) for which the Rough River Lake flowage easement
is not required to address backwater effects.
(2) PLAN.—The term “Plan” means the Rough River Lake

Flowage Easement Encroachment Resolution Plan of the Corps

of Engineers, dated January 2017.

(b) PROHIBITION ON ASSESSING ADMINISTRATIVE FEES.—Not-
withstanding any other provision of law, in carrying out the Plan,
the Secretary may not impose on or collect from any eligible prop-
erty owner any administrative fee, including—

(1) a fee to pay the costs to the Corps of Engineers of
processing requests to resolve encroachments under the Plan;

(2) fees for deed drafting and surveying; and

(3) any other administrative cost incurred by the Corps
of Engineers in implementing the Plan.

(c) REFUND OF ADMINISTRATIVE FEES.—In the case of an eligible
property owner who has paid any administrative fees described
in paragraphs (1) through (3) of subsection (b) to the Corps of
Engineers, the Corps of Engineers shall refund those fees on request
of the eligible property owner.

(d) SAVINGS PROVISION.—Nothing in this section affects the
responsibility or authority of the Secretary to continue carrying
out the Plan, including any work necessary to extinguish the flow-
age easement of the United States with respect to the property
of any eligible property owner.

SEC. 1176. PRECONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING DESIGN DEMONSTRA- 33 USC 2232
TION PROGRAM. note.

(a) DEFINITION OF ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT STATEMENT.—In
this section, the term “environmental impact statement” means
the detailed written statement required under section 102(2)(C)
of the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (42 U.S.C.
4332(2)(C)).

(b) DEMONSTRATION PROGRAM.—The Secretary shall establish Determination.
a demonstration program to allow a project authorized to execute
pursuant to section 211 of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 701b-13) (as in effect on the day before the
date of enactment of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1193)) to begin preconstruction engineering
and design on a determination by the Secretary that the project
is technically feasible, economically justified, and environmentally
acceptable.

(c) REQUIREMENTS.—For each project authorized to begin
preconstruction engineering and design under subsection (b)—

(1) the project shall conform to the feasibility study and
the environmental impact statement approved by the Secretary;
and

(2) the Secretary and the non-Federal sponsor shall jointly
agree to the construction design of the project.

(d) SECRETARY REVIEW OF POTENTIAL ADVERSE IMPACTS.—
When reviewing the feasibility study and the environmental impact



132 STAT. 3802 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

statement for a project under subsection (b), the Secretary shall
follow current USACE Policy, Regulations, and Guidance, to assess
potential adverse downstream impacts to the Pearl River Basin.
Upon completion of the Secretary’s determination under subsection
(b), the non-Federal sponsor shall design the project in a manner
that addresses any potential adverse impacts or that provides miti-
gation in accordance with section 906 of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2283).

(e) SUNSET.—The authority to carry out the demonstration pro-
gram under this section shall terminate on the date that is 5
years after the date of enactment of this Act.

(f) SAVINGS PROVISION.—Nothing in this section supersedes,
precludes, or affects any applicable requirements for a project under
subsection (b) under—

(1) section 906 of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2283); or

(2) the Comprehensive Environmental Response, Com-
pensation, and Liability Act of 1980 (42 U.S.C. 9601 et seq.).

Subtitle B—Studies and Reports

SEC. 1201. AUTHORIZATION OF PROPOSED FEASIBILITY STUDIES.

The Secretary is authorized to conduct a feasibility study for
the following projects for water resources development and con-
servation and other purposes, as identified in the reports titled
“Report to Congress on Future Water Resources Development” sub-
mitted to Congress on March 17, 2017, and February 5, 2018,
respectively, pursuant to section 7001 of the Water Resources
Reform and Development Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2282d) or otherwise
reviewed by Congress:

(1) CAVE BUTTES DAM, ARIZONA.—Project for flood risk
management, Phoenix, Arizona.

(2) SAN DIEGO RIVER, CALIFORNIA.—Project for flood risk
management, navigation, and ecosystem restoration, San Diego,
California.

(3) J. BENNETT JOHNSTON WATERWAY, LOUISIANA.—Project
for navigation, J. Bennett Johnston Waterway, Louisiana.

(4) NORTHSHORE, LOUISIANA.—Project for flood risk
management, St. Tammany Parish, Louisiana.

(5) OUACHITA-BLACK RIVERS, LOUISIANA.—Project for
navigation, Little River, Louisiana.

(6) CHAUTAUQUA LAKE, NEW YORK.—Project for ecosystem
restoration and flood risk management, Chautauqua, New York.

(7) TRINITY RIVER AND TRIBUTARIES, TEXAS.—Project for
navigation, Liberty, Texas.

(8) WEST CELL LEVEE, TEXAS.—Project for flood risk
management, Irving, Texas.

(9) COASTAL VIRGINIA, VIRGINIA.—Project for flood risk
management, ecosystem restoration, and navigation, Coastal
Virginia.

(10) TANGIER ISLAND, VIRGINIA.—Project for flood risk
management and ecosystem restoration, Tangier Island, Vir-
ginia.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3803

SEC. 1202. ADDITIONAL STUDIES.

(a) LOWER MississiPPI RIVER; MISSOURI, KENTUCKY, TEN-
NESSEE, ARKANSAS, MISSISSIPPI, AND LOUISIANA.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary is authorized to carry out
studies to determine the feasibility of habitat restoration for
each of the eight reaches identified as priorities in the report
prepared by the Secretary pursuant to section 402 of the Water
Resources Development Act of 2000, titled “Lower Mississippi
River Resource Assessment; Final Assessment In Response to
Section 402 of WRDA 2000” and dated July 2015.

(2) CONSULTATION.—The Secretary shall consult with the
Lower Mississippi River Conservation Committee during each
feasibility study carried out under paragraph (1).

(b) ST. Louis RIVERFRONT, MERAMEC RIVER BASIN, MISSOURI
AND ILLINOIS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary is authorized to carry out
studies to determine the feasibility of a project for ecosystem
restoration and flood risk management in Madison, St. Clair,
and Monroe Counties, Illinois, St. Louis City, and St. Louis,
Jefferson, Franklin, Gasconade, Maries, Phelps, Crawford,
Dent, Washington, Iron, St. Francois, St. Genevieve, Osage,
Reynolds, and Texas Counties, Missouri.

(2) CONTINUATION OF EXISTING STUDY.—Any study carried
out under paragraph (1) shall be considered a continuation
of the study being carried out under Committee Resolution
2642 of the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure
of the House of Representatives, adopted June 21, 2000.

SEC. 1203. EXPEDITED COMPLETION.

(a) FEASIBILITY REPORTS.—The Secretary shall expedite the Determination.
completion of a feasibility study for each of the following projects, State list.
and if the Secretary determines that the project is justified in
a completed report, may proceed directly to preconstruction plan-
ning, engineering, and design of the project:

(1) Project for riverbank stabilization, Selma, Alabama.

(2) Project for ecosystem restoration, Three Mile Creek,
Alabama.

(3) Project for navigation, Nome, Alaska.

(4) Project for flood diversion, Seward, Alaska.

(5) Project for flood control, water conservation, and related
purposes, Coyote Valley Dam, California.

(6) Project for flood risk management, Lower Cache Creek,

California.

(7) Project for flood risk management, Lower San Joaquin

River, California, as described in section 1322(b)(2)(F) of the

Water Resources Development Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1707)

(second phase of feasibility study).

(8) Project for flood risk management, South San Francisco,

California.

(9) Project for flood risk management and ecosystem res-
toration, Tijuana River, California.
(10) Project for flood damage reduction, Westminster-East

Garden Grove, California.

(11) Project for flood risk management in East Hartford,

Connecticut.

(12) Project for flood risk management in Hartford, Con-
necticut.



132 STAT. 3804 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Review.
Determination.

(13) Projects under the Comprehensive Flood Mitigation
Study for the Delaware River Basin.

(14) Project for ecosystem restoration, Lake Apopka,
Florida.

(15) Project for ecosystem restoration, Kansas River Weir,
Kansas.

(16) Project for navigation and channel deepening, Baptiste
Collette Bayou, Louisiana, under section 203 of the Water
Resources Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2231).

(17) Project for navigation and channel deepening, Houma
Navigation Canal, Louisiana, under section 203 of the Water
Resources Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2231).

(18) Project for navigation and channel deepening, Bayou
Lafourche, Louisiana, under section 203 of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2231).

(19) Project for flood damage reduction and ecosystem res-
toration, St. Tammany Parish, Louisiana.

(20) Project for ecosystem restoration, Warren Glen Dam
Removal, Musconetcong River, New Jersey.

(21) Project for flood risk management, Rahway River
Basin, New Jersey.

(22) The Hudson-Raritan Estuary Comprehensive Restora-
tion Project, New Jersey and New York.

(23) Project for flood control and water supply, Abiquiu
Dam, New Mexico.

(24) Project for reformulation, East Rockaway Inlet to Rock-
away Inlet and Jamaica Bay, Queens, New York.

(25) Project for navigation, New York-New Jersey Harbor
and Tributaries Focus Area.

(26) Project for water resource improvements, Willamette
River Basin, Fern Ridge, Oregon.

(27) Project for coastal storm risk management, Pawcatuck
River, Rhode Island.

(28) Project for the Rhode Island historical structure flood
hazard vulnerability assessment.

(29) Project for coastal storm risk management, Norfolk,
Virginia.

(30) Project for navigation, Tacoma Harbor, Washington.
(b) LOWER SAN J0AQUIN RIVER, CALIFORNIA.—In expediting

completion of the second phase of the Lower San Joaquin River
feasibility study under subsection (a)(7), the Secretary shall review
and give priority to any plans and designs requested by non-Federal
interests and incorporate such plans and designs into the Federal
study if the Secretary determines that such plans and designs
are consistent with Federal standards.

(¢) HUDSON-RARITAN ESTUARY COMPREHENSIVE RESTORATION
ProJECT, NEW JERSEY AND NEW YORK.—In the case of a rec-
ommendation for restoration activities within the Jamaica Bay Unit
of the Hudson-Raritan Estuary Comprehensive Restoration Project,
New Jersey and New York, under subsection (a)(22), which are
to protect property under the jurisdiction of the National Park
Service, the Secretary may recommend to Congress that the Sec-
retary accept and expend funds from the National Park Service
to carry out such activities.

(d) POST-AUTHORIZATION CHANGE REPORT.—The Secretary shall
expedite completion of a post-authorization change report for the



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3805

project for flood risk management, San Luis Rey River Flood Control
Protection Project, California.

(e) HUNTINGDON COUNTY, PENNSYLVANIA.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall expedite the updating
of the master plan for the Juniata River and tributaries project,
Huntingdon County, Pennsylvania, authorized by section 203
of the Flood Control Act of 1962 (Public Law 87-874; 76 Stat.
1182).

(2) PROCESS.—In carrying out subsection (a), the Secretary
shall update the master plan in accordance with section
1309(a)(2) of the Water Resources Development Act of 2016
(Public Law 114-322; 130 Stat. 1693).

(f) UpPER MiSSOURI RIVER BASIN FLOOD AND DROUGHT MONI-
TORING.—The Secretary shall expedite activities authorized under
section 4003(a) of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1311, 130 Stat. 1677).

(g) PROJECT MODIFICATIONS FOR IMPROVEMENT OF ENVIRON-
MENT.—For fiscal years 2019 and 2020, the Secretary shall give
priority to projects that restore degraded ecosystems through modi-
fication of existing flood risk management projects for projects—

(1) authorized under section 1135 of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2309a); and

(2) located within the Upper Missouri River Basin.

(h) EXPEDITED COMPLETION OF CERTAIN PROJECTS.—It is the
sense of Congress that the Secretary should provide funding for,
and expedite the completion of, the following projects:

(1) West Haven, Connecticut, as authorized by section 101
of the River and Harbor Act of 1954 (68 Stat. 1254) and section
3 of the Act of August 13, 1946 (60 Stat. 1056, chapter 960;
33 U.S.C. 426g).

(2) Providence River, Rhode Island, as authorized by the
first section of the Act of August 26, 1937 (50 Stat. 845, chapter
832) and section 301 of the River and Harbor Act of 1965
(79 Stat. 1089).

(3) Morganza to the Gulf, Louisiana, as authorized by sec-
tion 7002(3) of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1368).

(4) Louisiana Coastal Area, Louisiana, as authorized by
section 7002(5) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1369).

(5) Louisiana Coastal Area—Barataria Basin Barrier, Lou-
isiana, as authorized by section 7002(5) of the Water Resources
Reform and Development Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1370).

(6) West Shore Lake Pontchartrain, Louisiana, as author-
ized by section 1401(3) of the Water Resources Development
Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1712).

(7) Southwest Coastal Louisiana, Louisiana, as authorized
by section 1401(8) of the Water Resources Development Act
of 2016 (130 Stat. 1715).

(8) West Thompson Lake, Connecticut, as authorized by
section 203 of the Flood Control Act of 1960 (74 Stat. 489).

SEC. 1204. GAO STUDY ON BENEFIT-COST ANALYSIS REFORMS.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this Deadline.
Act, the Comptroller General of the United States shall—



132 STAT. 3806 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Review.

Recommenda-
tions.

Public
information.

Deadline.
Lists.

(1) conduct a study on the benefit-cost procedures of the
Secretary and the Director of the Office of Management and
Budget (referred to in this section as the “Director”), including—

(A) an examination of the benefits and costs that the

Secretary and the Director do and do not include in the

benefit-cost calculation, including, at a minimum, local and

regional economic benefits; and

(B) a review of the calculation, if any, of navigation
benefits used in a benefit-cost calculation for a non-commer-
cial harbor that is used by a State maritime academy

(as defined in section 51102 of title 46, United States

Code) for military training purposes; and

(2) submit to Congress a report that—

(A()1 describes the results of the study under paragraph

(1); an

(B) includes recommendations for legislative or regu-
latory changes to improve the benefit-cost analysis proce-
dures of the Secretary and the Director.

SEC. 1205. HARBOR MAINTENANCE TRUST FUND REPORT.

(a) DEADLINE.—Not later than 180 days after enactment of
this Act, the Secretary shall submit reports under section 210(e)(3)
of the Water Resources Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C.
2238(e)(3)) and section 330 of the Water Resources Development
Act of 1992 (26 U.S.C. 9505 note; Public Law 102-580) to the
Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of
Representatives and to the Committee on Environment and Public
Works of the Senate.

(b) ADDITIONAL INFORMATION.—For each report described in
subsection (a) that is submitted after the date of enactment of
this Act, the Secretary shall include, on a project-by-project basis,
additional information identifying—

(1) the most recent fiscal year for which operations and
maintenance activities have been carried out and the cost of
those activities; and

(2) the operations and maintenance activities that were
performed through either a recommendation from Congress
or unspecified funds made available for ongoing work.

(c) AVAILABILITY.—The Secretary shall make publicly available
all reports described in subsection (a) submitted before, on, or
after the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 1206. IDENTIFICATION OF NONPOWERED DAMS FOR HYDRO-
POWER DEVELOPMENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 18 months after the date
of enactment of this section, the Secretary shall develop a list
of existing nonpowered dams owned and operated by the Corps
of Engineers that have the greatest potential for hydropower
development.

(b) CONSIDERATIONS.—In developing the list under subsection
(a), the Secretary may consider the following:

(1) The compatibility of hydropower generation with
existing purposes of the dam.

(2) The proximity of the dam to existing transmission
resources.

(3) The existence of studies to characterize environmental,
cultural, and historic resources relating to the dam.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3807

(4) Whether hydropower is an authorized purpose of the

dam.

(¢c) AVAILABILITY.—The Secretary shall provide the list devel- Public
oped under subsection (a) to the Committee on Transportation information.
and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate, and make
such list available to the public.

SEC. 1207. STUDY ON INNOVATIVE PORTS FOR OFFSHORE WIND
DEVELOPMENT.

(a) DEFINITION OF INNOVATIVE PORT FOR OFFSHORE WIND
DEVELOPMENT.—In this section, the term “innovative port for off-
shore wind development” includes any federally authorized port
or harbor that can accommodate (including through retrofitting)—

(1) the upright assembly of the majority of an offshore
wind facility, including the foundation, tower, turbine, blade,
and electrical components;

(2) an assembly area, ground-bearing pressure, and over-
head clearance for the assembly of offshore wind facility tur-
bines, which each have a capacity of up to 20 megawatts;

(3) a heavy-lift quay and not less than 25 acres of port
storage;

(4) innovative offshore wind facility and vessel technologies
tha&t allow for the rapid installation of an offshore wind facility;
an

(5) any other innovative offshore wind facility technology,
as determined by the Secretary.

(b) STUDY AND REPORT.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 1 year after the date
of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall—

(A) in consultation with the all appropriate Federal Consultation.
agencies, carry out a study of all federally authorized ports
and harbors, including in the Mid-Atlantic, Gulf Coast,
West Coast, Great Lakes, and New England regions of
the United States, to identify—

(i) not less than three suitable federally authorized
ports and harbors in those regions that could become
innovative ports for offshore wind development;

(i1) barriers to the development of innovative ports
for offshore wind development;

(iii) the Federal and State actions, including
dredging and construction of supporting infrastructure,
needed to facilitate the development of the federally
authorized ports and harbors identified under clause
(i) to become innovative ports for offshore wind develop-
ment; and

(iv) recommendations on any further research Recommenda-
needed to improve federally authorized ports and har- tions.
bors in the United States for offshore wind facility
development and deployment; and
(B) submit to Congress a report describing the results

of the study under subparagraph (A).

(2) CONSULTATION.—In carrying out the study under para-
graph (1), the Secretary shall consult with, at a minimum—

(A) the Governor of each State in which a port or
harbor was identified;

(B) affected port authorities;



132 STAT. 3808 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Recommenda-

tions.

Public
information.

(C) units of local government; and
(D) relevant experts in engineering, environment, and
industry considerations.

SEC. 1208. INNOVATIVE MATERIALS AND ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES
REPORT.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall submit to Congress a report that—

(1) describes activities conducted by the Corps of Engineers
at centers of expertise, technology centers, technical centers,
research and development centers, and similar facilities and
organizations relating to the testing, research, development,
identification, and recommended uses for innovative materials
and advanced technologies, including construction management
technologies, in water resources development projects; and

(2) provides recommendations for types of water resources
development projects in which innovative materials and
advanced technologies should be used.

SEC. 1209. STUDY AND REPORT ON EXPEDITING CERTAIN WAIVER
PROCESSES.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall complete and submit to the Committee
on Environment and Public Works of the Senate and the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives a report based on the results of a study on the best options
available to the Secretary to implement the waiver process for
the non-Federal cost share under section 116 of the Energy and
Water Development and Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2010
(Public Law 111-85; 123 Stat. 2851).

SEC. 1210. REPORT ON DEBRIS REMOVAL.

Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall submit to Congress and make publicly
available a report that describes—

(1) the extent to which the Secretary has carried out section

3 of the Act of March 2, 1945 (33 U.S.C. 603a); and

(2) how the Secretary has evaluated potential work to
be carried out under that section.

SEC. 1211. CORPS FLOOD POLICY WITHIN URBAN AREAS.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall report to the Committee on Transportation
and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate on—

(1) flooding within urban floodplains; and
(2) the Federal policy constraints on the ability of the

Secretary to address urban flooding, including the regulations
under part 238 of title 33, Code of Federal Regulations (as
in effect on the date of enactment of this Act) (including the
limitation under section 238.7(a)(1) of that title that allows
the Secretary to provide assistance only where the flood dis-
charge of a stream or waterway within an urban area is greater
than 800 cubic feet per second for the 10-percent flood).

SEC. 1212. FEASIBILITY STUDIES FOR MITIGATION OF DAMAGE.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee on Transportation



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3809

and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate a report
that identifies—

(1) feasibility studies that are incomplete as of the date
of enactment of this Act for a project for mitigation of damage
to an area affected by weather or other events for which—

(A) during the 8-year period ending on the date of
enactment of this Act—

(i) the Secretary provided emergency response
under section 5 of the Act of August 18, 1941 (33
U.S.C. 701n); or

(i1) the area received assistance under the Robert
T. Stafford Disaster Relief and Emergency Assistance
Act (42 U.S.C. 5121 et seq.); and
(B) there is significant risk for future similar events

(as determined by the Secretary); and

(2) for each feasibility study identified under paragraph
(1), impediments to completing the study.

SEC. 1213. APPLICATIONS OF MILITARY LEASING AUTHORITIES.

Not later than 2 years after the date of enactment of this Deadline.
Act, the Secretary shall—
(1) complete a study on the application of section 2667
of title 10, United States Code, enhanced use leasing authori-
ties, and other military leasing authorities to the civil works
program of the Secretary; and
(2) submit to Congress a report on the results of the study
under paragraph (1), including a description of the obstacles
that must be removed so that the Assistant Secretary of the
Army for Civil Works may implement the authorities.

SEC. 1214. COMMUNITY ENGAGEMENT.

(a) REPORT.—Not later than 2 years after the date of enactment
of this section, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee on
Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives
and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate
a report on any potential disproportionate and adverse health or
environmental effects of programs, policies, and activities of the
Corps of Engineers related to water resources development projects
on minority communities, low-income communities, rural commu-
nities, and Indian Tribes.

(b) CONSULTATION.—In preparing the report under subsection
(a), the Secretary shall provide public and private meetings with
representatives of minority communities, low-income communities,
rural communities, and Indian Tribes, as well as representatives
of State and local governments, and shall ensure that sufficient
meetings are held in different geographic regions of the United
States to ensure that a diversity of views are obtained.

(c) RECOMMENDATIONS.—The report submitted under subsection
(a) shall include—

(1) the identification of any disproportionate and adverse
health or environmental effects to the communities and Tribes;
and

(2) any recommendations of the Secretary for addressing
such effects, including recommended changes to the statutory
or regulatory authorities of the Corps of Engineers, or changes
to the policies or guidance of the Corps of Engineers.



132 STAT. 3810 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Time periods.

Consultation.

SEC. 1215. TRANSPARENCY IN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.

Section 1012(b)(1) of the Water Resources Reform and Develop-
ment Act of 2014 (33 U.S.C. 2315a(b)(1)) is amended by striking
“The Secretary” and inserting “Not later than 1 year after the
date of enactment of the Water Resources Development Act of
2018, the Secretary”.

SEC. 1216. ASSESSMENT OF HARBORS AND INLAND HARBORS.

Section 210(e) of the Water Resources Development Act of
1986 (33 U.S.C. 2238) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “shall assess the” and
inserting “shall assess, and issue a report to Congress on,
the”; and

(2) in paragraph (2), by adding at the end the following:

“(C) OPPORTUNITIES FOR BENEFICIAL USE OF DREDGED
MATERIALS.—In carrying out paragraph (1), the Secretary
shall identify potential opportunities for the beneficial use
of dredged materials obtained from harbors and inland
harbors referred to in subsection (a)(2), including projects
eligible under section 1122 of the Water Resources Develop-
ment Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1645; 33 U.S.C. 2326 note).”.

SEC. 1217. MAINTENANCE OF HIGH-RISK FLOOD CONTROL PROJECTS.

(a) ASSESSMENT.—With respect to each project classified as
class III under the Dam Safety Action Classification of the Corps
of Engineers for which the Secretary has assumed responsibility
for maintenance as of the date of enactment of this Act, the Sec-
retary shall assess—

(1) the anticipated effects of the Secretary continuing to
be responsible for the maintenance of the project during the
period that ends 15 years after the date of enactment of this
Ac‘(ci, including the benefits to the State and local community;
an

(2) the anticipated effects of the Secretary not continuing
to be responsible for the maintenance of the project during
such 15-year period, including the costs to the State and local
community.

(b) REPORT.—Not later than 90 days after completion of the
assessment under subsection (a), the Secretary shall submit to
the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House
of Representatives and the Committee on Environment and Public
Works of the Senate a report summarizing the results of the assess-
ment.

SEC. 1218. NORTH ATLANTIC DIVISION REPORT ON HURRICANE BAR-
RIERS AND HARBORS OF REFUGE.

Not later than 1 year after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary, in consultation with State and local experts
in the North Atlantic Division of the Corps of Engineers, shall
submit to Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the
House of Representatives and the Committee on Environment and
Public Works of the Senate a report on the durability and resiliency
of existing hurricane barriers and harbors of refuge in the North
Atlantic Division, giving particular consideration as to how such
barriers and harbors will survive and fully serve their planned
levels of protection under current, near, and longer term future
predicted sea levels, storm surges, and storm strengths.



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3811

SEC. 1219. GREAT LAKES COASTAL RESILIENCY STUDY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall carry out a comprehen-
sive assessment of the water resources needs of the Great Lakes
System under section 729 of the Water Resources Development
Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2267a).

(b) COOPERATION.—In carrying out the assessment pursuant
to subsection (a), the Secretary shall cooperate with stakeholders
and coordinate with all ongoing programs and projects of the Great
Lakes Restoration Initiative under section 118(c)(7) of the Federal
Water Pollution Control Act (33 U.S.C. 1268).

(c) DEFINITIONS.—The term “Great Lakes System” has the
meaning given such term in section 118(a) of the Federal Water
Pollution Control Act (33 U.S.C. 1268(a)).

SEC. 1220. MCMICKEN DAM, ARIZONA, AND MUDDY RIVER, MASSACHU-
SETTS.

(a) REPORT.—The Secretary shall submit a report to the Com-
mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Rep-
resentatives and the Committee on Environment on Public Works
of the Senate on the status of—

(1) the project at McMicken Dam, Arizona, authorized by
section 304 of the Act of August 7, 1953 (67 Stat. 450); and
(2) the project for flood damage reduction and environ-
mental restoration, Muddy River, Brookline and Boston,

Massachusetts, authorized by section 522 of the Water

Resources Development Act of 2000 (114 Stat. 2656).

(b) REQUIREMENTS.—The report under subsection (a) shall
include a description of the reasons of the Secretary for
deauthorizing the projects described in subsection (a).

SEC. 1221. TABLE ROCK LAKE, ARKANSAS AND MISSOURI.

Not later than 120 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee on Transportation
and Infrastructure of the House of Representatives and the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public Works of the Senate a report
on the implementation of section 1185(c) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 2016 (130 Stat. 1680).

SEC. 1222. FORECAST-INFORMED RESERVOIR OPERATIONS.

(a) REPORT ON FORECAST-INFORMED RESERVOIR OPERATIONS.—
Not later than 1 year after the date of completion of the forecast-
informed reservoir operations research study pilot program at
Coyote Valley Dam, Russian River Basin, California (authorized
by the River and Harbor Act of 1950 (64 Stat. 177)), the Secretary
shall issue a report to the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives and the Committee on
Environment and Public Works of the Senate on the results of
the study pilot program.

(b) CONTENTS OF REPORT.—The Secretary shall include in the
report issued under subsection (a)—

(1) an analysis of the use of forecast-informed reservoir Analysis.
operations at Coyote Valley Dam, California;

(2) an assessment of the viability of using forecast-informed Assessment.
reservoir operations at other dams owned or operated by the
Secretary;

(3) an identification of other dams owned or operated by
the Secretary where forecast-informed reservoir operations may



132 STAT. 3812 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

Plans.

assist the Secretary in the optimization of future reservoir
operations; and

(4) any additional areas for future study of forecast-
informed reservoir operations.

SEC. 1223. CEDAR RIVER, IOWA.

Not later than 90 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall complete and submit to the Committee
on Environment and Public Works of the Senate and the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives a report summarizing the path forward and timeline to imple-
ment the project for flood risk management at Cedar River, Cedar
Rapids, Iowa, authorized by section 7002(2) of the Water Resources
Reform and Development Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1366).

SEC. 1224. OLD RIVER CONTROL STRUCTURE, LOUISIANA.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days after the date of
enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of
the Senate a report on the structure and operations plan for the
Old River control structure authorized by the Flood Control Act
of 1954 (68 Stat. 1258), based on the best available science,
improved monitoring capabilities, and other factors as determined
by the Secretary, including consideration of—

(1) flood control,

(2) navigational conditions;

(3) water supply;

(4) ecosystem restoration and ecological productivity; and
(5) hydroelectric production.

(b) PuBLIC PARTICIPATION.—In developing the report required
by subsection (a), the Secretary shall provide opportunity for public
input and stakeholder engagement, including public meetings.

SEC. 1225. UPPER MISSISSIPPI RIVER PROTECTION.

Section 2010 of the Water Resources Reform and Development
Act of 2014 (128 Stat. 1270) is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(d) CONSIDERATIONS.—In carrying out a disposition study with
respect to the Upper St. Anthony Falls Lock and Dam, including
a disposition study under section 216 of the Flood Control Act
of 1970 (33 U.S.C. 549a), the Secretary shall expedite completion
of such study and shall produce a report on the Upper St. Anthony
Falls Lock and Dam that is separate from any report on any
other lock or dam included in such study that includes plans for—

“(1) carrying out modifications to the Upper St. Anthony

Falls Lock and Dam to—

“(A) preserve and enhance recreational opportunities
and the health of the ecosystem; and

“(B) maintain the benefits to the natural ecosystem
and human environment;
“(2) a partial disposition of the Upper St. Anthony Falls

Lock and Dam facility and surrounding real property that

preserves any portion of the Upper St. Anthony Falls Lock

and Dam necessary to maintain flood control; and
“(3) expediting the disposition described in this subsection.

“(e) CONTRIBUTED FUNDS.—The Secretary shall accept and

expend funds to carry out the study described in subsection (d)



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3813

that are contributed by a State or a political subdivision of a
State under the Act of October 15, 1940 (33 U.S.C. 701h-1).”.

SEC. 1226. MISSOURI RIVER.

(a) IRC REPORT.—Not later than 18 months after the date
of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to the Com-
mittee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Rep-
resentatives and the Committee on Environment and Public Works
of the Senate a report regarding the impacts of interception-rearing
complex construction on the navigation, flood control, and other
authorized purposes set forth in the Missouri River Master Manual,
and on the population recovery of the pallid sturgeon.

(b) No ADDITIONAL IRC CONSTRUCTION.—Until the report under
subsection (a) is submitted, no additional interception-rearing com-
plex construction is authorized.

SEC. 1227. LOWER MISSOURI RIVER BANK STABILIZATION AND
NAVIGATION.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 180 days after the date of
enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House of Representa-
tives and the Committee on Environment and Public Works of
the Senate a report on the function and reliability of the Lower
Missouri River bank stabilization and navigation project, authorized
by the first section of the Act of July 25, 1912 (37 Stat. 219,
chapter 253).

(b) CONSIDERATIONS AND COORDINATION.—In developing the
report required under subsection (a), the Secretary shall—

(1) consider recommended improvements to the project
deficribed in such subsection and current and future flood risks;
an

(2) coordinate with State and local governments and
affected stakeholders.

SEC. 1228. COASTAL TEXAS STUDY.

The Secretary shall expedite the completion of studies for flood
damage reduction, hurricane and storm damage reduction, and
ecosystem restoration in the coastal areas of Texas that are identi-
fied in the interim report due to be published in 2018 that describes
the tentatively selected plan developed in accordance with section
4091 of the Water Resources Development Act of 2007 (121 Stat.
1187).

SEC. 1229. REPORT ON WATER SUPPLY CONTRACT, WRIGHT PATMAN
LAKE, TEXAS.

Not later than June 30, 2019, the Secretary shall submit to
the Committee on Transportation and Infrastructure of the House
of Representatives and the Committee on Environment and Public
Works of the Senate a report on the status of the implementation
of the water supply contract, Department of the Army, Civil Works
Contract No. 29-68—-A-0130, at Wright Patman Lake, Texas, that—

(1) describes the implementation of that contract at Wright

Patman Lake; and

(2) identifies—

(A) the activities that the Secretary expects to be nec-
essary to complete the execution of the contract;

(B) the expected completion date for each activity
identified under subparagraph (A); and



132 STAT. 3814 PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018

(C) the expected date of completion of the execution
of the contract.

Subtitle C—Deauthorizations,
Modifications, and Related Provisions

33 USC 579d-1. SEC. 1301. DEAUTHORIZATION OF INACTIVE PROJECTS.

(a) PURPOSES.—The purposes of this section are—

(1) to identify $4,000,000,000 in water resources develop-
ment projects authorized by Congress that are no longer viable
for construction due to—

(A) a lack of local support;

(B) a lack of available Federal or mnon-Federal
resources; or

(C) an authorizing purpose that is no longer relevant
or feasible;

(2) to create an expedited and definitive process for Con-
gress to deauthorize water resources development projects that
are no longer viable for construction; and

(3) to allow the continued authorization of water resources
development projects that are viable for construction.

(b) INTERIM DEAUTHORIZATION LIST.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall develop an interim
deauthorization list that identifies—

(A) each water resources development project, or sepa-
rable element of a project, authorized for construction
before November 8, 2007, for which—

(i) planning, design, or construction was not initi-
ated before the date of enactment of this Act; or

(i) planning, design, or construction was initiated
before the date of enactment of this Act, but for which
no funds, Federal or non-Federal, were obligated for
planning, design, or construction of the project or sepa-
rable element of the project during the current fiscal
year or any of the 6 preceding fiscal years;

(B) each project or separable element of a project identi-
fied and included on a list to Congress for deauthorization
pursuant to section 1001(b)(2) of the Water Resources
Development Act of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 579a(b)(2)); and

(C) any project or separable element of a project for
which the non-Federal sponsor of such project or separable
element submits a request for inclusion on the list.

(2) PUBLIC COMMENT AND CONSULTATION.—

(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall solicit comments
from the public and the Governors of each applicable State
on the interim deauthorization list developed under para-

graph (1).
(B) COMMENT PERIOD.—The public comment period
shall be 90 days.
Deadline. (3) SUBMISSION TO CONGRESS; PUBLICATION.—Not later than

90 days after the date of the close of the comment period
under paragraph (2), the Secretary shall—

(A) submit a revised interim deauthorization list to
the Committee on Environment and Public Works of the
Senate and the Committee on Transportation and Infra-
structure of the House of Representatives; and



PUBLIC LAW 115-270—O0OCT. 23, 2018 132 STAT. 3815

(B) publish the revised interim deauthorization list Federal Register,

in the Federal Register. publication.
(c) FINAL DEAUTHORIZATION LIST.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall develop a final
deauthorization list of water resources development projects,
or separable elements of projects, from the revised interim
deauthorization list described in subsection (b)(3).

(2) DEAUTHORIZATION AMOUNT.—

(A) PROPOSED FINAL LIST.—The Secretary shall prepare
a proposed final deauthorization list of projects and sepa-
rable elements of projects that have, in the aggregate,
an estimated Federal cost to complete that is at least
$4,000,000,000.

(B) DETERMINATION OF FEDERAL COST TO COMPLETE.—
For purposes of subparagraph (A), the Federal cost to com-
plete shall take into account any allowances authorized
by section 902 of the Water Resources Development Act
of 1986 (33 U.S.C. 2280), as applied to the most recent
project schedule and cost estimate.

(3) IDENTIFICATION OF PROJECTS.—

(A) SEQUENCING OF PROJECTS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall identify
projects and separable elements of projects for inclusion
on the proposed final deauthorization list according
to the order in which the projects and separable ele-
ments of the projects were authorized, beginning with
the earliest auth