AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

H.R. 8337

One Nundred Sixteenth Congress
of the
Mnited States of America

AT THE SECOND SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Friday,
the third day of January, two thousand and twenty

An Arct

Making continuing appropriations for fiscal year 2021, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Continuing Appropriations Act,
2021 and Other Extensions Act”.

SEC. 2. TABLE OF CONTENTS.
The table of contents of this Act is as follows:

Sec. 1. Short Title.
Sec. 2. Table of Contents.
Sec. 3. References.

DIVISION A—CONTINUING APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2021

DIVISION B—SURFACE TRANSPORTATION PROGRAM EXTENSION

Title I—Surface Transportation Programs
Title II—Trust Funds

DIVISION C—HEALTH EXTENDERS

Title I—Public Health Extenders

Title II—Medicare Extenders

Title III—Medicaid Extenders

Title IV—Medicare Part B Premium Adjustment
Title V—Accelerated and Advance Payment Programs
Title VI—Offsets

DIVISION D—OTHER MATTERS

Title I—Emergency Stopgap USCIS Stabilization Act

Title II—United States Parole Commission Extension

Title III—Antitrlft Criminal Penalty Enhancement and Reform Permanent Exten-
sion Act

Title IV—Community Services and Supports

Title V—Budgetary Effects

Title VI—Nutrition and Commodities Programs

DIVISION E—DEPARTMENT OF VETERANS AFFAIRS EXTENSIONS

Title I—Extensions of Authorities Relating to Health Care

Title II—Extensions of Authorities Relating to Benefits

Title III—Extensions of Authorities Relating to Homeless Veterans
Title IV—Extensions of Other Authorities and Other Matters

SEC. 3. REFERENCES.

Except as expressly provided otherwise, any reference to “this
Act” contained in any division of this Act shall be treated as
referring only to the provisions of that division.



H.R.8337—2

DIVISION A—CONTINUING
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2021

The following sums are hereby appropriated, out of any money
in the Treasury not otherwise appropriated, and out of applicable
corporate or other revenues, receipts, and funds, for the several
departments, agencies, corporations, and other organizational units
of Government for fiscal year 2021, and for other purposes, namely:

SEC. 101. Such amounts as may be necessary, at a rate for
operations as provided in the applicable appropriations Acts for
fiscal year 2020 and under the authority and conditions provided
in such Acts, for continuing projects or activities (including the
costs of direct loans and loan guarantees) that are not otherwise
specifically provided for in this Act, that were conducted in fiscal
year 2020, and for which appropriations, funds, or other authority
were made available in the following appropriations Acts:

(1) The Agriculture, Rural Development, Food and Drug
Administration, and Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020
(division B of Public Law 116-94), except sections 791 and
792.

(2) The Commerce, Justice, Science, and Related Agencies
Appropriations Act, 2020 (division B of Public Law 116-93),
except the last proviso under the heading “Department of Com-
merce—Bureau of the Census—Periodic Censuses and Pro-
grams”.

(3) The Department of Defense Appropriations Act, 2020
(division A of Public Law 116-93), except title X.

(4) The Energy and Water Development and Related Agen-
cies Appropriations Act, 2020 (division C of Public Law 116—
94)

(5) The Financial Services and General Government Appro-
priations Act, 2020 (division C of Public Law 116-93).

(6) The Department of Homeland Security Appropriations
Act, 2020 (division D of Public Law 116-93) (except for amounts
in title II of division D of Public Law 116-93 that were des-
ignated by the Congress as being for an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985), and title I of division
I of Public Law 116-94.

(7) The Department of the Interior, Environment, and
Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020 (division D of Public
Law 116-94).

(8) The Departments of Labor, Health and Human Services,
and Education, and Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020
(division A of Public Law 116-94).

(9) The Legislative Branch Appropriations Act, 2020 (divi-
sion E of Public Law 116-94), and section 7 of Public Law
116-94.

(10) The Military Construction, Veterans Affairs, and
Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020 (division F of Public
Law 116-94), except title V.

(11) The Department of State, Foreign Operations, and
Related Programs Appropriations Act, 2020 (division G of Public
Law 116-94).



H.R.8337—3

(12) The Transportation, Housing and Urban Development,

and Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020 (division H

of Public Law 116-94).

SEC. 102. (a) No appropriation or funds made available or
authority granted pursuant to section 101 for the Department of
Defense shall be used for:

(1) the new production of items not funded for production
in fiscal year 2020 or prior years;

(2) the increase in production rates above those sustained
with fiscal year 2020 funds; or

(3) The initiation, resumption, or continuation of any
project, activity, operation, or organization (defined as any
project, subproject, activity, budget activity, program element,
and subprogram within a program element, and for any invest-
ment items defined as a P-1 line item in a budget activity
within an appropriation account and an R-1 line item that
includes a program element and subprogram element within
an appropriation account) for which appropriations, funds, or

other authority were not available during fiscal year 2020.

(b) No appropriation or funds made available or authority
granted pursuant to section 101 for the Department of Defense
shall be used to initiate multi-year procurements utilizing advance
procurement funding for economic order quantity procurement
unless specifically appropriated later.

SEC. 103. Appropriations made by section 101 shall be available
to the extent and in the manner that would be provided by the
pertinent appropriations Act.

SEC. 104. Except as otherwise provided in section 102, no
appropriation or funds made available or authority granted pursu-
ant to section 101 shall be used to initiate or resume any project
or activity for which appropriations, funds, or other authority were
not available during fiscal year 2020.

SEC. 105. Appropriations made and authority granted pursuant
to this Act shall cover all obligations or expenditures incurred
for any project or activity during the period for which funds or
authority for such project or activity are available under this Act.

SEC. 106. Unless otherwise provided for in this Act or in the
applicable appropriations Act for fiscal year 2021, appropriations
and funds made available and authority granted pursuant to this
Act shall be available until whichever of the following first occurs:

(1) The enactment into law of an appropriation for any
project or activity provided for in this Act.
(2) The enactment into law of the applicable appropriations

Act for fiscal year 2021 without any provision for such project

or activity.

(3) December 11, 2020.

SEC. 107. Expenditures made pursuant to this Act shall be
charged to the applicable appropriation, fund, or authorization
whenever a bill in which such applicable appropriation, fund, or
authorization is contained is enacted into law.

SEC. 108. Appropriations made and funds made available by
or authority granted pursuant to this Act may be used without
regard to the time limitations for submission and approval of appor-
tionments set forth in section 1513 of title 31, United States Code,
but nothing in this Act may be construed to waive any other
provision of law governing the apportionment of funds.



H.R.8337—4

SEC. 109. Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act,
except section 106, for those programs that would otherwise have
high initial rates of operation or complete distribution of appropria-
tions at the beginning of fiscal year 2021 because of distributions
of funding to States, foreign countries, grantees, or others, such
high initial rates of operation or complete distribution shall not
be made, and no grants shall be awarded for such programs funded
by this Act that would impinge on final funding prerogatives.

SEC. 110. This Act shall be implemented so that only the
most limited funding action of that permitted in the Act shall
be taken in order to provide for continuation of projects and activi-
ties.

SEC. 111. (a) For entitlements and other mandatory payments
whose budget authority was provided in appropriations Acts for
fiscal year 2020, and for activities under the Food and Nutrition
Act of 2008, activities shall be continued at the rate to maintain
program levels under current law, under the authority and condi-
tions provided in the applicable appropriations Act for fiscal year
2020, to be continued through the date specified in section 106(3).

(b) Notwithstanding section 106, obligations for mandatory pay-
ments due on or about the first day of any month that begins
after October 2020 but not later than 30 days after the date specified
in section 106(3) may continue to be made, and funds shall be
available for such payments.

SEC. 112. Amounts made available under section 101 for civilian
personnel compensation and benefits in each department and
agency may be apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary
to avoid furloughs within such department or agency, consistent
with the applicable appropriations Act for fiscal year 2020, except
that such authority provided under this section shall not be used
until after the department or agency has taken all necessary actions
to reduce or defer non-personnel-related administrative expenses.

SEC. 113. Funds appropriated by this Act may be obligated
and expended notwithstanding section 10 of Public Law 91-672
(22 U.S.C. 2412), section 15 of the State Department Basic Authori-
ties Act of 1956 (22 U.S.C. 2680), section 313 of the Foreign Rela-
tions Authorization Act, Fiscal Years 1994 and 1995 (22 U.S.C.
6212), and section 504(a)(1) of the National Security Act of 1947
(50 U.S.C. 3094(a)(1)).

SEC. 114. (a) Each amount incorporated by reference in this
Act that was previously designated by the Congress for Overseas
Contingency Operations/Global War on Terrorism or as an emer-
gency requirement pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A) of the Balanced
Budget and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985 or as being
for disaster relief pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(D) of such Act is
designated by the Congress for Overseas Contingency Operations/
Global War on Terrorism or as an emergency requirement pursuant
to section 251(b)(2)(A) of such Act or as being for disaster relief
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(D) of such Act, respectively.

(b) Section 6 of Public Law 116-94 shall apply to amounts
designated in subsection (a) and sections 126 and 163 of this Act
for Overseas Contingency Operations/Global War on Terrorism or
as an emergency requirement.

(c) This section shall become effective immediately upon enact-
ment of this Act, and shall remain in effect through the date
in section 106(3).



H.R.8337—5

SEC. 115. (a) Rescissions or cancellations of discretionary budget
authority that continue pursuant to section 101 in Treasury Appro-
priations Fund Symbols (TAFS)—

(1) to which other appropriations are not provided by this

Act, but for which there is a current applicable TAFS that

does receive an appropriation in this Act; or

(2) which are no-year TAFS and receive other appropria-
tions in this Act,
may be continued instead by reducing the rate for operations other-
wise provided by section 101 for such current applicable TAFS,
as long as doing so does not impinge on the final funding preroga-
tives of the Congress.

(b) Rescissions or cancellations described in subsection (a) shall
continue in an amount equal to the lesser of—

(1) the amount specified for rescission or cancellation in

the applicable appropriations Act referenced in section 101

of this Act; or

(2) the amount of balances available, as of October 1,

2020, from the funds specified for rescission or cancellation

in the applicable appropriations Act referenced in section 101

of this Act.

(¢) No later than November 20, 2020, the Director of the Office
of Management and Budget shall provide to the Committees on
Appropriations of the House of Representatives and the Senate
a comprehensive list of the rescissions or cancellations that will
continue pursuant to section 101: Provided, That the information
in such comprehensive list shall be periodically updated to reflect
any subsequent changes in the amount of balances available, as
of October 1, 2020, from the funds specified for rescission or can-
cellation in the applicable appropriations Act referenced in section
101, and such updates shall be transmitted to the Committees
on Appropriations of the House of Representatives and the Senate
upon request.

SEC. 116. Notwithstanding section 101, amounts are available
in the “Rural Utilities Service—Rural Water and Waste Disposal
Program Account” of the Department of Agriculture for gross obliga-
tions for the principal amount of direct and guaranteed loans as
authorized by section 306 and described in section 381E(d)(2) of
the Consolidated Farm and Rural Development Act, as follows:
$1,400,000,000 for direct loans; and $50,000,000 for guaranteed
loans.

SEC. 117. Amounts made available by section 101 for “Depart-
ment of Agriculture—Food and Nutrition Service—Child Nutrition
Programs” to carry out section 749(g) of the Agriculture, Rural
Development, Food and Drug Administration, and Related Agencies
Appropriations Act, 2010 (Public Law 111-80) may be apportioned
up to the rate for operations necessary to ensure that the program
can be fully operational by May 2021.

SEC. 118. Amounts made available by section 101 for “Depart-
ment of Agriculture—Domestic Food Programs—Food and Nutrition
Service—Commodity Assistance Program” may be apportioned up
to the rate for operations necessary to maintain current program
caseload in the Commodity Supplemental Food Program.

SEC. 119. Amounts made available by section 101 for “Farm
Service Agency—Agricultural Credit Insurance Fund Program
Account” may be apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary



H.R.8337—6

to accommodate approved applications for direct and guaranteed
farm ownership loans, as authorized by 7 U.S.C. 1922 et seq.

SEC. 120. Section 260 of the Agricultural Marketing Act of
1946 (7 U.S.C. 1636i) and section 942 of the Livestock Mandatory
Reporting Act of 1999 (7 U.S.C. 1635 note; Public Law 106-78)
shall be applied by substituting the date specified in section 106(3)
of this Act for “September 30, 2020”.

SEc. 121. (a) Sections 7(j)(5), 7A(1)(4), and 21(e) of the United
States Grain Standards Act (7 U.S.C. 79G)(5), 79a(l)(4), 87j(e)) shall
be applied by substituting the date specified in section 106(3) of
this Act for “September 30, 2020” each place it appears.

(b) Sections 7D and 19 of the United States Grain Standards
Act (7 U.S.C. 79d, 87h) shall be applied by substituting “2021”
for “2020”.

SEC. 122. Section 7605(b) of the Agriculture Improvement Act
of 2018 (7 U.S.C. 5940 note; Public Law 115-334) is amended
by striking “the date that is 1 year after the date on which the
Secretary establishes a plan under section 297C of the Agricultural
Marketing Act of 1946” and inserting “September 30, 2021”.

SEcC. 123. Notwithstanding section 101, the second paragraph
under the heading “Department of Health and Human Services—
Food and Drug Administration—Salaries and Expenses” in title
VI of division B of Public Law 116-94 shall be applied by striking
“, contingent upon the enactment of the Over-the-Counter Mono-
graph User Fee Act of 2019,”.

SEC. 124. Notwithstanding section 101, amounts are provided
for “Department of Commerce—Bureau of the Census—Periodic
Censuses and Programs” at a rate for operations of $1,514,709,000:
Provided, That amounts made available under such heading by
this Act may be apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary
to conduct the 2020 Decennial Census Program.

SEc. 125. (a)(1) Notwithstanding any other provision of this
Act, the Secretary of the Navy may enter into a contract, beginning
with fiscal year 2021, for the procurement of up to two Columbia
class submarines.

(2) With respect to a contract entered into under subsection

(a), the Secretary of the Navy may use incremental funding

to make payments under the contract.

(3) Any contract entered into under subsection (a) shall
provide that—

(A) any obligation of the United States to make a
payment under the contract is subject to the availability
of appropriations for that purpose; and

(B) total liability of the Federal Government for termi-
nation of any contract entered into shall be limited to
the total amount of funding obligated to the contract at
time of termination.

(b) Notwithstanding sections 102 and 104, amounts made avail-
able by section 101 to the Department of Defense for “Shipbuilding
and Conversion, Navy” may be apportioned up to the rate for
operations necessary for “Ohio Replacement Submarine (Full
Funding)” in an amount not to exceed $1,620,270,000.

SEC. 126. (a) The remaining unobligated balances of funds
as of September 30, 2020, from amounts made available to “Depart-
ment of Defense—Other Department of Defense Programs—Office
of the Inspector General” in title III of division B of the CARES
Act (Public Law 116-136), are hereby rescinded, and, in addition



H.R.8337—7

to amounts otherwise provided by section 101, an amount of addi-
tional new budget authority equivalent to the amount rescinded
pursuant to this subsection is hereby appropriated on September
30, 2020, for an additional amount for fiscal year 2020, to remain
available until September 30, 2021, and shall be available for the
same purposes, in addition to other funds as may be available
for such purposes, and under the same authorities for which the
funds were originally provided in Public Law 116-136: Provided,
That the amounts rescinded pursuant to this subsection that were
previously designated by the Congress as an emergency requirement
pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget and
Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985 are designated by the Con-
gress as an emergency requirement pursuant to section
251(b)(2)(A)(1) of that Act: Provided further, That such amount
is designated by the Congress as being for an emergency require-
ment pursuant to section 251(b)(2)(A)(i) of the Balanced Budget
and Emergency Deficit Control Act of 1985.

(b)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, or
if the designation in section 114(b) occurs after September

30, 2020, this section shall be applied as if it were in effect

on September 30, 2020.

SEc. 127. (a) No funds shall be transferred directly from
“Department of Energy—Power Marketing Administration—Colo-
rado River Basins Power Marketing Fund, Western Area Power
Administration” to the general fund of the Treasury in fiscal year
2020.

(b)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, this
section shall be applied as if it were in effect on September

30, 2020.

SEC. 128. (a) Section 104(c) of the Reclamation States Emer-
gency Drought Relief Act of 1991 (43 U.S.C. 2214(c)) shall be
applied by substituting the date specified in section 106(3) of this
Act for “September 30, 2020”.

(b) Section 301 of the Reclamation States Emergency Drought
Relief Act of 1991 (43 U.S.C. 2241) shall be applied by substituting
“2006 through 2021” for “2006 through 2020”.

SEC. 129. Section 3007(a)(5)(A)(1)II)(bb) of the Scholarships
for Opportunity and Results Act (sec. 38—-1853.07(a)(5)(A)1)(II)(bb),
D.C. Official Code) is amended by striking “5 years” and inserting
“6 years”.

SEC. 130. Notwithstanding any other provision of this Act,
except section 106, the District of Columbia may expend local funds
made available under the heading “District of Columbia—District
of Columbia Funds” for such programs and activities under the
District of Columbia Appropriations Act, 2020 (title IV of division
C of Public Law 116-93) at the rate set forth in the Fiscal Year
2021 Local Budget Act of 2020 (D.C. Act 23-408), as modified
as of the date of enactment of this Act.

SEC. 131. In addition to the amounts otherwise provided by
section 101, for “District of Columbia—Federal Payment for Emer-
gency Planning and Security Costs in the District of Columbia”,
there is appropriated $13,000,000, for an additional amount for



H.R.8337—S8

fiscal year 2021, to remain available until expended, for costs associ-
ated with the Presidential Inauguration held in January 2021.

SEC. 132. Notwithstanding section 101, the matter preceding
the first proviso under the heading “Small Business Administra-
tion—Business Loans Program Account” in title V of division C
of Public Law 116-93 shall be applied by substituting “$15,000,000”
for “$99,000,000” and the third proviso shall be applied as if the
language read as follows: “Provided further, That commitments
for general business loans authorized under paragraphs (1) through
(35) of section 7(a) of the Small Business Act shall not exceed
$30,000,000,000 for a combination of amortizing term loans and
the aggregated maximum line of credit provided by revolving
loans:”: Provided, That amounts made available under such heading
by this Act may be apportioned up to the rate for operations
necessary to accommodate increased demand for commitments for
general business loans authorized under paragraphs (1) through
(35) of section 7(a) of the Small Business Act (15 U.S.C. 636(a))
and for commitments to guarantee loans for debentures under sec-
tion 303(b) of the Small Business Investment Act of 1958 (15
U.S.C 683(b)).

SEC. 133. Amounts made available by section 101 for “Small
Business Administration—Disaster Loans Program Account” may
be apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary to accommo-
date increased demand for commitments for disaster administrative
expenses.

SEC. 134. (a) Notwithstanding section 101, amounts are pro-
vided for “General Services Administration—Expenses, Presidential
Transition” for necessary expenses to carry out the Presidential
Transition Act of 1963 (3 U.S.C. 102 note), at a rate for operations
of $9,900,000, of which not to exceed $1,000,000 is for activities
authorized by sections 3(a)(8) and 3(a)(9) of such Act: Provided,
That such amounts may be transferred and credited to the “Acquisi-
tion Services Fund” or “Federal Buildings Fund” to reimburse
obligations incurred prior to enactment of this Act for the purposes
provided herein related to the Presidential election in 2020: Pro-
vided further, That amounts available under this section shall be
in addition to any other amounts available for such purposes.

(b) Notwithstanding section 101, no funds are provided by
this Act for “General Services Administration—Pre-Election Presi-
dential Transition”.

SEC. 135. Amounts made available by section 101 for “General
Services  Administration—Real Property  Activities—Federal
Buildings Fund—Limitations on Availability of Revenue” may be
apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary for monthly
rental of space operations.

SEC. 136. Notwithstanding section 101, for expenses of the
Office of Administration to carry out the Presidential Transition
Act of 1963, as amended, and similar expenses, in addition to
amounts otherwise appropriated by law, amounts are provided to
“Presidential Transition Administrative Support” at a rate for oper-
ations of $8,000,000: Provided, That such funds may be transferred
to other accounts that provide funding for offices within the Execu-
tive Office of the President and the Office of the Vice President
in this Act or any other Act, to carry out such purposes: Provided
further, That such amounts may be apportioned up to the rate
for operations necessary to carry out such responsibilities.



H.R.8337—9

SEC. 137. In addition to amounts provided in section 101,
an additional amount is provided for “National Archives and
Records Administration—Operating Expenses” to carry out transi-
tion responsibilities of the Archivist of the United States under
sections 2201 through 2207 of title 44, United States Code (com-
monly known as the “Presidential Records Act of 1978”) in the
event of a Presidential Transition at a rate for operations of
$18,000,000: Provided, That such amounts may be apportioned
up to the rate for operations necessary to carry out such responsibil-
ities.

SEC. 138. Amounts made available by section 101 for “Office
of Personnel Management—Salaries and Expenses”, including
amounts to be transferred from the appropriate trust funds of
the Office of Personnel Management without regard to other stat-
utes, may be apportioned up to the rate for operations necessary
to cover any expected shortfall in administrative expenses resulting
from the transfer of the National Background Investigations Bureau
function to the Department of Defense.

SEC. 139. Section 2(b)(2)(C)(i) of the Temporary Bankruptcy
Judgeships Extension Act of 2012 (28 U.S.C. 152 note; Public Law
112-121) is amended (with regard to the 1st vacancy in the eastern
district of Tennessee) by striking “5 years” and inserting “9 years”.

SEC. 140. Section 3610 of division A of the CARES Act (Public
Law 116-136) shall be applied by substituting the date in section
106(3) of this Act for “September 30, 2020”.

SEC. 141. Amounts made available by section 101 to the Depart-
ment of Homeland Security for “Office of the Secretary and Execu-
tive Management—Operations and Support”’, “Management Direc-
torate—Operations and Support”, and “Intelligence, Analysis, and
Operations Coordination—Operations and Support” may be appor-
tioned up to the rate for operations necessary to carry out activities
previously funded by the Working Capital Fund of the Department
of Homeland Security, consistent with the fiscal year 2021 Presi-
dent’s Budget proposal, submitted pursuant to section 1105(a) of
titlle 31, United States Code, and accompanying justification mate-
rials.

SEC. 142. Amounts made available by section 101 to the Depart-
ment of Homeland Security under the heading “Coast Guard—
Operations and Support” may be available for the pay and benefits
of Coast Guard Yard and Vessel Documentation personnel, Non-
Appropriated Funds personnel, and for Morale, Welfare and Recre-
ation Programs.

SEC. 143. Section 9307(f)(1) of title 46, United States Code
shall be applied by substituting the date specified in section 106(3)
of this Act for “September 30, 2020”.

SEC. 144. Amounts made available by section 101 to the Depart-
ment of Homeland Security under the heading “Cybersecurity and
Infrastructure Security Agency” may be obligated in the account
and budget structure set forth in H.R. 7669 and the accompanying
House Report 116-458, as reported by the House Committee on
Appropriations on July 15, 2020.

SEC. 145. Amounts made available by section 101 to the Depart-
ment of Homeland Security under the heading “Federal Emergency
Management Agency—Disaster Relief Fund” may be apportioned
up to the rate for operations necessary to carry out response and
recovery activities under the Robert T. Stafford Disaster Relief
and Emergency Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 5121 et seq.).



H.R.8337—10

SEC. 146. (a) Section 1309(a) of the National Flood Insurance
Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. 4016(a)) is amended by striking “September
30, 2019” and inserting “September 30, 2021”.

(b) Section 1319 of the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968
(42 U.S.C. 4026) is amended by striking “September 30, 2019”
and inserting “September 30, 2021”.

(c)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, this
section shall be applied as if it were in effect on September
30, 2020.

SEC. 147. (a) Notwithstanding section 101, the following shall
be applied by substituting “$0” for—

(1) “$32,300,000” in the first paragraph under the heading
“Bureau of Land Management—Land Acquisition”;

(2) “$10,000,000”, and “$320,000” in the first paragraph
under the heading “United States Fish and Wildlife Service—
Land Acquisition”;

(3) “$3,628,000” in the second paragraph under the heading
“United States Fish and Wildlife Service—Land Acquisition”;

(4) “$30,800,000” and “$23,702,000” for “$54,502,000” in
the first paragraph under the heading “United States Fish
and Wildlife Service—Cooperative Endangered Species Con-
servation Fund”;

(5) “$208,400,000”, “$140,000,000”, and “$13,000,000” in
the first paragraph under the heading “National Park Service—
Land Acquisition and State Assistance”;

(6) “$63,990,000” and “$283,000,000” for “$346,990,000”
under the heading “Forest Service—State and Private For-
estry”; and

(7) “$78,898,000” in the first paragraph under the heading
“Forest Service—Land Acquisition”.

(b) Notwithstanding section 101, the first paragraph under
the heading “United States Fish and Wildlife Service—Land
Acquisition” shall be applied by substituting “$7,550,000” for
“$70,715,000”.

(c) Amounts made available by section 101 to the Department
of the Interior for “Departmental Offices—Office of the Secretary—
Departmental Operations” may be apportioned up to the rate for
operations necessary to fund the Appraisal and Valuation Services
Office and such amounts shall be derived from the Land and Water
Conservation Fund.

SEC. 148. Amounts made available by section 101 to the Forest
Service may be obligated in the account and budget structure set
forth in the table provided by the Secretary of Agriculture to the
Committees on Appropriations of the Senate and the House of
Representatives prior to the end of fiscal year 2020 pursuant to
section 435(d) of the Department of the Interior, Environment,
and Related Agencies Appropriations Act, 2020 (division D of Public
Law 116-94): Provided, That amounts made available by section
101 under the heading “Forest Service—National Forest System”
shall be available for the base salary and expenses of employees
that carry out the functions funded by the “Capital Improvement
and Maintenance” account, the “Range Betterment Fund” account,
and the “Management of National Forests for Subsistence Uses”
account and may be apportioned up to the rate for operations
necessary to fund such base salary and expenses of such employees.



H.R.8337—11

SEC. 149. Activities authorized by part A of title IV and section
1108(b) of the Social Security Act shall continue through the date
specified in section 106(3) of this Act, in the manner authorized
for fiscal year 2020, and out of any money in the Treasury of
the United States not otherwise appropriated, there are hereby
appropriated such sums as may be necessary for such purpose:
Provided, That grants under section 418 of the Social Security
Act shall be issued on the same basis as grants under section
403(a)(1) of such Act.

SEC. 150. (a) The remaining unobligated balances of funds
as of September 30, 2020, from amounts credited and merged pursu-
ant to the second proviso under the heading “Department of Health
and Human Services—Centers for Disease Control and Prevention—
Buildings and Facilities” in title II of the Departments of Labor,
Health and Human Services, Education, and Related Agencies
Appropriations Act, 2016 (division H of Public Law 114-113) are
hereby rescinded, and, in addition to amounts otherwise provided
by section 101, an amount of additional new budget authority
equivalent to the amount rescinded pursuant to this subsection
is hereby appropriated on September 30, 2020, for an additional
amount for fiscal year 2020, to remain available until September
30, 2025, and shall be available for the same purposes, in addition
to other funds as may be available for such purposes, and under
the same authorities for which the funds were originally transferred
and merged pursuant to Public Law 114-113.

(b)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, this
section shall be applied as if it were in effect on September

30, 2020.

SEC. 151. (a) Notwithstanding section 101, section 529 of divi-
sion A of Public Law 116-94 shall be applied by substituting
“$1,150,000,000” for “$3,169,819,000” and by substituting “section
2104(a)(24)” for “section 2104(a)(23)”.

(b) Notwithstanding section 101, section 530 of division A of
Public Law 116-94 shall be applied by substituting
“$11,005,661,000” for “$6,093,181,000”.

SEC. 152. (a) Funds made available in Public Law 113-235
to the accounts of the National Institutes of Health that were
available for obligation through fiscal year 2015 and were obligated
for multi-year research grants shall be available through fiscal
year 2021 for the liquidation of valid obligations incurred in fiscal
year 2015 if the Director of the National Institutes of Health deter-
mines the project suffered an interruption of activities attributable
to SARS-CoV-2.

(b)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, this
section shall be applied as if it were in effect on September

30, 2020.

SEC. 153. (a) Funds made available in Public Law 113-76
under the heading “Rehabilitation Services and Disability Research”
that were available for obligation through fiscal year 2015 for
the Automated Personalization Computing Project pursuant to the
first four provisos under that heading in that Act are to remain
available through fiscal year 2021 for the liquidation of valid obliga-
tions incurred in fiscal years 2014 or 2015.



H.R.8337—12

(b)(1) This section shall become effective immediately upon
enactment of this Act.

(2) If this Act is enacted after September 30, 2020, this
section shall be applied as if it were in effect on September

30, 2020.

SEC. 154. Section 114(f) of the Higher Education Act of 1965
(20 U.S.C. 1011c(f)) shall be applied by substituting the date speci-
fied in section 106(3) of this Act for “September 30, 2020”.

SEC. 155. Section 458(a)(4) of the Higher Education Act of
1965 (20 U.S.C. 1087h(a)(4)) shall be applied through the date
specified in section 106(3) of this Act by substituting “2021” for
“2020”.

SEC. 156. (a) The remaining unobligated balances of funds
as of September 30, 2020, from amounts made available to “Corpora-
tion for National and Community Service—Salaries and Expenses”
in title IV of division A of the Further Consolidated Appropriations
Act, 2020 (Public Law 116-94), are hereby rescinded, and in addi-
tion to amounts otherwise provided by section 101, an amount
of additional new budget authority equivalent to the amount
rescinded pursuant to this subsection is hereby appropriated on
September 30, 2020, for an additional amount for fiscal year 2020,
to remain available until September 30, 2021, and shall be available
for the same purposes, in addition to other funds as may be avail-
able for such purposes, and under the same authorities for which
the funds were originally provided in Public Law 116-94.

(b) The remaining unobligated balances of funds as of Sep-
tember 30, 2020, from amounts made available to “Corporation
for National and Community Service—Operating Expenses” in title
IV of division A of the Further Consolidated Appropriations Act,
2020 (Public Law 116-94), are hereby rescinded, and in addition
to amounts otherwise provided by section 101, an amount of addi-
tional new budget authority equivalent to the amount rescinded
pursuant to this subsection is hereby appropriated on September
30, 2020, for an additional amount for fiscal year 2020, to remain
available until September 30, 2021, and shall be available for the
same purposes, in addition to other funds as may be available
for such purpos