AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

116TH CONGRESS
2D SESSION S. 3 1 58

To remove college cost as a barrier to every student having aceess to a
well-prepared and diverse educator workforce, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JANUARY 8, 2020
Mr. BOOKER (for himself, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. BROWN, Mrs. GILLIBRAND,
Ms. HARRIS, Ms. KLoBUCHAR, Mr. MARKEY, Mr. MERKLEY, and Ms.
WARREN) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Health, Education, Labor, and Pensions

A BILL

To remove college cost as a barrier to every student having
access to a well-prepared and diverse educator workforce,
and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
twes of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Diversifying by Invest-
ing in Educators and Students to Improve Outcomes For

Youth Act” or the “Diversify Act”.

SEC. 2. FINDINGS.

(o BN e VY, B N VS N 8]

Congress finds the following:



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

2

(1) Schools predominantly enrolling historically
underserved students are often disproportionately
impacted by teacher shortages.

(2) Data shows that between 2009 and 2014,
teacher education enrollments dropped from 691,000
to 451,000, a 35-percent reduction. This amounts to
a decrease of almost 240,000 professionals on their
way to becoming teachers in the year 2014, as com-
pared to 2009.

(3) Research suggests that service scholarship
programs like the TEACH Grant Program are suc-
cessful when they are both administratively manage-
able and when subsidies are large enough to sub-
stantially offset training costs. Efforts to increase
the TEACIH Grant award amount must be combined
with efforts to ensure that the program is adminis-
tratively manageable. In order for the TEACH
Grant Program to meet its full potential, the re-
search 1s clear that both criteria need to be ad-
dressed.

(4) The TEACH Grant’s award amount has not
increased since its creation in the bipartisan College
Cost Reduction and Access Act of 2007 (Public Law
110-84). In addition, due to the Budget Control Act
of 2011 (Public Law 112-25), the maximum

*S 3158 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

3
amount of grant aid available under the TEACH

Grant Program of $4,000 a year has been cut for
a majority of the program’s existence. This comes at
a time when the yearly full cost of a public 4-year
college for an in-State student exceeds $20,000.
Further, more than two-thirds of individuals enter-
ing the field of education borrow money to pay for
their higher education, resulting in an average debt
of about $20,000 for those with a bachelor’s degree
and $50,000 for those with a master’s degree.

(5) Grant programs can eliminate or reduce the
need to borrow student loans in order to afford a
college education. This 1s important because a col-
lege student’s potential debt burden influences the
student’s decisions about what profession to enter,
with the result that the student is less likely to pur-
sue a career in education or take other low-paying
jobs after graduation if the student expects to incur
more debt. This i1s especially true for students of
color, who, according to a recent report, are more
likely to come from families that are unable to con-
tribute financially to their higher education.

(6) Students with disabilities, including stu-
dents of color with disabilities, are also likely to ac-

crue significant student loan debt. This often results

*S 3158 IS



S O 0 N N B W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
b A W D = O 0O 0NN N R WNY e

4

from limited ability to work while in school due to
the increased time needed for coursework.

(7) Teachers of color face unique barriers to en-
tering and staying in the profession. For example,
teachers of color are more likely to enter teaching
through alternative pathways due to the high cost of
traditional teacher preparation programs and the
debt burden faced by college students of color.
Lower quality pathways can result in less effective
teaching and high turnover rates. Research shows
that candidates who receive comprehensive prepara-
tion are 2 to 3 times more likely to stay in teaching
than those who receive little training. In many cases,
however, teachers of color are more likely to begin
teaching without having completed comprehensive
preparation and entering instead through alternative
routes that often skip student teaching and key
coursework, leaving teachers to learn on the job.

(8) Research shows that recruiting and retain-
ing a diverse teacher workforce is key to improving
outcomes for all students and for closing achieve-
ment gaps. While White students also benefit by
learning from teachers of color, the impact is espe-
cially significant for students of color, who have

higher test scores, are more likely to graduate high

*S 3158 IS



[E—

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

-

J

school, and more likely to succeed in college when
they have had teachers of color who serve as role
models and support their attachment to school and
learning.
SEC. 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE HIGHER EDUCATION ACT OF
1965.

Section 420M of the Higher Education Act of 1965

(20 U.S.C. 10702-1) is amended—
(1) in subsection (a)(1), by striking “$4,000”
and inserting “$8,000”; and
(2) in subsection (d)—
(A) in paragraph (1)(B), by striking
“$16,000” and inserting “$32,000”; and
(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “$8,000”
and inserting “$16,000".
SEC. 4. AMENDMENT TO THE BALANCED BUDGET AND DEF-
ICIT CONTROL ACT.

Section 255(h) of the Balanced Budget and Emer-
ogency Deficit Control Act of 1985 (2 U.S.C. 905(h)) is
amended by inserting after the item relating to “Supple-
mental Security Income Program (28-0406-0-1-609).”
the following new item:

“TEACH Grants under subpart 9 of part A of

title IV of the Higher Education Act of 1965.”.
O

*S 3158 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2020-01-10T20:51:46-0500
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




