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RECOGNIZING MICHAEL J. 

SHEEHAN, AKA ‘‘THE PRO-
FESSOR,’’ FOR THE 900TH EPI-
SODE OF WORDS TO THE WISE 

HON. JACK BERGMAN 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. BERGMAN. Madam Speaker, it’s my 
honor to recognize Mike Sheehan, also known 
as ‘‘The Professor,’’ upon the occasion of the 
900th episode of his program Words to the 
Wise on WTCM NewsTalk 580 in Traverse 
City, Michigan. Through his exceptional in-
sight, expert knowledge of the English lan-
guage, and unique ability to teach with accu-
racy and humor, The Professor has become 
an indispensable part of Michigan’s First Dis-
trict. 

Born and raised in the southside of Chi-
cago, Sheehan spent much of his early life as 
a monk in the Order of St. Augustine, being 
ordained as a priest in 1965. He would later 
leave the priesthood to become an instructor 
of English at the Olive-Harvey College of the 
City Colleges of Chicago, where he taught for 
26 years and wrote three textbooks, a dic-
tionary, and two novels. Upon retirement, he 
and his late wife decided to make Northern 
Michigan their home. Deciding to stay active in 
his retirement, Sheehan has served on the 
state of Michigan’s Commission on Services to 
the Aging and is a member of the Society of 
Midland Authors, the Dictionary Society of 
North America, the American Dialect Society, 
and Michigan Writers. He also received the 
Distinguished Senior of the National Cherry 
Festival award in 2013. 

For the past 18 years Mike has also hosted 
a weekly radio show, Words to the Wise, on 
WTCM NewsTalk 580. This show, which is 
heard by listeners in 19 counties throughout 
Michigan, dives into the interesting, humorous, 
and sometimes bizarre world of grammar, 
spelling, punctuation, and etymology. His 
unique passion and sense of humor have re-
sulted in his show being beloved by students, 
retirees, and everyone in between. The 900th 
episode of Words to the Wise will air live from 
the City Opera House in Traverse City, Michi-
gan, on July 16. 

Madam Speaker, it’s my honor to recognize 
‘‘The Professor’’ for hitting the milestone of 
900 episodes full of entertainment and edu-
cation. Michiganders can take great pride in 
knowing the First District is home to such a 
dedicated individual. On behalf of my constitu-
ents, I wish Mike all the best in his future en-
deavors. 

f 

HONORING THE LIFE OF FORMER 
INDIANA POLITICIAN, GENE 
SNOWDEN 

HON. JIM BANKS 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. BANKS. Madam Speaker, I rise to 
honor the life of former Indiana politician and 
community leader, Gene Snowden. 

Snowden was a lifelong public servant in In-
diana state and local politics, having served in 
the Indiana House of Representatives and In-

diana State Senate in a legislative career that 
spanned nearly 20 years. 

He served as an Indiana City Councilman 
for Huntington and as Mayor of Huntington, In-
diana. In his political career, he lost just one 
election. 

Snowden was an active member of his com-
munity, involved heavily in his church and civic 
organizations like the Police Athletic League, 
the Salvation Army, the Huntington County 
Historical Society, the Boy Scouts, United 
Way, Christian Literature for Africa, and oth-
ers. 

While there’s not enough words to fully en-
capsulate all of Gene Snowden’s accomplish-
ments, his life is proof positive of the timeless 
legacy each one of us can forge, for ourselves 
and generations to come. 

I offer my deepest condolences to his wife, 
four daughters, six grandchildren, and 12 
great-grandchildren whom he leaves behind. 

f 

HONORING EDGAR J. CURTIS FOR 
RECEIVING THE ORDER OF LIN-
COLN AWARD 

HON. DARIN LaHOOD 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. LAHOOD. Madam Speaker, I would like 
to recognize Edgar J. Curtis for receiving the 
Order of Lincoln award from the Office of the 
Governor. This prestigious award is the high-
est honor that the state of Illinois can present 
for professional achievement and public serv-
ice. 

Ed currently sits as the President and Chief 
Executive Office of Memorial Health Systems 
in Springfield. He is also a member of the 
Southern Illinois University Board of Trustees, 
and a Southern Illinois University— 
Edwardsville School of Nursing Hall of Fame 
member. Throughout his professional career 
and philanthropic efforts, Ed has had tremen-
dous impact on the medical community in Illi-
nois. 

Ed has always had a passion for helping 
others and improving the lives of those around 
him. Since junior high, he has wanted to make 
a difference in the medical field. Ed attended 
Southern Illinois University—Edwardsville, 
where he received his bachelor’s degree in 
nursing. Later Ed earned an MBA from the 
University of Illinois at Champaign-Urbana, 
who also named him an honorary Doctor of 
Humane Letters. After his schooling, Ed 
turned his focus to helping others, and has 
done just that throughout his career. 

Again, I extend my sincere congratulations 
to Edgar J. Curtis for receiving the Order of 
Lincoln award. 

f 

RECOGNIZING LIEUTENANT COLO-
NEL JEFFREY J. IGNATOWSKI 
FOR HIS SERVICE TO 
LETTERKENNY MUNITIONS CEN-
TER 

HON. JOHN JOYCE 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. JOYCE of Pennsylvania. Madam Speak-
er, I rise today to salute the service of Lieuten-

ant Colonel Jeffrey J. Ignatowski, who has 
served his nation and the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania admirably as Commander of the 
Letterkenny Munitions Center (LEMC) in 
Chambersburg, Pennsylvania over the last two 
years. During Lieutenant Colonel Ignatowski’s 
command, LEMC executed six worldwide am-
munition rehearsal of concept drills, imple-
mented a tier meeting process that acceler-
ated work flow and communication, and multi-
plied employee suggestion implementation 
program participation. 

His leadership has strengthened LEMC’s 
reputation as the Army’s premier munitions 
center, orchestrating the distribution, mainte-
nance, and demilitarization of munitions from 
around the globe. On behalf of Pennsylvania’s 
13th District, I want to thank Lieutenant Colo-
nel Ignatowski and his family for his selfless 
service, and moreover highlight the sense of 
purpose with which he has handled every 
project managed in his time at Letterkenny 
Munitions Center. 

His leadership and the progressive changes 
he made will live on, and it is with the utmost 
appreciation with which I wish him the best as 
he continues to serve his nation in new capac-
ities. I take great pleasure in congratulating 
Lieutenant Colonel Ignatowski on his pro-
digious accomplishments and thank him for 
his tireless devotion to duty and continued 
service to the state and to the nation. 

f 

HONORING MICHAEL NGUYEN 

HON. TED S. YOHO 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. YOHO. Madam Speaker, I would like to 
bring attention to the unjust detention of an 
American citizen, Mr. Michael Phuong Minh 
Nguyen, in the Socialist Republic of Vietnam. 

Mr. Nguyen was arrested on July 7, 2018 
while visiting elderly relatives in Vietnam. He 
has since been held at the Phan Dang Luu 
Detention Center in Ho Chi Minh City. While 
the Vietnamese government still has not pro-
vided any evidence of wrongdoing that would 
justify his arrest, the Vietnamese government 
has confirmed they are charging Mr. Nguyen 
for allegedly violating Article 109 of Vietnam’s 
Penal Code, engaging in activity against the 
government. 

I have worked with my colleagues in Con-
gress, the Administration, our embassy per-
sonnel, as well as with Mr. Nguyen’s family, to 
encourage the government of Vietnam to find 
a fast, transparent, and fair resolution to this 
case. Unfortunately, Mr. Nguyen is still being 
held in Vietnam. It is disheartening that an 
American citizen be detained for such a pro-
longed time before a trial is held. 

Over the past four decades, our two coun-
tries have built a strong relationship based on 
trade, trust and mutual respect. My hope is 
that we can continue this relationship without 
the detraction of these kind of events. I will 
continue to urge a just resolution for Mr. 
Nguyen until he can return to his family and 
friends in the United States. 
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CONGRATULATING THE QUAD CIT-

IES VET CENTER ON 40 YEARS 
OF SERVICE 

HON. CHERI BUSTOS 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mrs. BUSTOS. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to recognize the Quad Cities Vet Center on 40 
years of assisting the veterans of this commu-
nity. As a member of the House Appropria-
tions Subcommittee on Military Construction 
and Veterans Affairs, I’m committed to serving 
the men and women who’ve worn our coun-
try’s uniform—making sure they have the re-
sources they deserve and have earned. 

The Quad Cities Vet Center was established 
in 1979 as a response to the lack of services 
that veterans received after the Vietnam War. 
Today, the center provides a wide range of 
social and psychological services, such as in-
dividual, group, marriage and family coun-
seling. I am proud to represent a community 
that provides such essential services to vet-
erans and their families, and I look forward to 
the continuation of their program. I join the 
Quad Cities community to celebrate this mile-
stone and commend them on all of their ef-
forts to improve the lives of those who have 
served our nation. 

It is because of philanthropic services such 
as this that I am especially proud to serve Illi-
nois’ 17th Congressional District. Madam 
Speaker, I would like to again formally con-
gratulate the Quad Cities Vet Center on their 
40th Anniversary and all that they do to enrich 
our community. 

f 

IN HONOR OF MS. SUE SWANN 

HON. ROBERT J. WITTMAN 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. WITTMAN. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today in recognition of Ms. Sue Swann’s forty 
years of service to the Essex County Depart-
ment of Social Security. 

Ms. Swann was known as a diligent and de-
termined employee who gave everyone she 
worked with countless reasons to admire her 
work ethic. Not only did she dedicate four dec-
ades of her life to the Department, but she 
worked three years in other state offices as 
well. 

At work, she was frequently requested per-
sonally by clients for face-to-face meetings to 
discuss the benefits entitled to them. She did 
her job with unmatched compassion and care. 
Over forty years, she decided to stay in her 
position and reject countless promotions. Had 
she chosen to move to other localities, she 
could have been a Benefit Program Specialist 
4 or 5, but because of the passion she has for 
what she did, she remained a Specialist. 

Ms. Swann plans to go into retirement now 
after decades of her tremendous work, and I 
wish her the best of luck in her future endeav-
ors. 

Madam Speaker, I ask you to join me in 
honoring the service of this great woman, Ms. 
Sue Swann, to the people of Virginia’s 1st Dis-
trict, to the Commonwealth of Virginia, and to 
the entirety of our great nation. May God bless 

Sue and her family for her countless hours of 
labor in service to her country. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. F. JAMES SENSENBRENNER, JR. 
OF WISCONSIN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. SENSENBRENNER. Madam Speaker, 
due to illness, I was physically absent from the 
House of Representatives on June 10, 2019. 
On that day, I missed 3 recorded votes. I in-
clude in the RECORD how I would have voted 
had I been present for those votes. 

On Roll Call No. 242 on the Passage of 
H.R. 542, I would have voted ‘‘Yea.’’ 

On Roll Call No. 243 on the Passage of 
H.R. 2539, I would have voted ‘‘Yea.’’ 

On Roll Call No. 244 on the Passage of 
H.R. 2590, I would have voted ‘‘Yea.’’ 

f 

CONGRATULATING RICH AND JUDY 
BUCHANAN 

HON. RODNEY DAVIS 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. RODNEY DAVIS of Illinois. Madam 
Speaker, I rise today to congratulate Rich and 
Judy Buchanan of Bloomington, Illinois who 
were among the honorees named as 2019 
History Makers by the McLean County Mu-
seum of History. 

Rich’s career in public service started short-
ly after his marriage to Judy and spanned 
nearly fifty years. He was first appointed to the 
Regional Planning Commission in 1971 and 
shortly after was elected to the Bloomington 
City Council at the age of 31. He then served 
as Bloomington’s mayor from 1977 to 1985. 
His final elected position was as a member of 
the McLean County Board from 2012 to 2017. 

Judy was also active in politics at nearly 
every level: her own husband’s campaign for 
mayor, state legislative races, congressional 
campaigns, and the campaign of former Presi-
dent George H.W. Bush, introducing him on 
his campaign stop in McLean County. Al-
though, she is perhaps most well-known for 
her fierce advocacy on behalf of the Alz-
heimer’s Association. Having lost her own 
mother to the disease at a young age, she 
spent countless hours at the Illinois State Cap-
itol bringing awareness to mental health 
issues and funding for Alzheimer’s centers 
across the state. 

I am proud to call the Buchanans friends. 
They deserve to be recognized and thanked 
for their decades of leadership and service to 
their community. 

Congratulations to Rich and Judy, on this 
wonderful accomplishment. 

f 

CELEBRATING THE 130TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF THE CITY OF 
MANISTEE FIRE STATION 

HON. JACK BERGMAN 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. BERGMAN. Madam Speaker, it is my 
honor to recognize the City of Manistee Fire 

Station upon the occasion of its 130th anniver-
sary and designation as the ‘‘Oldest Continu-
ously Manned Operating Fire Station’’ by 
Guinness World Records. Through its extraor-
dinary history and commitment to the public 
good, the Manistee Fire Station has become 
an indispensable part of Michigan’s First Dis-
trict. 

First constructed in 1889, the Manistee Fire 
Station has been manned continuously—24 
hours a day, 7 days a week—ever since. The 
hundreds of firefighters that have since served 
in the station’s 130 years fully devoted them-
selves to protecting the lives and well-being of 
the residents of Manistee, and the impact of 
their heroism cannot be understated. 

Efforts to receive recognition from Guinness 
World Records were spearheaded by Fred 
LaPoint, who first joined the fire department in 
1979. The approval process required more 
than two years of verification and was only 
possible thanks to the tireless effort of com-
munity leaders like Mark Fedder, executive di-
rector of the Manistee County Historical Mu-
seum. The fire station was finally awarded the 
title of ‘‘Oldest Continuously Manned Oper-
ating Fire Station’’ on its 130th anniversary— 
the very first time Guinness World Records 
has ever made this award designation. 

Madam Speaker, the celebration of the 
Manistee Fire Station’s 130th anniversary and 
designation as the oldest continuously 
manned operating fire station is the perfect 
opportunity for us to appreciate its unique his-
tory, cultural impact, and significance to North-
ern Michigan. Michiganders can take immense 
pride in knowing that the First District is home 
to such an important landmark. On behalf of 
my constituents, I wish the City of Manistee 
Fire Station all the best in its future endeav-
ors. 

f 

CELEBRATING THE LIFE OF 
RUPERT M. BARKOFF 

HON. DOUG COLLINS 
OF GEORGIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, June 18, 2019 

Mr. COLLINS of Georgia. Madam Speaker, 
I rise today to celebrate the life and work of 
Rupert M. Barkoff, a leader in Atlanta and the 
franchise business community. 

Rupert M. Barkoff was born May 7, 1948, in 
New Orleans, Louisiana, to Martha and Sam-
uel Barkoff. He graduated from the Isidore 
Newman School in New Orleans and later 
went on to graduate from the University of 
Michigan Ann Arbor and the University of 
Michigan Law School. 

After graduating from law school, Barkoff 
moved to Atlanta where he practiced law for 
46 years with Kilpatrick Townsend and estab-
lished himself as a prominent and beloved 
member of the firm. With his creation of the 
Fundamentals of Franchising program and 
book, Barkoff transformed the way in which 
lawyers new to franchising are introduced to 
the business model. 

Known for his generosity of spirit and knowl-
edge in franchisor and franchisee practices, 
Barkoff taught a franchise law course at the 
University of Georgia. He was devoted to his 
students and took a personal interest in each 
and every one. He even made a point of 
meeting with them individually to discuss their 
interests and mentor them toward their goals. 
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