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Senate 
The Senate met at 10 a.m. and was 

called to order by the President pro 
tempore (Mr. GRASSLEY). 

f 

PRAYER 

The Chaplain, Dr. Barry C. Black, of-
fered the following prayer: 

Let us pray. 
Gracious God, You have given us eyes 

to see, ears to hear, and minds to un-
derstand. Reveal Yourself to our law-
makers so that what they see, hear, 
and think will glorify You. Today, may 
they desire and do that which is most 
acceptable to You. Lord, use them so 
that Your will may be done in our Na-
tion and world as they trust the unfold-
ing of Your powerful providence. As 
they wait for You, O God, renew their 
strength, enabling them to mount up 
with wings as eagles, running without 
weariness and walking without faint-
ing. 

We pray in Your merciful Name. 
Amen. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

The President pro tempore led the 
Pledge of Allegiance, as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-
lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mrs. 
HYDE-SMITH). The Senator from Iowa. 

Mr. GRASSLEY. Madam President, I 
ask unanimous consent to speak as in 
morning business for 1 minute. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

TAX TREATIES AND PROTOCOLS 

Mr. GRASSLEY. Madam President, 
later today, the Senate Foreign Rela-
tions Committee is scheduled to con-
sider four protocols to the United 
States’ tax treaties with Spain, Swit-
zerland, Japan, and Luxembourg. I sup-
port swift action on these protocols 

both in committee and in the Senate, 
and I urge my colleagues to vote yes on 
them. 

I encourage the committee to also 
take up the new tax treaties with 
Chile, Hungary, and Poland as soon as 
possible. These new treaties will pro-
vide important benefits to U.S. tax-
payers and the U.S. Government. 

After years of discussion and debate, 
the time has come to move forward on 
all of these bilateral agreements. 

I yield the floor. 
f 

RECOGNITION OF THE MAJORITY 
LEADER 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The ma-
jority leader is recognized. 

f 

TAX TREATIES AND PROTOCOLS 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Madam President, 
let me first associate myself with the 
remarks of the chairman of the Fi-
nance Committee. These tax treaties 
are extremely important to a number 
of American businesses, and I thank 
him for his advocacy. 

f 

IRAN 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Madam President, 
the Senate and the Nation are closely 
watching the situation in the Gulf. 
Last week, the recent recklessness 
from Tehran reached a new level. Iran 
fired on an unmanned U.S. intelligence 
aircraft that was flying over inter-
national waters. This is as violent and 
dangerous an overt provocation as any 
nation has aimed at the United States 
in, literally, years. 

This is not a time for partisanship, 
but, unfortunately, we are already see-
ing extreme voices on the far left that 
are so afflicted by the ‘‘Trump derange-
ment syndrome’’ that they repeat Ira-
nian talking points and advertise the 
absurd notion that our country, our ad-
ministration, our President are some-
how to blame for Tehran’s violent ag-

gression. Blame America first. By 2019, 
nobody should need a history lesson on 
Iran, but, apparently, some need a re-
fresher, because there should be no 
question about who is at fault. 

Iran has disregarded international 
law and violated the laws of armed con-
flict since the first days of the Islamic 
Republic. Its malign activities as the 
world’s most active state sponsor of 
terrorism include its crusade to de-
stroy Israel, including its sponsorship 
of countless terrorist attacks; the ma-
levolence throughout the Persian Gulf, 
including proxies in Yemen who have 
recently attacked civilian targets; pe-
rennial threats to close the Strait of 
Hormuz, a key international waterway 
that is essential to global commerce; 
and, of course, the longstanding asym-
metrical war it has waged against us 
that began with the infamous takeover 
of the U.S. Embassy in 1979 and the 50- 
plus hostages who were held captive for 
444 days; the provision of weapons, 
training, funding, and direction to ter-
rorist groups, including Hamas, 
Hezbollah, the Palestinian Islamic 
Jihad, the Taliban, and Shiite militias 
in Iraq, which are responsible for the 
murders of hundreds of U.S. service-
members from Lebanon to Iraq to Af-
ghanistan, and more attacks plotted on 
U.S. targets worldwide, including in 
our own homeland. 

The record is blindingly obvious. It is 
why so many of us opposed the Obama 
administration’s deal with Iran. Many 
of us understood that the agreement 
not only failed to properly address the 
nuclear threat but that it also com-
pletely ignored the other threats that 
Iran posed to international peace and 
stability. In fact, some prescient Mem-
bers of this body warned that the deal 
would amplify Iran’s dangerous behav-
ior. 

I remember back in 2015 when the 
current ranking member on the For-
eign Relations Committee insisted the 
Obama administration’s policy would 
invite the kind of mess we see today. 
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