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Number four, President Trump met 

with President Zelensky, and the U.S. 
assistance flowed to Ukraine in Sep-
tember 2019, without Ukraine inves-
tigating President Trump’s concern for 
corruption. 

Mr. Speaker, there is no objective 
evidence to undo the votes of 63 million 
Americans. 

Not only do the Democrats and their 
leadership ignore the facts in order to 
impeach President Trump, but they are 
also ignoring the American people by 
failing to get anything done. 

Republicans stand at the ready to 
pass USMCA, secure our border, and 
create a bipartisan plan to lower pre-
scription drug costs. Sadly, Democrats 
intend to deny the American people 
such progress. 

COMMEMORATING SERVICE DURING MILITARY 
WEEK 

Mr. MARSHALL. Mr. Speaker, in 
honor of Veterans Day, this week is 
Military Week for our office. This 
week, we will honor the sacrifices of 
those who have and are currently serv-
ing in America’s armed forces. 

This year, our office took part in the 
2019 Veteran History Project to give 
our Nation’s heroes a platform to tell 
their stories. This project will allow fu-
ture generations to hear directly from 
veterans to better understand their re-
alities, the personal sacrifices of war, 
and the importance of public service. 

For this project, our office inter-
viewed three constituents from the Big 
First District about their military 
service. All three gentlemen not only 
served their country overseas but re-
turned home to make lasting impacts 
on their communities and create a bet-
ter Kansas for all of us. 

Listening to these veterans’ stories 
of sacrifice and bravery is quite inspir-
ing. Thank you to each of these fine 
gentlemen for your service, for your 
families’ sacrifices, and for sharing 
your stories for future generations. 

FIGHTING NORTHWEST KANSAS WILDFIRES 
Mr. MARSHALL. Mr. Speaker, this 

past Saturday, a disaster declaration 
was issued for Cheyenne County in 
northwest Kansas after a series of 
grass fires broke out between St. 
Francis and Wheeler. 

Thanks to fast-acting volunteers and 
the National Guard, many homes, 
farms, and, most importantly, families 
were kept safe. Even pheasant hunters 
out on opening day pitched in to help 
fight the fires. 

Time and time again, rural Kansans 
rise to the occasion and the challenges 
to provide for their communities’ needs 
without a moment’s notice. That is 
what Kansans do. These are Kansas 
values. 

Thank you to all the first responders, 
the troops, and the citizen volunteers 
who bravely responded to put out these 
fires in Cheyenne County. Thank you 
for helping take care of your neighbors. 

b 1045 
HIGHLIGHTING IMPROVEMENTS TO VA 

HEALTHCARE SYSTEM 
Mr. MARSHALL. Mr. Speaker, in 

honor of Military Week in my office, I 

would like to take a moment to high-
light improvements made to our VA 
healthcare system by the VA MISSION 
Act. This week, our office partnered 
with Newman Regional Health Center 
in Emporia to host a community forum 
to share information about healthcare 
options available to veterans through 
the VA MISSION Act, which went into 
effect June 6. 

Since being implemented, the VA 
MISSION Act has benefited thousands 
of veterans in Kansas greatly, allowing 
them the option to get care at home. In 
rural Kansas, it can be costly and bur-
densome for many veterans to travel to 
a nearby VA facility which might be as 
many as 2 to 3 hours away. The MIS-
SION Act enables them to seek the 
care they want from a provider closer 
to home. 

We must continue to empower our 
veterans, providing them with the 
choice they need to receive the care 
they deserve, the care we promised 
them all. Thanks to Congress and the 
work of the Trump administration, we 
are taking steps to provide our vet-
erans the very best of care because 
they deserve nothing less. 

f 

AMERICANS WHO HAVE VOLUN-
TARILY SERVED AND SAC-
RIFICED DESERVE OUR DEEPEST 
GRATITUDE AND RECOGNITION 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Colorado (Mr. CROW) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. CROW. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
in support of the Global War on Ter-
rorism Memorial Location Act, which I 
am very proud to have introduced 
along with my friend and colleague 
from Wisconsin, Congressman MIKE 
GALLAGHER. 

The global war on terrorism changed 
the course of American history and the 
lives of millions of servicemembers, 
first responders, and civil servants—in-
cluding my own. 

On 9/11 and since, we have learned 
that we can never take our democracy 
or our country’s security for granted. 
It is a fight that, sadly, continues 
today. 

The millions of Americans who have 
voluntarily served and sacrificed for 
our Nation deserve our deepest grati-
tude, but they also deserve our recogni-
tion. 

Several generations of Americans 
have now come of age during the global 
war on terrorism. There are now Amer-
icans born after 9/11 who are serving 
today, overseas, in uniform in what has 
become our Nation’s longest conflict. 

That is one of the reasons why it is 
now time for us to recognize the sev-
eral generations of Americans who 
have volunteered to serve our Nation: 
those of us who have served and who 
have worked to help our fellow vet-
erans understand the important power 
of place, the transformational power of 
a sacred location where veterans and 
their families can come together to 
heal, to remember, and to reflect. 

Memorials like those for World War 
II, Korea, and Vietnam have provided 
the opportunities for those generations 
whose lives and service were defined by 
those conflicts, and it is now time for 
the current generation of veterans to 
have that same opportunity. It is our 
hope that, by honoring them in the Na-
tion’s Capital, we will ensure a loca-
tion befitting of their service and their 
sacrifice. 

Over 21⁄2 million Americans have 
served in uniform in the global war on 
terrorism, and millions more first re-
sponders, law enforcement, and civil 
servants have also supported global op-
erations. To date, over 7,000 Americans 
have given the ultimate sacrifice and 
over 53,000 have been wounded. Many 
more bear the invisible scars of the war 
that will be with them for the rest of 
their lives. 

If these feel like statistics to some, 
they are not to me and to many others. 
At a time when Congress feels more di-
vided than ever before, I hope that this 
Congress can focus on what we do have 
in common and what does bring us to-
gether so that we can move our coun-
try forward. 

We have a sacred duty to those who 
have selflessly served in our Nation’s 
longest war, and it is a charge that we 
do not take lightly. I urge my col-
leagues to join me in this effort by sup-
porting the bill. 

f 

RECESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess until noon 
today. 

Accordingly (at 10 o’clock and 49 
minutes a.m.), the House stood in re-
cess. 

f 

b 1200 

AFTER RECESS 

The recess having expired, the House 
was called to order by the Speaker pro 
tempore (Mr. CUELLAR) at noon. 

f 

PRAYER 

Mr. Dipesh Pandya, BAPS 
Swaminarayan Sanstha, Warrington, 
Pennsylvania, offered the following 
prayer: 

Aum. 
O, Lord, lead us from illusion to the 

truth. Lead us from darkness to light. 
Lead us from death to immortality. 

May everyone in the world be happy. 
May everyone be healthy. May all ex-
perience what is good. May there be no 
suffering. 

O, Lord, may the skies give us peace. 
May space bring us peace. May the 
Earth give us peace. May the waters 
give peace. May herbs and plants give 
us peace. May all the beings of the 
Earth bring us peace. May the deities 
bestow peace. May all of Your cre-
ations bring us peace. May peace pre-
vail throughout the universe. 
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As we are here to celebrate Diwali, 

the Hindu festival of lights, I invoke 
the credo of my spiritual leader, His 
Holiness Pramukh Swami Maharaj: ‘‘In 
the joy of others lies our own. In the 
progress of others rests our own. In the 
good of others abides our own.’’ 

O, Lord, may all the Members of this 
House and their staff receive Your 
guidance in their thoughts and actions. 
May our Armed Forces stay victorious, 
and may they be protected. 

May God bless the United States of 
America. 

f 

THE JOURNAL 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair has examined the Journal of the 
last day’s proceedings and announces 
to the House his approval thereof. 

Pursuant to clause 1, rule I, the Jour-
nal stands approved. 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, pursuant to clause 1, rule 
I, I demand a vote on agreeing to the 
Speaker’s approval of the Journal. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
question is on the Speaker’s approval 
of the Journal. 

The question was taken; and the 
Speaker pro tempore announced that 
the ayes appeared to have it. 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I object to the vote on the 
ground that a quorum is not present 
and make the point of order that a 
quorum is not present. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 8, rule XX, further pro-
ceedings on this question will be post-
poned. 

The point of no quorum is considered 
withdrawn. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Will the 
gentleman from Kentucky (Mr. COMER) 
come forward and lead the House in the 
Pledge of Allegiance. 

Mr. COMER led the Pledge of Alle-
giance as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-
lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 

f 

WELCOMING MR. DIPESH PANDYA 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Without 
objection, the gentleman from Penn-
sylvania (Mr. FITZPATRICK) is recog-
nized for 1 minute. 

There was no objection. 
Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, I 

rise today to recognize our guest chap-
lain for today, Dipesh Pandya, along 
with members of the BAPS mandirs in 
our district in Pennsylvania. 

They are here with hundreds of 
prominent Indian Americans who are 
also members of the BAPS organiza-
tion, a Hindu faith that holds services 
in 32 States across 91 congressional dis-
tricts. 

They are here with us today to cele-
brate Diwali, the festival of lights, a 

festival celebrated by over 2 million In-
dian Americans across the United 
States. This 5-day celebration signifies 
the triumph of light over darkness, 
knowledge over ignorance, and hope 
over despair. 

Diwali reminds us that there is joy in 
serving God, serving our country, serv-
ing our community, and our fellow citi-
zens, particularly during times of ca-
lamity and despair. Traditionally, rows 
of divas, or candles, were used to illu-
minate and dispel darkness. 

Today we are reminded that we must 
work together, united and in friend-
ship, to serve this great Nation and the 
communities in which we live. 

Indeed, the BAPS community 
throughout the United States continu-
ously strives to serve society through 
various charitable and humanitarian 
activities, ranging from food drives to 
disaster relief efforts, including the 
planting of trees. 

On behalf of my fellow Members of 
Congress, I am proud to recognize and 
welcome the BAPS members who have 
traveled here to Washington from 
across the country. 

f 

ANNOUNCEMENT BY THE SPEAKER 
PRO TEMPORE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair will entertain up to 15 further re-
quests for 1-minute speeches on each 
side of the aisle. 

f 

SUPPORTING THE FARM 
WORKFORCE MODERNIZATION ACT 

(Mr. DELGADO asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. DELGADO. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today on behalf of the nearly 5,000 
farmers in my district, 96 percent of 
which are family-owned farms. 

Every time I am home, I meet with 
farmers about the major challenges 
they face today. The need to modernize 
and make more effective our H2A visa 
program is consistently flagged. 

That is why I am proud to support 
the bipartisan Farm Workforce Mod-
ernization Act, a historic bill that both 
simplifies and broadens the scope of 
the H2A application process. In addi-
tion to ensuring critical protections for 
work, the bill will finally allow dairy 
and other farm operations to access the 
H2A farm worker program, a critical 
priority for farmers in New York-19. 

Mr. Speaker, on behalf of upstate 
produce and vegetable growers, dairy 
operators, and all farmers in my dis-
trict, I applaud the bipartisan work of 
my colleagues in negotiating this im-
portant agreement. Now let’s come to-
gether and get this done. 

f 

IMPEACHMENT HOAX 

(Mr. WILSON of South Carolina 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. WILSON of South Carolina. Mr. 
Speaker, after over a month of secret 
investigations against the President, 
Democrats have now decided to open 
these controlled hearings to the public. 

This continued deception by Demo-
crats to mislead the American people 
is insulting. No Republican witnesses, 
no counsel of the President to partici-
pate, and full exoneration by the cou-
rageous President Zelensky of Ukraine. 

It is said that, instead of focusing on 
funding our military through the Na-
tional Defense Authorization Act or 
passing the United-States-Mexico-Can-
ada Agreement to create jobs, which 
improves our schools, like Lexington 
District 1, Democrats continue. 

They have wasted $30 million of tax-
payer money on the Russian hoax and 
are now proceeding with the Ukrainian 
hoax. This partisan witch hunt diverts 
attention from the President’s suc-
cesses. 

The unemployment rate is at a 
record low; there is record job creation; 
and the stock market is thriving, 
showing President Trump keeps his 
promises. 

In conclusion, God bless our troops, 
and we will never forget September the 
11th in the global war on terrorism. 

Thank you, President Lech Walesa of 
Poland, a world hero, for testifying 
yesterday for freedom. 

f 

LOWER DRUG PRICES NOW 
(Mr. CRIST asked and was given per-

mission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. CRIST. Mr. Speaker, I rise in 
support of lower drug prices, because 
Americans are getting squeezed while 
drug companies are raking in the cash. 

One of my constituents, Mike 
McKenny, runs a minority-owned, 
small business in St. Petersburg. He 
works hard for a living, making pay-
roll, serving his customers. 

When Mike’s daughter Taylor was di-
agnosed with diabetes, he had to pull 
thousands out of the family’s 401(k) 
and do, in his words, ‘‘other creative 
things’’ to make ends meet when the 
insurance coverage ran out. At the 
toughest point, he paid $120 for a 3-day 
supply of the insulin to keep his daugh-
ter alive. 

Mr. Speaker, $120 for 3 days. That is 
immoral. 

Under the Elijah Cummings Lower 
Drug Costs Now Act, nearly 600,000 of 
my constituents will pay less for drugs, 
some dramatically so. 

End the drug company abuse. Lower 
drug prices now. 

f 

SALUTING MILITARY FAMILIES 
(Mr. WILLIAMS asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. WILLIAMS. Mr. Speaker, it is 
my greatest privilege to represent our 
military servicemembers and their 
families in the 25th District of Texas, 
and I am humbled to be their voice in 
Washington. 
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