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During the month of November, we 

honor the dedication, the commitment, 
and daily sacrifices of 2.6 million mili-
tary family members in the United 
States. These men and women may not 
take an oath to defend our liberty, but 
they are the forces behind our 
frontlines. They are the faces of cour-
age and the steadfast models of resolve 
right here at home. 

Their contributions to our national 
security are indisputable, and because 
of them, America continues to shine as 
a beacon of hope throughout this 
world. 

I salute all our military families in 
the 25th District and across our Nation 
and thank them for the sacrifices they 
have made. 

May God bless all these families. May 
God continue to bless the United 
States of America. Most importantly, 
in God we trust. 

f 

WE ARE BETTER THAN THIS 
(Ms. DEAN asked and was given per-

mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. DEAN. Mr. Speaker, this week 
the Supreme Court heard oral argu-
ments surrounding DACA. Now 800,000 
lives hang in the balance. 

Mr. Speaker, 800,000 is a big number, 
and in the face of abstract figures it is 
easy to lose touch with the human re-
ality. 

So let’s think of, maybe, just one 
person, one young woman who has 
lived virtually her entire life in this 
country; whose friends, family, and 
community are here; who attends 
school and plays on the soccer team 
and volunteers at a food bank; who 
speaks English and no other language. 

Which one of us would take that 
child to the border and send her across 
alone? 

Which one of us would banish her to 
a place she has never been? 

Which one of us would force her to 
build a life and a language she does not 
even know? 

Which one of us could abandon that 
child with a clear conscience? 

I suspect the answer is very few of us. 
And, if that is right, if in our hearts we 
would not permit us to behave with 
such coldness and cruelty, then we can-
not allow our government to do so ei-
ther. 

As our dear colleague Mr. Cummings 
said, we are better than this. 

f 

CELEBRATING NATIONAL 
APPRENTICESHIP WEEK 

(Mr. COMER asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. COMER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to celebrate National Appren-
ticeship Week. 

I am proud the Trump administra-
tion has, once again, placed an empha-
sis on these crucial skills development 
and employee advancement programs. 

The Department of Labor has contin-
ually recognized the importance of ap-
prenticeships to the future of work in 
our Nation and, for the fifth year in a 
row, dedicated a week to highlighting 
the need for expanded access to these 
educational and career opportunities. 

It is essential we increase awareness 
of the benefits of these crucial pro-
grams which link our education system 
with our workforce development initia-
tives. 

As I travel throughout Kentucky’s 
First Congressional District, I hear 
from employers of all sizes and indus-
tries that say they are unsatisfied with 
recent graduates’ credentials and they 
are lacking workers with the skills 
necessary to perform the duties of 
their job. 

As a new member to the Committee 
on Education and Labor this Congress, 
I am proud of the bipartisan pieces of 
legislation we have advanced and look 
forward to future opportunities to sup-
port employers, provide skills develop-
ment for those already employed, and 
enhance the jobs and generations of the 
future. 
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BRING DOWN PRESCRIPTION DRUG 
PRICES 

(Mr. LIPINSKI asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. LIPINSKI. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today with a call to action to bring 
down prescription drug prices. 

Some say a drug company should be 
able to charge any price because that is 
just how the market works. But the 
market for many prescription drugs is 
broken. 

As a diabetic, I know how the price of 
insulin has skyrocketed for no good 
reason. Medicare spent 31⁄2 times more 
on insulin per patient in 2016 than in 
2007. 

Many Americans depend on other 
drugs to survive: EpiPens for life- 
threatening allergies, emergency inhal-
ers for asthma, chemotherapy drugs for 
cancer. Patients relying on life-sus-
taining drugs can’t simply vote with 
their wallet to fight back against price 
gougers. 

That is why I introduced H.R. 5039, to 
give Medicare the tools it needs to 
bring down the price of life-sustaining 
drugs, similar to other developed coun-
tries. 

American families deserve better 
than the Big Pharma status quo. Let’s 
pass H.R. 5039 and give that to them. 

f 

CALLING FOR CAUTION ON 
IMPEACHMENT 

(Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today to highlight 

the unfortunate position this institu-
tion has been placed in over the past 
several weeks. Long before Speaker 
PELOSI launched this impeachment in-
quiry, many of my colleagues had al-
ready made it clear that their number 
one priority was impeaching the Presi-
dent. 

Congress should rightfully use its 
oversight powers to ensure laws are ex-
ecuted faithfully, but this exercise has 
shown itself to be the ultimate manip-
ulation of the legislative branch’s over-
sight to achieve political gains. 

I caution my colleagues from placing 
political expediency ahead of modera-
tion. A vote for impeachment will for-
ever change this institution. Imagine a 
future where this body utilizes the 
most severe of its constitutional tools 
to continually put the minority party 
on trial. 

Mr. Speaker, the American people 
have elected their representatives to be 
their voice and vote on matters most 
important to this country. We must 
collectively focus on these issues, not 
the political impulses of a few. 

For the sake of this institution, and 
for the good of the Nation, this cannot 
become the new normal. 

f 

THANKING VETERANS FOR 
SERVICE 

(Ms. PLASKETT asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. PLASKETT. Mr. Speaker, I re-
cently spent time visiting schools 
throughout the Virgin Islands. 

While it is always exciting to spend 
time with our young people, it was sad 
to see that the school libraries across 
the territory are in dire need of books 
and librarians to provide students and 
teachers with educational resources, 
including territory-specific material 
that will enlighten our young people 
about their rich heritage. We all have 
to do better. 

My office also hosted two townhalls 
with officials from the VA and the U.S. 
Postal Service to discuss issues facing 
our veterans and the community at 
large. Within the next few months, it is 
my hope that both the Postal Service 
and the VA will make measurable 
progress. 

I thank members of my community 
for coming out, particularly our vet-
erans, because, on Monday, we com-
memorated Veterans Day, paying trib-
ute to men and women who have served 
in the U.S. Armed Forces. 

Elmer Davis once said it ‘‘will re-
main the land of the free only for so 
long as it is the home of the brave.’’ 

I am proud that the Virgin Islands 
has one of the highest rates of military 
service in our country, including my 
father. 

I thank every veteran across the Na-
tion for your service to America and to 
freedom. 
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