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was inducted into the San Diego Wom-
en’s Hall of Fame for her work in co-
founding the United Domestic Workers 
of America. 

With her passing, the State of Cali-
fornia and our Nation suffered a tre-
mendous loss. She will be remembered 
for her ‘‘si, se puede’’ attitude and for 
exemplifying the meaning of her Swa-
hili given name, Fahari, which means 
magnificent, and magnificent she was. 

f 

SUPPORT BIPARTISAN PATH FOR 
USMCA 

(Ms. KENDRA S. HORN of Oklahoma 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend her remarks.) 

Ms. KENDRA S. HORN of Oklahoma. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today in support of 
the continued effort by the U.S. Trade 
Representative and the Democratic 
working group to finalize the United 
States-Mexico-Canada Agreement, the 
USMCA. 

Oklahoma workers, families, busi-
nesses, and our Nation benefit from 
free and fair international trade. Every 
day, Oklahomans create and export 
world-class products, and two of our 
largest trading partners are our neigh-
bors to the north and the south. 

In 2018 alone, Oklahoma exported a 
total of $5.6 billion in manufactured 
goods. Nearly half of those went to 
Mexico and Canada. In the same year, 
Oklahoma agriculture exports to Mex-
ico and Canada totaled $154 million. 

A stronger trading relationship with 
Mexico and Canada means a stronger 
economy for Oklahoma. It is impera-
tive that Congress finish negotiating 
and pass a strong trade agreement to 
restore certainty in our trading rela-
tionship with Canada and Mexico and 
support millions of American jobs in 
the process. 

Though finding common ground is 
not easy, it is critical, and I support 
the USTR and lawmakers’ work to find 
a bipartisan path forward for this im-
portant trade agreement. 

f 

HONORING TRACY SINGLE ON 
TRANSGENDER DAY OF REMEM-
BRANCE 
(Mrs. FLETCHER asked and was 

given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Mrs. FLETCHER. Mr. Speaker, 
today, on Transgender Remembrance 
Day, I rise to remember Tracy Single, 
who was killed in July of this year in 
my district, the 15th transgender 
woman of color murdered this year. 

A music lover with an eye for fashion 
and an ear for music, 22-year-old Tracy 
moved to Houston to pursue her dream 
of becoming a rapper. Tension around 
her gender identity forced her out of 
her home, and she experienced a very 
hard time, but she was persistent and 
upbeat, always working to achieve her 
goals. 

Her life reminds us that creative and 
vibrant people can thrive even in the 

most difficult circumstances. And her 
death reminds us that transgender peo-
ple are under attack and must have 
equal protection under the law. 

f 

HONORING TOM VASQUEZ 

(Mr. GARCÍA of Illinois asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute and to revise and 
extend his remarks.) 

Mr. GARCÍA of Illinois. Mr. Speaker, 
today, I rise to honor the memory of 
my dear friend Tom Vasquez, who 
passed away on July 23. Tom was one of 
the founders of our progressive move-
ment in Chicago, and we were partners 
in many battles. 

He was born in Matamoros, Mexico, 
and eventually found his way to Chi-
cago, settling in the working-class 
community of Little Village. In the 
early 1980s, Tom was part of a group of 
young people who saw the disparities 
and lack of political representation in 
our community and sought to address 
these inequalities. 

He stepped up, led the change, and 
helped create the Independent Political 
Organization of the 22nd Ward. He was 
a precinct captain for many years. He 
organized block clubs and he was in-
volved in schools in the local commu-
nity. On election day, he was always 
getting people to the polling places. He 
attended many community meetings 
and mentored many young people in 
the community. He did this all while 
holding a full-time job with the Chi-
cago Transit Authority and being a 
member of a local union. 

Tom’s passing has left a gap not only 
for his family but for the entire com-
munity that benefited from his service 
and commitment to justice. 

Tom, may you rest in peace. 

f 

NATIONAL BIBLE WEEK 

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr. 
GREEN of Texas). Under the Speaker’s 
announced policy of January 3, 2019, 
the gentleman from Colorado (Mr. 
LAMBORN) is recognized for 60 minutes 
as the designee of the minority leader. 

GENERAL LEAVE 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I ask 
unanimous consent that all Members 
may have 5 legislative days in which to 
revise and extend their remarks and in-
clude extraneous materials on the 
topic of my Special Order. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there 
objection to the request of the gen-
tleman from Colorado? 

There was no objection. 
Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, it is a 

great honor for me to come to the 
House floor tonight to commemorate 
National Bible Week. This is an oppor-
tunity to celebrate the tremendous in-
fluence of the Bible on the freedoms we 
enjoy today in America. 

We are truly blessed to live in a na-
tion where we are free to worship and 
read the Holy Scriptures without fear 
of persecution. There are many places 

throughout the world where such free-
doms do not exist. 

Americans have the right under our 
wonderful system of government to re-
spect and study the Bible or any other 
system of belief that they so choose or 
even none at all. That is the beauty of 
the American way, and I believe it goes 
all the way back to the Bible. 

In 1941, President Franklin Delano 
Roosevelt declared the week of 
Thanksgiving to be National Bible 
Week. The National Bible Association 
and the U.S. Conference of Bishops 
have designated the specific days of 
November 18 to 24 as National Bible 
Week this year. This is the week set 
aside to recognize the Bible as a 
foundational building block of Western 
civilization, the Judeo-Christian herit-
age, and the legacy that motivated and 
shaped the founding of the United 
States. 

In this hour, we will hear from Mem-
bers of Congress from all throughout 
the United States from various faith 
traditions and denominations speak 
about what the Bible means to them. 
We are here, in keeping with tradition, 
to recognize National Bible Week. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentle-
woman from Washington (Mrs. ROD-
GERS), who is a good friend and col-
league. 

Mrs. RODGERS of Washington. Mr. 
Speaker, I want to say thank you to 
the gentleman from Colorado for bring-
ing us all together tonight for National 
Bible Week. 

Over the weekend, I finished reading 
through the Bible in a year, and I can 
testify that it has been the best year of 
my life in giving me perspective and 
quiet confidence for every day, remind-
ing me to lead with love. 

The Bible says to love your enemies 
and pray for those who persecute you. 
The Word of God is the source of love, 
joy, peace, patience, kindness, good-
ness, and self-control. Everything that 
we long for in life is found in the Word 
of God, the Bible. 

So why haven’t I been more faithful 
to read the Bible every day earlier in 
my life? Because, like a lot of people, I 
didn’t always feel like I had enough 
time, or I struggled to relate to the 
language. 

Why read the Bible? Why wake up 15 
minutes early each day? Why go to all 
that trouble? That was my struggle for 
many, many years. 

The Bible says in Psalm 90:12: ‘‘Teach 
us to number our days, that we may 
gain a heart of wisdom.’’ 

Psalm 103 says that ‘‘our days are few 
and brief, like grass, like flowers, 
blown by the wind and gone forever,’’ 
yet the Word of God endures forever. 

It is the Bible that provides us an-
swers to our questions about life more 
than any other book, seminar, or self- 
help program. 

The Bible also offers words of encour-
agement and hope at a time when de-
spair has come over our country. We 
have record suicides. A million people 
in America attempted suicide last 
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year, and 47,000 committed suicide. I 
grieve this loss. 

The deaths of despair are sky-
rocketing: suicide, drug overdoses, 
opioids, alcohol, and drug abuse. Peo-
ple are giving up on life. 

The Bible says in Matthew that not a 
single sparrow can fall to the ground 
without your Father knowing it. And 
the very hairs on your head are num-
bered, so don’t be afraid, you are more 
valuable to God. 

We need the truth and the wisdom of 
the Bible. As Proverbs 12:18 says: 
‘‘Careless words stab like a sword, but 
wise words bring healing.’’ 

As I begin a second year of taking 15 
minutes a day to read the Bible and 
then pray, I would invite each one of 
you to join me. Let’s do it together. 
Let’s agree that it cannot be business 
as usual. Let’s see what God could do 
on Capitol Hill through Members and 
staff who daily walk the Halls of Con-
gress—Democrats and Republicans, 
House and Senate, men and women—if 
we all read through the Bible in 2020. 

I am convinced the Democrats can’t 
fix it. The Republicans can’t fix it. 
Only God can fix it. 

My daily prayer is 2 Chronicles 7:14: 
‘‘If my people, who are called by my 
name, will humble themselves and pray 
and seek my face and turn from their 
wicked ways, then I will hear from 
Heaven, and I will forgive their sin and 
will heal their land.’’ 

Lord God, heal our land. May You 
bring order out of chaos. Lift the heav-
iness of misery and despair and busy-
ness. Remind us that You are with us 
in everything we do. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentlewoman for her words of wis-
dom, her personal experience, and for 
being here tonight. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Texas (Mr. BABIN). 

Mr. BABIN. Mr. Speaker, I thank my 
dear colleague for having this. 

Since Franklin D. Roosevelt in 1941, 
every U.S. President has declared the 
week of Thanksgiving to be National 
Bible Week. Next week, we will, once 
again, celebrate this beloved book, 
which continues to mold the lives of 
millions and even billions around the 
world. 

It is fitting that we take time today 
to bring attention to the very book 
that was so influential in the founding 
of our Nation. The Holy Bible was per-
haps the most accessible book to our 
Founding Fathers. Its principles gave 
them invaluable insights into human 
nature, civic virtue, political author-
ity, and the rights of citizens. 

Personally, I consider it a huge and 
great privilege to speak on the House 
floor today about a book that has had 
such a profound influence on my life 
and on the life of our country, and it 
continues to do so daily. 

As a believer in Christ, the Bible has 
shaped the way that I have lived my 
life, whether conducting my business 
as a dentist in Woodville, Texas, rais-
ing my family, or serving the good peo-

ple of the 36th District of Texas right 
here in the House of Representatives. 

I believe that the Bible is more than 
a book of inspiration and comfort or a 
compilation of moral teachings. I be-
lieve that it really is the Holy Word of 
God that contains the truth and teach-
ings of His love for us and His plan for 
redemption through faith in Jesus 
Christ, His Son. 

In history’s greatest love story, the 
Bible tells us that God sacrificed His 
Son to redeem us from depravity. In 
John 3:16, we read: ‘‘For God so loved 
the world, He gave His only begotten 
Son that whosoever believeth in Him 
should not perish but have everlasting 
life.’’ 

Centuries before, in one of my favor-
ite passages, the Book of Job proph-
esied of Christ the Redeemer who is to 
come: 
For I know that my Redeemer lives, 
And He shall stand at last on the Earth; 
And after my skin is destroyed, this I know, 
That in my flesh I shall see God, 
Whom I shall see for myself, and my eyes 

shall behold, and not another. 
How my heart yearns within me. 

Whenever I read these words, I am re-
minded of my Lord’s steadfast love for 
me and His promise to always be with 
and guide me through every chapter of 
my life. 

b 1800 

As we approach the 78th National 
Bible Week, I want to encourage my 
fellow Americans out there to take a 
moment to open the Bible and to read 
these profound words. No matter if it 
has been a while since you have read 
the Bible or you read it every single 
day, may each of us spend time remind-
ing ourselves of the Word of God, espe-
cially during this season of thanks. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman from Texas for sharing 
his heart with us tonight. 

Throughout American history, many 
of our great leaders have turned to the 
Bible for guidance, faith, and hope. 

President Abraham Lincoln once said 
of the Bible: ‘‘I have but to say, it is 
the best gift God has given to man. All 
the good the Savior gave to the world 
was communicated through this book. 
But for it we could not know right 
from wrong. All things most desirable 
for man’s welfare, here and hereafter, 
are to be found portrayed in it.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Pennsylvania (Mr. THOMPSON), as 
we go across the country and hear from 
folks all over this great country of 
ours. 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I thank my brother in the 
Lord from Colorado for hosting this 
Special Order tonight, during a special 
week where we commemorate the Holy 
Word, the Bible. 

Mr. Speaker, since 1941, every Presi-
dent since Franklin Delano Roosevelt 
has declared the week of Thanksgiving 
as National Bible Week. 

It is fitting that we celebrate this 
week along with the national day of 

Thanksgiving. Both the Bible and this 
annual holiday provide us with the 
time to reflect on what is most impor-
tant in our lives: our faith, our creator, 
our family, and our love for one an-
other. 

Mr. Speaker, part of my family lin-
eage can be traced back to those Pil-
grims who set out for the New World in 
search of religious freedom. They en-
dured both hardship and sacrifice at a 
heavy cost to be able to freely worship 
without persecution. 

Forty-five of the 102 Mayflower pas-
sengers died in the winter of 1620 to 
1621, and the Mayflower colonists suf-
fered greatly during their first winter 
in the New World from lack of shelter, 
scurvy, and general conditions of hard-
ship. They brought with them, though, 
their faith and several Bibles. 

The event that Americans commonly 
call the First Thanksgiving was cele-
brated by the Pilgrims after their first 
harvest in the New World in October of 
1621. This feast lasted 3 days, and, as 
accounted by attendee Edward Wins-
low, it was attended by 90 Native 
Americans and 53 Pilgrims. 

Thanks to William Bradford’s jour-
nal, we have knowledge of how these 
Pilgrims gave thanks. The question re-
mains as to whom and why did they do 
this. 

As people of faith, I would like to be-
lieve they were acting out the lessons 
of the Bible, such as that found in 
Psalm 107. This Scripture states the 
theme of God’s loyal love and redemp-
tion. It is written for at the time of 
Israel in exile. 

Wandering and overwhelmed by cir-
cumstances, I could see why these 
early Pilgrims could find solace in this 
Scripture. They also found themselves 
wandering and enduring hardship. 

The Bible illustrated the power of 
giving thanks to the Lord, the impor-
tance of assuming thankfulness as a 
human attitude. 

These words indicate not just a 
knowledge of, but also a recognition 
and a relationship through, the Word of 
God that the Bible offers. 

I don’t know if the Pilgrims ref-
erenced this Scripture in preparing or 
dealing with the hardships that they 
endured. I do know that the Bible and 
the Word within it was important to 
these travelers and early settlers. 

The Bible has had a tremendous in-
fluence in my life and the lives of mil-
lions of Americans. The Scriptures in-
side serve as a guide for us in both 
times of trouble and in times of tri-
umph. And, for that reason, it remains 
the best-selling book of all time. 

During this week, I am thankful for 
the strong community of faith that I 
have come to know through weekly 
Bible studies and prayer service here in 
the United States Capitol and, cer-
tainly, back in my district and my 
home community. It is a time where 
we put aside differences and come to-
gether to share the love and the Gospel 
of Jesus Christ. 

The words of the Bible unite people, 
nations, and even politicians as we 
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come together to celebrate faith, fel-
lowship, and prayer. 

As I prepare to close, let me share 
these thoughts. 

God chose Israel; America chose God; 
and God’s first love is Israel. Let’s 
make America God’s lasting love. 

Mr. Speaker, let us also celebrate the 
First Amendment, which affirms our 
right to choose and exercise faith with-
out government coercion or retalia-
tion. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman from Pennsylvania for 
his words, and I thank him for remind-
ing us about the Pilgrim tradition, es-
pecially as we enter this week of 
Thanksgiving. 

It is interesting, in American his-
tory, we have two different strains of 
life going on in this country: We had 
people starting in Jamestown looking 
for gold, looking to make money, put-
ting up with slavery; but we had people 
in Massachusetts who wanted to just 
have religious freedom, and they had a 
whole different view of the world and of 
God and the Bible. They were the start 
of the abolitionist movement. So I am 
glad that Mr. THOMPSON brought us the 
Pilgrim tradition tonight. 

Ronald Reagan, when he designated 
National Bible Week, said, when he was 
in office: ‘‘When I took the oath of of-
fice, I requested the Bible be opened to 
II Chronicles 7:14.’’ 

CATHY MCMORRIS RODGERS men-
tioned this earlier. It reads: ‘‘If my 
people, which are called by my name, 
shall humble themselves, and pray, and 
seek my face, and turn from their 
wicked ways, then I will hear from 
Heaven, and will forgive their sin, and 
will heal their land.’’ 

This passage expresses my personal 
hopes for the future of this Nation and 
the world. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Kansas (Mr. ESTES). 

Mr. ESTES. Mr. Speaker, I thank my 
friend and fellow colleague from Colo-
rado, Representative LAMBORN, for 
hosting this Special Order tonight as 
we honor National Bible Week. 

Every President since Franklin Dela-
no Roosevelt inaugurated the first one 
in 1941, every President has since de-
clared the week of Thanksgiving as Na-
tional Bible Week. It follows a long 
history, stretching back to the found-
ing of our country, of our leaders turn-
ing to their faith and the Bible as guid-
ance for our Nation. 

This is just as important now as it 
was at our country’s founding and in 
the midst of terrible world wars. 

This week, I am reminded of a pas-
sage in Luke 17, verses 5 through 6: 
‘‘The apostles said to the Lord, ‘In-
crease our faith.’ The Lord replied, ‘If 
you have the faith the size of a mus-
tard seed, you would say to this mul-
berry tree, ‘‘Be uprooted and planted in 
the sea,’’ and it would obey you.’’’ 

And also in Luke 17, verse 10, ‘‘So it 
should be with you. When you have 
done all you have been commanded, 
say, ‘We are unworthy servants; we 
have only done our duty.’’’ 

In this passage, Jesus’ apostles plead 
for more faith to make it easier for 
them to sacrifice and to do all that 
they have been asked to do. But Jesus 
answers them by pointing out that, if 
they had only the tiniest bit of faith— 
that, the size of a mustard seed—no 
task would be too difficult. This in-
cluded even the apostles’ seemingly 
impossible task to ‘‘go out and make 
disciples of all nations.’’ 

But instead of increasing the meas-
ure of their faith, Jesus tells his apos-
tles to humble themselves and be 
steadfast in accomplishing all that was 
asked of them. 

As public servants and representa-
tives, I believe we, too, are called to 
humble ourselves and to be unwavering 
in serving our fellow Americans. The 
American people have put their trust 
in us to preserve our democracy, pro-
tect our God-given rights, defend our 
country, and champion the American 
Dream. This is not an easy task. But, 
as Jesus pointed out, anything is pos-
sible if we humble ourselves, do our 
job, and have faith. 

I know for me, personally, I rely on 
teachings like this one in the Bible to 
better serve my fellow Kansans and our 
country. 

I am also thankful to live in a coun-
try where we are free to practice our 
faith, as well as to all the Americans 
who have served to protect this free-
dom. 

As we approach National Bible Week, 
I hope my colleagues and all Ameri-
cans, regardless of their faith back-
ground, take some time to reflect on 
their own calling to serve, as well as 
the gift of religious liberty. 

Like the Bible, public service and re-
ligious liberty are cornerstones of our 
country, and I am honored to recognize 
those here tonight and throughout Na-
tional Bible Week. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman from Kansas, in the Na-
tion’s heartland, for sharing his 
thoughts with us tonight. I am going to 
share my own story. 

When I was a freshman at the Univer-
sity of Kansas—also there in America’s 
heartland—in the 1970s, someone ap-
proached me and asked me if I knew 
what the Bible was about. I said: Yeah, 
sure I know what is in it.’’ 

But do you know what? I said that 
without ever having read any of it for 
myself. Kind of presumptuous on my 
part. 

Mr. Speaker, I wonder if there are 
any people listening in here to us today 
who are in the same position. Maybe 
they think they know what it is about, 
but they have never looked at it for 
themselves. 

The only honest thing I could do at 
that point was to read for myself. So I 
read the Gospel of John, and as I read 
it, I discovered that I didn’t know what 
was in there at all. It was totally dif-
ferent than what I had expected. 

And I found a man in there who said: 
‘‘I am the way, the truth, and the life. 
No one comes to the Father but 

through me.’’ So I ended up discovering 
for myself a relationship with Jesus 
Christ, who became my Lord and Sav-
ior. 

Mr. Speaker, that is what I know 
from personal experience. It is better 
to read the Bible for oneself and not 
just take someone else’s word for it. 
For me, it made all the difference in 
the world. My life has been totally dif-
ferent as a result. 

As David said in Psalms: ‘‘The un-
folding of your words gives light; it 
gives understanding to the simple’’— 
Psalm 119:130. 

So, as we celebrate National Bible 
Week, we remember the importance of 
faith in both our private and our public 
lives. We recognize the Bible’s powerful 
message of hope. We cherish the wis-
dom of the Bible, and we thank God for 
providing this holy book that has truly 
been, in the words of Scripture, a lamp 
unto our feet and a light unto our path. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Iowa (Mr. KING), another person 
from the heartland of America. 

Mr. KING of Iowa. Mr. Speaker, I 
thank the gentleman from Colorado for 
yielding to me and for leading here on 
this National Bible Week. 

I would like to start out with just a 
touch of levity, because we are called 
to address the Speaker, and I know 
that the Speaker happens to also be a 
man of God and a Bible scholar. 

In addressing the Speaker, I enjoy re-
visiting Ecclesiastes 10:2, which says: 
‘‘A wise man’s heart is at his right, but 
a fool’s heart at his left.’’ 

I couldn’t resist that, and I pray that 
you forgive me, Mr. Speaker, for that 
bit of levity at this time. 

I would move on to my favorite 
verse, which is Ecclesiastes 9:10: 
‘‘Whatsoever thy hand findeth to do, do 
it with thy might.’’ 

It calls us not to just wander through 
this life and touch things gently and 
kind of let the flow of life go by, but we 
are given gifts by God. He fills us with 
skill sets that we haven’t yet devel-
oped, whether it is intellectual, wheth-
er it is physical, but skill sets of the 
heart, and to put our vigor to those 
things that please Him. 

So with that verse in mind each 
morning, I pray that God will loan me 
the measure of his wisdom, that He 
would have me use this day to go forth 
and glorify Him. And if there is time 
for a little extra blessing, let me do so 
with joy. That sustains me through 
every day. 

Another verse that sustains me 
through these future days came to me 
this morning at our gathering. This is 
the first chapter of Jeremiah, verse 17, 
that says: ‘‘Meet them undaunted, and 
they shall have no power to daunt 
thee.’’ 

That says, in my vernacular, never 
let them see you sweat, but go forth 
with courage and with confidence. Do 
those things that God calls you to do, 
and do so with your might. 

I also look back on a verse in James 
that has caught my eye for some time, 
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and it calls us, I think, in the right 
way, Mr. Speaker: ‘‘Count it all joy, 
my brothers, when you meet trials of 
various kinds, for you know that the 
testing of your faith produces stead-
fastness. And let steadfastness have its 
full effect, that you may be perfect and 
complete, lacking in nothing.’’ 

That fits with a prayer that I offered 
for years when we went through the 
farm crisis years of the 1980s. Things 
were falling down around us. The econ-
omy had essentially collapsed, and my 
neighbor’s farms were being sold week-
end after weekend in farm sales. 

I was being tested in a similar way 
myself. Each day, I would pray that 
God would be finished testing me and 
start to use me. 

b 1815 

And we should take joy in that test 
before we are made perfect in the tests 
that He provides for us. I know they 
are in the Book of James, which is one 
that has stood out for me for a long 
time, and that is: If you fail to do what 
you know is right, then you have 
sinned. 

And I recall an issue that was going 
on in the Iowa State legislature. I was 
here in Congress, but I needed a bill in-
troduced and moved in the State legis-
lature. There were those who knew it 
was the right thing to do, but they 
didn’t have the courage to introduce it 
because leadership was pushing against 
them, and it was going to be a big po-
litical fight. 

But I found a young man who is my 
State representative today, and when I 
raised the issue with him, he said: I 
will do this. And I said: You understand 
the burden of this and the potential 
consequences if you step forward in 
this arena? 

And he looked at me and he said: If I 
don’t introduce this bill, I will not be 
able to receive final absolution. 

Whoa, that told me something about 
the man and the character and the 
faith of this man. I don’t know if this 
verse in James was something that had 
been branded on his heart. The mean-
ing of it was—the words, I don’t know— 
but he had to be thinking, if he failed 
to do what he knew was right, then he 
would have sinned. 

But he stepped forward and did what 
he knew was right. And I appreciate 
Mr. LAMBORN, the gentleman from Col-
orado, speaking today about Western 
civilization and about the foundation 
of Western civilization. It is every-
where where the footprint of Judeo- 
Christianity laid the foundation, this 
Western civilization. The values in it 
are rooted in the Old and the New Tes-
tament. 

America would not and could not be 
the great Nation it is today if we were 
not a nation that was rooted in Bib-
lical values. And I think that is some-
thing indisputable. 

Mr. Speaker, I want to bring some-
thing to the attention of this Congress 
and people across this country that not 
a lot of people know. And this was in 

Jamestown in 1607. When they landed 
at Jamestown, the first thing that the 
settlers did as they arrived there, they 
erected a cross. They knelt. They took 
Communion, and they prayed. 

The prayer is so profound, Mr. Speak-
er, that it should be hanging on the 
walls or somewhere around this Con-
gress, and I don’t know that it is. But 
here is their prayer, 1607, in this New 
World: 

‘‘We do hereby dedicate this land, 
and ourselves, to reach the people 
within these shores with the Gospel of 
Jesus Christ, and to raise up godly gen-
erations after us, and with these gen-
erations take the Kingdom of God to 
all the Earth. May this Covenant of 
Dedication remain to all generations, 
as long as this Earth remains, and may 
this land, along with England, be Evan-
gelist to the world. May all who see 
this cross remember what we have done 
here, and may those who come here to 
inhabit join us in this covenant and in 
this most noble work that the Holy 
Scriptures may be fulfilled.’’ 

If that doesn’t speak to the American 
destiny, I don’t know what does. It had 
to be the hand of God on them. There 
is no way a mortal would have under-
stood the path that they were all to 
follow and all that follow them. 

I appreciate the opportunity to ad-
dress this topic, Mr. Speaker. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman. Many of the early 
American settlers, we reference them 
many times. They came to the New 
World with the express purpose of fol-
lowing the Bible according to the con-
victions of their own consciences. 

One of the first acts of Congress dur-
ing the tumultuous beginning of our 
Nation was the authorization of an 
American published Bible. The war 
with the British had cut off any supply 
of Bibles from England. 

Our Founding Fathers understood 
how important it was for the American 
people to have Bibles. Robert Aitken, a 
private citizen, brought this need to 
the attention of Congress. In his letter, 
he wrote: ‘‘This work is an object wor-
thy the attention of the Congress of 
the United States of America, who will 
not neglect spiritual security, while 
they are virtuously contending for 
temporal blessings.’’ 

So in 1782, Congress reviewed, ap-
proved, and authorized the first known 
English language Bible to be printed in 
America. They passed a congressional 
resolution. I am not sure how many 
votes this would get if we brought this 
today. I know I would support it. 

‘‘Resolved: That the United States in 
Congress assembled, highly approve the 
pious and laudable undertaking of Mr. 
Aitken, as subservient to the interest 
of religion, as well as an instance of 
the progress of the arts in this country, 
and being satisfied from the above re-
port of his care and accuracy in the 
execution of the work, they rec-
ommend this edition of the Bible to the 
inhabitants of the United States, and 
hereby authorize him to publish this 

recommendation in the manner he 
shall think proper.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Texas (Mr. ARRINGTON). 

Mr. ARRINGTON. Mr. Speaker, I 
want to thank my colleague, Mr. LAM-
BORN, my brother in Christ, and one of 
our spiritual leaders here in this great 
Chamber. 

I so appreciate the gentleman leading 
this effort to pay tribute to God’s holy, 
inherent, infallible, active Word, that 
Word that has created the heavens and 
the Earth. The Word that became flesh 
and dwelt among us in the person of 
Jesus, God’s Son. 

This Word of God, this Bible that we 
speak of, I don’t know that there is any 
book that has had a greater influence 
on the world. It is no accident that the 
words behind me above our Speaker 
and our Nation’s motto are ‘‘In God we 
trust.’’ And as we trusted God, God 
blessed us. 

As I trust Him in my life, He blesses 
me. And when I depart as His child, as 
a follower of Jesus, and I say to Mr. 
LAMBORN that I have to confess, I de-
part from time to time. And when I do, 
I don’t have that peace that surpasses 
understanding, that hope and that joy 
unspeakable, but because of this great 
gift of the Bible, I cannot only know 
the will of God, the mind of God, the 
character of God, I can actually have a 
relationship with God. 

And that is mind-blowing. And the 
fact that I wouldn’t run to the Bible 
every day first thing when I get up, and 
I wouldn’t cling to it at night, every 
night, before I went to bed, is also 
mind-boggling, knowing the power and 
the richness, the depth of the wisdom 
of God in those Holy Scripture. 

And one of my favorite things to talk 
about back home is—and I do this often 
with school children—I talk about 
what has made America great. Because 
like all of us, they have heard that 
statement over the last couple of 
years, and they, I am sure, have pon-
dered that question. What has made 
America great? And how do we make 
America great again? 

Well, I say America is great because 
America is free. And no other Nation in 
all of the world has been gifted with 
that freedom like the United States. 
And I say America is great because 
America is brave. It is the 1 percent in 
every generation that is willing to sac-
rifice everything for these liberties and 
the opportunities that we are blessed 
with. But, ultimately, what makes 
America great is the goodness of Amer-
ica. 

Alexis de Tocqueville who set out to 
study what makes America great, said 
these words, and I think they are im-
portant for us to reflect on. He was a 
French philosopher. He came over here 
for a year, kind of a sabbatical, and his 
thesis was: What makes America 
great? 

He said: ‘‘I sought for the greatness 
and genius of America in her commo-
dious harbors and her ample rivers— 
and it was not there . . . in her fertile 
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fields and boundless forests and it was 
not there . . . in her rich mines and her 
vast world commerce—and it was not 
there . . . in her democratic Congress 
and her matchless Constitution—and it 
was not there. Not until I went into the 
churches of America and heard her pul-
pits aflame with righteousness did I 
understand the secret of her genius and 
power. America is great because she is 
good, and if America ever ceases to be 
good, she will cease to be great.’’ 

So I say this from my own personal 
perspective in my own life, and I say 
this to this great Chamber and to this 
amazing country we have been blessed 
to live in; we must return to the Bible 
and our relationship with God, so His 
goodness, through the power of the 
Holy Spirit will flow through us, so we 
can love our neighbors, serve our com-
munities, and we can make America 
great again. 

Amen. God bless America. And I 
thank the gentleman for this great op-
portunity to share in this tribute to 
the Bible, God’s Holy Word. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
Representative ARRINGTON for his 
heartfelt comments and for being here 
tonight and sharing with us. 

One reason many people respect the 
Bible is that so many prophecies for 
telling future events have come true 
exactly as foretold. It is one of the rea-
sons I look at whenever I ask myself: Is 
the Bible really true? Is it just a collec-
tion of stories and legends, or is it 
rooted in history and fact? 

So when I look at the prophesies of 
the Bible, that gives me the answer. In 
the Old Testament, there are many 
predictions that were given to prove 
that the speaker who claimed to be di-
vinely inspired really was or not. If, 
and when, those predictions or proph-
esies came true, it validated the words 
of that speaker. 

In the Book of Daniel, for instance, 
there are scores of detailed prophesies 
that were literally fulfilled. So skep-
tics who want to criticize the Bible 
have fallen back on the position that 
Daniel must have been written of after 
the facts about which they talk about. 

But, the Book of Daniel is found in 
its entirety in the Greek Septuagint 
and partially in the Dead Sea Scrolls, 
which were discovered in later years 
and now we know predated the events 
that were talked about in the Book of 
Daniel. So Daniel gave prophesies that 
came true in history. 

So the critics of the dating of the 
Book of Daniel are the ones who are 
not being honest. The rise and fall of 
empires, the capture and destruction of 
cities, the destiny of kings, all of these 
are prophesied about in minute detail, 
and history has literally confirmed 
hundreds of such prophesies as having 
come true. 

So that is one of the reasons I believe 
in the Bible and know it to be true, and 
not just a nice collection of stories. 

I yield to the gentleman from Geor-
gia (Mr. ALLEN). 

Mr. ALLEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today in honor of National Bible Week 

and thank Congressman LAMBORN for 
the time tonight to recognize the im-
portance of honoring God’s Word. 

As was said, 7 or 8 years ago, FDR de-
clared National Bible Week just before 
the start of World War II. Just as it 
was then, the Bible is God’s gift to us, 
standing the test of time, and serving 
as our guide during times of both joy 
and hardship. It is the way that God 
speaks to us. 

I was born in rural America in Geor-
gia and as most youngsters, I was bap-
tized at an early age because I believed 
in John 3:16: 

That God who gave us his Son, His begot-
ten Son, that who shall ever believe in Him 
shall not perish but have eternal life. 

What an amazing gift. 
And almost 20 years ago—and of 

course, there are many highs and lows 
during my time since then—but some 
20 years ago, in one of those times of 
despair, I made a covenant with God. 
And that covenant was to put Him 
first. 

And that meant an intense study of 
His Word. And He actually showed me 
how to change my priorities and put 
Him first because I had this thirst for 
His Word as soon as I got up in the 
morning. In fact, I would wake up and 
I would be quoting His Word because of 
something I thought of during the 
night. 

I learned that my strength and abili-
ties did not come from myself, but 
through Him, and Him alone. 

b 1830 
In this great country, we pride our-

selves on freedom, and that freedom is 
knowing that God is our strength and 
His grace has no limits. 

I often pray that thy kingdom come 
on Earth as it is in Heaven, and the 
Bible reveals to us that we already 
have a glimpse of what that is like. 

Genesis 1:26 through 28 shows us that, 
from creation, we were all made in 
God’s image and likeness. Now, 
wouldn’t the world be a much better 
place if we treated each other, our rela-
tionships, as if we were with God him-
self in those relationships. 

Our country’s very foundation comes 
from Judeo-Christian values, and these 
principles are woven throughout our 
founding documents. 

The Bible says we were created for 
God’s purpose and God’s image and in 
His likeness. 

If we study His Word and put it into 
action to value all people, even those 
we disagree with, I am certain that the 
division and hurt in this country would 
heal. 

We are a divided nation, and we have 
a divided government. You know, Jesus 
prayed for us in John 17:21 that we 
would be one, just as He and the Father 
are one. 

The enemy divides; God unites. And 
if we trust God, as His word says—and 
just above me, above the flag, says, if 
we put our trust in God, it would unite 
all of us here around those important 
issues that our Founders and the Amer-
ican people care about. 

I believe that if we actually, in this 
Chamber, debated what the Scriptures 
say about the very issues that divide 
us—and they are very divisive issues 
that we deal with on this floor every 
day—if we took the Scriptures and de-
bated what the Scriptures say about 
those issues, that we would all come to 
agreement that God is correct and that 
his way is the only way. 

In fact, his instruction in Joshua 1:8 
was: ‘‘Do not let this book of law de-
part from your lips. Be careful to do 
what it says; meditate on it night and 
day, and we will be prosperous and suc-
cessful.’’ 

America stands as a beacon of hope 
for the rest of the world and can truly 
be a shining city upon a hill that God 
described if we treat each other with 
the dignity and respect that God shows 
us how to do through His Word. 

I pray that God gives me the strength 
and humility to serve Georgia’s 12th 
District so that more people come to 
know and love Christ, the truth, so 
that the truth will set us free. 

God bless America. God bless His 
great Word. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman from Georgia for his 
words and for being here tonight. 

We have been on the Pacific Coast. 
Now we are with Georgia on the Atlan-
tic Coast. We have been hearing from 
Texas, people from Texas down at our 
Mexican border, and we are about to 
hear from someone from Wisconsin, our 
border with Canada in the north of our 
country. And as Mr. GROTHMAN comes 
forward, I want to just say a word 
about archaeology. 

It is a historical fact that there are 
archaeological discoveries that have 
validated accounts in the Bible, which 
gives trustworthiness to the Bible that 
we acknowledge during this National 
Bible Week. 

Time and time again, archaeology 
has shown that Biblical personalities, 
locations, and events actually existed 
in time and space. They weren’t just 
made-up stories. 

Claims by critics that a Bible state-
ment was simply made up have been 
debunked by later archaeological dis-
coveries more times than we can say. 
The Jewish archaeologist Nelson 
Glueck has said: ‘‘It may be stated cat-
egorically that no archaeological dis-
covery has ever controverted or con-
troverted a Biblical reference.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentleman 
from Wisconsin (Mr. GROTHMAN). 

Mr. GROTHMAN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
to address National Bible Week. 

The Bible is very important in this 
country. In part, it is important be-
cause it is the Word of God, and that 
makes it the most important book, but 
it is a particularly important book in 
America, and it is a book that every-
body should familiarize themselves 
with because I don’t think you can un-
derstand either the Declaration of 
Independence or our Constitution with-
out reading the Bible. 

You have to remember what America 
was like in its founding and probably 
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at least the first 125 years after its 
founding. People learned to read by ei-
ther learning to read the Bible itself or 
maybe learning to read another book, 
such as ‘‘The New England Primer,’’ 
which had many excerpts from the 
Bible in it, or ‘‘McGuffey’s Fourth 
Reader,’’ which had 10 chapters, which 
were solely parts of the Bible and also 
included the Sermon on the Mount. 

The Puritans, of course, who were 
such an important factor in the found-
ing of America, encouraged everyone to 
read the Bible. In 1782, the U.S. Con-
gress even commemorated an Amer-
ican Bible. The reason they commemo-
rated an American Bible is, at that 
time, there was somewhat of a crisis in 
America. We had a Revolutionary War 
going on. It was difficult to get Bibles 
from England. So somebody else had to 
get a Bible or they had to get Bibles in 
other ways, and Congress talked about 
that. But when you think about that, 
you realize why, for so many early 
Americans, the Bible was so important 
to them. 

It is kind of funny nowadays where 
they pretend that there is a separation 
between church and state in America, 
because John Jay, who was the first 
Chief Justice of the United States, was 
also president of the American Bible 
Society; and I could go on at length 
from early Supreme Court decisions in 
which they talked about the impor-
tance of God and made reference to the 
Bible. 

Other important Americans early on, 
Andrew Jackson, the Bible is ‘‘the rock 
on which our Republic rests.’’ 

We can take two things out of this: 
First of all, we could remember that 
the great Andrew Jackson felt the 
Bible was very important, and, sec-
ondly, remind people—because a lot of 
people around here don’t know it—that 
we are a Republic. 

Abraham Lincoln, of course, was 
known as our greatest Biblical Presi-
dent. There are all sorts of lessons in 
the Bible. 

I think in First Samuel it is inter-
esting to read when the Lord did not 
like Israel turning from Him and view-
ing Him as primarily their king over 
Israel, but instead they wanted kind of 
a strong central government under a 
king—example one of many lessons 
that I think our forefathers read when 
they designed our wonderful country. 

But in any event, I think, for Na-
tional Bible Week, what every one of us 
should do is take some time to read the 
Bible, particularly the parts of the 
Bible in which Israel was formed, be-
cause I think it was very important for 
our forefathers because they envisioned 
our country as a country which would 
be pleasing to God, and they wanted 
the type of country that God would 
love and bless. I think we have been 
given that love and blessings not so 
much because of the way we behave 
today, but because of the faith of our 
forefathers. 

So, again, my encouragement for 
whoever sits at home and listens to 

this, maybe say: Can I read the book of 
Deuteronomy or read First Samuel and 
learn a little bit of the Bible, not only 
the Bible for its own right, but to re-
member the type of books that were 
being read by our forefathers when 
they wrote our Constitution, when 
they wrote our Declaration of Inde-
pendence, and those books which cre-
ated their view of the world. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
Mr. GROTHMAN for his words tonight, 
and I appreciate him being here. 

Listen to what President Harry Tru-
man said during his address at the At-
torney General’s Conference on Law 
Enforcement Problems: ‘‘The funda-
mental basis of this Nation’s law was 
given to Moses on the Mount. The fun-
damental basis of our Bill of Rights 
comes from the teachings which we get 
from Exodus and St. Matthew, from 
Isaiah and St. Paul. I don’t think we 
emphasize that enough these days.’’ 

He continued: ‘‘If we don’t have the 
proper fundamental moral background, 
we will finally wind up with a totali-
tarian government which does not be-
lieve in rights for anybody except the 
state.’’ 

Now, we have been hearing from peo-
ple from the Atlantic to the Pacific, 
from the Canadian to the Mexican bor-
der. Mr. Speaker, I yield to the gentle-
woman from Missouri (Mrs. HARTZLER), 
my friend and colleague from the Na-
tion’s heartland. 

Mrs. HARTZLER. Mr. Speaker, I 
thank the gentleman. It is great to be 
here tonight. 

I just came from the Library of Con-
gress, and there are a lot of books 
there, but there is one book in par-
ticular that is there, and it is in the 
homes of many American families 
right now that I would call the most 
dangerous book in the world. 

It is a book that people are being put 
in prison for just having possession of. 
It is a crime in many nations for people 
to own this book, to read this book. 
There are thousands and thousands of 
people in prison right now in other 
parts of the world who are being tor-
tured and killed because they possess 
this book. 

I was reading earlier today about a 
country where there are people in pris-
on who have friends who tear this book 
up into little pieces, and they smuggle 
it into the prison. And that person 
takes them, and they piece together 
those pages so that they can not only 
read this book, but they can memorize 
it. Because as one of the prisoners said: 
‘‘Even though they can take the paper 
away, they can’t take away what’s hid-
den in your heart.’’ 

And there is another story from an-
other country where parents, if they 
have the privilege of getting one of 
these books, it is so precious they read 
it at night to their families and then 
they hide it. 

But the schools and the government 
trick their children in playing a hide- 
and-seek game, and they trick the chil-
dren into telling their teachers if their 

parents have that book and where it is. 
And they are given candy if they win 
this ‘‘game,’’ and then, sadly, they re-
alize their parents are taken away to 
prison camps as a result of that. 

So what is this book that I think is 
really one of the most dangerous books 
in the world? It is the Bible. It is the 
Bible. It is what we are commemo-
rating this week. 

But why is it so dangerous? Why are 
governments around the world so 
threatened by it? It is because it is the 
Word of God. I will say that again: The 
Bible is the Word of God. 

Now, that seems radical. I mean, 
some people would view that as radical, 
but people who have read this book, 
whose lives have been transformed by 
it, who have experienced the power of 
it, who have been set free from difficul-
ties in their life and the chains of ei-
ther sin or the chains of bondage of a 
government that is trying to oppress 
them will tell you it is the most pre-
cious book in the world. And that is 
why governments fear it, and that is 
why people seek it, and that is why ev-
eryone should take advantage—espe-
cially in America—of reading it. That 
is why it is such a popular book. 

By far, it is the world’s most popular 
book. There is no other book, fact or 
fiction, which comes close. Most esti-
mates place the number of Bibles print-
ed each year at 100 million. 

Mr. Speaker, 20 million Bibles are 
sold each year in the United States 
alone. The American Bible Society es-
timates that 9 out of 10 American 
households—or almost 9—87 percent of 
American households own a Bible. In 
fact, they say the average American 
family owns three Bibles. 

My question tonight to all of us is: 
Are we reading it? 

Having a Bible and not reading it 
would be just like being frustrated that 
you need to go somewhere and having a 
car in the garage but just not taking it 
out, or complaining about the room is 
so dark when you just don’t go over 
and turn the light switch on, or having 
no idea how to go somewhere when you 
can just turn on your Google Maps on 
your phone. 

The Bible is the source of help; it is 
the source of power; and it is the 
source of direction in our lives—and it 
is right there in our homes, too many 
times, sadly, gathering dust. 

In my own life, I started off going to 
church with my parents as a child, but 
I never read the Bible myself. It was 
something, we used it on Sunday, and 
the pastor would share a verse or two, 
and that was it. 

And then I went to camp when I was 
13. It was a Youth for Christ Camp. I 
learned that we could read the Bible 
ourselves and how powerful it is to, 
every day, start your day off reading 
from God’s Word, talking to Him 
through prayer, listening to Him 
through prayer, and getting inspiration 
and guidance for your life. 

And it was a revolutionary idea, so I 
started doing that when I was 13, con-
tinued that through my teenage years 
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to the present. And I can’t tell you 
what a difference that has made in my 
life. 

Day after day, I would pick up the 
Bible to read, maybe 15 minutes before 
the schoolbus came, and what I read 
that day would be something that later 
on, a couple hours later, I would face at 
school. Whether it would be something 
dealing with one of my classmates or a 
hard test or being sick, it doesn’t mat-
ter. 

b 1845 

They say the Bible is living and ac-
tive, and it really is. That is one thing 
that makes it so special, because it is 
very, very powerful. 

There have been many instances in 
my life where the Bible has made a dif-
ference for me. But I want to certainly 
say the most important verse is not 
just because it is the word of God; it is 
because it points me to how I can have 
a personal relationship with him. And 
that is John 3:16. 

I don’t know about you, but I love 
football. Many times when you watch a 
football game, somebody is holding up 
a poster that says, ‘‘John 3:16.’’ I hope 
you go and read what that says because 
it is so powerful. It says, ‘‘For God so 
loved the world.’’ That is what makes 
this different than other religions. God 
is a god of love, and because He loved 
the world, He gave His one and only 
Son that whoever believes in Him 
should not perish but have eternal life. 
It goes on and says, ‘‘For God did not 
send his Son to condemn the world but 
to save the world through him.’’ 

I believed that when I was 9 years 
old, and I am so thankful to have the 
privilege of knowing God and that God 
has made a way for each one of us to 
know that. 

I would, this week, encourage all of 
us to get our Bible off that shelf, dust 
it off, open it up, and experience know-
ing God, hearing from Him, and receiv-
ing the hope, healing, and help that 
only God can provide. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentlewoman from Missouri for her 
passionate and powerful words. 

Our last speaker now before we con-
clude our hour is from the great State 
of Texas. Mr. Speaker, I yield to the 
gentleman from Texas (Mr. GOHMERT). 

Mr. GOHMERT. Mr. Speaker, John 
Adams, our first Vice President, such a 
prominent fixture within the Conti-
nental Congress, Declaration of Inde-
pendence, so important to our found-
ing, such a strong antislavery person-
ality—and he was very, very learned, 
constantly reading—said: I have exam-
ined all the religions, and the result is 
that the Bible is the best book in the 
world. 

Patrick Henry, who gave the stem- 
winding speech that moved so many to 
support the Revolution, said: The Bible 
is a book worth more than all the other 
books that were ever printed. 

Benjamin Rush, also a Founder, a 
dear friend of John Adams, said: ‘‘By 
renouncing the Bible, philosophers 

swing from their moorings upon all 
moral subjects. . . . It is the only cor-
rect map of the human heart that has 
ever been published.’’ 

And I love what C.S. Lewis said in his 
book ‘‘The Case for Christianity.’’ He 
was discussing dualism, this idea that 
there are two equal forces in the uni-
verse and that they are at war, and we 
don’t know how it is going to come 
out. 

He said there is a war going on, but 
it is not between two equal forces. It is 
between a master and a rebel, and we 
happen to live in rebel-occupied terri-
tory. Basically, he goes on to say, can 
you imagine being behind enemy lines 
and getting a message from your home 
headquarters and you don’t even pick 
it up and read it? 

Those of us who are Christians, we 
believe that God gave us this book of 
messages, just like C.S. Lewis said. Un-
fortunately, many don’t pick them up. 

It is well known that Thomas Jeffer-
son, though he was not a deist, believed 
the Bible, not all of the miracles. But 
the story is told that he was coming 
down—and CRS has verified he came to 
church every Sunday here in the Cap-
itol. He usually rode his horse. When 
Madison came every Sunday—he was 
here in D.C.—he came down to the Old 
House Chamber. 

But someone asked Jefferson: Where 
are you going this Sunday morning? 

He said: I am going to church in the 
Capitol. 

He had a big Bible under his arm. 
He said: But you don’t believe every-

thing they do. 
He said: Sir, I am the highest elected 

magistrate in this country. It is imper-
ative that I set the proper example. 

I thank my friend for setting that 
same proper example. 

Mr. LAMBORN. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman from Texas for his 
words, and I thank him and all the oth-
ers who have spoken here tonight from 
all over this great country of ours for 
their heartfelt comments. 

It has been an honor and a pleasure 
for me to commemorate National Bible 
Week this evening. I am grateful to my 
colleagues who joined me to honor, re-
spect, and commemorate the Word of 
God. 

Mr. Speaker, the prophet Isaiah, 
thousands of years ago in this book 
right here, the Bible, in Isaiah 40:8 
says: ‘‘The grass withers, the flower 
fades, but the word of our God stands 
forever.’’ Those are powerful and true 
words. 

Civilizations have risen and fallen, 
generations have come and gone, yet 
here today, on November 20, 2019, we 
are still celebrating the enduring Word 
of God given to us starting thousands 
of years ago. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance 
of my time. 

f 

TRANSGENDER DAY OF 
REMEMBRANCE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under 
the Speaker’s announced policy of Jan-

uary 3, 2019, the gentlewoman from 
Massachusetts (Ms. PRESSLEY) is recog-
nized for 60 minutes as the designee of 
the majority leader. 

GENERAL LEAVE 
Ms. PRESSLEY. Mr. Speaker, before 

I begin, I ask unanimous consent that 
all Members may have 5 legislative 
days to revise and extend their re-
marks and include extraneous material 
on the subject of the Special Order. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there 
objection to the request of the gentle-
woman from Massachusetts? 

There was no objection. 
Ms. PRESSLEY. Mr. Speaker, I rise 

today in remembrance of Rita Hester, a 
Black transgender woman killed in the 
Massachusetts Seventh District, for 
whom Transgender Day of Remem-
brance was established in 1999. 

I rise today because, 20 years later, 
many more lives continue to be stolen. 
This year, we have been robbed of at 
least 22 transgender people because of 
hate, fear, and vitriol—22 souls, the 
majority of whom are Black 
transgender women; 22 people whose 
families, friends, and partners are for-
ever marred by grief; 22 experiences of 
secondhand trauma for transgender 
people everywhere. 

Among them we remember: Dana 
Martin, Jazzaline Ware, Ashanti 
Carmon, Claire Legato, Muhlaysia 
Booker, Michelle ‘‘Tamika’’ Wash-
ington, Paris Cameron, Chynal 
Lindsey, Chanel Scurlock, Zoe Spears, 
Brooklyn Lindsey, Denali Berries 
Stuckey, Tracy Single, Bubba Walker, 
Kiki Fantroy, Jordan Cofer, Pebbles 
LaDime ‘‘Dime’’ Doe, Bailey Reeves, 
Bee Love Slater, Jamagio Jamar 
Berryman, Itali Marlowe, and Brianna 
‘‘BB’’ Hill. 

May they rest in peace and power. 
Today, we remember still others not 

included on this list because their 
missing persons reports remain 
uninvestigated or because they are 
misgendered and deadnamed after their 
death because the people closest to 
them refused to recognize their truths. 

We remember those who die from pre-
ventable illnesses, poverty, and vio-
lence as a result of discrimination in 
healthcare, employment, education, 
and housing. 

We remember transgender women 
Johana Medina and Layleen Polanco, 
victims of an unjust and cruel immi-
gration and criminal legal system. 

Mr. Speaker, colleagues, the 
transgender community deserves to be 
seen safe and celebrated. However, due 
to this administration’s policies that 
continue to neglect, unfairly target, 
and commit violence against them, 
this is not the case. 

However, so as not to define the 
transgender community only by their 
trauma, today, I also rise to lift the 
talents and strengths of this commu-
nity. 

I honor you, my transgender friends, 
for your bravery to honor your truths, 
for intentionally creating a beautiful 
and rich community, and for being role 
models as leaders of social change. 
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