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HONORING ENSIGN JOSHUA KALEB 
WATSON 

HON. MARTHA ROBY 
OF ALABAMA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mrs. ROBY. Madam Speaker, I rise today to 
honor the life and sacrifices of Ensign Joshua 
Kaleb Watson, who was tragically killed on 
December 6, 2019, at Pensacola Naval Air 
Station in Florida. 

Born and raised in Enterprise, Alabama, 
Kaleb was a natural leader and devoted serv-
ant to his community from an early age. In-
spired by his uncle’s service in the Gulf War, 
Kaleb knew at a very early age since child-
hood that he wanted to serve his country in 
the military. 

Kaleb continued to demonstrate his leader-
ship skills at Enterprise High School, where he 
participated in JROTC, National Honor Soci-
ety, French Honor Society, and captain of the 
rifle team. It was through his experience on 
the rifle team that he learned of the opportuni-
ties at the United States Naval Academy. 
Kaleb was accepted to attend the prestigious 
Naval Academy upon graduating from high 
school in 2014. Kaleb continued to serve his 
hometown community after graduation by vol-
unteering his time to the rifle team during 
school breaks. 

At the Naval Academy, Kaleb set his sights 
on becoming a Navy pilot, and he excelled. A 
dedicated student, Kaleb majored in mechan-
ical engineering and was named to the Dean’s 
list and Commandant’s Honors list. Outside of 
the classroom, he was a member of the Acad-
emy’s rifle team, served as a wrestling coach, 
and was a small-arms instructor. Under his 
leadership as captain of the rifle team, the 
Naval Academy won its first victory over West 
Point in a decade. 

After commissioning, Kaleb served a tem-
porary assignment at the Naval Academy’s 
Physical Education department until last 
month, when he reported to Pensacola to 
begin flight training. On December 6, Kaleb 
made the ultimate sacrifice for his country 
when an active shooter opened fire at the 
Naval Air Station. Without hesitation, Kaleb 
sprang into action. After being wounded him-
self, Kaleb was able to locate first responders 
to identify the shooter, undoubtedly preventing 
many more causalities that day. 

Madam Speaker, it is my privilege to join 
the people of Alabama’s Second Congres-
sional District, the Enterprise community, and 
the Watson family to honor Kaleb today. He is 
remembered by his peers and many others as 
a kind friend, encouraging teammate, and 
generous volunteer. Kaleb died a hero, and 
his courageous actions and service to this na-
tion will not soon be forgotten as we continue 
to share his story of selflessness and valor. 
May God bless his family and community as 
we mourn the loss of Joshua Kaleb Watson, 
and may God bless all of our military mem-
bers who continue to defend and protect the 
United States of America. 

RECOGNIZING DYLAN M. GOETSCH 
AND CHRISTOPHER W. SCHMOKER 

HON. DUSTY JOHNSON 
OF SOUTH DAKOTA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. JOHNSON of South Dakota. Madam 
Speaker, I rise today to recognize and honor 
Dylan M. Goetsch and Christopher W. 
Schmoker for their tremendous courage last 
year while saving a citizen from a house fire 
in Sturgis, South Dakota. 

After arriving at the scene of a burning 
home in May 2018, police Officer Dylan 
Goetsch and Sgt. Christopher Schmoker 
rushed into the house without hesitation, 
knowing Jason McKee was trapped inside. 
They journeyed to the upper level of the home 
not once, not twice, but three times in search 
of the trapped man. The smoke was so dense, 
Officer Goetsch was unable to see more than 
a few feet in front of him, but they did not re-
treat until they were able to drag Mr. McKee 
to safety. 

I was pleased to hear Officer Goetsch and 
Sgt. Schmoker are being awarded the Car-
negie Medal by the Carnegie Hero Fund in 
honor of their bravery. This award is reserved 
for individuals who risk their lives to an ex-
traordinary degree in the attempt to save the 
lives of others. I can think of no citizens more 
deserving of this award than Officer Goetsch 
and Sgt. Schmoker. 

I thank both these South Dakotans for their 
selfless courage. Our state and country are 
better because of citizens like them. I com-
mend them for their outstanding heroism and 
congratulate them on the receival of the es-
teemed Carnegie Medal. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF THE 200TH AN-
NIVERSARY OF THE CITY OF 
BENNETTSVILLE, SOUTH CARO-
LINA 

HON. TOM RICE 
OF SOUTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. RICE of South Carolina. Madam Speak-
er, I rise today to recognize the City of 
Bennettsville, South Carolina and its 200th An-
niversary. 

The City of Bennettsville was founded on 
December 14, 1819 in Marlborough District on 
the Great Pee Dee River. Named after Thom-
as Bennett Jr., the 48th Governor of South 
Carolina, the city was formally chartered on 
December 20, 1866 and incorporated on 
March 4, 1976. 

Since its founding, agriculture has been the 
number one revenue source in and around 
Bennettsville. Agricultural products of 
Bennettsville include grain, indigo, cotton, to-
bacco, corn, peanuts, timber, fruits and vege-
tables, as well as the raising of cattle, poultry, 

and swine. Agritourism and agritainment have 
evolved from the stable agriculture industry. 

Upon its founding, the South Carolina Gen-
eral Assembly authorized the construction of a 
new courthouse, designed by South Carolina 
architect Robert Mills. The Mills courthouse 
was replaced in 1852. The following court-
house was headquarters of the 17th Army 
Corps of the Army of the United States and 
one of the few county seats holding records 
dating back to 1785. The current courthouse 
was built in 1884. 

Madam Speaker, I honor all that have 
worked to make the City of Bennettsville a 
symbol of American grace and charm and rec-
ognize its 200th Anniversary. 

f 

CONGRATULATING DUBLIN HIGH 
SCHOOL ON WINNING THE FOOT-
BALL STATE CHAMPIONSHIP 

HON. RICK W. ALLEN 
OF GEORGIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. ALLEN. Madam Speaker, I rise today to 
congratulate the Dublin High School Fighting 
Irish on winning the Georgia High School As-
sociation 2A Football State Championship. 

These young men have worked hard all 
season, and this weekend’s big win is a result 
of all their work. While at halftime the Fighting 
Irish were down, they quickly came back in 
the second half to ultimately defeat Brooks 
County 42 to 32—demonstrating the true 
meaning of perseverance. 

This was a unique win, as not one pass was 
attempted during the game. But the team won 
after rushing 437 yards, bringing Dublin its first 
state title since 2006. 

I have no doubt this program will continue to 
be successful in the years to come, and I look 
forward to seeing all these young men will ac-
complish, both on and off the field. 

Congratulations to Coach Roger Holmes, 
the team, and the entire Fighting Irish commu-
nity. 

f 

HONORING THE EXEMPLARY LIFE 
AND SERVICE OF MAYOR RICH-
ARD GORDON HATCHER 

HON. PETER J. VISCLOSKY 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. VISCLOSKY. Madam Speaker, it is with 
deep sadness and the greatest respect that I 
take this time to remember one of Indiana’s 
most distinguished citizens, the Honorable 
Richard Gordon Hatcher, who served the City 
of Gary with the utmost distinction. On Friday, 
December 13, 2019, Mayor Hatcher passed 
away at the age of 86. Mayor Hatcher’s self-
less and lifelong commitment to serving the 
people of Gary, and his dedication to the 
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cause of civil rights and advancing racial 
equality in all of our communities and through-
out the nation, is to be admired and emulated. 
He will be profoundly missed by his family, 
friends, co-workers, and the many grateful 
constituents whose lives he touched. 

Richard Hatcher was born on July 10, 1933, 
in Michigan City, Indiana. He graduated from 
Indiana University and went on to earn his 
Juris Doctor degree from Valparaiso University 
in 1959. Following law school, Mayor Hatcher 
settled in Gary, Indiana. He practiced at a pri-
vate firm and went on to serve as a deputy 
county prosecutor. In 1963, Mayor Hatcher 
was elected to the Gary City Council. In this 
position, he helped to pass an open housing 
law, which ended the practice that forced Afri-
can Americans to live primarily in the city’s 
midtown section due to restrictive property 
contracts. In 1967, Richard Gordon Hatcher 
was elected Mayor of Gary, Indiana, and in 
doing so became one of the first two African 
Americans in our nation’s history to become 
mayor of a large city. 

Throughout his twenty-year tenure, Mayor 
Hatcher was unwavering and passionate in his 
efforts to advocate for civil rights, economic 
justice, and equality for all Gary residents and 
citizens of the United States. In particular, 
Mayor Hatcher devoted substantial efforts to 
supporting those most in need in his city. For 
example, he was successful in securing fund-
ing for low-cost and public housing in Gary, 
and he worked to enhance the availability of 
job training so that every citizen could have 
the opportunity to meet their own potential and 
provide for their family. In addition, Mayor 
Hatcher repaved Gary roads, brought garbage 
collection services to inner-city neighborhoods 
for the first time, and oversaw the construction 
and completion of major projects such as the 
Genesis Convention Center and the Adam J. 
Benjamin Transportation Center. On the na-
tional front, Mayor Hatcher rose to serve as a 
political trailblazer for the African American 
community. He was instrumental in organizing 
the 1972 National Black Political Convention in 
Gary, and he also served as chairman of Rev. 
Jesse Jackson’s presidential campaign in 
1984, as well as his vice chairman four years 
later. Mayor Hatcher’s contributions to the City 
of Gary, throughout Northwest Indiana, and 
beyond are remarkable and immeasurable, 
and he is to be honored and commended for 
his tireless action. 

Mayor Hatcher is survived by his amazing 
wife, Ruthellyn, three beloved daughters, 
Ragen, Rachelle, and Renee, and six beautiful 
grandchildren. He also leaves to cherish his 
memory many dear friends and family mem-
bers and a saddened but grateful community. 

Madam Speaker, I respectfully ask that you 
and my other distinguished colleagues join me 
in paying tribute to a true public servant, 
Mayor Richard Gordon Hatcher. For his tre-
mendous contributions to the cause of civil 
rights, and for his dedication to the City of 
Gary and the community of Northwest Indiana, 
Mayor Hatcher is worthy of the highest praise. 
I thank him for his perseverance, sacrifice, 
and struggle. His legacy will serve as a time-
less inspiration for generations to come. 

RECOGNIZING THE IRWIN COUNTY 
HIGH SCHOOL FOOTBALL TEAM 

HON. AUSTIN SCOTT 
OF GEORGIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. AUSTIN SCOTT of Georgia. Madam 
Speaker, I rise today to congratulate the Irwin 
County High School football team from Ocilla, 
Georgia on their win against Marion County in 
the Class A Georgia State Championship on 
Saturday, December 14, 2019. 

With an impressive 56–14 win over the Mar-
ion County Eagles, the Indians football team 
finished their season undefeated (13–0) for 
the first time since 1975 and brought home 
the state title. This is the fifth time in six sea-
sons that Head Coach Buddy Nobles has led 
the Indians to the state finals, all while battling 
Stage 4 stomach cancer. He called this team 
a ‘‘team of destiny’’ and there is no doubt his 
leadership and fighting spirit inspired Irwin 
County to bring home another state football 
title to Georgia’s Eighth Congressional District. 

I want to congratulate the Indians, Coach 
Nobles, and the entire football and athletics 
staff at Irwin County High School for this ac-
complishment. 

f 

RECOGNIZING THE RECIPIENTS OF 
THE ATTORNEY GENERAL’S 
AWARD FOR DISTINGUISHED 
SERVICE IN POLICING 

HON. GERALD E. CONNOLLY 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Mr. CONNOLLY . Madam Speaker, I rise to 
congratulate four law enforcement officers of 
the Prince William County Police Department 
who have been awarded the Attorney Gen-
eral’s Award for Distinguished Service in Polic-
ing by the United States Department of Jus-
tice. These officers have been selected by the 
Office of Community Oriented Policing Serv-
ices for their bravery and commitment to serv-
ice. Only 19 law enforcement professionals 
from across the country have been selected to 
receive this award this year, and to be recog-
nized by the Department of Justice is a dis-
tinct honor that brings pride to the Prince Wil-
liam County Police Department and the com-
munities that these officers protect. 

Throughout their careers, these officers 
have bravely placed themselves in the line of 
danger. It takes a tremendous amount of cour-
age and character to step into high-risk situa-
tions, qualities that these honorees exhibit in 
abundance. In November of 2018, the Prince 
William County Police Department received an 
emergency call reporting an active shooter. 
Upon arriving to the scene, these officers took 
immediate action to warn incoming units while 
taking cover from gunfire. The shooter, who 
was on the roof, ignored commands to sur-
render and was eventually struck and fell to 
the ground. Overcoming their fear of a pos-
sible second gunman, the officers exposed 
themselves to extract the shooter for medical 
treatment and also pulled a civilian from a res-
idence to safety. The bravery and heroism dis-
played that day represents true courage and 
went far above and beyond the line of duty. 

It is my honor to recognize the following re-
cipients of the Third Annual Attorney General’s 
Award for Distinguished Service in Policing: 

Officer Evan Jurgenson 
Officer Nicholas Kelly 
Officer Rachel Mynier 
Officer John Yenchak 
Madam Speaker, I ask my colleagues to join 

me once again in honoring these individuals 
for their bravery and dedication and in thank-
ing them for their selfless service. The impor-
tance of their vital roles in protecting the safe-
ty of our neighborhoods cannot be overstated 
and is truly worthy of our highest praise. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF DR. WILLIAM 
H. LEE 

HON. DORIS O. MATSUI 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, December 19, 2019 

Ms. MATSUI. Madam Speaker, it is with 
profound sadness that I rise to honor the life 
of beloved Sacramento Observer founder and 
publisher, Dr. William Hanford Lee, who 
passed away on September 22, 2019 at the 
age of 83. His legacy will live on through the 
love of his family and friends, as well as the 
Sacramento Observer, a lighthouse for Sac-
ramento’s African-American community. Dr. 
Lee was blessed with the support of his fam-
ily, his wife Kathryn (deceased) and sons, 
Larry, Billy and Roderick (deceased). 

Dr. William Lee was born on May 29, 1936 
in Austin, Texas. In the early 1940’s, Dr. Lee 
moved to the Sacramento neighborhood of 
Del Paso Heights. As a young adult, he at-
tended California State University, Sacramento 
and later transferred to University of California, 
Berkley, where he received his B.A. in Ac-
counting. His brief employment with real-es-
tate companies Aerojet and IBM Corporations 
inspired Dr. Lee to establish his own real-es-
tate and land development company in 1960. 
His success in real estate allowed for the es-
tablishment of The Sacramento Observer on 
November 22, 1962, marking the beginning of 
a revolution in journalism. 

Several momentous achievements outline 
Dr. Lee’s career: he was awarded an Hon-
orary Ph.D. from Southeastern University in 
1970, he was named ‘‘Publisher of the Year’’ 
by the West Coast Black Publisher’s Associa-
tion in 1985, his newspaper has been named 
No.1 Black Newspaper six times, and he was 
awarded the John B. Russwurm trophy, the 
United States’ top newspaper publishing 
honor. Additionally, he was co-founder and 
former President of the Men’s Civic League, 
co-founder of The Greater Sacramento Urban 
League, and co-founder of the Sacramento 
Area Black Caucus. Nationally, Dr. Lee served 
on the Board of Directors and as an officer for 
the National Newspapers Publisher’s Associa-
tion, the Black Press of America, and co- 
founded the West Coast Black Publisher’s As-
sociation. These incredible achievements and 
roles certainly signify just how powerful Wil-
liam Lee’s presence was in the Sacramento 
region, in California, and in our nation. 

Madam Speaker, today we honor Dr. Wil-
liam Hanford Lee’s generous contributions to 
journalism and education; he has been a men-
tor, an advocate, and a leader—both locally 
and nationally. His efforts in providing rep-
resentation for the African-American commu-
nity will be remembered for a life-time. 
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