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minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. GUEST. Madam Speaker, as a 
member of the Committee on Home-
land Security, I rise today to express 
my strong opposition to the New Way 
Forward Act, which would completely 
eliminate our Nation’s ability to con-
trol our borders and determine who en-
ters our country. 

It would cripple the efforts of our law 
enforcement officers to remove dan-
gerous criminals from our streets, and 
it would undermine the sacrifice that 
the men and women of law enforcement 
make every day. 

Additionally, the New Way Forward 
Act would encourage and open new 
pathways for convicted criminals to 
enter and remain in the United States. 
Meanwhile, conservative policies like 
building the wall and supporting law 
enforcement agencies reduced the num-
ber of apprehensions by almost 75 per-
cent since May and led to the seizure of 
more than 50,000 pounds of drugs across 
our southwest border. 

Madam Speaker, I strongly urge my 
colleagues to oppose the New Way For-
ward Act. 

f 

RECOGNIZING EGG HARBOR TOWN-
SHIP HIGH SCHOOL MOCK TRIAL 
TEAM 

(Mr. VAN DREW asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. VAN DREW. Madam Speaker, I 
would like to recognize the Egg Harbor 
Township High School’s mock trial 
team from south Jersey. 

Egg Harbor Township High School 
unseated reigning Atlantic County 
trial champion Mainland Regional in 
the county final. 

Led by coaches Michael Martirone, 
Trevor Zompa, and Dara Quattrone, 
the Egg Harbor mock trial team won 
for the first time in 9 years. 

Students take on roles of prosecu-
tors, defense attorneys, witnesses, and 
jurors before New Jersey judges and at-
torneys at the New Jersey Law Center. 
Egg Harbor’s team will now compete in 
the semifinals, with the final competi-
tion being in March. 

I am going to mention all of their 
names: Raza Abbas, Tyler Weller, Mad-
eline Coyle, Annette Diaz, Michael 
Donchey, Gabriela Garcia, Malini 
Gulati, Tasmiah Haque, Megan Herbin, 
Jason Hill, David Lee, Matthew Levine, 
Nicholas Seppy, Ethan Saul, Carina 
Sharra, Danielle Sharra, Evan 
Shuttleworth, Isabella Spena, and fi-
nally Skyler Szilagyi. 

Congratulations, and good luck. We 
look forward to big things from all of 
you. We are so unbelievably proud of 
you. 

f 

b 1715 

EQUAL RIGHTS FOR WOMEN 

(Ms. CLARK of Massachusetts asked 
and was given permission to address 

the House for 1 minute and to revise 
and extend her remarks.) 

Ms. CLARK of Massachusetts. 
Madam Speaker, in 1970 in this very 
Chamber the first African American 
woman elected to Congress, Shirley 
Chisholm, said: 

There is an unspoken assumption 
that women are different. Artificial 
distinctions between persons must be 
wiped out of the law. 

Congresswoman Chisholm was calling 
for the passage of the equal rights 
amendment. Fifty years later and a 
century after securing the right to 
vote, I stand before you, Madam Speak-
er, with the same call to action. 

I stand before you as a Member of the 
116th Congress with the greatest pro-
portion of women Members in our his-
tory and a female Speaker, but yet as 
a woman, my rights remain unpro-
tected in the Constitution. 

The majority of Americans are 
women, but yet our Constitution does 
not fully and explicitly include our 
mothers, daughters, grandmothers, 
aunts, and neighbors. 

Our Constitution is not just a found-
ing document. It is a foundational doc-
ument to equality under the law. It is 
time to reflect the truths that have be-
come self-evident, that all people are 
created equal. It is time to pass the 
equal rights amendment. 

f 

WATER INFRASTRUCTURE 

(Mr. COSTA asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. COSTA. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to talk about the importance of 
investing in our Nation’s infrastruc-
ture. And, in particular, to fix our bro-
ken and aging water delivery systems, 
not only in California but throughout 
the country. 

In California’s San Joaquin Valley, 
the availability of a clean and reliable 
water supply is absolutely essential for 
the foundation of our economy. Farm-
ers need water to feed the world, and 
life becomes obviously very difficult if 
residents don’t have a clean drinking 
water supply. 

The waterways that carry our water 
were built decades ago in California 
and throughout the country. 

Last week, I introduced legislation to 
fix two pieces of critical water infra-
structure, the Delta-Mendota Canal 
and the California Aqueduct, that were 
built decades ago. 

The Conveyance Capacity Correction 
Act will provide $400 million to fund 
these needed projects. This legislation 
is just one of the many tools we have 
that can fix the water system that we 
have; one of the water tools in our 
water toolbox. 

We need to invest in our water infra-
structure now for the future sustain-
ability of our State and the livelihood 
of our residents. 

Food is a national security item. 

THE PRESIDENT’S BUDGET 
The SPEAKER pro tempore (Ms. 

CRAIG). Under the Speaker’s announced 
policy of January 3, 2019, the gentle-
woman from California (Ms. PORTER) is 
recognized for 60 minutes as the des-
ignee of the majority leader. 

Ms. PORTER. Madam Speaker, when 
Donald Trump was running for Presi-
dent, he promised that he would bal-
ance the budget, eliminate the national 
debt, and protect programs that sup-
port American families. 

He continues to promise to balance 
the budget, but his latest math is based 
on fantasy. The President’s budget cuts 
the programs that Americans rely on 
and those that Americans have in-
vested in in order to fund more tax 
cuts for the wealthy, a bigger defense 
budget, and an ineffective border wall. 

If it isn’t clear yet, the President 
failed to be truthful. He is putting spe-
cial interests above the health and 
safety of hardworking American fami-
lies. 

Our national debt is bigger than ever, 
and taxpayer dollars have been wasted 
paying for tax cuts that benefit the 
rich and powerful. 

Here is the stone-cold truth: Presi-
dent Trump is reneging on his promise 
to protect older Americans and those 
with disabilities. His proposed budget 
cuts billions from Social Security and 
Medicare. These drastic cuts and his 
failure to keep his word will devastate 
millions of Americans. 

Social Security has lifted millions of 
older Americans out of poverty, but 
the President doesn’t think it is nec-
essary to continue supporting our most 
vulnerable older Americans. 

The President would also slash the 
budget for the Administration for Com-
munity Living. Americans need this 
agency to support those who are aging 
and those who have disabilities, as well 
as their caregivers, so that they can 
age in place and live their best life 
every day of their lives. I have heard 
countless times from Orange County 
residents that they want the choice to 
grow older in their homes in our beau-
tiful community that they have spent 
much of their lives in. The President’s 
budget takes these choices away. 

Right now, our country is struggling 
to keep up with our global competitors. 
And apparently right now the Presi-
dent thinks this is a good time to gut 
funding for medical research and inno-
vation. 

The President wants to cut invest-
ments in medical research at the Na-
tional Institutes of Health that provide 
the pipeline for new cures and that 
spur innovation. 

The President wants to cut funding 
for the Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention, the Health Resources and 
Services Administration, and the Sub-
stance Abuse and Mental Health Serv-
ices Administration. These agencies 
ensure that there are qualified health 
professionals who can move new med-
ical discoveries into healthcare and 
public-health delivery, support Ameri-
cans while they are awaiting new 
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cures, and prevent them from getting 
sick in the first place. 

The President also wants to cut fund-
ing for the Food and Drug Administra-
tion and the Agency for Healthcare Re-
search and Quality. Americans need 
the Food and Drug Administration to 
approve new, safe, and effective treat-
ments and the Agency for Healthcare 
Research and Quality to provide evi-
dence on what treatments work best, 
for whom, and in what circumstances. 

If you follow the President’s budget 
proposals over his years in office, 
Madam Speaker, you know that this is 
a pattern that just keeps repeating, be-
cause the President doesn’t care about 
securing healthcare for older Ameri-
cans, for children, or for everyday 
Americans, he doesn’t care about en-
suring that older Americans have a se-
cure and comfortable retirement. He 
doesn’t care that millions of Americans 
depend on these programs to survive. 

The cuts as proposed are untenable 
for America’s health and are a radical 
change from how we funded these pro-
grams in decades past. 

It is my responsibility as a Rep-
resentative to provide Federal funding 
in 2021 that aligns with our core values 
as a nation and that supports the 
American people, and I promise to put 
Orange County families first. Unlike 
the President, I will never break this 
longstanding promise to my constitu-
ents. 

The President’s budget shows willful 
ignorance of the climate crisis that is 
threatening our country’s natural re-
sources, our communities’ health, and 
our global prosperity. He proposes cuts 
to environmental protection programs 
that would only further exacerbate the 
worst effects of the climate change. 
Countries around the world are experi-
encing their warmest winters in his-
tory. Antarctica saw temperatures of 
65 degrees for the first time in history. 

We have watched Australia and the 
rain forests burn. We have watched our 
home State of California burn. We have 
seen communities devastated by hurri-
canes and other adverse weather 
caused by climate change. The Presi-
dent’s proposed budget would slash the 
budget for the Environmental Protec-
tion Agency by 26 percent and cut in 
half funding for energy research and 
development. This would gut critical 
programs like the Land & Water Con-
servation Fund and tax credits for elec-
tric vehicles by millions of dollars 
each. 

People are dying, entire species are 
on the verge of extinction, and commu-
nities have been destroyed; but the 
President wants to devastate bipar-
tisan programs established to protect 
our natural resources, our commu-
nities, and our planet. 

Who is this budget for? 
Who are these proposals for? 
The oil industry, special interests, 

and the few in this world who gain 
more from harming our planet than 
from supporting it. This budget is not 
for Californians, and it is not for Or-
ange County families. 

As a mother of three, I fear for the 
world my children will grow up in, and 
I cannot stand by and let this Presi-
dent destroy programs that would pro-
tect it. 

On the topic of our children’s future, 
I am disgusted by the President’s deci-
sion to cut funding for public education 
while providing yet another tax break 
for the wealthy and largest corpora-
tions. The President’s proposal is an 
outright attack on our public schools 
which are a real point of pride in the 
45th Congressional District. 

To make matters worse, the budget 
would make higher education less af-
fordable and less accessible than it al-
ready is for too many students. The 
budget makes a $170 billion cut to stu-
dent loan programs over the next 10 
years. 

What does this mean for our college 
students? 

Increased costs for new students be-
cause subsidized student loans would 
be eliminated, difficulty getting jobs 
on campus because of cuts to funding 
for Federal workstudy, and difficulty 
repaying loans because of the elimi-
nation of the Public Service Loan For-
giveness Program. This program is 
based on a simple premise that dedi-
cating yourself to making this country 
better by responding to emergencies, 
by educating our students, and by pro-
viding care for the sick is an honorable 
and deeply needed service. 

These are just some of the many pro-
fessions performed by those who pursue 
a career in the public sector. By elimi-
nating the Public Service Loan For-
giveness Program, the President 
breaks our promise to our first re-
sponders, our teachers, and our nurses. 
These borrowers have tirelessly com-
mitted themselves to improving our 
communities, and we must keep our 
commitment to them. 

Despite being in the middle of a his-
toric affordable housing crisis which 
we feel acutely in Orange County, 
President Trump wants to make dra-
matic cuts to the housing and commu-
nity development programs that serve 
those in need. The proposal slashes 
funding for the Department of Housing 
and Urban Development by 15 percent. 
That is $8.6 billion. That money is com-
ing out of essential housing assistance 
programs that lift up our communities. 
In a State like California where the af-
fordable housing crisis hits especially 
hard, these cuts will hurt thousands of 
families who rely on them to make 
ends meet. 

In California, a minimum wage work-
er would have to work 116 hours a week 
to afford a two-bedroom apartment or 
have the good fortune to find a job that 
pays $35 an hour. But in my district of 
Orange County, make that $39 per 
hour, or $80,000 per year. The median 
cost for a single-family home in Orange 
County is over $800,000. 

Do we want to live in a country 
where only millionaires can afford 
shelter? 

Until we address the severe lack of 
affordable housing in America, we will 

need programs like community block 
grants and the HOME Investment Part-
nerships Program to help families. 
Those funds support affordable housing 
for low- and moderate-income families, 
and the President’s budget completely 
eliminates them. His proposal would, 
quite literally, leave families out in 
the cold. Taking a chunk out of HUD’s 
budget when home and rental prices 
are hitting new highs across the coun-
try is irresponsible and, frankly, cruel. 

President Trump says he is for our 
business owners, but he clearly means 
mega corporations—Big Oil, Big 
Pharma, and Wall Street banks—be-
cause his budget eliminates funding for 
the Economic Development Adminis-
tration’s grant program, and it cuts 
the Small Business Administration by 
11 percent. This budget would harm 
U.S. innovation and growth and hurt 
small business owners who are the 
backbone of our economy. 

President Trump also wants to cut 
our foreign aid budget by over 20 per-
cent. That money is about keeping 
Americans safe and keeping us out of 
never-ending wars. Former Chairman 
of the Joint Chiefs of Staff, Admiral 
Mike Mullen, raised similar concerns 
earlier this week: ‘‘The more we cut 
the international affairs budget, the 
higher the risk for longer and deadlier 
military operations.’’ 

The President’s budget puts Ameri-
cans and our military at risk, rather 
than funding foreign aid that keeps us 
safe and secure. 

We have a responsibility as elected 
officials to be good stewards of working 
Americans’ hard-earned dollars, and 
that means funding programs to get 
families the help that they need, pro-
grams that invest in our children, and 
priorities that keep us safe. Giveaways 
to special interests and wasted dollars 
on proposals not grounded in evidence 
are slaps in the face of our hard-
working taxpayers. 

If this budget is a reflection of the 
President’s values and of his goals and 
vision for our country, then I am afraid 
of what policies may come out of this 
White House next. 

I constantly seek opportunities to 
work with my colleagues on the other 
side of the aisle, and I look for chances 
to work with this President as well. 
But I cannot and I will not support gut-
ting the programs that serve our fami-
lies and our communities. 

It is Congress’ responsibility to make 
sure that we spend taxpayer dollars 
wisely on programs that support eco-
nomic growth rather than things that 
line the pockets of special interests 
and hurt our future. 

Congress was given the power of the 
purse as part of a system of checks and 
balances on the President’s power, and 
it is our responsibility on both sides of 
the aisle to fight for a real budget 
grounded in our values and a budget 
that works for the families and the 
American people that we represent. 

Madam Speaker, I yield to the gen-
tlewoman from Michigan (Ms. TLAIB). 
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b 1730 

Ms. TLAIB. Madam Speaker, I thank 
the gentlewoman from California (Ms. 
PORTER), my incredible colleague who 
co-chairs the Special Order within the 
Congressional Progressive Caucus. I do 
appreciate her continued leadership in 
fighting for families all across the 
country. 

One of the things that we need to re-
alize is this is a destructive and irra-
tional budget by the current adminis-
tration, and we want to wonder why. 

This is a reflection—very much so— 
of the values within this administra-
tion. It is also showing that we are 
going to leave working-class folks and 
anyone who needs access to food, 
healthcare, housing, clean air, and re-
lief from flooding behind. 

And we wonder: Why did this come 
about? Well, like folks in my district 
would say: Let’s go back and figure out 
who is part of the administration. 

Right now, under the current Trump 
administration, a coal lobbyist runs 
the EPA; a pharmaceutical executive 
runs Health and Human Services; an 
oil lobbyist runs the Department of the 
Interior; another lobbyist runs DOD, 
the Department of Defense; a Verizon 
lawyer runs the Federal Communica-
tions Commission; a Goldman Sachs 
executive runs Treasury; a private eq-
uity kingpin runs Commerce; a billion-
aire Amway heiress runs the Depart-
ment of Education. 

So what you have here is a reflection 
of those values, those folks who are 
completely disconnected from the 
American people. These folks are mil-
lionaires—some may be even billion-
aires—who do not understand the day- 
to-day challenges that our folks are 
facing. 

Madam Speaker, I represent the third 
poorest congressional district in the 13 
District Strong, where we have, in 
some areas, chronic poverty, but also 
lack of access to food. We also face 
that we are frontline communities of 
what doing nothing looks like on cli-
mate change. We also house the worst 
ZIP Code in the State of Michigan— 
48217. 

Madam Speaker, look at the budget 
itself. Just gloss over it. You are talk-
ing about $1.4 trillion in tax give-
aways—$1.7 billion in cuts just in the 
Army Corps of Engineers, where two of 
my communities right now are lit-
erally facing flooding of homes that 
they need the Army Corps of Engineers 
to be able to address, from commu-
nities in Dearborn Heights and all 
along the east side of Detroit. 

Madam Speaker, we have $920 billion 
in Medicaid cuts, healthcare to our 
most vulnerable, many of them, again, 
family members and those who have to 
take care of our children. 

Madam Speaker, a 26 percent cut to 
the EPA. We, right now, in the city of 
Detroit and throughout Wayne County, 
we don’t even meet sulfur dioxide 
standards, right now, under the Clean 
Air Act. We suffer every single day. In 
one of my ZIP Codes, we have three 

times higher asthma hospitalization 
among adults. 

We need to push back on these cuts 
that, again, reflect on who is running 
this administration versus a reflection 
of the American people and their needs. 

It directly eliminates affordable 
housing programs within HUD. Not 
only is the food assistance being cut, 
the $181 billion in food assistance, they 
are going and proceeding on to create a 
culture that says that working folks, 
working-class residents, our most vul-
nerable, seniors, the vulnerable com-
munities—like our mothers and others 
who are taking care of their families— 
have to be left behind while we give 
cuts to the wealthy and to corpora-
tions. 

And so it is really critically impor-
tant the American people wake up and 
understand who is running our govern-
ment right now, because, right now, 
our government is not about people. 
This budget is a reflection of those val-
ues that are going to be people versus 
profit, and this budget is very clear: 
Our people are not coming first. And, 
from a community, again, that is a 
frontline community that always gets 
left behind—if it is not around edu-
cation funding, environmental funding 
to housing funding to food assistance, 
we are, again, the frontline commu-
nities of what doing nothing looks like. 

Madam Speaker, this budget is wrong 
for our country. It is destructive, and 
it is something that we need to be able 
to push back together on in a bipar-
tisan way. 

I thank my colleague, again, for this 
opportunity to express and be a voice 
for many of my residents back home in 
13 District Strong. 

Ms. PORTER. Madam Speaker, I 
yield to the gentleman from California 
(Mr. COSTA). 

Mr. COSTA. Madam Speaker, I thank 
the gentlewoman from California for 
the good work that she does on behalf 
of her constituents, and I appreciate 
the opportunity to make comments 
that are important investments that 
we should be making in our infrastruc-
ture for all Americans. 

The President, when he ran for office, 
talked about his willingness to invest 
in America’s infrastructure. Sadly, we 
have seen little follow-through on be-
half of the administration to do just 
that. 

America was built over decades and 
generations on Americans willing to 
invest in our infrastructure. Clearly, 
today, we are living off the invest-
ments our parents and grandparents 
made a generation or two ago. 

In California, but throughout the 
country, that includes fixing our aging 
water systems, our transportation sys-
tems, and investing in our school sites. 
In my home in the San Joaquin Valley, 
the development of water over the last 
100 years has allowed deserts to bloom. 

A reliable water supply is a founda-
tion for any economy. Farmers need 
water to feed the world. We say, 
‘‘where water flows, food grows,’’ and 

life becomes increasingly difficult 
when we have literally hundreds and 
thousands of Californians and else-
where around the country in which 
communities that are small, that are 
not incorporated, cannot meet or com-
ply with clean drinking water stand-
ards either by the State or by the Fed-
eral Government. That is just wrong. 

The richest country in the world, and 
yet we have communities that don’t 
meet clean drinking water standards? 

We know that many of these water 
systems were built decades ago. Cali-
fornia now has doubled its population. 
We need to invest. 

Madam Speaker, this last week, I in-
troduced legislation for critical water 
infrastructure in parts of my district, 
the west side of the San Joaquin Val-
ley, the Delta-Mendota Canal that has 
lost 15 to 20 percent of its capacity. 

The California Aqueduct that not 
only brings water from the north to the 
San Joaquin Valley but to Los Angeles 
as a critical supply of those water 
needs for Los Angelenos, these canals 
supply water to tens of millions of peo-
ple, and also to the Santa Clara Valley 
Water, the home of what? Silicon Val-
ley. 

The legislation that I introduced, the 
Conveyance Capacity Correction Act, 
will provide $400 million to fund these 
needed repairs. This is just one piece of 
legislation to address the many tools 
in our water toolbox in California’s 
aging water system, but we need to in-
vest now in our water infrastructure. 

We also need to invest now in our 
transportation system. The roads that 
were built in California and the high-
ways, the inner city and transit sys-
tems and our air transportation have 
really, post-World War II, been the rea-
son why California has become the 
Golden State. And we, again, are living 
off those investments our parents 
made. We need to make the same kinds 
of investments. 

When the President talks about $1 
trillion of investment across America, 
that is wonderful, and our Committee 
on Transportation and Infrastructure 
has sought where those needs should be 
felt. But to do that, you have to put up 
real money to match local, State dol-
lars with Federal money. 

We haven’t really provided any new 
Federal sources of funding since the 
1990s; and it is absolutely essential if 
we are going to have this sort of 21st 
century system of transportation that 
is intermodal, that is interconnected, 
that will be provided for people for 
work, for pleasure, and for a host of 
purposes to get from point A to point 
B, to ensure that they can do it safely, 
in a way that makes the quality of life 
absolutely better. 

So those are the challenges we face. 
We are working to put an infrastruc-
ture package together that will fund 
our roads and highways, our transit 
systems, our inner-city rail systems 
that include high-speed rail. 

We are building high-speed rail in 
California, and I have introduced legis-
lation that will provide money for fast 
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trains throughout the country, as well 
as in California. We are under con-
struction now. 

But that is one part of an overall 
connected system that makes sure that 
our air transportation, that our inner- 
city transportation and our roads and 
highways are connected as we see in 
Europe and in other parts of the world. 
That is the challenge. 

Madam Speaker, I think, if we can 
come together in a bipartisan fashion 
as we have done traditionally, we can 
overcome these challenges and invest 
in ways that do what? Provide good- 
paying jobs; because when you invest 
in the infrastructure—whether it is our 
water, our transportation, our 
schools—we are investing in Ameri-
cans, and those create the good-paying 
jobs that raise all boats for working 
people. And, really, that is what we are 
talking about here when we talk about 
investing: investing for working peo-
ple, for all Americans. 

Madam Speaker, I thank the gentle-
woman from Orange County for all of 
her good work. 

FREEDOM OF RELIGION 
Ms. PORTER. Madam Speaker, the 

administration’s Muslim ban has 
ripped families apart. Orange County 
families have endured this Muslim ban 
for 3 long years; yet, the President has 
doubled down, making it so much 
worse. 

Make no mistake, this policy is based 
on hate. It is based upon dividing us 
with fear. 

President Trump showed hostility to 
Muslims during his campaign. He 
called for a ‘‘total and complete shut-
down of Muslims entering the United 
States.’’ 

Just 7 days into office, the President 
signed the first version of the Muslim 
ban. This was never about national se-
curity. It was about anti-Muslim hate 
and discrimination. 

The families in my community, as 
well as families across the United 
States, are suffering. Families in my 
district are being torn apart by the 
ban. It is separating husbands from 
wives, mothers from children, and 
adults from their dying parents. 

Let me be clear: No individual or 
family should be discriminated against 
based on their religious beliefs. It is 
why I backed the Freedom of Religion 
Act, which would prohibit religious dis-
crimination in our immigration system 
and protect Americans of all faiths— 
not just Muslim Americans. 

I am proud that so many Americans 
have stood together to protest the ad-
ministration’s Muslim ban, to push 
back and to vote in Representatives 
like me who will fight discrimination. 

Today, because the American people 
made their voices heard, the House of 
Representatives began the process to 
repeal this shameful ban. I am proud to 
be a backer of that legislation, the NO 
BAN Act, and I will always support and 
celebrate the vibrant Muslim commu-
nity in Orange County. 

Madam Speaker, I yield back the bal-
ance of my time. 

THE TALE OF TWO CITIES 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under 

the Speaker’s announced policy of Jan-
uary 3, 2019, the gentleman from Illi-
nois (Mr. RUSH) is recognized for the 
remainder of the hour as the designee 
of the majority leader. 

Mr. RUSH. Madam Speaker, I thank 
the gentlewoman from California (Ms. 
PORTER) for yielding the balance of the 
hour, of her time, to me. 

Madam Speaker, may I inquire how 
much time I have remaining. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The gen-
tleman from Illinois has 40 minutes re-
maining. 

Mr. RUSH. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to sound the alarm among the 
shrinking Black population in cities 
across the U.S. According to a recent 
study by the University of Illinois at 
Chicago, the city of Chicago lost 350,000 
Black residents between 1980 and 2016. 

Madam Speaker, this is what I call 
‘‘Black exodus’’—not exodus, but 
‘‘Black exodus.’’ This intense ‘‘Black 
exodus’’ is a result of decades of dis-
investment and disenfranchisement. 
Sadly, the city of Chicago that so 
many African Americans looked to as a 
beacon of hope during the great migra-
tion has often failed to invest in its 
Black population. 

The economic, cultural, and political 
impact of Chicago’s Black community 
on our Nation has been immense: Louis 
Armstrong’s groundbreaking jazz ema-
nated from Chicago, Thomas Dorsey’s 
gospel rose up from Chicago, and 
Muddy Waters’ blues all came about in 
Chicago. 

b 1745 
Since 1945, until recently, the iconic 

Ebony Magazine, along with its sister 
magazine, JET magazine, chronicled 
Black civic and social life in Chicago 
and across the Nation. 

The first African American President 
of the United States began his political 
career on Chicago’s South Side. 

The story of Black Chicago is one of 
power and perseverance, often in the 
face of extreme resistance and resound-
ing prejudice. 

The UIC study stated that a lack of 
well-paying jobs and affordable housing 
are two main factors that have driven 
the decline in Chicago’s Black popu-
lation. The alarming statistics pre-
sented in this study are proof that the 
consequences of the predatory and prej-
udiced practices from the past are still 
present with us and still being felt at 
this very hour. 

Madam Speaker, the practice of red-
lining was invented, first occurred, in 
Chicago. 

Last September, I highlighted a 
study from Duke University that stat-
ed that redlining, the practice of re-
stricting the availability of conven-
tional mortgage loans in certain neigh-
borhoods based on their racial makeup, 
stole up to $4 billion from Chicago’s 
Black community during the 1950s and 
1960s. Chicago’s Black community was 
ripped off up to $4 billion because of 
redlining in the 1950s and 1960s. 

Now, some of the neighborhoods that 
African Americans were initially sys-
tematically forced into are, all of a 
sudden, quickly developing, which 
threatens to push out families who 
have lived there for generations. 

Redlining is being followed by the 
gentrifying that is occurring in Chi-
cago. 

Despite the creation, Madam Speak-
er, of 65,000 new jobs in downtown Chi-
cago between 2010 and 2015, Chicago’s 
predominantly Black communities saw 
a net reduction of 1,500 jobs. While 
65,000 jobs in the downtown area in-
creased, 1,500 jobs in Chicago were de-
creased from the Black community. 

Compounding, Madam Speaker, this 
reduction is the fact that over 700,000 
jobs are located within 30 minutes of 
Chicago’s downtown, in the predomi-
nantly White North Side of Chicago, 
but just 60,000 jobs are located within 
30 minutes of the South Side of Chi-
cago. 

Chicago is a tale of two cities. It al-
ways was and currently remains the 
tale of two cities: the wealthy, afflu-
ent, upper-middle-class North Side, and 
the poor, devastated communities on 
the South and the West Sides, both 
within 30 minutes of Chicago’s down-
town area. 

Many Black Chicagoans who reside 
on the South Side are thus deprived of 
the opportunity to earn a living in or 
near the community that they reside 
in. 

Madam Speaker, these startling 
trends are certainly not confined or re-
stricted just to Chicago or even to the 
Midwest. In fact, Madam Speaker, we 
can look right here in our Nation’s 
Capital, the city of Washington, D.C., 
for our next example. 

A recent Georgetown University 
study found that African Americans 
accounted for over 70 percent of the 
District’s population in 1970. By the 
year 2015, African Americans were just 
48.3 percent of the District’s popu-
lation, from 70 percent to less than 50 
percent in just a few years. 

Georgetown’s findings were strik-
ingly similar to the findings at the 
University of Illinois at Chicago. Soar-
ing housing prices and a diminished job 
market for those who were without a 
bachelor’s degree pushed longtime resi-
dents out of our Nation’s Capital, and 
they pushed out longtime residents in 
Chicago as well. 

Madam Speaker, we don’t look just 
at Chicago or our Nation’s Capital. 
Let’s look south to see the same trou-
bling trend. 

Austin, Texas, Madam Speaker, is a 
modern-day boomtown whose popu-
lation grew by 20 percent between 2000 
and 2010, a boomtown in Austin, Texas. 
During this same period, its African 
American population fell by over 5 per-
cent. 

A 2014 survey from the University of 
Texas at Austin found that 26 percent 
of African Americans who moved out 
and left Austin did so because the city 
had gotten too expensive. 
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