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the Bangladeshi American community, as they 
celebrate the centennial of the birth of Sheikh 
Mujib. 

f 

RECOGNIZING DAN OHL OF MALTA 

HON. GREG GIANFORTE 
OF MONTANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. GIANFORTE. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to honor Dan Ohl of Malta for going 
above and beyond to answer the call of duty 
and personally fly blood platelets to his local 
hospital in a time of need. 

Dan loves to fly. He says there’s nothing 
like seeing Montana’s stunning landscape 
from a different perspective. 

As a Montana Highway Patrolman, Dan 
spends a lot of time on the ground, lending a 
hand to fellow Montanans. It wasn’t until this 
past December that his love of flying and help-
ing others came together. 

In December 2019, Phillips County Hospital 
contacted Montana Highway Patrol for assist-
ance delivering blood from Great Falls to their 
clinic in Malta. The troopers came up with a 
plan to use a series of relays to transport the 
blood to Malta but ran into a problem when 
there wasn’t enough staff to execute it. That’s 
when Dan stepped up. 

Dan jumped into action and using his own 
Beach Craft Bonanza 6-seater, started the 
over 200-mile flight to Great Falls to meet the 
Red Cross at the local airport. He says it was 
the most precious cargo, aside from his family, 
he has had on his plane. When he touched 
down in Malta, he met with hospital staff who 
transferred the blood to the hospital. His quick 
delivery of blood saved a life. 

For Dan, this is why he went into serving in 
the Montana Highway Patrol: he wanted to 
help Montanans. Whether he’s on or off duty, 
as a patrolman, he’s called to step up in times 
of need and that’s exactly what he did. 

Madam Speaker, for selflessly helping his 
fellow Montanans, from the air and on the 
ground, I recognize Dan Ohl for his Spirit of 
Montana. 

f 

COMMEMORATING THE 50TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF SOUTHERN ILLI-
NOIS UNIVERSITY SCHOOL OF 
MEDICINE 

HON. DARIN LaHOOD 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. LAHOOD. Madam Speaker, I would like 
to recognize Southern Illinois University (SIU) 
School of Medicine for celebrating their 50th 
anniversary. 

SIU School of Medicine was established in 
1970 after the Illinois General Assembly 
passed a bill calling for a second state med-
ical school to be established in downstate Illi-
nois and achieved full accreditation in 1972. 
Today, SIU School of Medicine admits 72 of 
the best medical students from around the 
world each year. 

The medical education curriculum offered at 
SIU School of Medicine has brought the 
school national attention. The school’s con-

tinuing medical education program provides an 
extensive schedule of accredited conferences 
and symposia for physicians and other health- 
care professionals in central and southern Illi-
nois. 

I applaud the efforts of SIU School of Medi-
cine, its faculty, and students. They continue 
to provide quality medical education com-
mitted to improving local healthcare. I extend 
my sincere congratulations to SIU School of 
Medicine for a successful 50 years, and I wish 
them continued success going forward pro-
viding quality healthcare services to the resi-
dents of Central Illinois. 

f 

CERTOL INTERNATIONAL LLC 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Certol Inter-
national LLC for receiving Commerce City’s 
Business Appreciation 2020 Business on the 
Move Award. 

The Business on the Move Award recog-
nizes businesses bringing new employment, 
growth in sales or new capital investment to 
the city in the last year. Founded in 1979, and 
located in Commerce City since 2003, Certol 
International was an early pioneer in the man-
ufacturing of infection prevention products for 
the medical and dental markets. Creating in-
novative products in these markets remains a 
core competency today. The company works 
with distribution partners to ship to customers 
in national and international destinations. 

Certol International operates out of a 46,000 
square-foot building in Commerce City with a 
staff of 38. In 2019, they hired two more em-
ployees and contributed over a million dollars 
in capital investment. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
Certol International LLC for this well-deserved 
recognition from Commerce City. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF ART OWENS, 
RECIPIENT OF THE GREATER 
PITTSTON FRIENDLY SONS’ 
SWINGLE AWARD 

HON. MATT CARTWRIGHT 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. CARTWRIGHT. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to honor Art Owens, who will receive the 
Francis Swingle Award from the Greater 
Pittston Friendly Sons of St. Patrick. He will be 
honored at the group’s 106th annual gathering 
on Tuesday, March 17, 2020. 

Art was born January 12, 1959 to Sheldon 
and Eleanor Owens in Wilkes-Barre, Pennsyl-
vania. He attended grade school in Wilkes- 
Barre and graduated from E.L. Meyers High 
School in 1979. He earned an associate de-
gree in social science from Luzerne County 
Community College and a bachelor’s degree 
in liberal studies in social services, along with 
a certificate in gerontology from College 
Misericordia. 

Art’s career serving others began in 1975 in 
the dietary department at Mercy Hospital in 

Wilkes-Barre. As the volunteer director, Art 
was integral to the management of the volun-
teer department, developing therapies and 
projects like the Angel/Golden Tree Project. 
During his 20-year career at the hospital, he 
successfully built professional relationships 
with area social service organizations, and 
served on the Policy and Procedure Com-
mittee. Art was also vice president of the 
Mercy Hospital Auxiliary. For his efforts, he re-
ceived the Mercy Leadership Award and the 
Mercy Community/Professional Involvement 
Award. 

In 1996, Art accepted a position with the 
Make-A-Wish Foundation of Northeastern 
Pennsylvania as a wish granting director/vol-
unteer supervisor. He continued to make wish-
es come true for critically ill children, advanc-
ing to the position of program services director 
and then vice president of program services. 
He worked to secure over $100,000 in dona-
tions by building relationships with local busi-
nesses and organizations across Northeastern 
Pennsylvania. He recruited, hired, trained, and 
coordinated volunteers in wish granting and 
development during his time with the founda-
tion. 

In 2006, Art transitioned to the Luzerne In-
termediate Unit No. 18, assisting children in 
the Behavioral Health and Rehabilitative Serv-
ices Department. He currently provides serv-
ices to children who attend the Greater Nan-
ticoke Area School District. 

In addition to the Greater Pittston Friendly 
Sons of Saint Patrick, Art is a member of the 
Fraternal Order of Eagles, Aerie 353, and cur-
rently serves on the Scholarship Committee to 
help raise funds for local students to assist 
with college expenses. 

It is an honor to join the Greater Pittston 
Friendly Sons of St. Patrick as they recognize 
Art Owens as the recipient of the Francis 
Swingle Award. He has had a successful ca-
reer in service to his community, and I wish 
him all the best on this St. Patrick’s Day. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. PRAMILA JAYAPAL 
OF WASHINGTON 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Ms. JAYAPAL. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to include in the RECORD how I would have 
voted for the following votes had I not been 
necessarily absent. Had I been present, I 
would have voted: YEA on Roll Call No. 87; 
YEA on Roll Call No. 88; NAY on Roll Call No. 
89; and YEA on Roll Call No. 90. 

f 

HONORING ZACHARY DAVID 
GRADINGER 

HON. SAM GRAVES 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. GRAVES of Missouri. Madam Speaker, 
I proudly pause to recognize Zachary David 
Gradinger. Zachary is a very special young 
man who has exemplified the finest qualities 
of citizenship and leadership by taking an ac-
tive part in the Boy Scouts of America, Troop 
495, and earning the most prestigious award 
of Eagle Scout. 
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Zachary has been very active with his troop, 

participating in many scout activities. Over the 
many years Zachary has been involved with 
scouting, he has not only earned numerous 
merit badges, but also the respect of his fam-
ily, peers, and community. Most notably, 
Zachary has contributed to his community 
through his Eagle Scout project. 

Madam Speaker, I proudly ask you to join 
me in commending Zachary David Gradinger 
for his accomplishments with the Boy Scouts 
of America and for his efforts put forth in 
achieving the highest distinction of Eagle 
Scout. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO CORALYN 
ANDRESTAYLOR—28TH CONGRES-
SIONAL DISTRICT WOMAN OF 
THE YEAR 

HON. ADAM B. SCHIFF 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. SCHIFF. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
in honor of Women’s History Month. Each 
year, we pay special tribute to the contribu-
tions and sacrifices made by our nation’s 
women. It is an honor to pay homage to out-
standing women who are making a difference 
in my Congressional District. I would like to 
recognize a remarkable woman, Coralyn 
AndresTaylor of the Silver Lake neighborhood 
of Los Angeles, California. 

Coralyn AndresTaylor has more than thirty 
years of public health education program de-
velopment, implementation and management. 
Her lifelong passion for public health began 
with her undergraduate degree in Dietetics 
from the University of California, Davis and 
then moving on to earn a Master’s in Public 
Health from the University of California, Berke-
ley. Upon receiving her master’s degree, 
Coralyn was admitted to the prestigious As-
sembly Fellowship Program at the California 
State Capitol where her interests and edu-
cation in policy, finance, and health converged 
during her work with the Assembly Ways and 
Means Health Subcommittee. 

Ms. AndresTaylor, MPH, RDN, CLE, CHES 
is currently the Department Administrator for 
PIH Health Good Samaritan Hospital’s Com-
munity Health Education Department and Lac-
tation Resource Center. Her department over-
sees nutrition, cardiovascular health, stroke, 
perinatal health, breastfeeding, and diabetes. 
Since chronic diseases such as diabetes are 
both common and costly, Coralyn has a long-
standing interest in prevention and educates 
individual patients and their family members in 
creating lifelong healthy habits. As a master’s- 
prepared Registered Dietician Nutritionist, Cer-
tified Health Education Specialist, 
Cardiopulmonary Resuscitation Instructor and 
Certified Lactation Educator, she has applied 
her knowledge and skills for the benefit of di-
verse ethnic and disadvantaged communities 
throughout Los Angeles County. She contin-
ued to serve her community when she was 
appointed a Los Angeles City Health Commis-
sioner in 2016. 

With a passion for making a difference in 
her community, Ms. AndresTaylor volunteers 
with LINC Housing to help the formerly home-
less, and people in need of affordable housing 
move to a stable living environment. Coralyn 

is well-regarded in her faith-based community 
frequently serving as Lector at Sunday morn-
ing services, and volunteers as a Eucharistic 
minister at Our Mother of Good Counsel 
Church in Los Feliz. She also participates in 
and plans the Women’s Cornerstone retreats 
and Faith Sharing groups for her church. 

Coralyn and her husband, Peter have lived 
in Silver Lake for the past thirty-one years 
where they raised their two wonderful daugh-
ters, Andrea and Allyson. At home, Coralyn is 
the chief infection control and safety officer 
who frequently reminds her family and friends 
to wash hands, use sunscreen and wear bike 
helmets. 

I ask all Members to join me in honoring this 
exceptional, well-respected woman of Califor-
nia’s 28th Congressional District, Coralyn 
AndresTaylor. 

f 

HUNTER CYPRIAN 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Hunter Cyp-
rian for receiving the Arvada Wheat Ridge 
Service Ambassadors for Youth award. 

Hunter Cyprian is a student at Standley 
Lake High School and received this award be-
cause his determination and hard work have 
allowed him to overcome adversities. 

The dedication demonstrated by Hunter 
Cyprian is exemplary of the type of achieve-
ment that can be attained with hard work and 
perseverance. It is essential students at all 
levels strive to make the most of their edu-
cation and develop a work ethic which will 
guide them for the rest of their lives. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to Hun-
ter Cyprian for winning the Arvada Wheat 
Ridge Service Ambassador for Youth award. I 
have no doubt he will exhibit the same dedica-
tion and character in all of his future accom-
plishments. 

f 

DISABLED VETERANS EDUCATION 
RELIEF ACT 

HON. GREGORIO KILILI CAMACHO 
SABLAN 

OF THE NORTHERN MARIANA ISLANDS 
IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. SABLAN. Madam Speaker, today, I in-
troduce the Disabled Veterans Education Re-
lief Act, which would reinstate VA education 
assistance for disabled veterans in vocational 
rehabilitation and employment (VR&E) training 
in the event their school closes or courses are 
disapproved. Section 109 of the Forever GI 
Bill law extended these protections to students 
using GI Bill benefits but did not include stu-
dents using education benefits under the 
VR&E program. By extending these protec-
tions to the over 100,000 veterans who partici-
pate in the VR&E program every year, our na-
tion will ensure that all veterans can access 
relief when their studies are disrupted by 
school closures or disapproved courses 
through no fault of their own. 

The bill requires the VA to protect VR&E 
students on the same basis as their counter-

parts using GI Bill benefits as mandated by 
section 109 of the Forever GI Bill law. These 
protections include the restoration of benefits 
for those affected by school closures or the 
course was disapproved as a result of a modi-
fied policy, regulation, or law. In addition, my 
legislation authorizes the VA to continue pay-
ing subsistence allowances to VR&E students 
through the end of the academic term during 
which such closure or disapproval occurred. 
VA will also be required to notify affected stu-
dents of imminent and actual school closures 
and inform them how the closure will affect 
their VR&E benefits. 

The Act has the support of the Disabled 
American Veterans, American Legion, Para-
lyzed Veterans of America, Veterans of For-
eign Wars, Student Veterans of America, 
AMVETS, Association of the U.S. Navy, Mili-
tary Officers Association of America, National 
Military Family Association, and the Enlisted 
Association of the National Guard of the 
United States. 

The gentleman from Illinois, Mr. BOST, is an 
original cosponsor of the bill. 

I urge my colleagues to support this bipar-
tisan legislation. 

f 

WELCOME MABEL ROSE WILLS 

HON. JOE WILSON 
OF SOUTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. WILSON of South Carolina. Madam 
Speaker, I am happy to congratulate Justin 
Matthew Wills and Aimee Renee Wills, of Lex-
ington, South Carolina, on the birth of their 
new baby girl, Mabel Rose Wills. Mabel was 
born on Friday, March 6, 2020, weighing six 
pounds and eleven ounces and measured 
nineteen and three-quarter inches long at Lex-
ington Medical Center in West Columbia, 
South Carolina. 

Congratulations to her maternal grand-
parents, Kim and Rose Myers of Etna, Ohio, 
and her paternal grandparents, John and Eliz-
abeth Wills of Huntsville, Alabama. 

f 

RECOGNIZING SPACE COAST CITY 
FEST 

HON. BILL POSEY 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, March 12, 2020 

Mr. POSEY. Madam Speaker, on March 
28th and 29th, 2020, Brevard County families 
along with 100 business owners and 190 local 
church organizations will gather together to 
celebrate Space Coast City Fest. This uplifting 
event will take place at Space Coast Daily 
Park in Melbourne, FL, concluding a year and 
a half long outreach effort to unite the Chris-
tian Community. 

Space Coast City Fest was created as a re-
gion-wide campaign to serve churches in the 
community and promote faith-based works. 
Over a period of 18 months, CityFest and 
CityServe have worked to raise the level of in-
volvement of Brevard County churches in 
serving community needs. The focus of their 
initiatives include building long term partner-
ships with public and non-profit groups to help 
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