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Muslim East. Though it was absorbed into the 
Soviet Union in 1920, Azerbaijan again de-
clared its independence seven decades later 
in 1991, following the collapse of the Soviet 
Union. 

Azerbaijan’s Republic Day serves as a time 
to highlight and reflect on some of the coun-
try’s best qualities, including its strong relation-
ship with Israel, its focus on energy security, 
and its key role in regional stability. 

A Muslim-majority country, Azerbaijan also 
hosts a thriving, secure Jewish community, 
and the Azerbaijan-Israel bilateral relationship 
is strong. 

Additionally, Azerbaijan is committed to pro-
tecting global energy security, especially 
through its efforts regarding the Southern Gas 
Corridor, which will decrease the Caspian re-
gion’s dependence on Russian oil. 

A stalwart U.S. ally, Azerbaijan has aided 
U.S. and NATO forces by providing critical re-
fueling stations, and Azerbaijan’s troops have 
fought side-by-side with U.S. troops in Afghan-
istan. In addition, Azerbaijan has contributed 
to the security of Kosovo and Iraq and sup-
ports peacekeeping operations under the 
United Nations and NATO. Azerbaijan is also 
committed to global nonproliferation efforts 
and participates as a member of the Organiza-
tion for Security and Cooperation in Europe. 

Azerbaijan is a significant U.S. partner in a 
strategically important area of the world, and I 
urge my colleagues to join me to commending 
the people of Azerbaijan on their Republic 
Day. 
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Mr. SOTO. Madam Speaker, Pauline Ho is 
a U.S. Certified Public Accountant in both 
Florida and Washington, as well as a U.K. 
Chartered Accountant. Besides having a 
Bachelor of Science in Accounting from Hong 
Kong, her hometown, Pauline has obtained a 
master’s degree in administration from An-
drews University of Michigan, and a master’s 
degree in accounting from the University of 
Central Florida. 

In 2008, she founded Laus Consulting Serv-
ices LLC, a company providing accounting, 
payroll, tax, and consulting services to small 
businesses. During this COVID–19 pandemic, 
she proactively seeks to assist her clients by 
helping them navigate loans and secure finan-
cial assistance in these challenging times. 
Pauline is highly active in the local commu-
nities as well. She is the former President of 
the Chinese American Association of Central 
Florida, Vice Chair to both Finance and Busi-
ness Development Committees of Asian 
American Federation of Florida in Central Flor-
ida, and a Board of Directors member at Flor-
ida Symphony Youth Orchestra. 

Furthermore, Pauline actively holds the po-
sitions of Advisor of the Chinese School of 
CAACF, Auditor and Past Scholastic Award 
Chair of Asian American Heritage Council of 
Central Florida, Chair of REACH of Central 
Florida, which is a high school non-profit orga-

nization dedicated to serving the local commu-
nities, Board of Director of Mills 50, Board of 
Director of the Sharing Center, Board of Direc-
tor of United Against Poverty, and CPA of nu-
merous nonprofit organizations. 
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Mr. HASTINGS. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to celebrate the life of, and express sad-
ness over, the passing of an extraordinary 
woman, Elmira ‘‘Nana’’ V. Gilbert: Elmira 
moved to West Palm Beach, Florida when she 
was five years old and lived there for nearly 
nine decades. She passed away on March 5, 
2020, just a few months shy of her 105th 
birthday. 

She was one of 52 members to graduate 
from the first high school for African Ameri-
cans in Palm Beach County in 1935 and 
served as the vice president of her Class Re-
union Committee for many years. She always 
lived her life to the fullest, embracing her role 
as matriarch of the Shederick, Gilbert, King, 
Brown I, and Brown II French families. 

Elmira was an extremely resilient woman 
having survived the many injustices of seg-
regation and numerous hurricanes, including 
the deadly hurricane of 1928. I extend my 
heartfelt condolences to Elmira’s many family 
members and friends. Our nation grieves with 
you, and I pray that you may find comfort dur-
ing this extremely difficult time. 
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Mr. WILSON of South Carolina. Madam 
Speaker, Omega Psi Phi Fraternity has proven 
itself of serving the community as we all work 
to defeat the Wuhan virus. The Aiken Stand-
ard on May 25th in an article by Matthew 
Enfinger presented the following acts of kind-
ness. A presentation photo highlighted frater-
nity members Ray Williams, Everett Chandler, 
Anthony White, and Will Jones. Fraternity 
buys lunch for Aiken police Officers. 

‘‘In an effort to show support and thanks to 
local police, Aiken Omega Psi Phi chapter pro-
vided lunch to officers at the Aiken Depart-
ment Public Safety on Thursday. 

Around noon, members of the local chapter 
carried boxes of food and drinks provided by 
Chick-Fil-A in Aiken. [Owned by Tom Johnson] 

Ray Williams with the Sigma Pi chapter of 
Omega Psi Phi Fraternity, Inc., said it’s a way 
to give back to area officers who work daily to 
keep Aiken safe. 

In addition to serving Public Safety, another 
group from the fraternity served lunch to We 
Care Nursing Home in New Ellenton. 

‘‘We wanted to show some support for our 
Aiken Public Safety by providing them lunch 
because they’re putting themselves out on the 
line every day to protect and serve us regard-
less of the COVID–19 pandemic, ‘‘They’re still 
out there doing our best to keep us safe.’’ 

Chief Charles Barranco with ADPS said the 
support from the community through lunches 
and simple thank you’s has meant a lot to the 
law enforcement division. 

‘‘We’re part of the community and when the 
community partners with us it’s pretty cool to 
see the engagement especially when there’s a 
fire call or police call going on,’’ Barranco said. 
‘‘Many groups, such as the Omegas, have 
been part of COVID–19 response and we’re 
very thankful.’’ 
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Mr. COSTA. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
along with my colleague, Mr. TJ COX to honor 
and pay tribute to the life of local artist Mar-
garet Hudson, who passed away on February 
2, 2020 at the age of 93. Her iconic clay 
sculptures of California wildlife and young chil-
dren were loved for generations. 

Margaret Metzler was born to David and 
Sadie Metzler in Fresno, California. From a 
young age, Margaret enjoyed spending time 
outdoors with animals at her parent’s home in 
Fresno’s Old Fig Garden neighborhood. She 
and her family also loved hiking and camping, 
especially in Sequoia National Park. Her ap-
preciation of the Central Valley’s beautiful 
landscape grew from a young age, which 
would later influence her art. 

Margaret attended college in New England 
and studied art and theology. She would go 
on to serve as a missionary in Japan for sev-
eral years. Margaret met and married her hus-
band Gilbert Hudson in 1955 and shortly after 
moved to South Korea as missionaries. Gilbert 
taught physics, and Margaret taught English, 
at the University of Daegu. They had four 
sons in South Korea and lived there until 
1967. 

After returning to the United States, the 
Hudson family lived in various parts of the 
country. Her love for art blossomed when liv-
ing in New York, where she first began to ex-
periment with materials such as decaying barn 
wood and automotive trims. In Maryland, she 
began working with red clay. Margaret finally 
found her style of art in red clay and began 
sculpting from her memories of South Korea. 

In 1968, the family moved to Coalinga, Cali-
fornia, but after her husband became ill with 
Valley Fever, they moved to Fresno to be 
closer to family. Margaret realized after Gil-
bert’s recovery that she would need to help 
support the family financially. In 1972, she de-
cided to open a business, Earth Art’s Studio 
and became one of the first female arts entre-
preneurs in Fresno. 

In 1988, Margaret lost her father, son, and 
mother within one year. She used art as her 
therapy and created pieces that were much 
larger than her original work. After 20 years of 
working with clay, Margaret attended Fresno 
City College to expand her artistic abilities to 
include paint. In 1992, she went to London 
and Paris and was inspired to paint on can-
vas. That same year, Margaret held her first 
art show. 

Margaret’s artwork is a fixture throughout 
the Central Valley. Her ‘‘Mama Bear’’ sculp-
ture is displayed at Valley Children’s Hospital, 
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