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On behalf of the Eighth Congressional District 
of Georgia, I would like to thank Bill for his 
service to our state’s electric cooperatives and 
wish him the best of luck in his future endeav-
ors. 

f 

HONORING THE CAREER OF CAROL 
BRICK-TURIN 

HON. DEBBIE WASSERMAN SCHULTZ 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Ms. WASSERMAN SCHULTZ. Madam 
Speaker, it is with great pleasure that I rise to 
recognize the remarkable career of Carol 
Brick-Turin. After 12 years, Ms. Brick-Turin is 
retiring as the Executive Director of the Great-
er Miami Jewish Federation’s Jewish Commu-
nity Relations Council. 

Carol originally moved to Washington, D.C. 
to join the U.S. Department of Agriculture, 
where she worked on public policy issues for 
more than a decade. A graduate of Cornell 
University with a Bachelor of Science degree 
in agricultural economics, she was recruited to 
join the Foreign Agricultural Service (FAS), 
and served as a diplomat in Brussels, Belgium 
in the U.S. Mission to the European Commu-
nity. She was the first married female to serve 
as an Agricultural Attaché in the history of 
FAS. 

Carol attended the Foreign Service Institute, 
completed a study program taught by faculty 
of the Jewish Theological Seminary and at-
tended the University of Tel-Aviv in 1973— 
both before and after the Yom Kippur War. 
Having raised her children as Zionists, she 
now has three grandchildren who were born in 
Jerusalem, in addition to her two grand-
daughters in Miami. 

As the JCRC’s Executive Director Carol has 
adroitly mobilized and engaged Miami’s Jew-
ish community on many levels. She has led 
our citizen activists in building relationships 
with Members of Congress on both sides of 
the aisle, key to the success of the pro-Israel 
movement and the national agenda supported 
by the Jewish Council for Public Affairs. We 
have worked together to address a multitude 
of issues facing our community—from the 
scourge of anti-Semitism and senseless gun 
violence plaguing our schools and places of 
worship to ensuring we maintain our strong 
U.S.-Israel relationship. 

Carol’s commitment to Miami’s Jewish com-
munity and the state of Israel is exemplary, 
and I am proud to call her my very good 
friend. I will miss her guidance and wisdom, 
but our loss is her husband Alan and her fam-
ily’s gain. I wish her a hearty Mazel Tov on 
her retirement and am grateful for her invalu-
able work. 
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HONORING THE CITY OF FALLS 
CHURCH VIRGINIA 

HON. DONALD S. BEYER, JR. 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. BEYER. Madam Speaker, I rise today in 
honor of the City of Falls Church, Virginia. The 
City of Falls Church has recently been ranked 

the 3rd healthiest community in the United 
States in 2020 according to the U.S. News 
Healthiest Communities Report. 

Falls Church received nearly a perfect score 
for measurements including population health, 
education, and a perfect score for local econ-
omy—the highest score for economic health in 
the nation. 

Settled more than 300 years ago and situ-
ated less than 10 miles from the Capitol, Falls 
Church has had a front row seat to many of 
the nation’s most historic moments. Tradition 
holds that a copy of the Declaration of Inde-
pendence was read from the steps of The 
Falls Church, the city’s namesake, in 1776. 

Please join me in honoring the City of Falls 
Church for achieving such a monumental ac-
complishment. 
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MR. NAT O’DAY BIRTHDAY 
RECOGNITION 

HON. KAY GRANGER 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Ms. GRANGER. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize Mr. Nat O’Day, a North 
Texan and military veteran, as he celebrates 
his 90th birthday on September 27, 2020. 

Nat spent 20 years of his life serving in the 
U.S. Army achieving the rank of Lieutenant 
Colonel. He served overseas in South Viet-
nam, Korea, Japan, and Germany. Nat played 
a pivotal role in the modernization of our na-
tion’s military as he operated a communica-
tions system at over 52 sites across the world 
and tested flight equipment that is now used 
as today’s standard. During his military serv-
ice, Nat married the love of his life, Lynn, and 
they enjoyed over 60 years of marriage to-
gether. They raised three wonderful children, 
Robin O’Day Dettmer, Steve Ray O’Day, and 
Tim James O’Day. 

Nat has dedicated his life to our nation and 
his community in Fort Worth, Texas. Following 
his retirement from the Army, Nat worked for 
the City of Fort Worth for over 25 years. He 
was a devoted volunteer, spending over 20 
years and thousands of hours volunteering at 
the Fort Worth Symphony, the Van Cliburn 
Foundation, and Bass Performance Hall, 
where he and Lynn shared their love of music. 
He also volunteered every Tuesday for 20 
years at the Dallas Fort Worth International 
Airport helping travelers navigate the airport. 
Nat also dedicated his time to the Cook Chil-
dren’s Hospital, where he was rightfully named 
Volunteer of the Year. Nat is committed to 
helping the people of 12th District of Texas, 
and his business cards that read ‘‘Volunteer 
Extraordinaire’’ sum up his dedication and de-
votion to North Texas. 

I had the great honor and pleasure of hav-
ing Nat as an advisor on military affairs and as 
the Chairman of my military academy nomina-
tion board. I could not have done it without 
Nat’s commitment and enthusiasm. I am 
grateful to know and celebrate Nat O’Day. Our 
Nation and my district wouldn’t be the same 
without his decades of selflessness and dedi-
cation. 

On behalf of the 12th District of Texas, I 
offer my congratulations and best wishes to 
Nat on his very special birthday. 

HONORING BARBARA TURK 

HON. H. MORGAN GRIFFITH 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. GRIFFITH. Madam Speaker, I rise in 
honor of Barbara Duncan Turk of Radford, Vir-
ginia, who passed away on September 16, 
2020 at the age of 87. She was a faithful serv-
ant of her community who worked to improve 
it in a variety of volunteer roles. 

Barbara was a native of Reading, Pennsyl-
vania, and a graduate of Southern Seminary 
in Buena Vista, Virginia. She was married to 
her late husband, James Turk, a Virginia state 
senator and U.S. District Court Judge, for 59 
years until his death in 2014. 

Improving Radford and helping the people 
who lived there was her life’s work. Among the 
organizations she devoted her time and atten-
tion to were the Radford Women’s Club, 
Radford Community Hospital/Carilion New 
River Valley (NRV) Medical Center Volunteer 
Program, Radford Rotary Club, and the NRV 
Community Chorus. Radford University bene-
fited from her activity on the Board of Visitors, 
Foundation Board of Directors, Arts Society, 
and Athletic Association, just a few of the nu-
merous ways she supported the university’s 
mission. As a devout member of First Baptist 
Church, she sang in the choir and frequented 
Sunday services and Wednesday dinners. 
Barbara also served on her alma mater’s 
Board of Directors and on the Board of Direc-
tors for Saint Alban’s Foundation and Carilion 
Hospital. 

Barbara’s activities did not detract from her 
commitment to her family, including her chil-
dren Ramona Gravley, James Turk, Jr. and 
wife Allison, Judge Robert ‘‘Bobby’’ Turk and 
wife Laura, Mary T. Prince, and D. Michael 
‘‘Mick’’ Turk and wife Barbara; fifteen grand-
children; and five great-grandchildren. I would 
like to extend them my condolences on the 
loss of this generous and service-minded 
woman. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF THE CENTEN-
NIAL OF THE DISABLED AMER-
ICAN VETERANS (DAV) 

HON. ROBERT J. WITTMAN 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. WITTMAN. Madam Speaker, I rise 
today in recognition of the Centennial of Dis-
abled American Veterans (DAV) on Sep-
tember 25, 2020. I want to celebrate and com-
mend DAV for reaching a momentous mile-
stone: 100 years of virtuous and important 
work. 

The honorable undertakings of DAV do not 
go unrecognized. DAV Founder Robert Marx 
saw a gaping hole in society that veterans 
continued to fall through: underfunded medical 
care and services. This led him to create the 
non-profit, empowering veterans to live with 
respect, dignity, and with access to the sup-
port they deserve. 

Now, with over 1,000 chapters, DAV con-
tinues to make strides for veterans and their 
families. DAV has supported numerous vet-
erans from giving them rides to medical ap-
pointments to assisting with benefit claims to 
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connecting veterans with meaningful employ-
ment by hosting job fairs. On behalf of myself 
and the veterans in our region, I thank you for 
your continued support and efforts to ensure 
our veterans get to experience the American 
dream they fought to protect. 

Therefore, Madam Speaker, I ask you to 
join me in recognizing the centennial of Dis-
abled American Veterans. I thank DAV, for an 
outstanding first 100 years, and let us look for-
ward to another prosperous 100 years. 

f 

HONORING DR. PATRICK WELCH 

HON. BRIAN HIGGINS 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. HIGGINS of New York. Madam Speak-
er, I rise today to honor Dr. Patrick Welch, a 
Vietnam War veteran who made it his mission 
in life to ensure that veterans receive the ben-
efits they deserve. 

Dr. Welch enlisted into the United States 
Marine Corps at the young age of 17 and 
served in combat as an Infantry Squad Leader 
with the 3rd Division during the Vietnam War. 
He was severely injured on the battlefield and 
immobilized for two years. For his service, Dr. 
Welch was awarded the Purple Heart, the 
Combat Action Ribbon, the Good Conduct 
Medal, the National Service Defense Medal, 
the Vietnam Campaign Medal, Vietnam Serv-
ice Medals, and the New York State Con-
spicuous Service Cross. 

Like many veterans, when Dr. Welch re-
turned to Buffalo, New York from the war he 
was struggling with post-traumatic stress dis-
order (PTSD). He quickly realized that many 
of his fellow comrades were facing the same 
challenges he was. It was at that point that he 
decided to dedicate his life to raising aware-
ness about veterans’ mental health and he 
worked to provide avenues in which they 
could seek treatment. In doing so he substan-
tially altered the conversation about the mental 
health of veterans in Western New York. He 
promoted the idea that mental health isn’t a 
taboo subject but rather a reality for a number 
of veterans returning home. He often says 
‘‘War doesn’t break us, war changes us.’’ 

Those who know Dr. Welch can attest to the 
fact that he is a great leader, educator, and a 
speaker who uses his skills to advocate for 
veterans. Dr. Welch is an active member of 
the Vietnam Veterans of America, was the Di-
rector of Erie County Veterans Services, and 
the Director of the Center for Veterans and 
Veteran Family Services at Daemen College. 
His most treasured role was helping individual 
veterans as a Senior Mentor in the Buffalo 
Veterans Treatment Court. Dr. Welch currently 
serves as the Chair of the Community Vet-
erans Engagement Board of Western New 
York. He always works closely with our office 
to advocate for policies and services that ben-
efit veterans. Dr. Welch recently joined our 
Service Academy Advisory Committee to as-
sist those following in his footsteps to serve 
our nation. He has built relationships with 
many veterans in Western New York behind 
the scenes. In doing so he has set a solid 
precedent for how each one of us should treat 
veterans returning home after defending our 
freedom. 

Dr. Welch’s extensive work has laid solid 
groundwork for the next generation of leaders 

and advocates. His openness about his per-
sonal struggles has fostered an atmosphere 
within our community where veterans feel like 
they have a safe place to be supported and 
heal. I have closely worked with Dr. Patrick 
Welch for many years so it is my privilege 
today to personally thank him for his service 
and friendship. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. SCOTT PERRY 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. PERRY. Madam Speaker, I was un-
avoidably detained. 

Had I been present, I would have voted: 
YEA on Roll Call No. 196; YEA on Roll Call 
No. 197; and NAY on Roll Call No. 198. 

f 

IN HONOR OF REP. EDWARD 
BUTLER 

HON. CHRIS PAPPAS 
OF NEW HAMPSHIRE 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. PAPPAS. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to honor State Representative Ed Butler, who 
is retiring after twelve years of service to the 
citizens of New Hampshire. Rep. Butler served 
Carroll County District 7 for six terms in the 
New Hampshire House of Representatives. 

Rep. Butler, a fierce leader, has dedicated 
his career to championing progressive and in-
clusive legislation including defending LG 
BTQ+ rights, advocating for accessible health 
coverage, and supporting local small busi-
nesses. After years of faithful service and an 
unyielding commitment to furthering the cause 
of equality and justice for all Granite Staters, 
Rep. Butler made the difficult decision to fore-
go re-election in order to dedicate his time to 
helping his husband with the operation of their 
small business, the Notchland Inn, which has 
been impacted by the COVID–19 pandemic. 

Rep. Butler is known amongst colleagues as 
a hard worker who goes the extra mile to ad-
vocate for the betterment of his district. He 
has served as an example to many of what it 
means to be an effective and compassionate 
lawmaker. He approaches his work with good-
will, grace, and fervor. His embodiment of 
these values serves as a model to other rep-
resentatives and will continue to be a guiding 
principle in the General Court for decades to 
come. 

On behalf of my constituents in New Hamp-
shire’s First Congressional District, I want to 
thank Rep. Butler and his family for their years 
of dedication to our state. I congratulate him 
on his accomplished law-making career, and I 
wish him all the best in his future endeavors. 

f 

HONORING THE LIFE OF GIANA 
HUTTON 

HON. JAMIE RASKIN 
OF MARYLAND 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. RASKIN. Madam Speaker, I rise today 
to honor the life of my constituent from Silver 

Spring, Giana Hutton, who passed away unex-
pectedly on September 15, 2020. Originally 
from the south suburbs of Chicago, Giana 
graduated from Williams College with a Bach-
elor of Arts in History. She will be sharply 
missed. 

Giana was deeply committed to empowering 
young people and fighting for the rights of stu-
dents. While in her junior and senior years at 
Williams, Giana interned with Senator Ronald 
Burris as an Education & Judiciary Intern. Fol-
lowing graduation, she was selected as a Jun-
ior Associate Fellow in the Urban Education 
Leadership Program, where she worked with 
the District of Columbia Public Schools in the 
Office of Special Education to find potential 
community stakeholders to support inde-
pendent work habits for students with emo-
tional and learning disabilities. 

Giana later returned to school to receive her 
Master of Science in Public Policy and Man-
agement. During her second year, Giana in-
terned with Reading is FUNdamental Pitts-
burg, serving as its Outreach and Develop-
ment Intern. During her time with RIF Pitts-
burg, Giana was able to further work on her 
goal of reducing the achievement gap across 
socio-economic classes by raising money for 
literacy programs which provided students with 
greater access to books, activity-based 
projects to focus on the joys of reading and 
materials aimed at developing reading and 
comprehension skills. 

In 2013, Giana was selected as a recipient 
of the Public Service Career Opportunities 
Program Award. Through this prestigious 
award, Giana got a job as a Program Analyst 
working on federal grants to support low-in-
come students in the local charter and D.C. 
Public Schools. Through her job, Giana sup-
ported schools in providing students with sup-
plemental learning opportunities. 

Giana was a beloved sister of Alpha Kappa 
Alpha Sorority, Inc, an organization she joined 
because of its commitment to education. 
Through her involvement in Alpha Kappa 
Alpha, Giana was proud to be a part of a com-
munity in which she felt empowered and could 
inspire others. 

Giana will be remembered for her commit-
ment to empowering others and her dedication 
to providing educational opportunities for 
young people. I ask my colleagues to join me 
today in honoring the remarkable life of my 
constituent, Giana Hutton. 

f 

COMMEMORATING THE SMITH 
CREEK WATERSHED PARTNERSHIP 

HON. BEN CLINE 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, September 24, 2020 

Mr. CLINE. Madam Speaker, I rise today to 
discuss a unique public-private partnership 
that has yielded big conservation dividends for 
my home state of Virginia. 

Ten years ago, a dedicated group of land-
owners and partners gathered in a small 
Shenandoah Valley community to launch a 
unique initiative designed to improve local 
water quality through the power of Conserva-
tion, Collaboration and Community. Smith 
Creek was one of three ‘‘showcase water-
sheds’’ established by USDA’s Natural Re-
sources Conservation Service as part of a 
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