AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

REPORT

119TH CONGRESS
HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 119-44

1st Session

FILING RELIEF FOR NATURAL DISASTERS ACT

MARCH 27, 2025.—Committed to the Committee of the Whole House on the State
of the Union and ordered to be printed

Mr. SMITH of Missouri, from the Committee on Ways and Means,
submitted the following

REPORT

[To accompany H.R. 517]

[Including cost estimate of the Congressional Budget Office]

The Committee on Ways and Means, to whom was referred the
bill (H.R. 517) to amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to mod-
ify the rules for postponing certain deadlines by reason of disaster,
having considered the same, reports favorably thereon with an
amendment and recommends that the bill as amended do pass.

CONTENTS

@

Pag
I. SUMMARY AND BACKGROUND .....
A. Purpose and Summary ....... .
B. Background and Need for Leg ettt
C. Legislative HiStOTY ....cccceiiiiiiiiiieiieeiieeeeteeeee e
D. Designated Hearing ........cccccoccevviiiiieniiienieeiieiie et
II. EXPLANATION OF THE BILL ...
III. VOTE OF THE COMMITTEE ............
IV. BUDGET EFFECTS OF THE BILL ......cccccccovvvuennen.
A. Committee Estimate of Budgetary Effects ........cccccecovvevevieeninennnns
B. Statement Regarding New Budget Authority and Tax Expendi-
tures Budget Authority ..........ccccoovvieiieiiiieiiiiiiiciee e
C. Cost Estimate Prepared by the Congressional Budget Office .......
V. OTHER MATTERS TO BE DISCUSSED UNDER THE RULES OF
THE HOUSE ..ottt ettt
A. Committee Oversight Findings and Recommendations .. .
B. Statement of General Performance Goals and Objectives ............. 10
C. Applicability of House Rule XXI, Clause 5(b) ....cccccervuenuene .
D. Information Relating to Unfunded Mandates .........c.cccccvveervreennnes 10
E. Congressional Earmarks, Limited Tax Benefits, and Limited
Tariff Benefits ... 10
F. Duplication of Federal Programs ....
G. Tax Complexity ANalySiS ........cccceevieriieriiiiriiieiieniieeieenie e 10
VI. CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS REPORTED 11

59-006

OO WO WO=Ik kR wWwhN




The amendment is as follows:
Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Filing Relief for Natural Disasters Act”.

SEC. 2. MODIFICATION OF RULES FOR POSTPONING CERTAIN DEADLINES BY REASON OF DIS-
ASTER.

(a) AUTHORITY TO POSTPONE FEDERAL TAX DEADLINES BY REASON OF STATE-DE-
CLARED DISASTERS.—Section 7508A of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amend-
ed by redesignating subsections (c), (d), and (e) as subsections (d), (e), and (f), re-
spectively, and by inserting after subsection (b) the following new subsection:

“(c) SPECIAL RULE FOR STATE-DECLARED DISASTERS.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary (after consultation with the Administrator of
the Federal Emergency Management Agency) may, upon the written request of
the Governor of a State (or the Mayor, in the case of the District of Columbia),
apply the rules of subsections (a) and (b) to a qualified State declared disaster
in the same manner as a disaster, fire, or action otherwise described in sub-
section (a).

“(2) QUALIFIED STATE DECLARED DISASTER.—For purposes of this section, the
term ‘qualified State declared disaster’ means, with respect to any State, any
natural catastrophe (including any hurricane, tornado, storm, high water,
winddriven water, tidal wave, tsunami, earthquake, volcanic eruption, land-
slide, mudslide, snowstorm, or drought), or, regardless of cause, any fire, flood,
or explosion, in any part of the State, which in the determination of the Gov-
ernor of such State (or the Mayor, in the case of the District of Columbia)
causes damage of sufficient severity and magnitude to warrant the application
of the rules of this section.

“(3) STATE.—For purposes of this section, the term ‘State’ includes the District
of Columbia, the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico, the Virgin Islands, Guam,
American Samoa, and the Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana Islands.”.

(b) MANDATORY EXTENSIONS EXTENDED TO 120 DAYs.—Section 7508A(e) of such
Code, as redesignated by subsection (a), is amended—

(1) by striking “60 days” in paragraph (1)(B) thereof and inserting “120 days”,

(2) by striking “60-day” in paragraph (6) thereof and inserting “120-day”, and

(3) by striking “60-DAY” in the heading and inserting “120-DAY”.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by this section shall apply to dec-
larations made after the date of the enactment of this Act.

I. SUMMARY AND BACKGROUND

A. PURPOSE AND SUMMARY

The bill, H.R. 517, the “Filing Relief for Natural Disasters Act,”
as amended, was ordered reported by the Committee on Ways and
Means on February 26, 2025.

Under the provision, the Secretary may, upon written request of
the Governor of a State (or the Mayor of the District of Columbia),
and in consultation with the Federal Emergency Management
Agency (“FEMA”), apply the rules of subsection 7508A(a) and sub-
section 7508A(b) to a qualified State declared disaster in the same
manner as a disaster, fire, or action otherwise described in sub-
section 7508A(a).

“Qualified State declared disaster” is defined to include any nat-
ural catastrophe (including any hurricane, tornado, storm, high
water, wind-driven water, tidal wave, tsunami, earthquake, vol-
canic eruption, landslide, mudslide, snowstorm, or drought), or, re-
gardless of cause, any fire, flood, or explosion, in any part of the
State, which in the determination of the Governor of such State (or
the Mayor of the District of Columbia) causes damage of sufficient
severity and magnitude to warrant the application of the rules of
this proposal.



3

The term “State” includes the District of Columbia, the Common-
wealth of Puerto Rico, the Virgin Islands, Guam, American Samoa,
and the Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana Islands.

The provision also extends the mandatory 60-day suspension pe-
riod 1 from 60 days to 120 days.

B. BACKGROUND AND NEED FOR LEGISLATION

The Committee on Ways and Means has conducted oversight of
the IRS and the need for modernization. On February 11, 2025, the
Committee held a hearing titled “IRS Return on Investment and
the Need for Modernization,” to examine the lack of return on in-
vestment from funding provided by to the IRS by the Inflation Re-
duction Act and the need for information technology modernization
at the agency.2 In modernizing the administration of the tax laws,
the Committee considered how to ease the burden on taxpayers
who are recovering from a natural disaster.

While the IRS has the authority to postpone tax filing deadlines
for taxpayers impacted by federally declared national disasters, the
federal government may take weeks or months to issue such a dec-
laration. In many cases, States have the ability to move at a faster
pace than the federal government when an event necessitates the
declaration of a natural disaster within their borders. A delay in
the issuance of a disaster declaration can lead uncertainty and an
unnecessary burden on the taxpayer as they attempt to maintain
compliance with tax filing deadlines while recovering from a nat-
ural disaster.

To streamline the process and provide relief to taxpayers facing
these natural disasters, this bill authorizes the Secretary of Treas-
ury, in consultation with FEMA and the impacted State, to extend
relief to taxpayers that are impacted by natural disasters by post-
poning federal deadlines prior to a federal disaster declaration
being made. This bill also expands the mandatory extension from
a declared disaster from 60 to 120 days, to allow families to have
additional time to file taxes while recovering from the disaster.

The Committee on Ways and Means is committed to ensuring
that taxpayers facing natural disasters in their area receive relief
from tax deadlines in their time of need. This bill ensures that fam-
ilies have the flexibility to extend their tax deadline while they re-
build and recover after a state declared national disaster.

C. LEGISLATIVE HISTORY

Background

H.R. 517 was introduced on January 16, 2025, and was referred
to the Committee on Ways and Means.

1Sec. 7508A(e).

2H. Comm. On Ways and Means, Hearing: IRS Return on Investment and the Need for Mod-
ernization (Feb 11, 2025) https:/waysandmeans.house.gov/event/oversight-subcommittee-hear-
ing-on-irs-return-on-investment-and-the-need-for-modernization/.



Committee Hearings

On February 11, 2025, the Committee on Ways and Means held
a hearing titled, “IRS Return on Investment and the Need for Mod-
ernization.” 3

Committee Action

The Committee on Ways and Means marked up H.R. 517, the
“Filing Relief for Natural Disasters Act” on February 26, 2025, and
ordered the bill, as amended, favorably reported (with a quorum
being present).

D. DESIGNATED HEARING

Pursuant to clause 3(c)(6) of rule XIII, the following hearing was
used to develop and consider H.R. 517:
“IRS Return on Investment and the Need for Modernization”
on February 11, 2025.

II. EXPLANATION OF THE BILL

A. MODIFICATION OF RULES FOR POSTPONING CERTAIN DEADLINES
BY REASON OF DISASTER (SEC. 2 OF THE BILL AND NEW SEC.
7508A(c) AND SEC. 7508A(e) OF THE CODE)

PRESENT LAW

General time limits for filing tax returns and paying estimated tax

Individuals generally are required to file their Federal income
tax returns by April 15 of the year following the close of a taxable
year.* Present law also provides that the Secretary may grant rea-
sonable extensions of time for filing such returns.> Upon applica-
tion on the proper form, Treasury regulations provide an automatic
six-month extension (until October 15 for calendar-year individ-
uals) for any individual timely filing that form and paying the
amount of tax estimated to be due.®

In general, individuals are required to make quarterly estimated
tax payments by April 15, June 15, September 15, and January 15
of the following taxable year. Wage withholding is considered to be
a payment of estimated taxes.

Suspension of time periods

In general, the Secretary may specify a period of up to one year
that may be disregarded for performing various acts under the
Code, such as filing tax returns, paying taxes, or filing a claim for
credit or refund of tax, for any taxpayer determined by the Sec-
retary to be affected by a Federally declared disaster,” a significant
fire,® or a terroristic or military action?® with respect to any tax li-
ability of the taxpayer.l® In addition, the period specified by the
Secretary may be disregarded in determining the amount of any in-

31d.

4Sec. 6072.

5Sec. 6081.

6Treas. Reg. sec. 1.6081-4.

7 As defined by section 165(1)(5)(A).

8 Significant fire means any fire with respect to which assistance is provided under section
420 of the Robert T. Stafford Disaster Relief and Emergency Assistance Act.

9 As defined in section 692(c)(2).

10 Sec. 7508A.



5

terest, penalty, additional amount, or addition to tax, and the
amount of any credit or refund.

There are special rules provided for pension plans and other em-
ployee benefit plans. The Secretary may prescribe a period of up to
one year which may be disregarded in determining the date by
which any action by a pension or other employee benefit plan, or
by any sponsor, administrator, participant, beneficiary, or other
person with respect to such plan, affected by a Federally declared
disaster, a significant fire, or a terroristic or military action would
be required or permitted to be completed. A plan is not treated as
operating in a manner inconsistent with its terms or in violation
of its terms merely due to disregarding any such periods.

The suspension of time may apply to a wide variety of acts, in-
cluding the (1) filing of any return of income, estate, gift, employ-
ment, or excise tax; (2) payment of any income, estate, gift, employ-
ment, or excise tax; (3) allowance of a credit or refund of any tax;
(4) assessment of any tax; (5) collection of the amount of any liabil-
ity in respect of any tax; (6) notice or demand for payment of any
tax or with respect to any liability of tax; and (7) any other act re-
quired or permitted under the internal revenue laws specified by
the Secretary of the Treasury.ll The types of acts for which time
may be suspended are identified in a related provision and incor-
porated by reference.12

For a tax-related deadline to be postponed under this authority,
the Internal Revenue Service (“IRS”) generally will publish, as soon
as practicable after the declaration of the disaster, significant fire,
or occurrence of a terroristic or military action, a revenue ruling,
revenue procedure, notice, announcement, news release, or other
guidance authorizing the postponement and describing the acts
postponed, the postponement period, and the location of the cov-
ered disaster area.l?

Mandatory 60-day suspension

In the case of a Federally declared disaster, qualified taxpayers
have a mandatory 60-day period that is disregarded in determining
whether the acts listed above were performed in the time pre-
scribed; the amount of any interest, penalty, additional amount, or
addition to tax; and the amount of any credit or refund.'* The 60-
day period begins on the earliest incident date specified in the dec-
laration to which the relevant disaster area relates and ends on the
date which is the later of 60 days after the earliest incident date
so specified or the date such declaration was issued. In the case of
multiple declarations, a separate 60-day period shall be calculated

11Treas. Reg. sec. 301.7508A-1. The regulations note that the IRS may postpone deadlines
for performing certain acts with respect to taxes other than taxes not administered by the IRS
such as firearms tax (chapter 32, section 4181); harbor maintenance tax (chapter 36, section
4461); and alcohol and tobacco taxes (subtitle E).

12Sec. 7508(a)(1)(A) through (K). Under Treasury regulations, additional acts were added to
this list with respect to affected pension plans and affected taxpayers with respect to such plans:
Making contributions to a qualified retirement plan (within the meaning of section 4974(c))
under section 219(f)(3), 404(a)(6), 404(h)(1)(B), or 404(m)(2); making distributions under section
408(d)(4); recharacterizing contributions under section 408A(d)(6); or making a rollover under
section 402(c), 403(a)(4), 403(b)(8), or 408(d)(3). Treas. Reg. sec. 301.7508A—1(c)(1)(iii). In addi-
tion, Revenue Procedure 2018-58, 2018-50 I.R.B. 990, supplements the list of postponed acts
in section 7508(a)(1) and Treasury Regulation section 301.7508A-1(c)(1) with an additional list
of time-sensitive acts.

13 Treas. Reg. sec. 301.7508A—1(e).

14 Sec. 7805A(d)(1).



6

with respect to each declaration. The 60-day period is disregarded
in determining under the internal revenue laws, in respect of any
tax liability of a qualified taxpayer, whether any of the specified
acts to which the extension applies were performed within the time
prescribed (without regard to any extensions otherwise provided for
periods after the 60-day period). The mandatory 60-day period pro-
vided is in addition to, or concurrent with, any period of suspension
provided by the Secretary. In the case of multiple declarations, a
separate 60-day period shall be calculated with respect to each dec-
laration.

Qualified taxpayers are (1) any individual whose principal resi-
dence is located in a disaster area, (2) any taxpayer if the tax-
payer’s principal place of business (other than the business of per-
forming services as an employee) is located in a disaster area, (3)
any individual who is a relief worker affiliated with a recognized
government or philanthropic organization and who is assisting in
a disaster area, (4) any taxpayer whose records necessary to meet
a deadline for the acts listed above are maintained in a disaster
area, (5) any individual visiting a disaster area who was killed or
injured as a result of the disaster, and (6) solely with respect to a
joint return, any spouse of an individual who is a qualified tax-
payer.

Statute of limitations on credit or refund

In general, a taxpayer is required to file a claim for credit or re-
fund of an overpayment of tax within three years from the time the
return was filed or two years from the time the tax was paid,
whichever expires later.15 If the taxpayer did not file a return, the
taxpayer is required to file a claim for credit or refund within two
years from the time the tax was paid.l® No credit or refund is al-
lowed or made after the expiration of this period of limitation, un-
1es(s1 tl'%le taxpayer files a claim for credit or refund within such pe-
riod.

If a taxpayer files a claim for credit or refund during the three-
year limitation period, the amount of credit or refund is limited to
the portion of tax paid within the three years immediately before
filing the claim plus the period of any extension of time for filing
the return.1® If the claim was not filed within the three-year pe-
riod, the amount of credit or refund is limited to the two years im-
mediately preceding the filing of the claim.1®

REASONS FOR CHANGE

The Committee believes that taxpayers affected by disaster, sig-
nificant fire, terroristic or military actions should receive prompt
and clear guidance from the IRS to prevent confusion, particularly
when such events occur around tax filing season. The Committee
notes that disasters are typically recognized much more swiftly at
the State level than at the Federal level. Thus, the Committee be-
lieves a State declaration of disaster should be sufficient to allow

15Sec. 6511(a).

16 Jbid.

17Sec. 6511(b)(1).

18 Sec. 6511(b)(2)(A). Any withholding and estimated taxes paid are deemed paid on April 15th
in the year following the close of the tax year in which the tax is allowable as a credit. Sec.

6513(b).
19 Sec. 6511(b)(2)(B).



7

the IRS to grant postponements of tax filing and payment dead-
lines and extensions of time for actions related to pension or other
employee benefits plans to affected taxpayers. The Committee also
believes that a lengthened mandatory filing extension period en-
sures taxpayers have sufficient time and resources to recover after
a Federally declared disaster before addressing their tax obliga-
tions.

EXPLANATION OF PROVISION

Under the provision, the Secretary may (after consultation with
the Administrator of the Federal Emergency Management Agency),
upon written request of the Governor of a State (or the Mayor of
the District of Columbia), apply the rules of subsection 7508A(a)
(related to disregarded deadlines for filing and payment) and sub-
section 7508A(b) (related to extensions of time for actions required
or permitted to be completed with respect to pension or other em-
ployee benefit plans) to a qualified State declared disaster in the
same manner as a disaster, fire, or action otherwise described in
subsection 7508A(a).

“Qualified State declared disaster” is defined to include any nat-
ural catastrophe (including any hurricane, tornado, storm, high
water, wind-driven water, tidal wave, tsunami, earthquake, vol-
canic eruption, landslide, mudslide, snowstorm, or drought), or, re-
gardless of cause, any fire, flood, or explosion, in any part of the
State, which in the determination of the Governor of such State (or
the Mayor of the District of Columbia) causes damage of sufficient
severity and magnitude to warrant the application of the rules of
this proposal.

The term “State” includes the District of Columbia, the Common-
wealth of Puerto Rico, the Virgin Islands, Guam, American Samoa,
and the Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana Islands.

The provision also extends the mandatory 60-day suspension pe-
riod 29 from 60 days to 120 days.

EFFECTIVE DATE

The provision applies to declarations made after the date of en-
actment.

III. VOTE OF THE COMMITTEE

Pursuant to clause 3(b) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House of
Representatives, the following statement is made concerning the
vote of the Committee on Ways and Means in its consideration of
H.R. 517, the “Filing Relief for Natural Disasters Act,” on February
26, 2025.

The bill, H.R. 5617 was ordered favorably reported to the House
of Representatives as amended by a roll call vote of 42 yeas to 0
nays (with a quorum being present). The vote was as follows:

Representative Yea Nay Present Representative Yea Nay Present

Mr. Smith (MO) oo X Mr. Neal X e
Mr. Buchanan ... . Mr. Doggett

Mr. Smith (NE) Mr. Thompson
Mr. Kelly ...... Mr. Larson ...

20 Sec. 7508A(e).



Representative Yea Nay Present Representative Yea Nay Present
Mr. Schweikert .......ocooevvereneenenens X M. DaViS o X
Mr. LaHood ....... e X Ms. Sanchez X
Mr. Arrington . X Ms. Sewell ....... X
Mr. Estes ... X Ms. DelBene X
Mr. Smucker .. e X Ms. Chu X
Mr. Hern .....coveeee. e X Ms. Moore (W) +..covvveirierirs X
Mrs. Miller (WV) .. X Mr. Boyle oo X
Dr. Murphy ... e X Mr. BEYEr oo X
Mr. Kustoff ..... X Mr EVANS s X
Mr. Fitzpatrick .....cooovveeverierieinnes X Mr. Schneider ........cocoevverrernnnnns X
Mr. Steube ..... e X Mr. Panetta .......cooovvereecennereiinnens X
Ms. Tenney ..... X ME. GOMEZ oo X
Mrs. Fischbach ... X Mr. Horsford .....cccoocenvevnerirerinenns X
Mr. Moore (UT) oo X Ms. Plaskett .......ccocorieeermereernnens X .
Ms. Van Duyne .......cccccoevrmrennens X M. SUOZZI .o ) S
Mr. Feenstra ....... X
Ms. Malliotakis ... X
Mr. Carey . X
Mr. Yakym ...... X
Mr. Miller (OH) e X
Mr. Bean ........ X
Mr. MOran ... X

IV. BUDGET EFFECTS OF THE BILL

A. COMMITTEE ESTIMATE OF BUDGETARY EFFECTS

In compliance with clause 3(d) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the following statement is made con-
cerning the effects on the budget of the bill, H.R. 517 as reported.
The estimate prepared by the Congressional Budget Office (CBO)
is included below.

The bill is estimated to have a negligible effect on Federal fiscal
year budget receipts for the period 2025 through 2034.

B. STATEMENT REGARDING NEW BUDGET AUTHORITY AND TAX
EXPENDITURES BUDGET AUTHORITY

In compliance with clause 3(c)(2) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee states that the bill in-
volves no new or increased budget authority.

C. CosT ESTIMATE PREPARED BY THE CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET
OFFICE

In compliance with clause 3(c)(3) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, requiring a cost estimate prepared by
the CBO, the following statement by CBO is provided.



H.R. 517, Filing Relief for Natural Disasters Act
As ordered reported by the House Committee on Ways and Means on February 26, 2025

By Fiscal Year, Millions of Dollars 2025 2025-2030 2025-2035
Direct Spending (Outlays) 0 0 0
Revenues * * *
Increase or Decrease (-) N N '

in the Deficit

Spending Subject to * * -
Appropriation (Outlays) Not estimated
Increases net direct spending in Statutory pay-as-you-go procedures apply? Yes
any of the four consecutive 10-year No

periods beginning in 2036? Mandate Effects

Increases on-budget deficits in any Contains intergovernmental mandate? No
of the four consecutive 10-year *

periods beginning in 20367 Contains private-sector mandate? No

* = between -$500,000 and $500,000.

H.R. 517 would amend the Internal Revenue Code to modify the
rules for postponing certain tax deadlines in response to declared
disasters. The bill would permit the Secretary of the Treasury, in
the case of certain state-declared disasters, to grant filing exten-
sions that are similar to those granted in the event of federally de-
clared disasters. The bill also would increase deadline extensions
from 60 days to 120 days.

The Congressional Budget Act of 1974, as amended, stipulates
that revenue estimates provided by the staff of the Joint Com-
mittee on Taxation (JCT) are the official estimates for all tax legis-
lation considered by the Congress. CBO therefore incorpor ates
such estimates into its cost estimates of the effects of legislation.
The revenue estimates for the bill were provided by JCT.! JCT esti-
mates that the bill would reduce federal revenues by an insignifi-
cant amount.

CBO estimates that it would cost less than $500,000 over the
2025-2030 period to implement the bill. Any related spending
would be subject to the availability of appropriated funds.

The CBO staff contact for this estimate is Jennifer Shand. The
estimate was reviewed by John McClelland, Director of Tax Anal-
ysis.

PHILLIP L. SWAGEL,
Director, Congressional Budget Office.

V. OTHER MATTERS TO BE DISCUSSED UNDER THE
RULES OF THE HOUSE

A. COMMITTEE OVERSIGHT FINDINGS AND RECOMMENDATIONS

With respect to clause 3(c)(1) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee made findings and rec-
ommendations that are reflected in this report.

1 See Joint Committee on Taxation Description of H.R. 517, the “Filing Relief for Natural Dis-
asters Act,” JCX-12-25 (February 24, 2025), www.jct.gov/publications/2025/jcx-12-25; and De-
scription of the Chairman’s Amendment in the Nature of a Substitute to H.R. 517, the “Filing
Relief for Natural Disasters Act,” JCX-14-25 (February 25, 2025), www.jct.gov/publications/
2025/jcx-14-25.



10

B. STATEMENT OF GENERAL PERFORMANCE GOALS AND OBJECTIVES

With respect to clause 3(c)(4) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee advises that the bill does
not authorize funding, so no statement of general performance
goals and objectives is required.

C. APPLICABILITY OF HOUSE RULE XXI, CLAUSE 5(b)

Rule XXI 5(b) of the Rules of the House of Representatives pro-
vides, in part, that “A bill or joint resolution, amendment, or con-
ference report carrying a Federal income tax rate increase may not
be considered as passed or agreed to unless so determined by a
vote of not less than three-fifths of the Members voting, a quorum
being present.” The Committee has carefully reviewed the bill, and
states that the bill does not provide such a Federal income tax rate
increase.

D. INFORMATION RELATING TO UNFUNDED MANDATES

This information is provided in accordance with section 423 of
the Unfunded Mandates Reform Act of 1995 (Pub. L. No. 104-4).

The Committee has determined that the bill does not contain
Federal mandates on the private sector. The Committee has deter-
mined that the bill does not impose a Federal intergovernmental
mandate on State, local, or tribal governments.

E. CONGRESSIONAL EARMARKS, LIMITED TAX BENEFITS, AND
LiMITED TARIFF BENEFITS

With respect to clause 9 of rule XXI of the Rules of the House
of Representatives, the Committee has carefully reviewed the pro-
visions of the bill, and states that the provisions of the bill do not
contain any congressional earmarks, limited tax benefits, or limited
tariff benefits within the meaning of the rule.

F. DUPLICATION OF FEDERAL PROGRAMS

In compliance with clause 3(c)(5) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, the Committee states that no provision
of the bill establishes or reauthorizes: (1) a program of the Federal
Government known to be duplicative of another Federal program,;
(2) a program included in any report from the Government Ac-
countability Office to Congress pursuant to section 21 of Public
Law 111-139; or (3) a program related to a program identified in
the most recent Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance, published
pursuant to the Federal Program Information Act (Pub. L. No. 95—
220, as amended by Pub. L. No. 98-169).

G. Tax COMPLEXITY ANALYSIS

Section 4022(b) of the Internal Revenue Service Reform and Re-
structuring Act of 1998 (the “IRS Reform Act”) requires the staff
of the Joint Committee on Taxation (in consultation with the Inter-
nal Revenue Service and the Treasury Department) to provide a
tax complexity analysis. The complexity analysis is required for all
legislation reported by the Senate Committee on Finance, the
House Committee on Ways and Means, or any committee of con-



11

ference if the legislation includes a provision that directly or indi-
rectly amends the Internal Revenue Code and has widespread ap-
plicability to individuals or small businesses.

The staff of the Joint Committee on Taxation has determined
that there are no provisions that are of widespread applicability to
individuals or small businesses.

VI. CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS
REPORTED

A. TEXT OF EXISTING LAW AMENDED OR REPEALED BY THE BILL, AS
REPORTED

Pursuant to clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the House of
Representatives, the text of each section proposed to be repealed by
the bill is shown below:

CHANGES IN EXISTING LAW MADE BY THE BILL, AS REPORTED

In compliance with clause 3(e) of rule XIII of the Rules of the
House of Representatives, changes in existing law made by the bill,
as reported, are shown as follows (existing law proposed to be omit-
ted is enclosed in black brackets, new matter is printed in italics,
and existing law in which no change is proposed is shown in
roman):

INTERNAL REVENUE CODE OF 1986

* * * * * * *

Subtitle F—Procedure and Administration

* * & & * * &

CHAPTER 77—MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

* * k & * * k

SEC. 7508A. AUTHORITY TO POSTPONE CERTAIN DEADLINES BY REA-
SON OF FEDERALLY DECLARED DISASTER, SIGNIFICANT
FIRE, OR TERRORISTIC OR MILITARY ACTIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a taxpayer determined by the
Secretary to be affected by a federally declared disaster (as defined
by section 165(i)(5)(A)), a significant fire, or a terroristic or military
action (as defined in section 692(c)(2)), the Secretary may specify
a period of up to 1 year that may be disregarded in determining,
under the internal revenue laws, in respect of any tax liability of
such taxpayer—

(1) whether any of the acts described in paragraph (1) of sec-
tion 7508(a) were performed within the time prescribed there-
for (determined without regard to extension under any other
provision of this subtitle for periods after the date (determined
by the Secretary) of such disaster, fire, or action),

(2) the amount of any interest, penalty, additional amount,
or addition to the tax for periods after such date, and

(3) the amount of any credit or refund.



12

(b) SPECIAL RULES REGARDING PENSIONS, ETC..—In the case of a
pension or other employee benefit plan, or any sponsor, adminis-
trator, participant, beneficiary, or other person with respect to such
plan, affected by a disaster, fire, or action described in subsection
(a), the Secretary may specify a period of up to 1 year which may
be disregarded in determining the date by which any action is re-
quired or permitted to be completed under this title. No plan shall
be treated as failing to be operated in accordance with the terms
of the plan solely as the result of disregarding any period by reason
of the preceding sentence.

(¢) SPECIAL RULE FOR STATE-DECLARED DISASTERS.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary (after consultation with the
Administrator of the Federal Emergency Management Agency)
may, upon the written request of the Governor of a State (or the
Mayor, in the case of the District of Columbia), apply the rules
of subsections (a) and (b) to a qualified State declared disaster
in the same manner as a disaster, fire, or action otherwise de-
scribed in subsection (a).

(2) QUALIFIED STATE DECLARED DISASTER.—For purposes of
this section, the term “qualified State declared disaster” means,
with respect to any State, any natural catastrophe (including
any hurricane, tornado, storm, high water, winddriven water,
tidal wave, tsunami, earthquake, volcanic eruption, landslide,
mudslide, snowstorm, or drought), or, regardless of cause, any
fire, flood, or explosion, in any part of the State, which in the
determination of the Governor of such State (or the Mayor, in
the case of the District of Columbia) causes damage of sufficient
severity and magnitude to warrant the application of the rules
of this section.

(3) STATE.—For purposes of this section, the term “State” in-
cludes the District of Columbia, the Commonwealth of Puerto
Rico, the Virgin Islands, Guam, American Samoa, and the
Commonuwealth of the Northern Mariana Islands.

[(©)] (d) SPECIAL RULES FOR OVERPAYMENTS.—The rules of sec-
tion 7508(b) shall apply for purposes of this section.

[(d)]1 (e) MANDATORY [60-DAY] 120-DAY EXTENSION.—

(l)dIN GENERAL.—In the case of any qualified taxpayer, the
period—

(A) beginning on the earliest incident date specified in
the declaration to which the disaster area referred to in
paragraph (2) relates, and

(B) ending on the date which is [60 days] 120 days after
the later of such earliest incident date described in sub-
paragraph (A) or the date such declaration was issued,

shall be disregarded in determining, under the internal rev-
enue laws, in respect of any tax liability of such qualified tax-
payer, whether any of the acts described in subparagraphs (A)
through (F) of section 7508(a)(1) were performed within the
time prescribed therefor (determined without regard to exten-
sion under any other provision of this subtitle for periods after
the date determined under subparagraph (B)).

(2) QUALIFIED TAXPAYER.—For purposes of this subsection,
the term “qualified taxpayer” means—

(A) any individual whose principal residence (for pur-
poses of section 1033(h)(4)) is located in a disaster area,



13

(B) any taxpayer if the taxpayer’s principal place of busi-
ness (other than the business of performing services as an
employee) is located in a disaster area,

(C) any individual who is a relief worker affiliated with
a recognized government or philanthropic organization and
who is assisting in a disaster area,

(D) any taxpayer whose records necessary to meet a
deadline for an act described in section 7508(a)(1) are
maintained in a disaster area,

(E) any individual visiting a disaster area who was
killed or injured as a result of the disaster, and

(F) solely with respect to a joint return, any spouse of an
individual described in any preceding subparagraph of this
paragraph.

(3) DISASTER AREA.—For purposes of this subsection, the
term “disaster area” means an area in which a major disaster
for which the President provides financial assistance under
section 408 of the Robert T. Stafford Disaster Relief and Emer-
gency Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 5174) occurs.

(4) APPLICATION TO RULES REGARDING PENSIONS.—In the case
of any person described in subsection (b), a rule similar to the
rule of paragraph (1) shall apply for purposes of subsection (b)
with respect to—

(A) making contributions to a qualified retirement plan
(within the meaning of section 4974(c)) under section
219(f)(3), 404(a)(6), 404(h)(1)(B), or 404(m)(2),

(B) making distributions under section 408(d)(4),

(C) recharacterizing contributions wunder section
408A(d)(6), and

(D) making a rollover under section 402(c), 403(a)(4),
403(b)(8), or 408(d)(3).

(5) COORDINATION WITH PERIODS SPECIFIED BY THE SEC-
RETARY.—Any period described in paragraph (1) with respect to
any person (including by reason of the application of paragraph
(4)) shall be in addition to (or concurrent with, as the case may
be) any period specified under subsection (a) or (b) with respect
to such person.

(6) MULTIPLE DECLARATIONS.—For purposes of paragraph (1),
in the case of multiple declarations relating to a disaster area
which are issued within a [60-dayl 120-day period, a separate
period shall be determined under such paragraph with respect
to each such declaration.

[(e)] (f) SIGNIFICANT FIRE.—For purposes of this section, the
term “significant fire” means any fire with respect to which assist-
ance is provided under section 420 of the Robert T. Stafford Dis-
aster Relief and Emergency Assistance Act.

* * *k & * * *k

O




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-04-12T00:26:29-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




