S4642

Employees, the National Treasury Em-
ployees Union, and the list goes on.

This amendment makes abundant
sense. Our clear intent is to allow
those who are under Federal employ-
ees’ health benefit plans to take advan-
tage of enrolling their children now.
This amendment basically clarifies
that law so that OPM can move for-
ward to enroll children up to the age of
26 immediately and not wait until Jan-
uary of next year, causing a lapse in
coverage. It is a bipartisan amend-
ment, insignificant cost. I hope it will
be cleared so I may offer it, and hope-
fully we can act on it without too
much time.

I yield the floor.

——————

RECESS

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under
the previous order, the Senate stands
in recess until 2:15 p.m.

Thereupon, the Senate, at 12:38 p.m.,
recessed until 2:16 p.m. and reassem-
bled when called to order by the Pre-
siding Officer (Mr. BEGICH).

——————

AMERICAN JOBS AND CLOSING
TAX LOOPHOLES ACT OF 2010—
Continued

Mr. BINGAMAN. Mr. President, I
suggest the absence of a quorum.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will call the roll.

The legislative clerk proceeded to
call the roll.

Mr. BAUCUS. Mr. President, I ask
unanimous consent that the order for
the quorum call be rescinded.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

Mr. BAUCUS. Mr. President, the Sen-
ator from Alabama took issue with the
use of an emergency designation in the
substitute before us. Let me take a mo-
ment to explain why that use of the
emergency designation is entirely ap-
propriate.

First, the concluding section of the
amendment designates two items as
emergency items. Those items are un-
employment insurance and additional
payments to States under Medicaid.
Both of these items are directly related
to the economic emergency that we
find ourselves in; namely, the great re-
cession.

From the beginning of emergency
designations, with the Budget Enforce-
ment Act of 1990, Congress has recog-
nized periods of recession as true emer-
gencies, and that makes good economic
sense as well. It makes good sense to
allow automatic stabilizers such as un-
employment insurance and Medicaid to
spend more when the economy is in
rough shape. Programs such as unem-
ployment insurance and Medicaid help
to cushion the blow for those hurt by
bad economic times. Programs such as
unemployment insurance and Medicaid
help to increase economic demand, and
that helps to keep the recession short-
er than it otherwise would be.

That is why the old Gramm-Rudman-
Hollings law provided for exceptions to

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

budget discipline in periods of reces-
sion. It is why the Budget Enforcement
Act carried on that policy by allowing
exceptions for budget emergencies, and
budget resolutions have carried that
policy further to the current day.

The Senator from Alabama also took
issue with the budgetary treatment of
payments to doctors under Medicare.
That provision is in our amendment,
paying doctors at the end of next year.
In our amendment, the provision on
doctors’ payments simply says this
provision will be accounted for as Con-
gress provided in the Pay-As-You-Go
Act. This provision does not evade the
budget law. This provision merely pro-
vides for this bill’s treatment in ac-
cordance with the budget law. So the
budgetary treatment of this bill is con-
sistent with the budget law and it is
entirely appropriate.

The Senator from Alabama has once
again offered his amendment to put
caps on appropriated spending. That is
basically the same amendment the
Senate has repeatedly rejected. The
Senator from Hawaii, the distinguished
chairman of the Appropriations Com-
mittee, will no doubt have more to say
about this in due course. At this point
let me note the Sessions amendment
violates the Congressional Budget Act
and I expect a point of order to be
raised against the Sessions amendment
later today.

Mr. President, I now ask unanimous
consent that the Sessions amendment
be temporarily laid aside so the Sen-
ator from Maryland may offer an
amendment.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The Senator from Maryland.

AMENDMENT NO. 4304 TO AMENDMENT NO. 4301

Mr. CARDIN. Mr. President, I call up
my amendment No. 4304.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will report.

The legislative clerk read as follows:

The Senator from Maryland [Mr. CARDIN]
proposes an amendment numbered 4304 to
amendment No. 4301.

Mr. CARDIN. I ask unanimous con-
sent that the reading of the amend-
ment be dispensed with.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without
objection, it is so ordered.

The amendment is as follows:
(Purpose: To provide for the extension of de-

pendent coverage under the Federal Em-

ployees Health Benefits Program)

At the appropriate place, insert the fol-
lowing:

SEC. . EXTENSION OF DEPENDENT COV-
ERAGE UNDER FEHBP.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This section may be
cited as the “FEHBP Dependent Coverage
Extension Act”.

(b) IN GENERAL.—

(1) PROVISIONS RELATING TO AGE.—Chapter
89 of title 5, United States Code, is amend-
ed—

(A) in section 8901(5)—

(i) in the matter before subparagraph (A),
by striking ‘22 years of age’ and inserting
‘26 years of age’’; and

(ii) in the matter after subparagraph (B),
by striking ‘‘age 22’ and inserting ‘‘age 26’’;
and

June 8, 2010

(B) in section 8905(c)(2)(B)—

(i) in clause (i), by striking ‘22 years of
age’’ and inserting ‘26 years of age’’; and

(ii) in clause (ii), by striking ‘“‘age 22’ and
inserting ‘‘age 26”°.

(2) PROVISIONS RELATING TO MARITAL STA-
TUS.—Chapter 89 of title 5, United States
Code, is further amended—

(A) in section 8901(6) and subsections
(M(2)(A), (€)(2)(B), (e)1)B), and (e)(2)(A) of
section 8905a, by striking ‘‘an unmarried de-
pendent’ each place it appears and inserting
“‘a dependent’’; and

(B) in section 8905(c)(2)(B), by striking ‘‘un-
married dependent’” and inserting ‘‘depend-
ent’’.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments
made by this section shall become effective
as if included in the enactment of section
1001 of the Patient Protection and Affordable
Care Act (Public Law 111-148), except that
the Director of the Office of Personnel Man-
agement may implement such amendments
for such periods before the effective date
otherwise provided in section 1004(a) of such
Act as the Director may specify.

Mr. CARDIN. Mr. President, I took
the floor a little earlier today to ex-
plain that this amendment allows the
members of the Federal Employees
Health Benefits plan to be able to en-
roll their children up to age 26 imme-
diately rather than waiting for the be-
ginning of the year, which would effec-
tively deny those who are graduating
from college today, who may not qual-
ify as being under 22 and single, to be
able to stay or enroll on their parents’
Federal Employee Benefits plan. This
is an amendment that the OPM Direc-
tor supports in that he would like to do
this but can’t do it under the current
law. It has minimal cost.

Private insurance companies are al-
lowing up to 26-year-olds to enroll on
their parents’ policies today. This al-
lows the government workforce to have
those same rights. It would normally
take effect at the beginning of the
year. It makes sense to do this now. It
is bipartisan. It is supported by Demo-
cratic and Republican Senators. I urge
my colleagues to support this amend-
ment.

With that, I yield the floor and sug-
gest the absence of a quorum.

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The
clerk will call the roll.

The assistant bill clerk proceeded to
call the roll.

Mr. KYL. I ask unanimous consent
that the order for the quorum call be
rescinded.

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mrs.
GILLIBRAND). Without objection, it is so
ordered.

Mr. KYL. Madam President, I rise to
speak to the pending bill and a poten-
tial amendment Senator VITTER is pre-
paring and hopes to offer, an amend-
ment which would make sure that any
increase in the trust fund for oilspills
would be spent on cleaning up oilspills.
That might seem rather obvious, but it
turns out that the bill before us in-
creases the required contribution of oil
companies to this trust fund to clean
up oilspills from 8 cents to 41 cents per
barrel and then spends the money not
to clean up oilspills but, rather, to pay
for other items in the underlying legis-
lation, the so-called extenders bill.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2015-05-11T15:18:12-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




