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As we do so, we must come together to ad-

dress the impacts of lead poisoning on Flint’s 
residents, particularly Flint’s children. Be-
cause, sadly, for them, this crisis is just begin-
ning. 

f 

IN RECOGNITION OF PINE FORGE 
ACADEMY 

HON. PATRICK MEEHAN 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. MEEHAN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize Pine Forge Academy for providing 
70 years of exemplary education to Penn-
sylvania’s 7th District. 

Pine Forge Academy is a co-educational 
boarding school that serves grades 9 through 
12. It is a part of the Seventh-Day Adventist 
education system, the world’s second largest 
Christian school system. 

Today, the school remains committed to 
providing African-American high school stu-
dents with an exemplary education, a chance 
to develop their faith and to prepare for a life 
of service. 

Mr. Speaker, Pine Forge Academy has 
been changing the lives of young men and 
women for the past 70 years. I congratulate 
the school and look forward to seeing the ex-
cellent work it will continue to do in the years 
to come. 

f 

CELEBRATING THE 150TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF LEBANON VALLEY 
COLLEGE 

HON. CHARLES W. DENT 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. DENT. Mr. Speaker, it is my pleasure to 
recognize the 150th Anniversary of Lebanon 
Valley College. Lebanon Valley College was 
founded on February 23, 1866. For 150 years 
it has delivered quality liberal arts educational 
instruction to its students. 

During this time, the school has grown to 
become a vital and vibrant part of the culture 
and community of Lebanon County and of 
Annville Township. 

Lebanon Valley College currently offers thir-
ty-six undergraduate majors to its student 
body of approximately sixteen hundred under-
graduate students. At various times, the U.S. 
News & World Report, the Princeton Review 
and Forbes have all placed the school on their 
respective lists recognizing America’s best col-
leges. 

Mr. Speaker, I warmly extend my congratu-
lations to the students, faculty, employees, ad-
ministrators and alumni of Lebanon Valley 
College on the happy occasion of their Ses-
quicentennial. I extend my congratulations to 
Lebanon Valley College for its outstanding 
record of successfully providing so many 
young men and women with a strong liberal 
arts education, and wish continued growth and 
success for the College and all of its students. 

NATIONAL TRAUMA INSTITUTE 
RECOGNITION 

HON. WILL HURD 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. HURD of Texas. Mr. Speaker, traumatic 
injury in America affects everyone, claiming 
over 190,000 lives and costing hundreds of 
billions of dollars in healthcare annually. It is 
the number one cause of death for Americans 
between 1 and 46 years old. As a result, in 
2006, the National Trauma Institute was 
founded in San Antonio, Texas, to stop unnec-
essary suffering from trauma through preven-
tion, education and research. Ten years later, 
the National Trauma Institute celebrates a 
decade of trauma research advocacy and 
funding. 

The National Trauma Institute has enjoyed 
much success throughout its first decade in 
existence advocating for federal appropriations 
for trauma-related research so that patients 
can receive care faster and more efficiently. 
To date, the organization has been respon-
sible for securing $55 million in funding for 
trauma-related research, special projects and 
research infrastructure. That $55 million has 
made an incredible impact on millions of 
Americans, allowing them to survive injuries 
that were once unthinkable and go on to lead 
healthy productive lives. 

There is no question that the National Trau-
ma Institute, founded in San Antonio, Texas, 
has contributed to trauma research that has 
saved and dramatically improved lives. The or-
ganization has become a pillar of the commu-
nity and is now the leading voice of advocacy 
for the funding of clinical trauma research. I 
am proud to congratulate The National Trau-
ma Institute for its incredible achievements for 
San Antonio and the rest of the nation. 

f 

PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. MICHAEL E. CAPUANO 
OF MASSACHUSETTS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. CAPUANO. Mr. Speaker, I missed sev-
eral votes last week while meeting with the 
Speaker of Parliament of the Republic of the 
Sudan. I wish to state how I would have voted 
had I been present: 

Roll Call No. 55—No 
Roll Call No. 56—No 

f 

COMMEMORATING THE 75TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF PEORIA CHARTER 
COACH COMPANY 

HON. DARIN LaHOOD 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. LAHOOD. Mr. Speaker, I would like to 
honor a remarkable business, Peoria Charter 
Coach Company, an icon of Central Illinois 
celebrating their 75th anniversary. 

Peoria Charter Coach Company started in 
Lacon, Illinois under Walter Winkler who had 
nothing but the earnest desire to put his com-
munity first. After seeing his fellow citizens 
struggle to travel to work due to the World 
War II gas rations, he opened a bus service 
so that others around him could safely com-
mute to work to earn their paychecks. 

Seventy-five years later and now 
headquartered in Peoria, Illinois, four genera-
tions of Winklers have found many other ways 
to serve their community. From transporting 
war-time United States Defense Workers and 
Military Personnel to serve their country to 
helping schoolchildren to attend classes, from 
assisting college students returning home for 
the holidays to serving locals looking to catch 
a ball game in Chicago, the Winklers continue 
to pride themselves on assisting others. To 
date, the Peoria Charter Coach Company now 
carries an impressive half million passengers 
over four million miles annually. 

I am thankful that America has been a 
country where hard-working families with a vi-
sion, such as the Winklers can grow their 
small business, employ others, and serve their 
fellow Americans. I extend my sincere con-
gratulations to the Winkler Family and Peoria 
Charter Coach Company for their impressive 
accomplishments and thank them for their 
continued service to the 18th District. I wish 
them seventy-five more years of good fortune 
and safe travels. 

f 

HONORING THE LIFE AND LEGACY 
OF MRS. WAYEDEAN BEATRICE 
MCGRAW 

HON. ALCEE L. HASTINGS 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. HASTINGS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize the life and legacy of Mrs. 
Wayedean Beatrice McGraw of Broward 
County, Florida, who sadly passed away on 
Friday, January 1, 2016 at age 73. Wayedean 
was born in Leeds, Alabama where she at-
tended Moton High School. She later moved 
to Florida where she worked providing private 
home health care in various locations through-
out Broward County. She worshipped at Beth-
el Baptist and Evergreen Missionary Baptist 
Church, now known as Greater Providence 
Baptist Church. 

Wayedean is survived by her three loving 
children, Bruce, Annette and Ronald; seven 
wonderful grandchildren: Cornelius Sr., Valen-
cia, Antwon Sr., Calvin Sr., Marquis, Brittany 
and Lauren; ten great grandchildren: Roy, 
Cornelius Jr., D’Naisah, Kristian, Antwon Jr., 
A’Niyah, Nakyla, Calonni, Calvin Jr., and 
Makai; one sister, Nancy of Oakland Park, 
Florida; and many loving nieces, nephews, 
other relatives and friends. Her mother, Ar-
lene, and four siblings: Jean, Mary, Paul and 
Charles all preceded her in death. 

Mr. Speaker, I am truly honored to celebrate 
the incredible life of Mrs. Wayedean Beatrice 
McGraw, and express my deepest condo-
lences to her family. I know that her spirit, lov-
ing memory, and legacy will always live on. 
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CONGRATULATIONS TO LIBRADA 

PAYAN 

HON. WILL HURD 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. HURD of Texas. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize the 101st birthday of Mrs. 
Librada Payan of El Paso, Texas. 

A beloved mother of 7 children, 30 grand-
children, 15 great grandchildren, and several 
more great-great grandchildren, Mrs. Payan is 
known for her cheerful outlook and devotion to 
her beloved family. 

Mrs. Payan was born in 1915, and moved to 
the El Paso area in 1918. She was happily 
married to the love of her life for over 65 
years. She never ceases to be amazed at the 
changes of the world around her, and greets 
each day with an enthusiasm that eludes even 
the most optimistic of people. 

On behalf of the Twenty-Third Congres-
sional District of Texas, congratulations to 
Librada Payan on turning 101 years old, and 
may she celebrate many more. 

f 

HONORING THE ACCOMPLISH-
MENTS OF DR. JAMES H. 
BILLINGTON 

HON. JEFF FORTENBERRY 
OF NEBRASKA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. FORTENBERRY. Mr. Speaker, today I 
would like to honor the accomplishments of 
James H. Billington as founding chairman of 
the Open World Leadership Center in Wash-
ington, DC, in recognition of his retirement in 
September 2015. 

James H. Billington served as the 13th Li-
brarian of Congress from 1987 until his retire-
ment in 2015. 

‘‘Jim’’, a native of Philadelphia, Pennsyl-
vania, is an accomplished author, scholar, ed-
ucator, and administrator and has earned the 
respect and admiration of his students, col-
leagues, peers, and fellow Trustees. 

Librarian Billington earned a Bachelor of 
Arts degree from Princeton University in 1950 
and a doctorate from Balliol College, Oxford, 
where he was a Rhodes Scholar. 

After serving with the United States Army 
and in the Office of National Estimates, Mr. 
Billington taught history at Harvard University 
from 1957 to 1962 and subsequently at 
Princeton University where he was professor 
of history from 1964 to 1973. 

James H. Billington became director of the 
Woodrow Wilson International Center for 
Scholars in September 1973, an institution 
created by the United States Congress in 
1968 as a living memorial to the 28th Presi-
dent. He grew the Woodrow Wilson Center 
International Center for Scholars allowing 
American and invited foreign scholars to 
spend time reflecting on issues central to un-
derstanding a complex world. 

He then helped create the Kennan Institute 
for Advanced Russian Studies in 1974, believ-
ing that the relationship with the Soviet Union 
was America’s most important international 
challenge. 

As a scholar of Russian history and culture, 
Dr. Billington has accompanied 10 congres-

sional delegations to Russia and the former 
Soviet Union, and joined President Reagan at 
the summit meeting in June, 1988. 

On September 14, 1987, Professor 
Billington was sworn in as the 13th Librarian 
of Congress where he oversaw the largest col-
lection of books, maps, photographs, record-
ings, and motion pictures in the world. 

Dr. Billington is the author of Mikhailovsky 
and Russian Populism (1956), The Icon and 
the Axe (1966), Fire in the Minds of Men 
(1980), Russia Transformed: Breakthrough to 
Hope, August 1991 (1992), The Face of Rus-
sia (1998)—a companion book to the three- 
part television series of the same name, which 
he wrote and narrated for the Public Broad-
casting Service, and Russia in Search of Itself 
(2004), books translated and published in a 
variety of languages. 

James H. Billington has received over 40 
honorary doctorates—including from the Uni-
versity of Tbilisi in Georgia (1999), the Rus-
sian State University for the Humanities in 
Moscow (2001), and the University of Oxford 
(2002), has been awarded the Woodrow Wil-
son Award from Princeton University (1992), 
the UCLA Medal (1999), the Pushkin Medal of 
the International Association of the Teachers 
of Russian Language and Culture (2000), the 
Karamzin Prize (2005) from the Foreign Lit-
erature Library in Moscow, the Likhachev 
Prize (2006) from the Likhachev Foundation in 
St. Petersburg, the inaugural Lafayette Prize 
by the French-American Cultural Foundation, 
the EastWest Institute Outstanding Leadership 
Award, and the Presidential Citizens Medal by 
President Bush in 2008. 

Dr. Billington is a member of the Russian 
Academy of Sciences. He was decorated as 
Commander of the Order of Arts and Letters 
and as Chevalier of the Legion of Honor by 
the President of France, as Commander of the 
National Order of the Southern Cross of 
Brazil, the Order of Merit of Italy, a Knight 
Commander’s Cross of the Order of Merit by 
the Federal Republic of Germany, the 
Gwanghwa Medal by the Republic of Korea, 
the Chingiz Aitmatov Gold Medal by the 
Kyrgyz Republic and the Order of Friendship 
by the President of the Russian Federation; 
the highest state order that a foreign citizen 
may receive. 

Dr. Billington will continue to study and write 
on important Russian-American issues, after 
retiring as the second-longest-serving Librar-
ian of Congress, and as Founding Chairman 
of the Open World Leadership Center. 

It is fitting that the United States Congress 
recognize his deeds throughout his 28 years 
of service as Librarian of Congress and the 
accomplishments and achievements of James 
H. Billington as founding Chairman of the 
Open World Leadership Center throughout his 
16 years of service. 

f 

HONORING DR. JAMES BILLINGTON 

HON. DAVID E. PRICE 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. PRICE of North Carolina. Mr. Speaker, 
I wish to congratulate and thank Dr. James 
Billington upon completion of his 42 years of 
distinguished public service, culminating in 28 
years as the 13th Librarian of Congress. He 

presided over a doubling of the Library’s hold-
ings and a major enhancement of the Library’s 
role in American cultural life. 

Dr. Billington, a Rhodes Scholar and a dis-
tinguished expert on Russia, began his career 
as a professor of history at Harvard University 
and Princeton University. He served as direc-
tor of the Woodrow Wilson International Cen-
ter for Scholars and helped found the Kennan 
Institute for Advanced Russian Studies before 
coming to the Library of Congress in 1987. 

Dr. Billington recognized that the Library 
must be a great public asset, an educational 
resource for all Americans, not just for aca-
demics and Members of Congress. He set 
about digitizing many of the Library’s collec-
tions and arranging the purchase and display 
of dozens of important relics that had long 
been hidden from public view. He also created 
the National Book Festival, which has brought 
hundreds of thousands of book lovers to 
Washington to celebrate our literary history. 

As a Member of Congress and a leader of 
the House Democracy Partnership (HDP), I 
have particularly appreciated Dr. Billington’s 
application of his background as a scholar of 
Russia and his extensive international experi-
ence to the establishment of the Open World 
Leadership Center, a unique legislative branch 
initiative that has brought some 24,000 young 
leaders from post-Soviet states to the U.S. for 
intensive exposure to our people and commu-
nity life. I have enjoyed hosting these delega-
tions in North Carolina, parliamentary col-
leagues but also teachers, doctors, provincial 
leaders, and others from all walks of life. 

The Library and the Congressional Re-
search Service (CRS) have also been invalu-
able in HDP’s outreach to parliaments in de-
mocratizing countries, helping build their staff, 
research, and IT capabilities. This work began 
with the Frost-Solomon Task Force in the 
early 1990s, when post-communist states 
faced the challenge of equipping and oper-
ating modern parliaments. It has continued 
over the past decade as HDP has helped es-
tablish research facilities and personnel, with 
the help of CRS, in countries ranging from Li-
beria to Afghanistan to Timor-Leste. 

I congratulate Dr. Billington on his historic 
career, and I wish him and his family the very 
best for a well-deserved retirement. 

f 

HONORING TERRY’S HOUSE AS 
THEY CELEBRATE THEIR 5 YEAR 
ANNIVERSARY 

HON. JIM COSTA 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, February 9, 2016 

Mr. COSTA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor Terry’s House, a hospitality home dedi-
cated to providing affordable and convenient 
lodging for families of patients in critical care 
units at the Community Regional Medical Cen-
ter. This year Terry’s House is celebrating its 
five year anniversary of continuous service in 
Downtown Fresno, California. Since its incep-
tion in 2011, Terry’s House has served over 
3,600 families, from forty-two states and twen-
ty-three countries around the world. Operating 
solely on donations, Terry’s House has been 
made possible by the generosity of the com-
munity, and it is their hope that they may con-
tinue to assist families of those in critical care 
for many years to come. 
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